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' P V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

. - 51 Libi Ave 1 #0125 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
/f_! TEL 5255 3561 FAX 6256 4315
Reg No 199607198R GST Reg. No 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD Ref CCa/CTI18011768/T1ub3
SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079909 et IRt l] ‘"WI“M"M"I
Coda: CTI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SLN 1480X Veh. Inspected SHD 2885J
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess () 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 27/06/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer = Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
RI/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre I
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date 09/02/2018 Inspection Date 27/06/2018
Survey held at PRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE PTELTD
6 BENOI PLACE
SINGAPORE 620027
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
H)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS. WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
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Yourref: To Be Advised Date: 28.06.2018

Our ref: CCH/CTII 01 1766/T lubd

The Motor Cluims Department

M/s CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (5) FTELTD

Dear Sir/Mudum,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SHID2885]
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 27.06.2018
at the premises of M/fs _Prime Auto Claims Services Pie Ltd and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 2.604.07

Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 1.894.0]

"Check” Items Amount - S8 -

Marker Value 1 5% -

LTA Reimbursement Value : S5 -

Nett Vilue . 5% -

Description of Damuge: . ; '_-.

The vehicle sustained dumages at the . - R
Front N/S Portion .

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 2 days

Yours faithfully,

MOHD. TAUFIKH
Licensed Appraiser



Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd
GST Reg. No : 201606560M

5 Benol Place Singapore 529926

Tel: 6B61 0908 Fax: 6515 2948

PRIME GROUP

Date: 27.06.2018

China Taiping Insurance (S) Pte Ltd
2 Anson Road #16-00

Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

RE: ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIR TO VEHICLE SHD2885] TOYOTA VELLFIRE (2013)

To Supply
1] 1pc Frant bumper 5 ‘("{?35,0&
2) 1set  Front bumper clip S Al §0.00
3) 1pc  Front bumper left retainer § M —"120.35
4) 1pc Front bumper left front sensor S Aavx 559.10
5) 1pc Front bumper left frant sensor cover S A 4450
6) 1pc Frant bumper left front tow hook cover s  Kv¥ 5080

Sub total parts S 2,638.75

Less: 25% discount S 659.68
5 1,979.07
To Supply S.Nett Parts

1) 1pc  Frontno. plate ¢ " x' 13500
Sub total S.Nett Parts S 35.00

L/charges 20
1) Toremove & refit front sensor, reset front sensor light. Check wiring. S 40.00

light. Check wiring
B ..ju

2 ) Toremove & replace front bumper. Align & adjust front bumper. 5 250.00



Jos

3 ) To putty, respray painting front bumper, front sensor cover & tow hook S 300.00

cover in pearl white. To polish

Sub total L/charges S 590.00

Estimated Grand total 2,604.07
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Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Jowyn Tay <jowyn.tay@sg cntaiping.com:

Sent: Tuesday, 10 July 2018 12:50 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto); Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Cc Angie Foo, Admin A, Jowyn Tay

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLN1490X (O1 : SNM18D00803/C03/0) and
SHD2885] (TP : LKK REF - CC&/CTITB011766/ub3 ) on 09.02.2018

Attachments: MANC18020246-5LN1430X pdf; SNM18D00803C03 20180710-TO INSD-APPT LKK AS
SETTLEMENT AGENT pdf

Importance: High

Dear Shu Pei and Thin Thin,

Refer to the said matter.
We attached our insured’s accident report and letter for your immediate attention
At the same time, please request for the video footage from SHD2885) and thereafter, forward the same 1o us

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jowyn Tay
Deputy Claims Executive
Claims Department — Motor Division

China Taiping Insurance [Singapore) Ple. Lid.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleal Tower Singapore 079809
Dwrect (65) 63BS 6174

Fax (65) 6224 7175/ 6224 7478

Email: claimsdept@sg.cnlaiping.com

Websile www.sg.cntaiping.com

LN Ths A )
1 \ |
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This message a5 confidential; irs contents do nar constitute o commultment by China Tafping Inswrance (Singapore ) Pte. Lud. except
where preondeded for ina weitten agreemment betwees ver amd Chira Taiping Teswrmnce (Stagapore ) Pre. Lid Ay siasthorized diselasiere
use o disseminarion, dither in wiydle e partiel, is probibited. 1F vou are min the intended vecipient of the wiesooge, please nolifv
seiler primmedictiely.,



From: Shu Pei {LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@Ilkkauto.com)

Sent: Wednesday, 27 June, 2018 8:03 PM

To: Claims-Dept of CT| <claimsdept @sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Jowyn Tay <jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Angie Foo <angle.foo@sg.cntaiping.com=; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin®@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving SLN1490X (Ol : CT1 - TBA) and SHD2885 (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI1B011766/ub3 ) on 09.02.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Jowyn,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case from M/s Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd.
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP's GlA report

Our case handler in-charge is Thin Thin and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2360.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall; shupeiEikkauto com | fan; 5741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubl industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408533)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http//www symanteccloud com
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CHINA TAIPING INSURAMCE [SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD
CHIMNA TAIPING

4 Anson Bosg 91830 Gerngeal Towe Wingagpces 0 FRG
T RMGETT Fau @7 VO
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Ca Meg So 20070818

Our Reference: SNM18D00803/C03/0
Date : 10 JULY 2018 via Ordinary & Registered Mail

ONESTO CAR RENTALS

511 GUILLEMARD ROAD
#03-05 GRANDLINK SQUARE
SINGAPORE 399849

Dear Sir{ Madam
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLN1490X AND SHD2885J ON 08 FEBRUARY 2018
ALONG PAYA LEBAR ROAD

We refer to the abovementioned accident.

Please be advised that the third party vehicle, SHD2885J | is filing a third party property
claim against your vehicle.

We have appointed LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd, to administer the said claim on our behalf
and they will contact you for more information aboul the accident.

Kindly render your assistance and co-operation accordingly.

Yours trulv,
Claims Department

(This is a computler generated letter and no signature is required,)

CC : LKK Autc Consultants Pte Lid

Attn THIN THIN

Ref CCB/CTNBED11768/UB3
Contact No = 68412360

via Email THINTHINELKKAUTO COM

CC : Agent - [ANDS80A) - TECK WEI CREDIT PTE LTD

FOVLKKDS-2013



Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd
GST Reg. No : 201606560M

5 Benoi Place Singapore 629926

Tel: 6861 0S0B Fax: 6515 2948

PRIME GROUP

Date: 03.07.2018

Our ref: SHD28851
Your Rel: Please advice

China Taiping Insurance (S) Pre Lid

3 Anson Road #16-00 Without prejudice
Springleal Tower Fax: 6224 7175
Singapore 079909

Aun: Motor Claims Dept
Dear Madam,
ACCIDENT ON 09022018 INNOLVING VEHICLES SHD288A) & SLN1490X

We are on behalf of M/S Prime Car Rental & Taxi Services Pte Lid the owner of vehicle
SHD2885) in their third party claim against your insured / driver of SLN 490X

Appended below our client’s claim:-

1. Cost of repair § 1.605.00
2. Loss of rental (Pre-inspection arrungement) S 142.80
3. Loss of rental @$142.80 x 2 days § 28560
4. GIA search Fee 5 2.00

T'otal $ 2,03540

We enclosed herewith our invoice 2128, GIA scarch receipt, letter of authority & Letter of
Certification for vour retention. Please acknowledie receip.

For amicable settlement, please let us have vour offer
Regards
Yours [L'uitht‘uli}'.

|J_,_r

Alice Lcuég
E-mail: aliceleong@primeautoclaims com

Enel,



TAXINVOICE No: 2128

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd
6 Benoi Place Singapore 628927

Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2948

GST Reg. No: 201606560M

PRMEGROUP  Req No. 201606560M

MESSRS China Taiping Insurance (S) Pte Ltd o= 0/6/2018
3 Anson Road 2130
Waorks Order No:
#1e-00 Springleal Tower
Singapore 079909 Vehicie No: __SHD288SI
ITEM DESCRIPTION LINIT PRICE AMOLINT
MakeModel Toyota Vellfire
Repir Deie 26/6/2018
T of Payment:
Third Party Claims
L Being lump sum repair to the above vehicle 5 1.500.00
* Compound inlerests al the mbe of 1% par manth
will ba charged on lole payment SUB TOTAL 5 1,500.00
GSTT% S 10500
x’ TOTAL S 1,605.00
Prepared by i - Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd

Manager
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Our Ref Nao
Date of Regues!.

GENERAL
INSURANCE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

GR-18-022256

09/02/2018

Prime Auto Claims Servica Pta Lid

8 Banol Place
Singapore 629927

Dear SirfMaaam,

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raflles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

Phone: +65 6224 D010 Fax +85 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday 10 Friday Sam o Spm
GST Regisiration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Your Rel No Oniing Furchase

Enquiry Dale 08/02r2018
Enquiry By Liu Pei Yee

Vehicle No. SLN1480X
+ LCident Dale 0g/02r2018
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (58]
TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Intlusive) 2.00
Thank You.
This is a compuler generatad document and requires no signature
For GIARMC Official use:
Qate
[X] GIRO | | Cash | | Cheque

T i bl sl TIOYTIRCEIM=?RVARRPACF TOKEN =000 2n
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GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
I"SUME Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax +£5 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours Monday to Friday Sam ta Spm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE ©ST Reutration No M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No GR-18-022258
Date of Request 09/0272018 Your Ref No Online Purchasa
Prime Auto Claims Service Ple Lid
& Benol Place
Singapore 629927
Dear Sir/Madam,
Enquiry Date 08/02/2018
Enguiry By Liu Pei Yeg
7 Vehigle No. SLN1490X
scident Date 09/0272018
Enguiry Result
TP Vehicle Na Insurer Pericd of Insurance Insurer Tel. No
SLNT490X China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lig 24/04/2017-23/04/2018 6389 6111
Thank You

The images provided Io you are taken from the original reports forwarded (o the centre by the members of the Ganeral Insurance Aasoclation of
Singapore and we take no rasponsibility for their Accuracy or contants and shall ba under no |lability whatsoever for any loss or damage arising oul of
Of in connection with the repons or thair images

This is a computer generaled document and requires no signature




LETTER OF AUTHORITY

To: PRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE PTE. LTD.

Re: ACCIDENT ON 09.02.2018 INVOLVING SHD2885) & SLNI490X
AT PAYA LEBAR ROAD

I/ We. M/S Prime Car Rental & Taxi Services Pte Ltd hereby authorized you to carry out

repairs of the damage caused to my / our vehicle no. SHD2885) in the above accident,

I/ We further also confirm and agree that all sums of money to be recovered by you on
my/ our behalf shall be paid to you. I/ We hereby also authorise the third party insurer to

release to you such sums of money recovered on my / our behalf.

.........‘h{..“.“. L L T T
Stgnature (Comipany s stamp if applicable)
Name:

NRIC:



PRIME CAR RENTAL

& TAXISERVICES PTELTD

Co. Cert. No: 1996062932
Gst Reg. No: 19-9606293-Z

Your Ref : Please advise Our Ref: SHD2885)
Date :29.06.2018

To : Whom It May Concemn

From : Prime Car Rental & Taxi Services Pte Ltd

RE: LETTER OF CERTIFICATION FOR MR. WONG KOK
CHUAN

This letter serves to confirm that Mr. Wong Kok Chuan, Nric Number S8436675G is a
Taxi Master for Prime Car Rental & Taxi Services Pte Lid hiring the Vehicle
Registration Number SHD2885 for Singapore Dollar One Hundred and Forty Two and
Cents Eighty ($142.80) Only.

Should clarification require | can be contacted at 9452482

Thank vou with Best Regards

Yours Sincerely
TN/ CHAN KONG LOONG
, — ,é_— —7 Srm0108; =
- L \‘ ';\ 4 J uw,mfj}‘}«:_r MAMAGER
- ¥, | R, T L3 DENCL PLAD
1 . \ BNGAPORE map

Mr Chan Kong Logng
Waorkshop Manager



Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 23 May 2019 4:14 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Ce Alfred Toh

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SHD2B8B5) DOA: 09.02.2018 YOUR REF: CCB/CTIBO11766/T1ub3 -
SNM18D00B03C03/0

Hi Sir,

We refer to the above matter,
Third party repairer have inform that the case have submitted to lawyer to handle.

In view of above, we will process to closed the case and submit our report to your good office.

Thank You.

Beyt Regaros,
Asher Ing | Cose Hondler
LEK Autoe Conmullants Ple Lid

phone: §841-4051 | emall: shenng@ikkoulo com | fax: 6741-4108

Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Pork. Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5[{408933)

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 2 November 2018 10:23 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept®sg cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Ce: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg entalping.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@|kkauto.com>; KKLau <kklau@Ikkai ito.coms>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SHD2885) DOA: 09.02.2018 YOUR REF: CC6/CTI8011766/T1ub3 - SNM18D00803C03/0
Importance: High

LKK REF: CC6/CTI18011766/T1ub3
CT1 REF: SNM18D00803C02/0 (SLN1490X)

Dear Alfred,
We refer to the below matter.
Please be inform that we have send reminder to Insured, however there is no response from O,

In view of the above, kindly let us have your further instruction as TP s keep on chasing us for settlement.



Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid
Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg cntaiping.com>

Sent: Friday, 5 October 2018 12:33 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAute) <thinthin@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Irene Tay <irene.ta cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Hslao Tong (LKKAuto)

<chewht@lkkauto.com>; KKLau <kklau@lkkauto com>
Subject: RE: OUR REF: SHD2885) DOA; 09.02.2018 YOUR REF: CC6/CTI8011766/T1ub3 - SNM18D00803C03/0

LKK REF: CC6/CTIB011766/T1ub3
CT1 REF: SNM18D00B03CO02/0 (SLN1490X)

Dear Thin Thin
We refer to the above matter.

Please assist to demand the Rental Agreement from Insured and check the status of their claim against SHD2885)
{SUCCESSFUL or REJECTED).

Best Regards

Allred Toh
Senior Execullve
Claims Department
China Talping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd,
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: +65 6389 6183
FAX: +65 6224 T478/6224 T175
Email: claimsdepl@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.lo .cnla m

Iping.com

ANNIVERSARY
In Sinpupore simer 1958

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; ity contents do not constitute a commimment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Fre. Lid. excepi
where provided for in @ written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid. Any unauthorized disclosure,
use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, i prohibited. If vou are not the intended reciplent of the message, please notify the
sender immediarely.

2



From: Alice Leong llto:alicel ri aims.co
Sent: Friday, October 05, 2018 12:06 PM
To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@®|kkauto.com>

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: OUR REF: SHD2885) DOA: 09.02.2018 YOUR REF: CC6/CTI8011766/T1ub3 - SNM18D00803C03/0

Importance: High

Hi Thin Thin

Our below e-mail referred.

Please let us have your decision towards the case by end of the day 05.10.2018 1730hrs.
Thank you

Alice Leong
Manager, Motor Claims

Prime Auto Claims Service Pie Lid

& fenoi Place Singapore 629927
T(65): 6861 0908 | F(65) 6515 2048
HP (65) 9818 4304

A member of the Prime Group
This e-madl (including all attachment} containg confidential information which may be privileged, It is intended solely for the identified reciplentis)

to whom it is sddressed, If you are not an intend recipient, please reply to us immedintely and deleie this message from your system. You mmay not
copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person,

From: Alice Leong [mailto:aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com]
Sent: 28 September, 2018 10:51 AM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntai LLom>

Subject: FW: OUR REF: SHD2885) DOA: 09.02.2018 YOUR REF: CC6/CTIB011766/T1ub3

Importance: High
Hi Thin Thin, Final Reminder

For swift & amicable settlement and to avoid costly litigation for collision damages, please let us have your
offer on or before 05.10.2018.

Failing which, our client will have no altemative but to recover their losses via their appointed solicitors
without further reference o you

Regards

Alice Leong
Manager. Motor Claims

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Lid
6 Benai Place Singapore 629927



T (65): 6861 0908 | F(65) 6515 2948
HP (65) 9818 4304

A member of the Prime Group

Disclaimer

This e-mail (including all attachment) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is htﬂldﬁ.l solely for the identified recipient(s)
o whom it is addressed. If you are not an intend recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your sysicm. You may not
copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents [0 any persan.

From: Alice Leong [mailto:alicelecng@ primeautoclaims.com]
Sent: 13 September, 2018 12:05 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@®lkkauto.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: admin-a@lkkauto. com <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: OUR REF: SHD2885) DOA: 09.02.2018 YOUR REF: CC6/CTI8011766/T1ub3

Importance: High

Qur LOD dated 03.07.2018 referred.

Our video footage forwarded to you on 02.07.2018.

From our hirer’s video footage, we are in view that your insured statement did not match the actual

circumstances of this accident and he had no reason to apply emergency brake after he had changed lane into
our client's lane.

If we do not receive your offer on'or before 19.09.2018, our client will not hesitate to recover their losses via
their appointed solicitors without further reference to you

Regards

Alice Leong
Manager, Motor Claims

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd

6 Benol Place Singapare 629927

T (65): 6861 0908 | F(65) 6515 2948
HP (65) 9818 4304

A member of the Prime Group
Disclaimer
This e-mail (including all attachment) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified recipientis)

10 whom It Is sddressed. If you are not an inlend recipient. please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not
copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its conients (o any persan.

Fram: Alice Lenng_ Ito:aliceleon rimeautoclaims.
Sent: 05 September, 2018 10:43 AM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@| >
Subject: FW: OUR REF: SHD28B5) DOA: 09.02.2018 YOUR REF; CCB/CTIBO11766/T1ub3
Importance: High

Hi Thin Thin, 2" reminder

4



LOD & video had forwarded to your office earlier.

31092018

o before 1

For swift & amicable settlement, please let us have your offer on liabilities & quantum on §

Regards

Alice Leong
Motor Claims Manager

Prime Auto Cluims Service Pie Ltd

i Benoi Place Singapore 629927

T (65): 6861 0908 1 F(65) 6515 2948
HP (65) 9818 4304

A member of the Prime Group
Disclajmer
This c-mail {including all attachment) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended salely for the identified recipient(s)

mwhmimndmmd.ll.'ruu-rumminumlndpm.plmm]ymmmdlmlymmmhmup&mymmm?mmynm
copy of use it for any purpase, or otherwise disclose ils contents (o any person,

From: Alice Leong [mailto:aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com]
Sent: 02 August, 2018 2:51 PM

To: Thin Thin [LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: OUR REF: SHD2885) DOA: 09.02.2018 YOUR REF: CC6/CTI8011766/T1ub3

Impaortance: High
Hi Thin Thin 1* Reminder
Our LOD dated 03.07.2018 referred.

For switch & amicable settlement, please let us have your offer on liabilities & quantum.
Regards

Alice Leong
Motor Claims Manager

Prime Auto Clulms Service Ple Lid
5 Benol Place Singapore 629926

T (65): 6861 0908 1 F(65) 6515 2948
HP (65) UE1E 4304

A member of the Prime Group

Disclaimer

This e-mail (including all awachment) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely fior the identified recipient(s)
o whom it is addressed. If you are not an intend recipient, please reply 1o us immediatcly and delete this message from your system. You may nol
copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its conlents (o any person.

From: Alice Leong [mailto:alicel rimeautoclaims.

Sent: 24 July, 2018 9:58 AM
To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)' <thinthin@Ikkauto com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SHD2885) DOA: 09.02.2018 YOUR REF: CC6/CTI8011766/T1ub3
Importance: High



Hi Thin Thin.
The above referred,

For swift & amicable settlement, please let us have your offer.

Regards

Alice Leong
Motor Claims Manager

Prime Auto Clalms Service Pte Lid
5 Benoi Place Singapore 629926

T (635): 6861 0908 | F(65) 6515 2948
HP (65) 9818 4304

A member of the Prime Group

Disclaimer

This e-mail (including sll wiachment) containg confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified recipieni(s)
1o whom it is addressed. If you are not an intend recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not
copy of use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents 1o any person,

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) [mailto:thinthin@Ikkauto.com)]

Sent: 04 July, 2018 10:20 AM
To: Alice Leong <aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SHD2885) DOA: 09.02.2018 YOUR REF: CC6/CTIB011766/T1ub3
Dear Alice,

We acknowledge your email below.

We will look into the matter and will revert back to you.

Thanks,

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lidauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{408933)

From: Alice Leong [mailto:aliceleong @ primeautoclaims.com]

Sent: Monday, 2 July 2018 4:45 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@| m>

Subject: OUR REF: SHD2885) DOA: 09.02.2018 YOUR REF: CC6/CTIB011766/T1ub3
Impaortance: High

Hi Thin Thin,



The above referred.
We enclosed our hirer’s video footage for your perusal. Please establish liabilities after viewing on urgent basis.
Regards

Alice Leong
Motor Claims Manager

Prime Auto Cluims Service Pie Lid

5 Benol Place Singapore 629926

T (65): 6861 0908 | F(65) 6515 2948
HP (65) 9818 4304

A member of the Prime Group

Disclaimes

This e-mail (including all machmenrt) contains confidential informarion which may be privileged. It is imended solely for the identified recipient(s)
to whom it is addressed. If you are nol an intead recipient, please reply to us immedistely and delete this message from your system. You may not
capy or use il for any purpose. or otherwise disciose its contents 1o any person.

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hitp://www.symanteccloud.com
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

TEL 6256 1561 FAX: 62564215

Reg. Mo: 198607T188R GS5T Reg. No. 18-8607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Exports En Automoblla

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD Rel CCB/CTIHBE011768/T1eb3g2
SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 076509 Pate 12062019 MHI"""”I"‘I”[I
Code: CTI
1: Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, SLN 1480X Veh. Inspected SHD 2885
Policy No. DMHCSN1734061700 Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. SNM18000803/C03/0 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 27106/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA VELLFIRE c.c 2362
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2013
Chassis No. ATH208025243 Colour WHITE
Odometer 470082 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOGD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/85 R15 GOODRIDE 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/85 R15 GOODRIDE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[215/85R15 GOODRIDE 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/85R15 GOODRIDE 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT N/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 08/02/2018 Inspection Date 27/06/2018
Survey held at PRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE FTELTD
6 BENOI PLACE
SINGAPORE 6280827
Sa. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days




s mm &

V V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6258 3561 FAX: 6258 4315

Reg No: 189607198R GST Reg No. 19-9607196-R Page No. 1 af 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHD 2885J
: : Estimate By | Our Adjustad
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop (§) (s)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED 1, 785,00 1,785.00
1|SET FRONT BUMPER CLIP NECESSARY 80.00 60.00
1|FRONT BUMPER LEFT RETAINER NECESSARY 120.35 120.35
1|FRONT BUMPER LEFT FRONT SENSOR NOT NECESSARY 569.10
1|FRONT BUMPER LEFT FRONT SENSOR COVER NOT NECESSARY 44 50
1|FRONT BUMPER LEFT FRONT TOW HOOK COVER TO REPAIR SEE 58.80
LABOUR
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -659.68 -491.34
1,979.06 1,474.01
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT NO.PLATE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 35.00
35.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE & REFIT FRONT SENSOR ,RESET FRONT 40.00 20.00
SENSOR LIGHT .CHECK WIRING LIGHT CHECK WIRING
TO REMOVE & REPLACE FRONT BUMPER ALIGN & 250.00 200.00
ADJUST FRONT BUMPER.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF
FRONT BUMPER LEFT FRONT TOW HOOK COVER
TO PUTTY RESPRAY PAINTING FRONT BUMPER FRONT 300.00 200.00
SENSOR COVER & TOW HOOK COVER IN PEARL
WHITE .TO POLISH,
§00.00 420.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,604.08 1,894.01
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,500.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CC6/CTI18011766/T1eb3q2

-@g{l,

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

ré

HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TD THIRD FARTIES:- This Aepart is made solaky for the use snd banefl of the Cllent named on the fron) page af this Repor




