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Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Parson.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
25-08-2018 Our Ref No. D1B004261MFSH
22-08-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHC2466R Third Party Vehicle. SDH2282A
55 UBI ROAD 1
JEFFERY TAN
63682323/ 67688611 Fax Mo. 68411183
DIRECT SETTLEMENT:

LKK AUTO CONSLULTANTS PTELTD

NA Fax No. 68418315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

PREMILUM
Cc : Workshop AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD Attention. NIL
Cc: TP Solicitor NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge KARENT

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly subrmit the survey raport via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection,

This s a computer generated letter, no signature required
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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital. com.sg=

Sent: Friday, 29 June 2018 4:23 PM

To: Nivitha (LKK Auts)

Ce: sur@Ikkauto.com; CWS Motar Claims; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Subject: CAMCEL SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D1B00496TMFSH/1

Dear Nivitha,

We were informed that the workshop had arranged for another surveyor for survey. Hence, kindly
treat this survey assignment as cancelled.

Best Regards,

g Thwn

Motor Claims Dept .

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | DID : 6507 3582 | Fax No.
: 6507 3849 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C
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From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 27 June, 2018 5:04 PM

To: CWS Motar Claims <cwsmotorclalms@msfirstcapital com, sg>; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Ce: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; sur@lkkauto.com

Subject; RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004961MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in warkshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

GiNiviths | Adiain

LEK Auto Consultunts Pte Lid

Phone 6B41-1972 | email: assignments@ikkautocom | fox: 6256- 4315
Hilk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Uhi Avenue 1. #02-25 | $(408033)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclai msfirstcapital.com.
Sent: Wednesday, 27 June 2018 4:13 PM
To: ASSIGNMENTS@ LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWSMOTORCLAIMS @MSFIRSTCAPITAL COM.SG; KARENTAN@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004961MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



We -efer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,
Admin Team

‘Claim Workflow System

Muotor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

P'S: This is a system genernted mail. Please do not reply to this mail.
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