Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 26 June 2018 3:16 PM

To: 'ONG LI LI'; assignments

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG'; Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKN977C & SLV6334P ON 18/06/2018 Our Ref:
18/18/18/VP05/020684

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 26 June 2018 2:38 PM

To: claims@tohahswee.com.sg; assignments@lkkauto.com; 'SUR' (sur@lkkauto.com) <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKN977C & SLV6334P ON 18/06/2018 Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020684

Without Prejudice

Dear Sally/Elaine

Please liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for the survey and assessment of liability.
Dear Catherine/Nivitha

FYA.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: claims claims [mailto:claims@tohahswee.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 26 June, 2018 2:11 PM

To: ONG LI LI

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKN977C & SLV6334P ON 18/06/2018

Dear Ms Ong,



We refer to the above matter.
Attached herewith our Estimated repair bill and our client's SAS report for your kind attention.

Please kindly arrange for PRI. In the mean time, revert us on liability if your insured has reported for
this accident.

Thanks & Best Rgds,

Sally / Elaine Tham

Toh Ah Swee Spray Painting Co.
Tel: 63660286

Fax: 63685943

—————————— Forwarded message ----------

From: claims claims <claims @tohahswee.com.sg>

Date: Fri, Jun 22, 2018 at 4:30 PM

Subject: Fwd: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKN977C & SLV6334P ON 18/06/2018
To: jeffching76 @ gmail.com, Jeff Ching <sales @omnimetalgroup.com>

Dear Mr Jeff

Attached with the SAS report for your reference.

Thanks & Best Rgds,

Sally / Elaine Tham

Toh Ah Swee Spray Painting Co.
Tel: 63660286

Fax: 63685943

—————————— Forwarded message ----------

From: Elite Automotive <elite.automotivel3 @ gmail.com>

Date: Fri, Jun 22, 2018 at 4:18 PM

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKN977C & SLV6334P ON 18/06/2018
To: claims claims <claims @tohahswee.com.sg>

Hi Elaine,

Kindly refer to attached report. Thanks!

Regards,



Christy

On 22 June 2018 at 14:57, claims claims <claims @tohahswee.com.sg> wrote:
Dear Yen/ Christy

So sorry for the miss attach herewith attached the Log Card.

company UEN: 199100474W

Thank you

Thanks & Best Rgds,

Sally / Elaine Tham

Toh Ah Swee Spray Painting Co.
Tel: 63660286

Fax: 63685943

On Fri, Jun 22, 2018 at 2:52 PM, claims claims <claims @tohahswee.com.sg> wrote:
Dear Christy/ Yen

Please help submit the accident report as following, thank you !

Thanks & Best Rgds,

Sally / Elaine Tham

Toh Ah Swee Spray Painting Co.
Tel: 63660286

Fax: 63685943

Regards,



