Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 28 June 2018 5:09 PM

To: ‘Tan, Rachel'

Cc: 'LKK Assignments'; sur@lkkauto.com; 'Nivitha (LKK Auto)’;
ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Subject: RE: DOA:24.06.18 - TP CLAIM - SHA7223C > GBG1084R - GREAT AMERICAN
INSURANCE

Attachments: SHA 7223C - Preli Advise.pdf

Dear Rachel,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SHA 7223C.

Kindly provide us the claim reference no.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 27 June 2018 9:28 AM

To: 'Tan, Rachel' <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: 'LKK Assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>; sur@lkkauto.com

Subject: RE: DOA:24.06.18 - TP CLAIM - SHA7223C > GBG1084R - GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tan, Rachel [mailto:Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 27 June 2018 9:25 AM

To: Fauzy Bin Mokhtar <fauzy@sparkcarcare.com>

Cc: LKK Assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: DOA:24.06.18 - TP CLAIM - SHA7223C > GBG1084R - GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE

Without prejudice

Dear Sir
Our insured has not reported accident. We will arrange for LKK to conduct PRI on a without prejudice basis.



Dear LKK
Attached TP’s request, please assist.

Regards

Rachel Tan

Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company
Tel: 6804 7846

From: Fauzy Bin Mokhtar <fauzy@sparkcarcare.com>

Sent: Monday, June 25, 2018 6:05 PM

To: General Claims <GeneralClaims@sg.gaig.com>; Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>

Subject: [External] DOA:24.06.18 - TP CLAIM - SHA7223C > GBG1084R - GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE

Hi Motor Claims,

Please refer attached GIA report and estimate to arrange survey.
The taxi was grounded at our workshop on 25.06.18

With Regards

Fauzy Bin Mokhtar

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Taxi Crash Repair Department

DID : 6214- 8319

FAX:: 6546-8156

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.



