Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 10 July, 2018 1:37 PM

To: kangcar@singnet.com.sg

Cc: Kang Car (yahoo; Adrian Ling (LKKAuto); Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Vic
(LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: [resent] Accident involving SKJ8943T (our client) and SHC2635U on 23 Jun 18

LKK REF CC4/11118011686/Ahb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Jeffrey,
We refer to the above matter and to our telephone conversation earlier.

As requested, below is our Insured’s driver statement for your reference.
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Erief Details.

On 23/6/2018 at about 1545hrs | had just alighted a passenger at the Singapore Indoor Stadium. | am a
cab driver driving COMFORT cab bearing number (SHC2635U). | then exited a gantry and before moving
off to the main road along Stadium Walk, | checked both sides if there was any oncoming vehicles. |
decided to move off from the gantry after ensuring there was no other vehicles oncoming. As | began to
drive off towards Kallang theater, suddenly a car (SKJ89431) from my left side hit onto my cab. I wasin a
state of shock and after a minute or two | alighted from my cab to check what had happened. My left knee
had some blood but | am not sure what had hit on. The other car had hit onto mine and had mount a kerb
nearby due to the impact of the collision. The female driver in her early 30s believed to be Chinese
national then, came up to me and inform that she did not see my cab exiting from the gantry thus had hit
onto mine. The driver's parents whom were the passengers of the car also apologized to me saying that
they did not notice my car. | experience some numbess and pain on the back of neck and left leg.
Ambulance then came to my spot and subsequently conveyed me to Tan Tock Seng Hospital. | was
discharged on the same night and was then given 2 days MC by the docter. A traffic police 10 then called
me to lodge a report in regards to this incident. | believe my cab was towed away by Traffic Police. | am
not sure of the repair cost at this moment and | have already informed my COMFORT company. There is
an in-built camera in my cab provided by my COMFORT company.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 10 July, 2018 11:50 AM

To: kangcar@singnet.com.sg

Cc: Kang Car (yahoo; Adrian Ling (LKKAuto); Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: [resent] Accident involving SKJ8943T (our client) and SHC2635U on 23 Jun 18 LKK REF
CC4/11118011686/Ahb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Wei lJia,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that we are still pending for instructions from our principal.

We will follow up on the matter.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 10 July, 2018 10:42 AM

To: kangcar@singnet.com.sg

Cc: Kang Car (yahoo; Adrian Ling (LKKAuto); Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: FW: [resent] Accident involving SKJ8943T (our client) and SHC2635U on 23 Jun 18

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Please note that: -

LKK ref Officer in charge
CC4/11118011686/Ahb3 Vic

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd [mailto:kangcar@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 10 July 2018 10:07 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Kang Car (yahoo) <kangcarl76@yahoo.com.sg>; Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: [resent] Accident involving SKJ8943T (our client) and SHC2635U on 23 Jun 18

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir/Mdm

Our client's vehicle SKJ8943T was surveyed by Adrian on 26 Jun 18.
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We would like to proceed for Direct Settlement. Appreciate if you can advise on whether your insured has reported
the accident and the liability for this case.

Thank you

Thank you & Regards,
Kong Wei Jia

Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd
Tel: 6747 7636

Fax: 6748 5071



