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Veron Chen ([KKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Wednesday, 27 )une 2018 1 1:03 AM

KKLau; LKK Valuation; SUR; Celine Fong (LKKAuto); OH Vale

RE: Assistance required: Effect MV for XE3648B - Mitsubishi Fuso FV5l SJD2DEA

Dear Vale,

The market value of XE 36488 is $180K-$200K (Estimated) as at May 2018.

Best Regards,

Veron chen I Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, Ubi Avenue I, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: KKLaU

Sent: Tuesday,26 June 2018 11:35 AM
To: LKK Valuation <va luation @ lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@ lkka uto.com>; Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

<celinefong@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Fwd: Assistance required: Effect MV for XE3648B - Mitsubishi Fuso FV5lSJD2DEA

FYA please. KKLaU

Sent from my iPad

Begin forwarded message:

From: HO Vincent <vincent.ho@axa.com.sg>

Date: 26 June 2018 at 8:44:47 AM SGT

To: "bhtav@a utopro be.com.sg" <bhtav@ a utoprobe.com.sg>, "ad min @a utoorobe.com se"

<admin @a utoorobe.com.se>, " iosevloh @a iaxinspection.com " <iq!Cylq-b@,Aiq!!!pe!!-q!.!q!l>,

"frankie@fia.com.sg" <frankie@fta.com.sg>, "motorsurvev(dfta.com.sg"
<motorsu rvev@fta,com.sq>, "benson@lbs-auto.com" <be nson @ lbs-a uto.com>, "nick@ lbs-

auto.com" <nick@ lbs-a uto.com>, "kkla u(d lkkauto.com" <kklau@lkkauto.com>

Cc: OH Vale <va le.o h (a axa.com.sg>, HO Kow Wai <l<owwai, ho @axa.com.sg>, "CHOW Soon Hee

Gene" <gene.chowsh(daxa.com.sg>

Subject: Assistance required: Effect MV for XE3648B - Mitsubishi Fuso FV51SJD2DEA

Dear Partners,

Please assist to provide Ms Vale Oh with the Market Value for this case.

DOA:23/051201-8

Thank you.

. Warmest Rega rds



Vincent Eg
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa com ss

Email: vincent.ho(aaxa.com.sg
DID: (6s) 6880 4349
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Elq!rfr9?4Rf ./C-O-'ERebate.f orRegisteredV=ehjcle
VehicleOwner Particulars

tofr: zdshs

OwnerlDType:

OwnerlD:
. Company

5702G
tAx6)

Vehicle Details
vehicle No: xE3648B

Veh icle to be Exported:

lntended De-reSistration Date: 27 )u.' 2018

ysti*l1tek, rryffi-, trtv, $lSok - $>eF
Vehicle Model: . -- _ 

JUSOFV51SJD2DEA

PrimaryColour: Multi-Colour

ManufacturingYear: 2077

Engin-e No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power output:

: 9q* M.9.!!:1v"ly:l

: Original Registration Date:

oM 4 57 tA4 57 97 2CO3 4 720 4

rvsistnzozs:

$98,598.00

37Oct2017

3TOctZO!7

0

ActualARF Paid:

lntended PARF Rebate Details
$4,930.00

NoPARF Elicibilityl

PARF Elisibility Expiry Date:

PARF RebateAmount:

lhtended COE Rebate Details
COE ExpiryDate:

$0.00

30 Oct2027
C - GoodsVehicle& BuscqF,cjt-"99.t -.

, COE Period{Years):

qp iiid,
10

$51,890.00

coE R,.bate Imount: $41,512.00

Total Rebate Amount:

ffre intormation iontiinediereln is corr..t as at 27 )\n 2078

$47,512.00

OK


