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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 28 August 2018 9:06 AM

To: 'chan pick yuen'

Subject: RE: SJQ4899P DOA 23.06.2018 ***LKK REF:CC6/QBE18011647/eb3 

Attachments: 24866674-a81e-4590-9cb0-2986dca3e0a9.mp4; OI SKETCH PLAN.pdf

Without Prejudice 

 

Hi Chris, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

We attached here with a copy of our insured’s accident statement and for your easy reference. 

 

Our principal has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client rear ended our 

insured vehicle. 

 

We are of the opinion that liability is not in your client’s favor. 

 

Under such a circumstances, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable 

to look into your client’s claim. 

 

Thank You. 

 

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>  

Sent: Monday, 27 August 2018 11:09 PM 

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SJQ4899P DOA 23.06.2018 ***LKK REF:CC6/QBE18011647/eb3  

 

Dear Asher ,  

 

Final Reminder  

 

Case submitted 2 month , is time to offer .  
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Please check & revert to us asap . Thanks  

 

Regards,  

Chris Chan Pick Yuen 

  

    

 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Thursday, August 16, 2018 12:38 PM 

To: chan pick yuen 

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A 

Subject: RE: SJQ4899P DOA 23.06.2018 ***LKK REF:CC6/QBE18011647/eb3  

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi Chris, 

  

We refer to the email below. 

  

Our insured reported, however we are seek further instruction from our principal. 

  

Shall revert to you once our principal approved. 

  

Thank You. 

  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 16 August 2018 12:32 PM 

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SJQ4899P DOA 23.06.2018 ***LKK REF:CC6/QBE18011647/eb3  

  

Dear Asher ,  

  

Without Prejudice  
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This case claim under QBE .  

Please check & revert to us , your insured got report yet ?  

If your insured still no report , I will pass lawyer in next 7 days . Thanks  

  

  

Regards,  

Chris Chan Pick Yuen 

  

    

  

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, August 1, 2018 8:55 AM 

To: chan pick yuen 

Subject: RE: SJQ4899P DOA 23.06.2018 ***LKK REF:CC6/QBE18011647/eb3  

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi Chris, 

  

We refer to the email below. 

 

We have no details of our insured / insured driver, our principal will follow up with our insured. 

  

Shall sent chaser to our principal. 

  

Thank You. 

  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 1 August 2018 8:53 AM 

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SJQ4899P DOA 23.06.2018 ***LKK REF:CC6/QBE18011647/eb3  

  

Dear Asher , 
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Please call & check with your driver direct due to report system always got mistake . I got a lot case , said no 

report but insured already report . Thanks  

  

Get Outlook for iOS 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, August 1, 2018 8:49:29 AM 

To: chan pick yuen 

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: SJQ4899P DOA 23.06.2018 ***LKK REF:CC6/QBE18011647/eb3  

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi Chris, 

  

We refer to the email below. 

  

However we yet to received our insured report till date. 

  

Shall revert to you once we received our insured report. 

  

  

Thank You. 

  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 31 July 2018 9:20 PM 

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SJQ4899P DOA 23.06.2018 ***LKK REF:CC6/QBE18011647/eb3  

  

Dear Sir / Mdm ,  

  

1ST REMINDER  

  

Liability is clear 100% .  
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Our case submitted 1month , please let us have your offer in next 7 days . Thanks   

  

Regards,  

Chris Chan Pick Yuen 

 HP: 92712214 

    

  

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, July 4, 2018 11:11 AM 

To: chan pick yuen 

Subject: RE: SJQ4899P DOA 23.06.2018 ***LKK REF:CC6/QBE18011647/eb3  

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi Chris, 

  

We acknowledge your email below. 

  

However we yet to received our insured report till date. 

  

Shall revert to you once we received our insured report. 

  

Thank You. 

  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  

From: chan pick yuen [mailto:chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 4 July 2018 10:21 AM 

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SJQ4899P DOA 23.06.2018 ***LKK REF:CC6/QBE18011647/eb3  

  

Dear Asher ,  

  

Enclosed is our invoice , GIA report , LOA & Rental Bill with  agreement .  

As request following :  
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1. RC     $3798.50 ( $3550 with 7% gst )  

2. LOR $900 ( $150 X 6 DAYS - 5 days recommend + 1 day weekend )  

  

@ 100% (cut lane with video camera - video already submitted )  

  

Total $4698.50 

  

Please check your insured got file report & liability clear 100% . 

Please let us have your offer soon . Thanks  

  

Regards,  

Chris Chan Pick Yuen 

 GREEN FOREST AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD  
HP: 92712214 

  

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, June 26, 2018 5:33 PM 

To: chan pick yuen 

Cc: assignments; Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) 

Subject: FW: SJQ4899P DOA 23.06.2018 ***LKK REF:CC6/QBE18011647/eb3  

  

Dear Chris, 

  

We refer to the below email. 

  

Please be informed that we are currently pending for our insured’s report. 

  

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Asher at 6841 6051. 

  

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 

  

Thank you 

  

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned. 
  

Best Regards, 
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Shu Pei| Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  

From: chan pick yuen [mailto:chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com]  

Sent: Monday, 25 June 2018 11:10 PM 

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: SJQ4899P DOA 23.06.2018  

  

Dear Sir / Mdm ,  

  

Claim QBE , I will call Mr Adrian to survey tomorrow .  

Enclosed is our client's GIA report & scene video .  

Your insured cut lane & our insured try to avoid but still caused collision .  

Please check your insured got file report & liability is clear 100% in our favour .  

Please let us have your reply soon . Thanks  

  

Regards,  

Chris Chan Pick Yuen 

 GREEN FOREST AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD  
HP: 92712214 


