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51 UBIAVE 1, 801-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : ((65) 62564315

Your Ref: D18004988MFSH Date: 27/7/2018
Our Ref: csFCIB011639/Ktd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO.__SLF 5261G

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
24/7/2018 at the premises of M/s_ Autoworx House and have the following to report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount : 88 5,066.50
Revised Estimate Amount 'S 3.211.63
“Check” Items Amount : 5% 235.65
LTA Reimbursement Value 1 8%

Nett Value 31

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
Front portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully
Kenneth
Automotive Assessor



i i H5 First Capital Insurance Limited coRes Mo 155000106 cat Heg o, ME-DGA1E7E S
MS‘ Flrﬁtcapltﬂl G Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore D4BSED

Tel: (B5)6222 2311 Fax: (65) 6222 3547

Chalms & Heter Undenwriting Depe 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877
Tek (55) 6507 3848 Fax: 65} 6507 3849

wrwmsfirsteapital com.sg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 26-06-2018 Our Ref No. D180043988MFSH
Accident Date 24-06-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHB3502T Third Party Vehicle. SLF5261G
Survey Location C/0 178 SIN MING DRIVE #02-01

Contact Person. MNA,

Contact No. 64528211/ 0 Fax No. 84517420
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

Arpointad LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Surveyor

Contact Person MNA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report,

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop AUTOWORX HOUSE Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor MNA TP Solicitor Fax No., NA
Officer Incharge SITHARA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer generated letter no signature required,

Member of [EREEEN INSURANCE GROUP




Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Sithara <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 June 2018 3:03 PM

To: ‘assignments@lkkauto.com®; SUR; Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Subject: FW: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004988MFSH/1
Attachments: Jobsheet_D18004988MFSH_TPD1 .pdf

Dear Sirs,

Please note our insured reported as below — he mentioned there was no fresh damage to third party's vehicle,

As such, kindly verify on our driver's allegations as well as the consistency of damages to accident.

T e A S O o NN 8 I 1 5 5 O 0 O O O
DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT
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Thanks and regards,

Sithara G §
Motor Claims

E Change of email address

Sitha[g@mgﬁrstcgnftar.;gm.sg

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Rd #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | TEL : 6507 3848 | Fax No. : 6507 3849 |
Company Regn. No, 195000106C

A Hember of INSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

Under the POPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
Please refer to www, msfirstcapital.com.sa for details of POPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential, It may also be legally privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is Intended, you may not copy, forward, disclase ar yse any part of it,

If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender
immediately by return e-mail,

From: CWS Motor Claims

Sent: Tuesday, June 26, 2018 2:57 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cw5motarclaEms@msﬁrstcapital.cum.sg}; Sithara <Sithara@ msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSM ENT - D1B004988MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



‘We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.

Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Denise Taz (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 27 July 2018 10:00 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); ‘Claim Workflow System’; assignments
Cc SITHARA@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004988MFSH/1
Attachments: PRELI ADVISED SLF 5261G.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLF 5261G

Bect Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 26 June 2018 4:24 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: SITHARA@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004988M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 26 June 2018 2:57 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SITHARA@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004988MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,
Admin Team



AUTOWORX HOUSE

C/0.176 SIN MING DRIVE #02-01 SINGAPORE 575721
TEL: 64520715 FAX: 64529250

ESTIMATE ﬁ
7 & 7 ¢504
A/i’;,,
Thames Limousine Services LLP % /%m?’
clo 46 Lentor Plain &
Singapore 786548 ,
Date: 10/7/2016
QUANTITY PARTICULARS AMOUNT ($)
RE: TOYOTA WISH / SLF 5261 G
1 po Weithonise PO % 867.90| —
1 pc front bonnet emblem r) T 67.40| —
1 pc front bumper “/ e 675.40 —
1pc front bumper reinforcement #T B77.00| x
1 pc front bumper top grille j’{;-ff: Cer  467.30| —
1 pc front bumper sponge he 314.20 K
6 pc front bumper grille clip @ 3.70 e 22.20|—
2 pc front head lamp el by @ 975.30 1,950.60 L+
sub total 4,942.00
less 25% 1,235.50
sub total 3,706.50
1 pc front number plate 5.nett sz, 35.00 }f’
1 pc front number plate casing 5.nett 35.00) <
To remove and replace the parts mentioned above, panel beat g’cl’ﬁ(/
and realign the necessary affected areas. 600.00
To check wiring system. 40.00| 7=/
&
To apply putty & spray painting on affected areas. 650.00 F‘-?'
y‘ K Auto Consultants hence natife 11
’ ‘ﬂ: f:s & | 5,066.50
¥ -_. daplay o amaged part]s II
o : |

- —

Pg1af1



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapare 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg, Mo; 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-36071968-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Raf CS/FCIB011639/Kid3n2
16 01 Gt HOUBESRGARCRE 68aT7 P 24102018 IH”"'N“'“”'M m
Code - FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SHE 35027 Veh. Inspected SLF 5261G
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. D18004988MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From SITHARA Assign Date 26/06/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAWISH (A) c.c 1798
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. JTDGG20W40J005030 Colour METALLIC SILVER
Odometer 164318 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOCD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/65R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/65 R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |19565R15 YOKOHAMA & rmm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/65 R15 YORKOHAMA & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5, General Information
Accident Date  24/06/2018 Inspection Date 24/07/2018
Eunrey held at AUTOWORX HOUSE
176 SIN MING DRIVE
#02-01
SINGAPORE 575721
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE"” BASIS
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|ESTIMATE'D NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Awve 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL. B256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607198-R Page No..1of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLF 5261G
L Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ﬂj}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BONNET BENT BE7 .90 79313
1|FRONT BONNET EMBLEM NECESSARY 67.40 B7.40
1|FRONT BUMPER DENTED/ B75.40 87540
BUCKLED
1|FRONT BUMFER REINFORCEMENT TO REPAIR SEE 577.00
LABOUR
1|FRONT BUMPER TOP GRILLE cuT 467.30 361.64
1|FRONT BUMPER SPONGE SERVICEABLE 314,20 -
&|FRONT BUMPER GRILLE CLIP @3$3.70 NECESSARY 22.20 22.20
2|FRONT HEAD LAMP @$975.30 oIS CUT 1,950.60 97530
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -1,235.50 .723.82
3,706.50 2,171.45
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT NUMBER PLATE (SN} } BENT 35.00 45.00
1|FRONT NUMBER PLATE CASING (SN} } BENT 35.00 -
70.00 45.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE AND REPLACE THE PARTS MENTIONED 600.00 400.00
ABOVE,PANEL BEAT AND REALIGN THE NECESSARY
AFFECTED AREAS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF
FROMT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT
TO CHECK WIRING SYSTEM. 40.00 20.00
TO APPLY PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED 650.00 440.00
AREAS
1,280.00 860.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,066.50 3,076.45
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,450.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No, CS/FC118011638/Ktd3n2

Y éva

KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser

HSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report I8 made solely for the use and benefit of the Clisnt named on the front page of this Repod.




