Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 26 June 2018 11:01 AM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'; assignments
Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG'; Admin A

Subject: RE: PRI ET9933J) DOA:25.6.2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 26 June 2018 9:50 AM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: FW: PRI ET9933) DOA:25.6.2018

Dear Catherine,

Kindly proceed with the pre-repair survey as
Advised.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Accord Claims(AV) [mailto:avclaims@mycarworkshop.com.sq]
Sent: Tuesday, 26 June, 2018 9:48 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: Re: PRI ET9933] DOA:25.6.2018

Dear Gerald,
Re-send with attached file.

Thank you.



Kind regards,
Celia Lai

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd
Blk 1009 Bukit Merah Lane 3
#01-80

Singapore 159723

Mobile: (65) 9274 0999
Tel :(65) 6271 7433
Fax :(65) 6274 5715

This email is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view,
disseminate, use or copy this email. Kindly notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from
your system. Thank you.

On Tue, Jun 26, 2018 at 9:46 AM, Accord Claims(AV) <avclaims @mycarworkshop.com.sg> wrote:
Dear Gerald,

Kindly refer attached file for your reference.

Thank you.

Kind regards,
Celia Lai

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd
Blk 1009 Bukit Merah Lane 3
#01-80

Singapore 159723

Mobile: (65) 9274 0999
Tel :(65) 6271 7433
Fax :(65) 6274 5715

This email is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view,

disseminate, use or copy this email. Kindly notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from
your system. Thank you.

On Tue, Jun 26, 2018 at 9:29 AM, GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh @]lonpac.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Celia,



Please see attached and revert to us.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Accord Claims(AV) [mailto:avclaims@mycarworkshop.com.sq]
Sent: Monday, 25 June, 2018 8:09 PM

To: CHEW BENG KEE

Cc: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Subject: PRI ET9933] DOA:25.6.2018

Dear Officer In Charge,

Kindly arrange survey as above mentioned and please provide us 10 surveyor name list.

Thank you!

Kind regards,
Celia Lai

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd
Blk 1009 Bukit Merah Lane 3

#01-80



Singapore 159723

Mobile: (65) 9274 0999
Tel :(65) 6271 7433
Fax :(65) 6274 5715

This email is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view,
disseminate, use or copy this email. Kindly notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from
your system. Thank you.



