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_' == {!“ G;T:;mr.:n!s
T Pre Lid Campany Raglstration No. 15960T198R
5] URLAVE L. §02-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAN : (65) HIE64X15
Your Ref: SGQ9002M/SL/pl Date: 27 June 2018

Our Ref: CS/EGI18011595/Ksd3

The Motor Claims Department
ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _ SLA 7913Y .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 26/06/2018 at the premises of M/s Optima Werkz Pte Ltd and have the following to
report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :5%  6911.52
Revised Estimate Amount :8%  3.302.32
“Check™ Items Amount ;8% 923,60
Market Value 1 5%
LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5%
Nett Value 1 8%

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the rear portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 6 Days

Yours faithfully,
Kenneth Kong
Automotive Assessor



Nivitha (LKK Auto)
“

From: survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 June 2018 10:45 AM

To: ‘admin-d@Ilkkauto.com’

Cc: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Subject: Ol : 5GQ9002M / TP : SLAT913Y/LKK / DOA : 22/06/2018

Attachments: 5GQY002ZM - SAS.pdf; SLAT913Y - SAS.pdf; SLAT913Y - PRS FORM.pdf; SLA7913Y -

estimate.pdf

Dear Catherine,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016” in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,

both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single loint Expert”,

Please conduct this survey request from OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD,
ADDRESS : 9A SERANGOON NORTH AVE 5 (PLEASE AVOID 1-2PM)
SINGAPORE 554500

PERSON TO CONTACT : MSRIZA @ 6484 9919 EXT 105
ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : STEVE LIM

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Please advise the consistency of damages to third party vehicle.
Obtain estimate from workshop and inform the repairer in writing, that you are require to conduct a re-survey
before vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey

status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are insured and TP's SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party). No estimates was provided.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Thank you

Yee PeiLi

Claims Assistant (Motor)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd

5 Temasek Boulevard

#04-01 Suntec Tower Five

Singapore 038985

Tel.: 65 6829 9199 DID: 65 6820 9194
Fax: 65 6820 9247

Website: www.ergo.com.sg

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO is represented in more than 30 countries
and concentrates on Europe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's leading risk carriers,



Date:
Our Reference:

Your Reference:

Ta:

26.06.2018

5GQ 9002M/5L/pl

SLA 7913Y

OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD

Pre-Repair Survey {PRS) Acknowledgement

Vehicle Far Inspection: SLA 7913Y

Insured's Vehicla:

Date Of Accident:

5GQ 5002M

22.06.2018

We acknowledge receipt of your request for PRS an:

22.06.2018

ERGO

Sent via Fax

ar

Email
riza@ow.sg

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016", do select an assessor from

the list below and indicate your selection in the box marked *.

#*

AlS Automobile Inspection Services Pte Lid LBS L.B.5 Auto Consultants Pre Ltd
FTA FormTeam Consultancy Pte Lid LKK LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
145 Infiniti Appraisal Service PS Priority Services

IPK JP Knights Pte Ltd VAC Vicom Ltd

Owr Insured’s driver has not reported the accident to us todate.

Your request for inspection does not have your client's cost of repair estimate, kindly forward a capy.
Your request for inspection does nat have your client's GIA report, kindly forward a copy.

We acknowledge your interest for direct settlement, we will assess & revert soon upon receipt of estimate,

V' |others;  OFFICER-IN-CHARGE - STEVE LIM
Prepared by: w_\_/ Pei Li 68299194 claims@ ergo.com.sg
Signature: g FAX : 6829 9247
Assessor use only: Workshop use only:
Assessor attend rkahop on:

Assignment Date:
Assignment Time:

Remarks:

Date:
Time
Inspectar:

D Vehicle not avallable at the appointed date and time.

Kindly acknowled ge our Assessor presence for the abave job .

Workshop Acknowledgement & Stamp.
Note: Our Inspection is on a without admission to Nabillity basis.




Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Lily.loi@ow.sg

Sent: Monday, 17 September 2018 10:02 AM

To: 'Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)’; ‘Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)'

Cc WINSON 'Riza’; 'Adeline Lim'; 'LKK - Main'

Subject: RE: To finalize for vehicle SLA7913Y Honda Vezel DOA 22 June 2018

Dear Shirley,

We confirm and accept COR PP $5286.81 and 6 days.

Thanks & Best Regards,

Lily Loi (Ms)
Motor Claims Department
Serangoon Branch

OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD

6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 | Tel: (+65) 6472 1313 | Fax: (+65) 6472 2112 | 9A Serangoon North Avenue 5
Singapore 554500 | Tel: (+65) 6484 9919 | Fax: (+65) 6481 1011 |

551 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415 | Tel: (+65) 6452 6868 | Fax: (+65) 6452 9223 | www.OW.58
www.facebook.com/optimawerkz

----- Original Message-—-

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com=

Sent: Monday, 17 September, 2018 10:00 AM

To: 'Lily Loi' <Lily.Loi@ow.sg>; 'Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)' <kKennethKong@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: "WINSON' <winson@ow.sg>; 'Riza’ <riza@ow.sg>; 'Adeline Lim' <adeline@ow.sg>; 'LKK - Main'
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: To finalize for vehicle SLA7913Y Honda Vezel DOA 22 June 2018

Dear Lily,

Please confirm final fig 55,286.81 (part by part) @ 6 days of repairs before GST.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25
| 5(408933)

From; Lily Loi [mailto:Lily.Loi@ow.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 19 July 2018 3:00 PM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethkKong @lkkauto.com>

Cec: WINSON <winson@ow.sg>; Riza <riza@ow.sg>; Adeline Lim <adeline@ow.sg>; LKK - Main <sur@lkkauto.com=>
Subject: Re: To finalize for vehicle SLA7913Y Honda Vezel DOA 22 June 2018

1



Dear Kenneth,

Kindly confirm the finalise amount COR P/P $5,701.20 and 8 days.

Thanks & Best Regards,

Lily Loi (Ms)

Claims Executive

Tel: +65 6484-9919 (ext.107)
Fax: +65 6481-1011

OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD

6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 | Tel: (+#65) 6472 1313 | Fax: (+65) 6472 2112 | 9A Serangoon MNorth Avenue 5
Singapore 554500 | Tel: (+65) 6484 9919 | Fax: (+65) 6481 1011

551 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415 | Tel: (+65) 6452 6868 | Fax: (+65) 6452 9223 | www.ow.5g
www.facebook.com/optimawerkz

On 11/7/2018 11:24 AM, Lily Loi wrote:

> Dear Kenneth,

-

> TP Claims - SLA7913Y Honda Vezel DOA 22 June 2018

-

> As spoken to you with regard to the finalize case.

>

> Attached are the surveyed estimate repair, resurvey photos and after
> repair photos for your perusal.

=

> Please advise to be finalize for this case soonest possible.

>

> Your assistance would be much appreciated.

>

= Thank you.

>

>

> Thanks & Best Regards,

>

> Lily Loi (Ms)

> Claims Executive

> Tel: +65 6484-9919 (ext.107)

> Fax: +65 6481-1011

>

> OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD

> 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 | Tel: (+65) 6472 1313 | Fax: (+65)
> 6472 2112 |

> 9A Serangoon North Avenue 5 Singapore 554500 | Tel: (+65) 6484 9919 |
> Fax: (+65) 6481 1011)

> 551 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415 | Tel: (+65) 6452 6868 | Fax:
> (+65) 6452 9223 |

> WWW.OW.58

> www.facebook.com/optimawerkz

-

> 0n4,/7/2018 8:00 PM, WINSON wrote:

»> Dear Kenneth,

=



>> TP Claims - SLA7913Y Honda Vezel DOA 22 June 2018

>

>> As spoken to you with regard to the finalize case.

>>

>> Attached are the surveyed estimate repair, resurvey photos and after

>> repair photos for your perusal.
>3

»> Please advise to be finalize for this case soonest possible.
2>

>> Your assistance would be much appreciated.

>

>> Thank you.
=
-



Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 June 2018 5:03 PM

To: ‘Mivitha (LKK Auto)’; 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)"
assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM; sur@'kkauto.com

Subject: RE: SGQY002M / TP : SLAT913Y/LKK / DOA : 22/06/2018

Attachments: SLA 7913Y - Preli Advise.pdf

Dear Pei Li,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SLA 7913Y.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

shirley Hiew | Case Handlier

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408923)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 26 June 2018 10:59 AM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>; assignments@Ikkauto.com
Cc: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM; sur@lkkauto.com

Subject: RE: SGQ9002M / TP : SLA7913Y/LKK / DOA : 22/06/2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G Nivitha | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4:315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) [mailto:Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg)
Sent: Tuesday, 26 June 2018 10:45 AM

To: 'admin-d@lkkauto.com' <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Cc: &SSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTD.CDM

Subject: Ol : SGQI002M /TP : SLA7913Y/LKK / DOA : 22/06/2018

Dear Catherine,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please conduct this survey request from OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD,
1



ADDRESS . 9A SERANGOON NORTH AVE 5 (PLEASE AVOID 1 - 2PM)
SINGAPORE 554500

PERSON TO CONTACT . MS RIZA @ 6484 9919 EXT 105
ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE @ STEVELIM

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Please advise the consistency of damages to third party vehicle.
Obtain estimate from workshop and inform the repairer in writing, that you are require to conduct a re-survey
before vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are insured and TP’s SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party). No estimates was provided.
Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Ihank you

Yee Pei Li

Claims Assistant (Mator)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd

5 Temasek Boulevard

#04-01 Sunlec Tower Five

Singapore 038985

Tel- 65 6829 9195 DID: 65 6829 9194
Fax 656829 9247

Wiahsite: www erqo.com. g

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO is represented in more than 30 countnes
and concentrates on Europe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's leading nsk carmriers.



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Wehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

COwner 10k

WVehicle Details

Wehicle Moz

Vehicle ta be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Wehicle Make:

YWehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis Ma.:

raximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period{Years}:

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amaount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein iz correct as at 23 Jun 2018

Singapare NRIC
4087G

SLATP13Y

No

23 Jun 2018
HONDA

WEZEL 1.55CVT
White

2015
L15B4024324
RU11104321
960kW (128 bhp)
$20,847.00

17 Mar 2016

17 Mar 2016

0

$16,186.00

Yes
16 Mar 2026
$12.139.00

16 Mar 2024

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW [130bhp)
10

%4.3,000.00

$33.215.00

$45,354.00

Page | of |

https://vrl.Ita.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateBy PublicBeforeDere gInput?FUNCTION_ID=F030400... 6/23/2018



OptiMA WERKZ PTELTD

Head office

: 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 Tel: +65 6472 1313 Fax: +656472 2112

Branch office : 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500 Tel : +65 6484 9919 Fax : +65 6481 1011

Co. Reg. No. 201212455W

Date: 22 lune 2018 Third Party Insurer: . ERGO

Vehicle No:  SLA7913Y Third Party Veh No: SGQ2002ZM

Model: HONDA VEZEL Date of Accident: 22 June 2018

Chassis: RU11104321

ESTIMATE
QTy o ~ DESCRIPTION UNIT S$ AMOUNT 5%

1 REARTAILGATE . 72, $953.30 —
1 REAR TAILGATE WINDSCREEN MOULDING - e, $120.00 «—o
1 REAR TAILGATE "VEZEL" EMBLEM - - | Ae, $3290 —
1 REAR TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD Ju~ $153.40
1 REAR TAILGATE REFLECTOR LAMP LH fin 5264.60 X

REAR TAILGATE MECHANISM LOCK

(.

et 5216.20 —*

1 REARTAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP 47 519800 —
1 REAR TAILLAMP LH Gn  $487.50 —
1 REAR BUMPER CENTER /% $528.30 —
1 REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR LH P~ $151.40 X
8 REAR BUMPER CLIP - $3.90 e, 53120 —
2 REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH/RH ) 51450 [~ $29.00 A
1 REAR SIDE BUMPER LH - S~ $19500 X
1 REAR END PANEL 2,  $470.30
1 REAR END PANEL TAILGATE ANTENA SENSOR BUZZER Crp 8500 T
1 REAR END PANEL INNER TOP GARNISH | et $98.00 —
1 REAR FENDER ARCH GARNISH LH : P 519200 X
1 REARWELLPANELLOWERUNDERCOVER A $213.20 >
REAR WELL PANEL LOWER UNDER COVER CLIP 5880 Ar  517.60 7
| REAR WELL PANEL INNER TOP TOOLS SPONGE Crgp 521500 €~
' SUB TOTAL ~ $4,651.90
oy Air b oy s Less 20% ~ -$930.38
PARTS TOTAL $3,721.52
P /-4, ALLL e
Ty B, a7
t b,

95/3%.2¢
e st

* Parts prices ars i
» . = NI T e 5

Third party SUTVEY 18 0N 3 “Withay dice” ha

i JUl Frejudice” basi

* No illegal mod .‘.-;'a'.h;.". 5) 1§ aowed h
-E:.un,:'-:-:"senk\- temys) must , ey fl nd

1% ik . | e .

% subject 1o final ‘j:-r"‘ val f_pr"l RSLrance

Dy

Ackn ':W.‘.N'}f_'.ll_‘ d by Renairer

Signature: Page1




OptimA WERKZ PTELTD

Head office : 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143

Tel: +65 6472 1313 Fax: +65 6472 2112

Branch office : 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500 Tel : +65 6484 9919 Fax : +65 6481 1011

Co. Reg. No. 201212455W

Date: 22 June 2018 Third Party Insurer: ERGO
Vehicle No:  SLA7913Y Third Party Veh No: SGQOS002M
Model: HONDA VEZEL Date of Accident: 22 June 2018
Chassis: RU11104321
ESTIMATE S
ary o SPECIAL NETT - UNIT 55 AMOUNT S5
1 REAR TAILGATE WINDSCREEN SEALANT WITH PRIMER e, $100.00 Pore
1 REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR N Lot 528000 Zocyn
- S/N TOTAL $380.00
LABOUR CHARGES:
TO REMOVE & REPLACED WITH PANEL BEATING ALL ACCIDENT PORTION $1,000.00 ;ﬂ’f

TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING WITH SEALANT ALL ACCIDENT PORTION
TO TUFF KOTE / ANTI-RUST

TO CHECK WIRING WITH WATER LEAKAGE TEST

TO DISMANTLE 8 REINSTALL REAR TAILGATE REVERSE CAMERA

TO DISMANTLE & REPLACED REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR

TO REMOVE AND REINSTALL REAR WINDSCREEN PERFORM AND
WATER LEAK TEST

TO DISMANTLE & REINSTALL INTERIOR CARPET WITH OTHER ATTACHMENT
PARTS COMPONENT TO FACILITATE REPAIR

LABOURTOTAL

WINSON TOTAL

Page 2

$1,000.00 cf::.?—

$80.00 J#{

$60.00 Zer
$80.00 Ser

$80.00 Sy
$150.00 /22y

$360.00 42/

$2,810.00

$6,911.52



Optima WERKZ PTE LTD

Head office : 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143

A

Tel: +65 6472 1313 Fax: 4656472 2112

Branch office : 34 Serangoon North Ave § Singapore 554500 Tel : +65 6484 9919 Fax : +65 6481 1011

Co. Reg. No. 201212455W

Date: 22 June 2018 = Third Party Insurer: ERGO
Vehicle No:  SLA7913Y Third Party Veh No: SGA2002M
Model: HONDA VEZEL Date of Accident: 22 Jjune 2018
Chassis: RU11104321
B ESTIMATE
Qry DESCRIPTION ~ UNITS§ | AMOUNT % |
| 1 REARTAILGATE ' = 2, §5EEE0 —
|1 REARTAILGATE WINDSCREEN MOULDING A 00} ——
| 1 REAR TAILGATE “VEZEL” EMBLEM | A, 5 -
|1 REAR TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD S ol
_ 1 [REAR TAILGATE REFLECTOR LAMP LA ] A A |sibdieo 3 )
1 REAR TAILGATE MECHANISM LOCK o | = Pt e
1 [REARTAMGATEWEATHERSTRIE | | %~ 515800 —
|1 [REARTAILLAMP Li _ _ | 4r semsop—
1 [EARBUMPERGENTER T 7% omem
|1 REARBUMPERREFLECTORLN Lo | 4 sisia0
B [REAR BUMPER CLIP - 1  $390 e 13120 —
2 REAR BUMPER SIDF RETAINER LH/RH ; 51450 f $2900 &
1 REARSIDEBUMPERLW | -
1 [REARENDPANEL _ i ;
1 REAR END PANEL TAILGATE ANTENA SENSOR BUZZER I
|1 REAR END PANEL INNER TOP GARNISH - ‘ j}
T T T — T B
1 REARWELL PANEL LOWER UNDERCOVER IR
2 REAR WELL PANEL LOWER UNDER COVER CLIP (I 58.8
1 |REAR WELL PANEL INNER TOP TOOLS SPONGE < + e sl
B/ S—— O
VT Aithoyy — esin S903 455 ¢
/{ e PARTS TOTAL SHT2L521 34 1. 34
A
e, B¢ Petics
i L =
&5};& GDK . = ﬁ"ﬁ/.:;s,.f L F -
LKK Auto Consultants hence o,
hManhnfuibuwmg
® T0 resurvey beforelafier spray paning
'hmmﬂﬂ:imamm
::ﬂm"“_‘"‘“m
8003 "W "
:Mlzwm";m:umﬁwm'
8011l 5 Fo s o
Ackficwiedged by Reparer Page 1
S nature



Oprima WeRKz pre L1p

Head office  : 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 Tel : +65 6472 1313 Fax : +65 6473 2112
Branch office - 94 serangoan Nerth Ave 5 Singapore 554500 Tel : +65 6484 9919 Fax : +65 6481 1011
Co. Reg. No. 201212455w

Date: 22 lune 2018 e _ Third Pa&}_r;u-l'_ér: ___Eﬁég_ N
Vehicle No:  SLA7913y Third Party Veh No: 5GQ5002Mm
Model: HONDA VEZEL Date of Accident: 22 June 2018
Chassis: RU11104321
S o __ ESTIMATE e i
Qry _ SPECIAL NETT . uniTss | AMQEJT 5 ]
L [REAR TAILGATE WINDSCREEN SEALANT WiTH {PRIMER | f&\ 510000 Feze
1 ﬂean BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR Sl e ______t' Sert $2 uuuj&hq.,.,
T e - S/NTOTAL 5 g 538000 740

LABOUR CHARGES: w-

TO REMOVE & REPLACED WITH PANEL BEATING AL ACCIDENT PORTION fm{ St.o0000 T
TD PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING WITH SEALANT ALL ACCIDENT PORTION opﬂ-"’t’ $1,000.00
TO TUFF KOTE / ANTI-RUST { #¢ 58000 2,,7#
10 CHECK WIRING WITH WATER LEAKAGE TEST 360.00 Zgy
TO DISMANTLE & REINSTALL REAR TAILGATE REVERSE CAMERA $30.00 Far
TO DISMANTLE & REPLACED REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR $80.00 5
TO REMOVE AND REINSTALL REAR WINDSCREEN PERFORM AND i
WATER LEAK TEST S150.00 “Zg
TO DISMANTLE & REINSTALL INTERIOR CARPET WITH OTHER ATTACHMENT
PARTS COMPONENT TO FACILITATE REPAIR $360.00 4G
LABOURTOTAL _ 52,810.00
el 280
B i e TOTAL e
£ - 2 W 20
- & e .co
L - & 200 op




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315
Reg, Mo: 198607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8507108-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CS/EGIB011505/Ksd3n2

LM

ERGO INSURANCE PTELTD Ref

5 TEMASEK BOULEVARD

#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date :  17-09-2018
SINGAPCRE 038985
Code: EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. S5GQ s002M Veh. Inspected SLA T913Y
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DSMPC1801206 Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From YEE PEI LI Assign Date 26/06/2018
& Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA VEZEL (A) c.c 1456
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. RU11104321 Colour METALLIC PEARL WHITE
Odometer 36833 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOCD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/55 R17 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/55R17 DUNLOP & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/55 R17 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/55 R17 DUNLOP & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  22/06/2018 |Inspection Date 26/06/2018
Survey held at OPTIMAWERKZ PTE LTD
g4 SERANGOON NORTH AVE 5
SINGAPORE 554500
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON AWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjlM ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 6 Working Days




TEL: 6256 3561 FA

X, 6256 43135

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 10-0607198-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLA 7913Y

Page Mo, 1 of 2

Estimate Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition | =S mmp?;}] ﬁ{
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR TAILGATE BENT 953,30 953 30
1|REAR TAILGATE WINDSCREEN MOULDING MECESSARY 120.00 120.00
1|REAR TAILGATE "VEZEL" EMBLEM MECESSARY 3280 32.80
1|REAR TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD SERVICEABLE 1653.40
1|REAR TAILGATE REFLECTOR LAMP LH SERVICEABLE 264 60
1|REAR TAILGATE MECHANISM LOCK DENTED 216.20 216,20
1|REAR TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP cuT 198.00 198.00
1|REAR TAILLAMP LH CuTt 487 50 487 .50
1|REAR BUMPER CENTER BENT 528.30 528.30
1|REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR LH SERVICEABLE 151.40
8|REAR BUMPER CLIP @3$3.90 NECESSARY 31.20 31.20
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH/RH @314.50 SERVICEABLE 29.00 -
1|REAR 5IDE BUMPER LH SERVICEABLE 195.00 -
1|REAR END PAMEL BENT 470.30 470.30
1|REAR END PAMEL TAILGATE ANTENA SENSOR BUZZER |CRACKED 85.00 B5.00
1|REAR END PAMNEL INMER TOP GARNISH DENTED 98.00 98.00
1|REAR FENDER ARCH GARMISH LH MTG CRACKED 192 .00 192 00
1|REAR WELL PANEL LOWER UNDER COVER CRACKED 213.20 213.20
2|REAR WELL PANEL LOWER UNDER COVER CLIP @%8.80 NECESSARY 17.60 17.60
1|REAR WELL PANEL INNER TOP TOOLS SPONGE CRACKED 215.00 215.00
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -930.38 -771.689
3.721.52 3,086.81
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1 Rsi]AR TAILGATE WINDSCREEN SEALANT WITH PRIMER NECESSARY 100.00 40.00
(SN)
1|REAR BEUMPER REVERSE SENSOR (SN) SCRATCHED 280,00 200.00
3B0.00 240.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE & REPLACED WITH PANEL BEATING ALL 1,000.00 800.00
ACCIDENT PORTION.

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18011595/Ksd3n2




' Pl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

.-—f; A 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408033
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 5256 4315
Reg, No: 199607198 GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.-2 of 2
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition

i i Workshop (5)] _ (8)
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING WITH SEALANT ALL 1,000.00 800.00
ACCIDENT PORTION
TO TUFF KOTE/ANTI-RUST 80.00 60.00
TO CHECK WIRING WITH WATER LEAKAGE TEST £0.00 20.00
TO DISMANTLE & REINSTALL REAR TAILGATE REVERSE 80.00 50.00
CAMERA.
TO DISMANTLE & REPLACED REAR BUMPER REVERSE 80.00 50,00
SENSOR
TO REMOVE AND REINSTALL REAR WINDSCREEN 150.00 120.00
PERFORM AND WATER LEAK TEST
TO DISMANTLE & REINSTALL INTERIOR CARPET WITH 360.00 60.00
OTHER ATTACHMENT PARTS COMPONENT TO
FACILITATE REPAIR.

2,810.00 1,960.00

GRAND TOTAL 6,911.52 5,286.81
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | 5,286.81

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18011595/Ksd3n2
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KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repart Is made solely for the use and bersfit of the Client namsed o0 1he frant page of this Repart.
o amy third party wha may resly on the Repert wholly o in par, Any third party acting of repiving on this




