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Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd

| kaks Buki Ave o, #0200 Antobay i kaki Bukn Singapore 4 | TRES
[EL: 6747 Tadé FAN aTIR 3071 Epunl kingeara smgmet com sg
UGS T MMM A

M/S:  CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE

3 ANSON ROAD Estimate No:  EST1800188
#16-00 SPRINGLEATF TOWER Date: 22 Jun 2018
SINGAPORE 079909
TEL: 63896111 FAX: 62247175 Veh Reg Not SKLA150E
ATTIN: Motor Claim Department Make Model TOYOTAVIOS E
GRADE AUTO
X1 Tor ¢ ChasisNo:  MRIBTOF34010472147
Claim Type: Third Party Reg. Date: O8/11/2013
Accident Date: 217062018 Your Ref No: GBD6323/
TP Veh Reg No:  GBD65237
Estimate Repair Cost to Vehicle No :SKL4150E
Quantity  Description List Price Amount
List Pri = =
1 Price ]
| IPC  REAR RIGHT FENDER Prsteded. 45920 86320 =
2 |PC REAR RIGHT TAIL Lfi'l-l’_(lﬂi p 109440 35790«
3 | PC REAR BUMPER & 482.10 =
4 IPC  REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER A~ 113.90
1.817.10
Less 25% 45428  1362.84
Special Net /
5 I SET  REAR RIGHT STICKERS 7, 1Y 190,00 v~
6 ISET  REAR BUMPER STICKER 195.00 —
7 I PC  REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT f GO0 2o
8 IPC  REAR WINDSCREEN INNER SEAL | 6080° J
505.00 505.00
Labour
9 | TO CHECK WIRING (Y sppe—23v
10 | TO SPRAY PAINTING DAMAGED PORTION, INCLUDING 1,000,00° 4
SUPPLY OF PAINT MATERIALS
I ( REMOVE AND REFIT SEAT CUSHION 20060~ 6o
12 | REMOVE AND REFIT WINDSCREEN 120:60° 7 o

: 137000 1.370.00
Poned MV-% 3ot Loy



Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd

| bkt Fukin Ave b, 90200 Auvobayu kaky Bukin Singapore 417883
THL: AT4T Todb FAN T8 2071  Emml: kangosr «ingnet. com
ST 20 30020 %

M/S: CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE

3 ANSON ROAD Estimate No:  ESTIS00188
#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER Date: 22 Jun 2018
SINGAPORE 079909
TEL: 63896111 FAX: 62247175 Veh Reg No: SKLAIS0E
ATTN: Motor Claim Department Make'Model:  TOYOTA VIOS E
GRADE ALTO
Chasis No: MRIBTOF34010472147
Claim Type: Third Pary Reg. Date: 081172013
Accident Date: 21/06/2018 Your Ref No:  GBD6523/4

TP Veh Reg No: GBD65237

I;g_@y_tr l_l_ega_lr Cost to Vehicle No :SK1L4150E

Quantity  Deseription List Price Amount

= — sS >
Total 5% 3.237.84

Add G5T @ 7% 226.65

Toml Amount Pavahle S% 3,464 .40

TOTAL: SINGAPORE DOLLAR THREE THOUSAND FOUR HUNDRED SIXTY FOUR AND CENTS
FORTY NINE ONLY

This is only an estimate based on our preliminary inspection and does not cover additional parts, labour
time which may be required after work has begun.

For Kang Car Repairers Pre Lid

AUTHORISED SIGNATURE
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 28 August 2018 B:24 AM

To: ‘claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com’

Cc jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com’; Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBDE523Z (O : CTI - SNM18D03116C02)
and SKL4150E (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18011506/Apa3) on 21/06/2018

Attachments: TP ESTIMATE_MARKED pdf; Preliminary Advice - SKL 4150E pdf; LKK Survey
Photos.pdf

You Ref: SNM18D03114C02
Dear Sirs/Madam,

We reler to the above matter,
Enclosed for your perusal is; -

- Esfimated cost of repair
Preliminary advice
- Photographs of TP vehicle in its domoged condition

Best Regands,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultunts Pre Lud

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: ghewht@lkkauto com | ficc: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrinl Park, Ubt Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{4089:13)

From: Mei Kwan [LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 25 June 2018 7:04 PM

To: ‘claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com’ <claimsdept @sg.cntaiping.com>

Ce: 'jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com' <jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Angie Foo <angie.foo@sg.cntaiping.com>; Hsiao
Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBDB523Z (Ol : CT1 - TBA) and SKL4150E (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CT118011506/Apa3) on 21/06/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case.

We had inspected the vehicle SKL 4150E at M/s Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd - Kaki Bukit.



En;:l:rsed herewith a copy of TP’s GIA report for your perusal.

Please be informed that the estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.

We will revert to you on preliminary advice in due course.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report and claim reference for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned,

Thank vouw,

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@@lkkouto com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408043)



Hsiao Tunﬂ !LI[KAutuZ

From: Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd <kangcar@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 14 September 2018 11:40 AM

To: CS A Team

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A; Kang Car (yahoo)

Subject: LOD:ACCDT INVLG SKL4150E & GBD6523Z ON 21.06.2018
Attachments: LOD.SKL4150E.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

To: The Claims Officer-in-charge
We refer to the above accident and attach herewith our LOD for your reference.

Please let us have your offer to settle our client's claim asap.

Thank you & Regards,
Sharon

Kang Caor Repairers Ple Ltd
Tel: 6747 7636

Fox: 4748 5071



Inbu INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD

5 ‘ IDAC T NOTLINE
[STA Inspection 655SGH8R
VICOM Assesamient Centre | 1H00-2255822
CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

RETTEI VERICLES (THIRB-PAR TY IISKS AMIZ CUMPENSATION) ACT (CHAPTER 189) " _
AEFTEI VIHEELER (THHR-PAKTY LSS AN COMMENEATION) RULIE, (960 ROAD TRANSPORT ATT. [UAT (R0 ATEIA)
MOTOR VETICLES (THIRD-PARTY RISKS) RULEN, 1957 (MALAYSIA)

This ceniftenie kb nol imnlerable (o o mew owner of he vehicle. 1 Tbr any romson the lomme S yerminuted during nE ooy e Cdr et momi
be renimed 10 the Insurer. o i e Certilicatic has begn |ost or destroyed o Statuiary Declaration @ that effect muat be made  Duduc b cimply it this
prbliggnd bisn dn n effonce ynder the keglsiation relaling Lo compulsory Insurance

The Cenificate miist be retwrmed iTthe fresurance is susponded during its cureney.

Ageney Code:  1082TSE Lxeoss: NIl (Employees enly) .

Comprehensive $500/- Sect. | (Authorized Drivers including Lenrney
Drivers) & additional $2000/- Sect. | for age < 21 years &lor
the holder of a Provisional Driving Licence (Excl. Learner

Drivers of CDC)
CERTIFICATE NO. M489523 6
- Indes Mark sad Megistrntlon - SKL4IS0E ~ t \
Punher ul ¥kl
L N f Plicy Duldar ComfortDelgro Driving Centre Pte Ltd
k Eftertive date of ihe Conunencement ol
Ipissmisge Fus' e joir punes of the Agy n* January 2017
4 Dute ol Expiry of lisurnnes 31" December 2019

4 Perssos o Clapics of Porsons entliled 1o drive®

Any person who ls driving on the Policyholder's order or with hisMer perminsion.

Praovided that the person driving is permined in secordance with the licensing or other v or regulonons to drive the Motor Yehicle ac has
biexn 20 permitted und i not disguslifisd by arder of 8 Coun of Law ar by rewson of iy esnctment or regulation in (sl behall'lrom driving
Ihe Mutar Yehicle.

% Ndmbimiime ws bo wer®
e ity fior sockal, domest e snd pleasine purposes snd for the Pelicyholder's business.
The Palicy does nol eover usc for hire or rewsrd other than for ihe purposes of driving iwilion o icel, meing, poce-rmoking. rolabilny el
spovid-isting. the cemioge of goods ather than samples in connection with eny trude or busingss or ves (o sy purpme i Sofnest o with the
Merr Trode.

* Uit rendred lissporsilve by Socikim § of e Moior Veslole [Think-Mmy Risks and Compematin | Act (U hagpier 1B9) s Seoion 75 ol e
Wil Tranmguort Act, 1987 (Masliysial, sre sl 1o be included seder (hese hendings.

U D TRERELEINY CHIETIFY thid the Policy to which this Cenificale relates in isswed in sceordance wilh the pmi!it-wl'llu Motur Vehicles [ Thind-
Purry Witks mind Coenpensation) Act (Chapler | B9) and Murt IV of the Reod Trenaport Act, (987 (Maloysia).

Dt o « RL/29.12.2016 fae lisdia Liiernationsl Veswrauce 1"te. 1 hi.
(APPROVED INSURERS)

M 2L LIV ATE CARY
INIIVITIUAL TYWNERSTHINF Ainthorisnd Signony

IMPORTANT NOTICE

Poliey bolders and hereby warned thit wider the Moter Vehicle (Third Party Risks und Compensstion) Act (Uap. 1891, 1 shal | be untiwfiil for any person
Vb ke O 10 SR oF perril any other person (o wee s moler vehicle without & valid policy of insurence under the Act

Iabigy hualtdiers amne Flarther swarned Uit on the sale ol e molor whicks (hey must surmender e Centiffeaie of lrsumnee ond the Bfolicy o the s
compmoy 171l CentiVicgie of Tnsurancy s boen Jost or destroyed 8 Stalutory Declarution 1o thet ofVect must be madie. Failure w oomply vl e
arbligation i un olTenee under the Motor Yehicles { Thind funy Risks snd Cempensstion) At (Uap 184

Ve Wl v i o o Bt i) e (e muastoe veliels i Beon anld o snndher person unless the mnsdee of imenes) s Brown duby notilied 1o pnd agrnad
1in by ilae imsasrance compuny comeermid. (il mmrsncs sompany sgree o saver the mew svwner they will enduee the pulivy sceudinghy und will lsse o
A Cemificut ol nnusnmee im thee new ovner's misme.

T5CTHE IEVEST O ASTAUTTENINT NOTIFICATION SHEH LI BE GIVEN IMMITREATILY T0 THE CORIPARY . FATLLI T 000 50 Wikl KERELT I
LN THOCWRITI RS BEL LINING LLALATY .

Agent ! lirker Mo ComlartDelgro Ins Breokers

INDIA& INTERHATIOHAL INSURANCE PTE UID

CO. GEG. NO.- 1987037V2K

&4 CECIL STREET #04/#06/#06-02 108 BUILDING SINGAPORE DAPY11  TEL 6347 6100 FAX; 6224 4174 = 6225 7741 WER www Jil com.sy
POSTAL ADDRESS: ROBINSON ROAD P.O, BOK NO, 738 SINGAPORE 01438



Hsiao Tnnﬂ !LKI{Autn)

From: kangcar@singnet.com.sg

Sent: Tuesday, 7 May 2019 10:48 AM

To: Hsiae Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Kang Car (yahoo)

Subject: RE: LOD:ACCDT INVLG SKL4150E & GBD6523Z ON 21,06.2018 *** LKK REF:
CCB/CTI1B011506/Apa3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi Hsiao Tong,

We confirmed acceptance on the offer at G/S $1,450.00 (all in).

Kindly forward us the DV for our client's action.

Thank you & Regards,
Sharon

Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd
Tel: 6747 7636

Fax: 6748 5071

On Sat Apr 13 2019 15:11:41 GMT+0B00 (Malay Peninsula Standard Time) Hsiao Tong (LKKAutao)
<chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

mereeaaas Original Message
Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Thank you for your email.

We are of the opinion that this is a case of confiicting versions. There is no concrete
evidence(ie: Video footage) yet to support either party's version. Enclosed herewith in this
email is a copy of our insured's accident report for your perusal.

Strictly without admission of liability whatever, but with a view towards a resolutions of your
client's claim in the above matter without resort to litigation, we are prepared to offerat a
global sum of $1,450.00(all-in) towards your client’s claim.

Please confirm acceptance.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basks with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of lability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negaotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by elther party that will materially
affect/influence on the Issues of liability/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negatiation
terms/settiement.”



Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew

| Case Handler

LEE Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht @lkkauto.com

| fax: 6741-4108

Hik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(4q08933)

From:

Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 2B lanuary 2019 11:51 AM

To: Alice Tng <kangcarl76@yahoo.com.sg>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd <kangcar@singnet.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A
Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: LOD:ACCDT INVLG SKL4150E & GBD6523Z ON 21.06.2018 *** LKK REF:
CC6/CTI18011506/Apa3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE A5 TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for your email.

Please note that: -

LKK ref Officer in charge
CCA/CTI1B011506/Apa3 Hsiao Tong - 6742 3197

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank vou

Best Rogards,

Mei Kwan

| Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com

| fox: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408939)

From:

Alice Tng <kangcarl? hoo.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 26 January, 2019 11:50 AM

To: S A Team < kkauto.com>

Cce: Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd <kangcar@singnet.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Fw: LOD:ACCDT INVLG SKL4150E & GBD6523Z ON 21.06.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE / REMINDER



Dear All,
We rafer to our LOD dated 14 Sept 2018.

We have yet to raceive your offer to settle our client's claim. Attached herewith our LOD for your
releranca.

Please let us have your offer to settle our client's claim asap..
Thank you & Regards,

Sharon

Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd

Tal: 6747 7636

Fax: 6748 5071

On Friday, 14 September 2018, 11:39, Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd <kangcar@singnet com.sg>
wrote

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

To: The Claims Officer-in-charge

We refer to the above accident and attach herewith our LOD for your
reference.

Please let us have your offer to settle our client's claim asap.

Thank you & Regards,
Sharon

Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd
Tel: 6747 7636

Fax: 6748 5071



Inwoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF

SINGAPORE
GENERAL  ReCORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

INSURANCE ¢ Ratfles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
ASSOCIATION Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am lo Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M400017735

BfL2r2018

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-18-085313

Dats of Request:  22/06/2018 Your Ref No; Online Purchase

Kang Car Repairers Pte Lid

No 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#02-06 AutoBay@Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Near SirMadam,

Enquiry Data 22/06/2018

Enquiry By Kong Wel Jia

TP Vehicle No. GBD6523Z

Accident Date 21/06/2018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. |Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
GBD6523Z China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Ltd. 16/02/2018-15/02/2018  [6389 6111
Thank You.

T Images provided to you are taken from the ariginal reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Asociation of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for
any loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

hitps:/fsingapora.manman com/clalimaindax.cim Tfusebox=MTRsas&lussacton=sdap_geninvipSrefid=1838307TACFID=358503208CFTOKEN=8a... 112



82272018 Invoica

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF

SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

|NSURANCE 6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone; +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
peraling Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Spm

O
RECORDS MAM&GEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M4D0017735

TAX INVOICE
Our Ref No: GR-18-085313
Date of Request:  22/06/2018 Your Ref No; Online Purchase
Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd
Mo 1 Kaki Bukit Ave B
#02-06 AutoBay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883
Near SirMadam,
Enquiry Date 22/06/2018
Enquiry By Kong Wei Jia
TP Vehicle No, GBDB6523Z
Accident Date 21/06/2018
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S5)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

/ GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRO [] Cash [ ] Cheque

hittps:/isingapore. marmen.com/daims/index. cfm?Museba=MTRsasA fuseaction=dsp_geninvip&refid=183930T8CFID=15050320CFTOKEN=18d.., 22



_H:‘«"eiﬁcll: Registration Detail Information

Enquire Vehicle Registration Details

Owner Particulars

NRIC/Passport’Company Cart
Mot

Owner 1D Type:
Owner Name:
Ragisterad Address.
Malling Address:
Birth Data:

Vehicla No.:

Previous Vehicls No.:
Effactive Date of Ownership:
Original Regn Date:

Yaar of Manufnciure:

Madmum Laden Weight
Opan Markst Valua:

PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibiity Expiry Date:
Minimum PARF Benafit:
No. of Transfars:

I Labal Mo.:

COE No.:

COE Expiry Date:

COE Calagory:

CODE Registration Calegory:

Quota Premium [QF) /
Prevailing Quota Premium:
Actual QP Pald:

199501882C

Company

COMFORTDELGRO DRIVING CENTRE PTE LTD
205 BRADDELL ROAD SINGAPORE 578701

08 Nov 2013

08 Nov 2013

08 Nov 2013

2013

For Instruction (Co) Car With 10 Years Lifespan

Mo Attachment

MRZETIF3D104T2AT
1NZYBTT114

14097 ecf -

Petrol

1045 kg

1500 kg

$13,184.00

Yea

07 Nov 2023

$4,082.00

0

1125121169
2013080101000075C

07 Nov 2023

A - Car (1600cc & balow)
A - Car (1600cc & below)
$73,100.00/-
$73,100.00

Page 1 of 2

cer st b T A nTT TN TR=FIROTN9... 11/11/2013



= AB IR AR LA 3
"~ KANG CAR REPAIRERS PTE LTD

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #02-06 AUTOBAY @KAKI BUKIT SINGAPORE 417883

TEL- 67477636, 67473005 FAX: 67485071 Email: kangcar@singnet.com.sg
Co. Aeg. No. 201300201N GST Reg. No. 201300201N

Our Ref ' KCR0620184150CTI
Your Ref . GBD6523Z

Date - 4 & SEP 2018 WITHOUT PREJUDICE

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
C/O LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1

#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Pk

Singapore 408833

Dear Sirs, 5 _ P
Accident involving SKL 4150E and GBD6523Z on 21.06.2 18 along Hougang Ave 3.

We refer to the above accident. On our record showed that you are the insurer of motor
vehicle GBDB523Z.

Wae are instructed that the accident was caused by your insured's negligent driving and/or
management of his vehicle. As a result of the accident, our client's vehicle was damaged and
our client has been put to loss and expense.

On behalf of and as authorized by M/S ComfortDelgro Driving Centre Pte Ltd, the owner of
motor-vehicle no: SKL4150E, we submit their claim to you:

Cost of repairs (Inclusive of 7% GST) $ 2,300.50
Loss of use (7 days x $120.00-Training Vehicle)$ 840.00
LTA search fee $ 1000
GIA search fee s 2.00

$3,152.50

Our claim for the loss of use is as follows

No of days Date Remarks
21.06.18 Date of Accident/ Reporting

1 22.06.18 } Surveyed by LKK

2 23-06.18 } Day 1 repair

3 24.06.18 } Sunday

4 25-06.18 } Day 2

5 21.06.18 }Day 3

6 22.06.18 }Day 4

T __ 23.06.18 }Day 5

T days recommended 5 repair days

Pg1



Enclosed herewith are copies of the following documents in support of our client's claim
1) Tax invoice no: KCR-INV1800530
2) GIA report and insurance certificate of SKL4150E
3) GIA /LTA search fee and invoice
4) \ehicle registration card
We hope to receive your early reply soon,

Thank you

Yours faithfully,_ (
KANG AQ,REF'AIREHS PTELTD

{/(—'ﬁ/

R

Pg2



LETTER OF AUTHORI

Your Ref : GBDB523Z

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road

#16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Dear Sirs,

Accident involving SKL4150E and GBD6523Z on 21.06.2018 along Hougang
Ave 3.

We, the undersigned, hereby accept and authorize China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to issue the settlement cheque of $ 1,450.00 in favour of our

workshop, Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd in full and final settlement of our claim for
our repair cost and loss of use in respect of the above accident.

Yours faithfully,

SRRt

Witnessed b g Chin Watt



3| UBIAVE L, 20025 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE J08833 TEL: 10651 62563500 FAN @ (651 A2364313

Our Ref: CC6/CTT18011506/Apal
29 JUNE 2018

PIKASA BUILDERS PTE LTD

80 KAKI BUKIT INDUSTRIAL TERRACE
SINGAPORE 416160

ATTN: THE MANAGEMENT

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD 65237 AND SKL 4150E ON 21/06/2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write 1o inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to deal with
the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from SKL 4150E against your motor insurance policy.

Both parties involved have given conflict of version. Based on the circumstances of
accident and both parties damage profile, there is no conclusive evidence to substantiate
either's parties version. We are of the view that the case would be settled at equal liability.

If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim,
kindly let us have them in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 09 July 2018, after we
shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis
and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by yow/your driver against the
other party's insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

HEW HSIAO TONG
Case Handler
DID: 67423197
FAX: 6741 4108
EMAIL: chewht@lkkauto.com

ce.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)
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o clar ansing fom
HOUTOR_CLAIME DISCHARGE VOUCHER
Paliczy No i DMCVSHI&05551802 Clatm Ho : SHNWLSDO3IT16C02
Claimant < KANG CAR REPAIRERS PTE LID
Amount 1 351,44%0.00

Singapore Dollars One Thousand Four Hundred And Fifty Only

1/¥e agree Lo accept the above mentioned amount to be pald to mefus in full «
final sestlemsnt of all clalms, costs & disbursementa for Lnjuriss / damages
sustalned by mefus through an accident lnvalving

Claimant Vehlele Ho. : SKL 4150DE
Insured Vehicle Ho. : GBD 85231
Dates of Loas t 21/08/2018
Place of Accidenc : JALAN EUNCGS TOWARDS HOUGANG AVENUE 3

IN CONSIODERATION of the payment made to mefus of the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE| FPTE. LTD.., I/We agree absolurtsly to
discharge CHIMA TAIPING I[NSURANCE (SINGAPORE)] PTE. LTD. and/or

Insurea Hamea : PIEASA BUILDERS FTE LTD
bDriver Mams ¢ RAJENDRAN NATARAJAN

from all claims, present or futurs in respect of all loss, ainjury or damage
sustalpad by ma/us arlaing out of tha said secident,

I acknowledge that this payment 35 made without admission of Lliability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

(1} Global Sum 55 1.450.00
TOTAL . & o & & & & & & & & &« a &« = 9% 1,450.00
Clalmant Mame : e HRIC Mo :

15 MAY 2018

Bignature ' Date
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1 KAK! BUKIT AVE 6 #02-06 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT SINGAPORE 417883
TEL: 67477636, 67473005 FAX: 67485071 Email: kangcar@singnet.com.sg
Co. Reg. No. 201300201N GST Reg. No. 201300201N

M/S:  CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD  Final No: KCR-INVIBOOS30
3 ANSON ROAD Claim No: ESTIROD1SY
#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER Due: 10 Sep 2018
SINGAPORE 079909 Policy No:
TEL: HIBO6111 FAX: 62247175 Yeh Reg No: SKL4150E
ATTN: Motor Claim Department Muke/Model: TOYOTA VIOS E
GRADE AUTO
Your Rel' No: OBD65237 Chassis No: MR2ZBT9F34010472147
Claim Type: Third Party Engine No;
Accident Date:  21/06/2018 Reg. Date: 08/11/2013

TP Veh Reg No: GBD6523Z
Tax Invoice to Vehicle No :SKL4150E

i*AGE: ]

_- Description |  Quantity | List Price Amount
b33 Ss

As recommended by surveyor to proceed repair at 1ol cost/lumpsum cost 5% 2.150.00

Add GST @@ 7% 150.50

Total Amount payable 5% 2.300.50

TOTAL: SINGAPORE DOLLAR TWO THOUSAND THREE HUNDRED AND CENTS FIFTY ONLY

For K.nngér Repairers Pte Ltd
e :
A/ C‘)’

E &0 E AUTHORISED SIGNATURE



Vehicle Hub Page | of |

Enquire Vehicle & Owner Information ( Vehicle No. GBD&523Z As At 21 Jun 2018 / 09:25:00)
Law Firm Search Details

Search Reason: Insurance claim in relation to traffic accident
Livws Firrn Cane Mo ACSLTAKC 06,18

Current Owner Details

Owner [0 Type: Company

Qwenar |D: 201113%3IN

DOwner Mame: PIKASA BUILDERS PTELTD

Registered Address Type:  Private Residential [Condo Apt or House) / Shopping / Office Complexes
Registered Block/House NoBO

Registered Street Name:  KAKI BUKIT INDUSTRIAL TERRACE

Registered Unit Mo

Registered Bullding Name: -

Registered Postal Code: ™~ 418150

Current Vehicle Details

Vehicle Mo GBD&523Z
Make Descriptioniodel:  MITSUBISHI f CANTER FEAD1BRISDEB (CBLN
Insurance Company Name: CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) BTELTD

https://vrl.lia.gov.sg/lw/vrl/action/lawFirmDetail "FUNCTION_ID=F 1801071 ET - 22672018



A.C. SYED & PARTNERS

ADVOCATES & SOLICITORS
COMMISSIONER FOR OATHS

101A UPPER CROSS STREET, #13-23 PEOPLE'S PARK CENTRE, SINGAPORE 058358

TEL : 6538 7411 & FAX : 6534 1011

TO : KANG CAR REPAIRERS PTELTD

BILL NO: B051 /2018

YOUR REF:

OUR REF : ACS.KC.LTA.JUNE.2018

DATE : 6/7/18

out tha work antrustad to us Inclusive of all advice.

LTA SEARCHES FOR THE MONTH JUNE 2018

1. SLC 5921B as at 12.6.18
2. YM9273E as at 13.6.18

3, SKH 5148C as at 16.6.18
4. PA 5212C as at 20.6.18

5. SLR 9676D as at 21.6.18

6. GBD 6523Z as at 21.6.18 =RLYINME
7. SHC 2635U as at 23.6.18

Total:

[SINGAPORE DOLLARS: SEVENTY ONLY.]

WsAC & PARTNERS
ADVOCATES & SOLICITORS
|SINGAPORE

We reserved the right to forward a subsequent bill for any
disbursements omitied herain.
E.LOE

TO OUR PROFESSIONAL CHARGES for acting for you in tha above matter including
whara negessary perusals, attendance preparation examination of documents

refating thereto, cormespondence, attendance, perusals, telaphona calls, ssarches

d all other incidental works not specifically mantionad hereln to enable us to carry

10.00
10.00
10.00
10.00
10.00
10.00
10.00

44 N Y A A

$ 70.00




VB 74l 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

i ——v— 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusirial Park, Singapors 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX 6258 4315

Reg. No: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 18-8607T198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Das Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD Ref : CCB/CTI18011506/Apa3g2
SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079809 pete zeoseme I”III“'""""I"W
Code: CTI
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, GBD 65232 Veh. Inspected SKL 4150E
Policy No. DMCVSN 1605551802 Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. SNM18D03116C02 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 22/068/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAVIOS c.c 1487
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2013
Chassis No. MR2ZBTOF3401047217 Colour SILVER
Odometer 105807 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/60 R15 YOKOHAMA 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/60 R15 YOKOHAMA 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/60 R15 YOKOHAMA 8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185/80 R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S BODY
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 21062018 Inspection Date 22/06/2018
Survey held at KANG CAR REPAIRERS PTE LTD
NO.1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6
#02-06 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOLUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL 6256 1561 FAX: G256 4315

Reg No: 199607198R GST Reg Mo 18-856071968-R Page No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKL 4150E
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition [veaanentol .
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR RIGHT FENDER DISTORTED 863.20 B63.20
1|REAR RIGHT TAIL LAMP NOT NECESSARY 357.90
1|REAR BUMFER DEFORMED 48210 48210
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER NECESSARY 113.90 113.80
LESS 25% DISCOUNT 454 28 -364 BO
1.362.82 1,084 .40
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET REAR RIGHT STICKERS (SN) NECESSARY 180.00 190,00
1|SET REAR BUMPER STICKER (SN) NECESSARY 195,00 165.00
1|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 80.00 30.00
1|REAR WINDSCREEN INNER SEAL (SN) NECESSARY 80.00 30.00
505.00 44500
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING. 50.00 30.00
TO SPRAY PAINTING DAMAGED PORTION INCLUDING 1.000.00 400.00
SUPPLY OF PAINT MATERIALS
REMOVE AND REFIT SEAT CUSHION. 200.00 60.00
REMOVE AND REFIT WINDSCREEN. 120.00 100.00
PANEL BEATING 800.00 600.00
2.170.00 1,120.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,037.82 2,729.40
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,150.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CC6/CTI118011506/Apa3q2

3

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE.AMIRTE AMSAE-A M. MATAI

Licensed Appralser

DISCLAMWER OF LIABILITY TD THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made sobely fof the ute and benefit of the Clent named an the front page of this Reper




