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-y Bip L i Company Registration N 19960 7T 198R
S UREAVE ©#02-25 PAY A UREINDUSTRIAL PARK, 5% LPORE 408933 TEL : (0651 62563561 FAX @ tie5) 1504315
Your ref: DIR0049ESMESH

Cur ref: CS/ECLIE01 1486/Uvh DATE: 23/7/2018

The Motor Claims Department

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

/s FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO.SGR 4219H

We thank for your instruction on 25/6/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

vehicle on 25/6/2018  at the premises of M/s FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

and have the following to report:-

Waorkshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
"Check” Irems Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Nett Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
rear portion,

Comments/Present Staius:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser

: 5514.940.20
: $55.800.00 (LUMP SUM)
o]
1 5%
1 83
: 5%
rear

front




MS @ FirstCapital

§ Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapare 048580
Tel (65) 6222 2311 Fax (556222 3547

MS First Capital Insurance Limited CeReg. Mo, 1550000060 GST Rug. M M2 00016769

Claiem & Mubor Usnderwelting Dept: 36 Robinsan Road BLE-0L City House Singapore 068877

Tel: (65) 6507 3848 Fax (65} 6507 3849
wvivi msfirstcapital. com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

25-06-2018 Our Ref No.
23-06-2018 Claim Type.
SHCB949A Third Party Vehicle.

1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE & #01-46/48/50AUTOBAY
NANCY LAM
67465405/ 0

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: NO EST. PROVIDED

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MA Fax No.

NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Fax No.

D18004985MFSH

Third Party

SGR4219H

67458520

68416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop
Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD Attention.
MA, TP Solicitor Fax Na.
SERENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

NIL
NA

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

A Member of [EEEENE vsuRencE sROuF




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Monday, 23 July 2018 11:10 AM

To: ‘Claim Workflow System’

Cc: 'SERENELER@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.5G"; SUR

Subject: RE- SURVEY ASSESSMEMT - D18004985MFSH/1, SGR 4219H
Attachments: SGR 4219H HPRELI ADVISED, pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SGR 4219H
Date of survey: 25/6/2018
Number of days :06 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Veron Chen {LKKAuto)

sent: Wednesday, 27 June 2018 8:39 AM

To: 'Claim Warkflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Cc: SERENELER@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D13004985MFSH/1, SGR 4219H

Dear Sir/Madam.
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SGR 4219H on 25/6/2018 .

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(4083933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 26 June 2018 3:55 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmoterclaims@msiirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <d ssignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SERENELER@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004985MF5H/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assinments@lkkauto.com | fax: bagh-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

Erom: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)

sent: Tuesday, 26 June 2018 2:29 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @ LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SERENELER@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004985MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

#

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 27 June 2018 8:39 AM

To: "Claim Workflow System’

Cc: SERENELER@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004985MFSH/1, SGR 4219H
Dear Sir'Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SGR 4219H on 25/6/2018 .

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 26 June 2018 3:55 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SERENELER@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004985MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email; assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: b256-4315

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)

Sent: Tuesday, 26 June 2018 2:29 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @ LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SERENELER@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004985MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,



Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Departiment

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Used Mazda 3 Car for Sale in Singapore. Hua Yang Credit Pte Ltd - sgCarMart
saCarhdMarT. CoMm

Mew Cars Used Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles

SELL YOUR CAR BY BIDDING

HIGHEST SELLING PRICE GUARANTEED!
or GET $100 CASH!

Logir

Page 1 of 2

Forum Resources

R = ML N

@UOTZ

Mazda 3 Price Range 'w| Depreciation W | | > 10 yearl| v | Vehicle Type \-'f: W Submiti
) ced S Eradlt B -p
Resources Mazda 3 1.6A SP Luxury (COE till 02/2022)
Car Buying Overview Financial Accessories  Similar Research Photos  Map
C Selling
ll = N 11 DTE 1 1
v [B] HUA YANG creDIT PTE LTD
Car Aftermarket
The M a e R (= 1= 5
Lifestyl
£26,800
Tyres §7,280 /yr L 2]
- DONEOr Reg Date 28-Feb-2007
NO STRESS, {3yrs Bmths 2days COE left)
NO WORRY
WE GOT rou M ctured 2007
COVERED Anufa ©
——— < Mileage
L f—; E a2
mmm——
Engine Cap 1,598 cc
Road Tax $B16 jyr [ 7]
Power 79.0 KW (105 bhg)
View specs of the
Curb Welght 1,235 kg 1]
Features Powiered By 1.6L 4 Cylinder DOHC 16 Values Engina, 4
Speed Auto Transmission With Tiptronic, Knock Down
Rear Seats, Immobilizer Remaote Key, Airbags.
Accessories Crigingd Leather Uphotstery, Upgraded Sports Rim,
Upgraded Mazda Touwch Screen System, Reverse
Sensors, Spdar Filo EXc.
Description Hari Raya Specal, New Paintwork! Very Well Taken o
Care Off! Owner's Reluctant Sale! 100% Finance BNr =
Available, Lowest Interest Rates Wikth Fast Approval! L0
Same Day Delivery! Buy With & Peace O Mind From An )
150 Certified Comparry With Mere Than 30 Years OF Seller Information
Experiences! New Road Tax, Inspection Cleared! 2 x Company Hua Yang Credit Pte Lid
Free In House Sendacing Provided! Make An Appt With ,, :
Dominic Now For A No Obligation Discussion! 165 | 145
COE $75,197 [ 7]
oMY £15,200 a Address 61 Ui Avenue 2 #03-14
ARF $11,611 L 7]
Location
Dereg Value $18,547 as of wday | e} [ 7]
Office No B4545111
MNo.of Owners 3 L 1]
Contact Person{s) Dominic Tan 94230390
Tl ven Edison 82696288
Category
Compare Availability Available
http://www.sgearmart.com/used_cars/info.php?ID=721628&DL=1066 25-Jun-18



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Page 1 of 2

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner 1D:

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Message

Singapore NRIC
3260D

SGR421%H
MNo

25 Jun 2018
MAZDA

MAZDA3 SPHB
Red

2006

26527590
JM6BK106270335728
79.0 kW (105 bhp)
$14.999.00

08 Feb 2007

08 Feb 2007

1

$16,499.00

Forfeited

$0.00

31 Jan 2022

A - Car (1600cc & below)
5

$25,323.00

$18,229.00

$18,229.00

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle
must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if

applicable), whichever is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 25 Jun 2018

hitps://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDeregInput 7FUNCTION _ID=F030...

OK

25-Jun-18



FASTECH AUTO PTELTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

#01-46/48/50 Autobay
SINGAPORE 417883

VEHICLE NO:SGR 4215H

QaTry

1PCS
2PCS
1PCS
1 PCS
1PCS
1 SET
2PCs
1PCS
1PCS
2PC3
2PCs
1PCS
1PCS
1PCS
1PCS
1PCS
1PCS
1PCS
1SET
1PCS

1 8ET
1PCS
1PCS
1PCS
1 PCS
1 8ET

mt e

Ll¢ @KUV

PARTICULAR
TAILGATE fﬁ? ? | ( J

TAILGATE REFLECTORS @$231.60
TAILGATE INNER LOCK

TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP

TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD

TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS
TAILLAMPS @$794.9

REAR BUMPER SPORT /to0s.~J
REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT

REAR BUMPER SIDE RSTAINERS @$37.60
REAR BUMPER LAMPS @$115.00

REAR END PANEL

REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH

REAR FLOOR PANEL

REAR FLOOR PANEL TOOLS TRAY

REAR FENDER O/S

REAR FENDER INNER TRIM O/S

REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING

AMOUNT
Selhio 140830 =
A $463.20 K

SW $221.80 —
Al 39770 =

”‘t’fﬂl $205.30
UA s5000

#(Sene  g158080 lPC
DRSS wﬂ.uuf‘{,«l
DX $374.50

g[’( Rerf  $7520 tpc
A $23000 X
‘?"Bﬁ'-‘ $357.00—
Tl $212507
A $1,12030X
Tl saar10—"
L s762.90 X

2/1s.n s26250 —
Al $66.80

REAR LICENCE PLATE LAMP ’?,,?Z v $280.20 pd

REAR EXHAUST A $971.10 M
Yl 3o $10,680.20

S.NETT -

REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR 3gaf clted  s28000 290

REAR BUMPER WIRE MESH Sef  $100.00 &

REAR LICENCE PLATE cnAq  $40.00 2O

REAR END PANEL SEALANT
REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT
REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR 'LED'

LABOUR CHARGES:
TO CHECK WIRING

TO DISMENTLE & REPLACING REVERSE SENSOR

TO DISMENTLE & REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN

A $50.00

A $5u.uu%

129 $280.00 1o
$80.00 52

$80.00 _(“D
$150.00 [ Lo



TO DISMENTLE & REFIX PETROL TANK A $10000 X

TO DISMENTLE & REFIX SEAT,CUSHION UPHOLSTC Ry $150.00 ££0
TO DISMENTLE & REFIX TAILGATE COMPONENTS $100.00 4 o
TO SPRAY RUST PROOFING $100.00 § >
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING & REPLACING PARTS $1,200.00
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING §1500.00 | 5 >
TOTAL $14,940.20
7 25.0¢

607



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

57 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315
Reg. Mo 189607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607 196-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Exparts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURAMNCE LTD Ref © CSFCIA011486/Uvbn2
#1601 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068677 D s N""”lmwul‘ "N
Code : FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 889404 Veh. Inspected SGR 4218H
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D180042985MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From SERENE Assign Date 25/06/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MAZDA 3 5P HB (A) c.C 1598
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2007
Chassis No. JMEBK106270335728 Colour RED / BLACK
Odometer 147571 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/45 R17 HANKOOK 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/45 R17 HANKOOK B mm
R/H Rear Tyre |21545R17 HANKDOK & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |21545R17 HANKOOK & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  23/06/2018 Inspection Date 25/06/2018
Survey held at FASTECH AUTO PTELTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
Sa. Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 6 Working Days




Ty 7 "4
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

TEL: B256 3561 FAX: G256 4315

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Reg. Mo 19%607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-89607198-R Page No.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SGR 4219H
= Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ©)
BEPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1| TAILGATE BADLY DENTED 1,408.30 1,099.60
2| TAILGATE REFLECTORS @$231 60 NOT NECESSARY 463,20 -
1| TAILGATE INNER LOCK SHORTED 221,80 221.80
1|TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP TWISTED 897.70 97.70
1| TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD DEFORMED / 29530 29530
CRACKED
1|SET TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS NECESSARY 50.00 50,00
2| TAILLAMPS @3%794.90 OIS CRACKED 1,589.80 704.90
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT DISTORTED 374 50 37450
2| REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS @$37 60 OIS BENT 75.20 a7.60
2| REAR BUMPER LAMPS @5115.00 NOT NECESSARY 23000 .
1|REAR END PANEL BADLY DENTED 357.00 357.00
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH TWISTED 212.50 21250
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 1.120.30 -
LABOUR
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL TOOLS TRAY TWISTED 341.10 341.10
1|REAR FENDER O/S TO REPAIR SEE 762.90 I
LABOUR
1|REAR FENDER INNER TRIM O/S DEFORMED / TORN 262 50 262.50
1|REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING NECESSARY 66 80 66.80
1|SET REAR LICENCE PLATE LAMP NOT NECESSARY 280.20 =
1|REAR EXHAUST NOT NECESSARY 871.10 "
LESS 20% DISCOUNT > -842.26
9,180.20 3,369.04
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BUMPER SPORT (SN) DISTORTED 1,500.00 1,100.00
1|SET REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR (SN) SHORTED 280.00 200.00
1|REAR BUMPER WIRE MESH (SN} BENT 100.00 80.00
1|REAR LICENCE PLATE (SM) CRACKED 40.00 20.00
1|REAR END PANEL SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|REAR WINDSCREEMN SEALANT (SN} NECESSARY 50.00 40.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18011486/Uvbn2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607188-R Page No.2of 2
- T Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop {{.'] '[511
1|SET REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR "LED" (SN} BROKEN 280.00 200.00
2,300.00 1,690.00
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING. 80.00 30.00
TCO DISMENTLE & REPLACING REVERSE SENSOR 80.00 50.00
TO DISMENTLE & REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN 150.00 120.00
TO DISMENTLE & PETROL TANK. MOT NECESSARY 100.00
TO DISMENTLE & REFIX SEAT CUSHION UPHOLSTERY 150.00 80,00
TO DISMENTLE & REFIX TAILGATE COMPONENTS, 100.00 60.00
TO SPRAY RUST PROCFING 100.00 60.00
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING & REPLACING 1,200.00 800.00
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR FLOOR
PANEL AND REAR FENDER O/S,
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING 1,500.00 1,000.00
3,460.00 2,200.00
GRAND TOTAL 14,940.20 7,259.04
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 5,800.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18011486/Uvbn2
MARKET VALUE: $24,500.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: §18,229.00=NETT VALUE: §6,271.00

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

MECLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Report is made solely far the use and benedit of the Clisnd named on the frond page of this Raport.

wholly o in part, Any third party acking er reptving on this




