Vic (LKKAuto)
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From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 16 October, 2018 3:44 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YP8102G (OI': LPC

- 18/18/18/VC05/020697) and SJV8755T (TP : LKK REF - CC6/LPC18011404/Uha3)
on 22.06.2018

Dear Vic,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 16 October, 2018 1:10 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: Admin A; MT_Claim_SG; Vic (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YP8102G (OI : LPC -
18/18/18/VC05/020697) and SIVB755T (TP : LKK REF - CCH/LPC18011404/Uha3) on 22.06.2018

Your Ref: 18/18/18/VC05/020697
Our Ref: CC6/LPC18011404/Uha3

Dear Gerald,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES ¥P 8102G (O1) AND SIV 87557 (TP) ON 22/06/2018 ALONG CTE TOWARDS PIE
We refer to the above matter.

We refer to the assignment dated 25™ June 2018 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settiement with our Principal,
Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

This is a clear-cut case where Insured Driver had rear-ended TP vehicle. As such, liability is not to our Insured’s
favour.

We propose to offer to TP repairer “FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD" as below:

TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair {w/gst) 5 19,695.30 5 9,309.00
Loss of Rental (5100 x 6 days) S 600.00 5 600.00
GIA Search Fee S 2.00 S 2.00
TOTAL | $ 20,297.30 $ 9,911.00

Breakdown of days is as follows:



Our surveyor's recommended days to repair 6 days
TOTAL 6 days

The above is for your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-20096 | email: vicalpeh@lk .oom | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

¥ SRS
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SLERIT WETT Save the Earth- Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law, If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

sent: Thursday, 2 August, 2018 3:09 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YPE102G (Ol : LPC - 18/18/18/VC05/020697) and SIVEB755T (TP :
LKK REF - CC6/LPC18011404/Uha3) on 22.06.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Gerald,

We refer further to our below email.
Enclosed for your perusal is:

- TP estimated cost of repair
= Preliminary Advice

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2066 | email: vicalpeh@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408a373)

¥ ISV .
FLERER W shve the Earthe Print only when necessary

Thiz e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
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read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 25 June, 2018 7:14 PM

To: 'MT_Claim_5G’

Cc: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN" 'ERIC WOO JUN KIAT'; ONG LI LI; Vic (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YP8102G (0! : LPC - TBA) and SJV8755T (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/LPC18011404/Uha3) on 22.06.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case.

We have inspected TP vehicle S|V 8755T at M/s Fastech Auto Pte Ltd - Kaki Bukit.
Enclosed for your perusal is:

« TP's GIA report
« Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Please be informed that the estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.
We will revert to you on preliminary advice in due course.

Kindly assist to verify validity of our insured’s policy, and let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our
necessary action,

Our case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)



FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay
Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67465405 / 67465376 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

Date : 10.07.2018

Lonpac Insurance BHD
300 Beach Road
#17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 1993555

Attn: Motor Claim Department
Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES : SJV 8755T / YP 8102G ON 22.06.2018

We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no: SJV 8755T . which was involved
in the captioned accident with your insured vehicle no: YP 8102G . The vehicle owner has requested and
authorized us to assist him in presenting his/her claim against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving, we are submitting these claims for
vour consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant.

I} Cost of Repair {inclusive of GST) b 9.309.00

23 Loss of Rental b 600.00

3}  GIA Search Fee b 2.00
5 9.911.00

We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims:

a) Final Repair Invoice by Car Rental Invoice / Agreement

c) GIA Search Result d) Letter of Authorisation, etc...

e) GIA Reporl f) I/C & Driving Licence

g} Insurance Certificate h) Vehicle Registration Log Card

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our customer’s claims
as soon as possible.

Pleasc note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to
any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/claimant.

Thank you,
Yours faithfully, |~
¥
Jason Tang (jasopi@ fastechauto.com.sg)
For Fastech Auto Pte Ltd
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TO ; \IJ,L'"ﬂIl‘?'J.C Insuance Bhd

0Ty NIT MATY L
RE . ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLENO. 1\ (45%] [ 024

ALoNG @-’1 F:"H,':_'-h Twards (MY

oN _22.06.201%
I/'We, | Hl’ i Howy
of (NRIC No./ROC No.) 2RI BER H
of | nphia F'l-ﬁ:.]{;l 3 21- 0| ! o DAY
owner of vehiclle no. STV BASKT in cu%slideratiun of M/s FASTECH AUTO
PTE LTD repairing my/our vehicle SN *HK‘;T at my/our instruction and hereby

authorise M/s FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD to demand claim settlement whatever

amount settled/payable by the Insurance Company and/or third party or to commence legal
proceedings. if necessary, under my name, for the cost of repairs, car rental and/or loss of use.
ete. and to their appointing solicitor to act for me/us in respect of the said accident/claim and

all claimed and/or settled shall belong to them absolutely.

I/We further agree and undertake to indemnify them against the above-mentioned claim cost

which may arisen therewith.

Signature of Owner :

Name of Owner




LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIMNO : 18/18/18/VCD5/020697
DATE : 16 OCTOBER 2018 ind

ajech i

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/'We, KOK NAI HOW confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD and/or the owner of YP 8102G the sum of Singapore Dollars Nine Thousand
Nine Hundred Eleven Only ($9,911.00) in full and final satisfaction, liquidation and
discharge of property claim competent to mefus upon the said M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD in respect of property claim sustained by me/us whether now or
hereafter to become manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from an accident to
my vehicle, SIV 8755T on 22 JUNE 2018 along CTE TOWARDS PIE.

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (GREEN EARTH
COMMERCIAL PTE LTD / LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and
any claims whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the
said accident.

[/We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/S
FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD.

I/'We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

\
(7...30ubr

hicle owner/Date

kol N o Hﬂ/u

Name of vehicle owner/Date



TAX INVOICE

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158  Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

Tax Invoice - 20363
Lonpac Insurance BHD
300 Beach Road Date 10.07.2018
#17-04/07 The Concourse Vehicle No SIV BT55T
Singapore 199555 Make/Model  VOLKSWAGEN TIGUAN
Chassis’Engs
Attn : Motor Claim Department Accidemt Date 1 22.06,2018
Claim No -
Reference 0618 -20363
Policy No
Amount
To proceed on lump sum repair S% 8700.00
E.& O. E. Total : S% 8700.00
GS5T @ 7% : 8% 609,00
Amount Due @ 88 9309.00

for FASTECHAUTO PTE LTD

All Invoices are subjected to GST




DYNAMIC CAR RENTAL

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-46 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 6741 7244 / 6746 5405 Fax No: 6745 8520/ 6746 5786
Co. Reg No: 52928467TK

Tor KOK NAIHOW Invoice : DCR-2018-06-21

Date : 10.06.2018
Agreement Mo @ 20485
Payment Term : LOD

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Rental charges for vehicle : SV 7392M | 0618-20363 ) 5 600.00
Rental Period from_22.06.2018 to 28.06.2018
E. & O. E. Total 5  600.00
LINA PANG

for Dynamic Car Rental



Dynamic Car

Rental

1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE B, #01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY, SINGAPORE 417883,

TEL:

Co. Reg. No, 52928467K
RENTAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

(+65) 6741 7244, 6746 5405 FAX: (+65) 6745 8520, 6746 5786

No.20485

feame:

Kok

Nai  How

ADDRESS

REG. No, : MAKE WODEL
3;” :ﬁq‘lm DIESEL | PETROL | £ 14|12 |2
(AT

iy

1 D%E & TIME IN 1
K [ N6 018 @ 3-Hpm
KM DATE & TIME OUT :
ouT 22.06. 2018 © 3-53M -
M TIME USED '
ORIVEN
NAMED DRIVER
nn@ﬁﬁgﬁuﬁgﬁ [ DATE OF EXPIRY FLAGE OF |SSUE youms | ess
PASSPORT NO DATE OF IBSUE | PLACE OF ISSUE G oavs | ess () # £00
- | |
ADD NAMED DRIVER WEEKS | @55
DAIVING LICENCE NO | DATE OF EXFIRY PLACE OF ISSUE MONTHS | @58
“PASBROAT NO DATE OF IS50UE FLAGE OF S5UE | BY INITIALLING, RENTER | sus-TOTAL ¥ EQ{_‘J
AGHEES TO PAY ADD FEE
| FOR COLLISION DAMAGES
| 1MPDF|.'I_'.!|NTLIOTEZ_5'. - WAIVER (C.0W.)
Nt it il e Eywn. o vaPcts v arly TOTAL RENTAL
Mo redund will b given lod penfod 81 n wahca
Hirer |5 lialalis 85 pay lirst BR000 wicjes sectian LA 1 in sty ool ol ons af samings while damages sehels
\m ungar risdic DELIVERY FEE
Hirot i linbin 1o phy all pEhing 1ee and irsflic summonsas
i COLLECTION FEE
Yahicle mitum dunng oifice: laur anly
K Senvce on Pubie Hoddwy enid Sundoyg x
EXCESS: PER DAY PEA WEEK  PER MONTH
*Sec | - Lsen n §'pors Only SG0H § % [
*Jac |l - Used inS'pore Only ;SE02M0
*Eo |« Used Dulnde Spoed Daly [SGE04000 T
"ec . Lind Guein Gty Oy S0M00 BY INITIALLING, RENTER
Wiacrean Exces b S'pare: S50100 )
Wisctpan Evcess Ouiside S pas: BROEID ‘:'ggiEEgggN:t:&ﬂ:jngﬁi
ADDITHONAL CONDITIONS: INSURANCE (FLAL)Y
* Qeogrephical areas Singapore & Was Mataysia
" Dirsar must bo)
0 18 yearn oid &nd Sbave;
1 hoding a valid retavasl clezs ol driving iieense x
* helanionn: Own Damage Ercess of 581,000 = eppicabls for any nemedinnznad divers who PER DAY  PER WEEK  PER MONTH
il age 22 o 23 yaees oid, g 5 g
b} age 68 o 70 paErsold,
€l wWith diwing exnerance aof 1 year 1o less than 2 weams 0 Singapars on the ralevant classas of driving
licesse PREPAYMENT TOTAL CHARGE
*Adnitomal Al Clarms evoess o 532,000 Is applcabike for ity nsrsediumnsmed disers who —
a} iw 18 yoarn okl 1o 21 years old andéar CHECK DEPOSIT
tij 18 71 years olz and above andior ) !
cf with driving akperiemco of bk than 1 year an B releyent classes of divan (ieeiss
CASH
* Upen ralufning the replacemond vabicks yow mul answes that 2 senensas Bng |mponam heme o be
remerved away Iram 1he replacament vehicla, Wedt wil nof be resporstble for sny repaning of such lieses AECEIFT NO. NETT CHARGE
* Hires i linbls 1o pay first SA000 undar saction | & |l in any acoicani plus loss ol sarmng whils damagoe wahicle
% unided rEmaif,
Hirer i= respansile for Additional 54,000.00 Excess AMOUNT DUE / BEFUND
1o the THIRD PARTY ‘DAMM* {INJURY elaims.
| HAVE READ THE TERMSIAND CONDITIONS ON BOTH SIDES
OF THIS RENTAL AGR ENT AND AGREE THEREOF
SIGNEDBY THE PARTIEBHERETO DN THE i nii i s Re R R iasios s siasat b ierarn s sb i I T M oo s o b o o o st e B

X N

RENTER'S

IVER'S SIGNATURE




Invoice Page 1 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSUME Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-18-095337
Date of Request: 22/06/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Lid
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue G #01-48
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Dear SirfMadam,

Enguiry Date 22/06/2018

Enguiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan

TP Vehicle No. YPB102G

Accident Date 22/106/2018

Enguiry Result

TP Vehicle Ma. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
¥YP8102G Lonpac Insurance Bhd 21/06/2018-20/06/2019 +65 62507388
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken fram the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any
loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reparts or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=M1Rsas&fuseaction=dsp_g... 22-Jun-18



[nvoice

GENERAL

Our Ref Mo: GR-18-095337
Date of Reguest: 22/06/2018

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-48
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit

INSURANCE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to 5pm
GS5T Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Singapore 417883

Dear SirfMadam,

Enguiry Date 22/08/2018

Enguiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan

TP Vehicle No. YP8102G

Accident Date 22/06/2018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S§)

TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You,

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[¥] GIRO [ ] Cash [ ] Cheque

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp_g... 22-Jun-18



