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Celine Fong !LKK.Auth

Friam: Darren Lee <Darren Lea@hibank.com .sg >

Sent: Wadnesday, 20 June 2018 1200 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAUtD)

Ces Vanessa Ngoi _

Subject: QUOTATION FOR DESKTOR VALUATION JUME 2018
Attachments: imig-620115326-0007 paf

Dirar Celine,

wWe would like to have a desktep Valuation for SKC3657P | damage on left tall lamp area) and YP2866T
Attached with log card

Thank you

Burst Regards

Darren Lee
PIS Credit Approval & Collections
HL. Bank Singapare
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Chasvsplas 000000 JHHUCSIHIOKDLT?EE PR A e S|

Mainm. Powser Cutpur: == e P = m—
| Cpen Mackst Vialue: i $30,170.00 |

Actis] ARF Paid: _ $1.508.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eliglhilicy-

Intended COE Rebate Details

P Palm . ;N . —
(COE Asbute dempunt: == ErmepnEseaee L
 Total Rebits Amount: . $5.912.00 OIS S D

“Tha informatian containe harein is cormect ax at 20 Jun 2018

FITIS.41W11. 0. OV, SQIMAIVINECHDN FeNQUITE HEDEIE By MUDICEETOMELIEINEUTAF LN | IN_ILI=hUsuau | |

w



B/20:2018 Singapore Used Car Lisfings - sgCarMant

SGCARMART.COM
THE ONIY PLACE FOR SMART CAR DUYERS
Hino XZU710R Used Vehicle List (2 vehicles)

Car Model Price Depreciation  Reg Date EngCap Mileage  Company Avaiiability

Hino XZUTL0R | [lessl %65,800 8,480 fyr 23:-Mar2016 4,009 cc - Avallable

1 O, 14 Fool B Loy, S0l Unger Agent Warranty Sendaces, Very Good Candition And Mo Regair Neesd,

Office N, - -
JefT Tan - 67755985

Hino KZUZ10R. | Dissel) $89,800 $10,660 /yr 16-Mow-2016  4009cc 20,000 km Avallable
N Agents Pleass, 1 Careful Owiier, New Risad Tax, Used | Yenr, 4 Years Aent Warrarity, 20k m Mileage, Free Servicing, Free Warranty, Serving At Agént,
Pl VP

Office No, - -

Fraddie Woo - 47305040

sqCarMart is the number one car Hassifieds for paratiil Import cars, Taybta, Monda, Nessan, Mitsubtini & BMW, There are plenty of cary for sile, even for COE
fars, OPC rars, viins, trucks, Bybrid cars, sports can o stationwirgons. You can afso buy from & cad suctiof, book up c3r loans, kiw, milesgs cars, car brahds,
rarpark rates & car insarpnce; We have new car deslars comprising parillel Imparters, authorised car dealirs, and vsed car dealers on our site. Fnd tew cir
price lisks, mew oo fauniches and new car promotiong, snd alss matoring vice, car revisws Bocar news 6n the latest modeds. Visit our partnar sies for job
openings for Singapore jobs, resl aaste properties for sale, mover, Gar parformance pitts, 7 discussion, fonm dsoussion, commercil vehice mm_amé
resubis.

i 2004-2018 tgCarMart. Al rights reserved,

-8

i www sgoanmart comiused_cars/ssarch_resull priceds!_prinl php?SA=AMOD=HIno%20XZUT 1IRARPG=204VEH-08RGD=2016&AVL=2
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Celine Fong !LKKAuto!

From: Caline Fong (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Friday, 22 June 2018 8:32 AM

To: ‘Darren Lee’

Ce= Vanessa Ngol

Subject: RE:QUOTATION FOR DESKTOP VALUATION JUNE 2018
De=ar Darren,

The valuation of YP 3866T Is as below:

NIV SE0K F5: 850K
Beat Regards,

Celine Fong

LEK Aulo Consultunts Pre Lid

phione: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauta.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ui Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Darren Lee [mailto:Darren.Lee@hlbank.com.sg)

Sent: Thursday, 21 June 2018 4:28 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkaute.com>

Cc: Vanessa Ngol <Vanessa Ngol@hlbank.com.sg=

Subject: RE: QUOTATION FOR DESKTOP VALUATION JUNE 2018

Hi Celirie,
Please see attached for YP3860T phote

Thank you

Bast Regards

Darren Lee
PFS Credit Approval & Collections
HL Bank Singapore

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) [mailto:celinefong@ikkauto,com]
Sent: Thursday, 21 June, 2018 4:24 PM

To: Darren Lee

Cc: Vanessa Ngol |

Subject: RE: QUOTATION FOR DESKTOP VALUATION JUNE 2018

Dear Darren,

The valuation of SKC3657P s as below:



MV: SBEK FS: 563K

For vehicle YP 3866T, please forward us photo of the said vehicle.

Bost Regards;

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

phione: 6256-3501 | emuilt g Kk [ fax: 6256-4315
Bk 51, Paya Ui Thdustrial Park, Ubi Avenud 1, #o2-25 | S(408933)

From: Darren Lee [maiito:Darren.Lee@hlbank.com,sg)
Sent: Wednesday, 20 Jupe 2018 12:00 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>
Vanessa.Ngoi@hibank.com. sg>

Cc: Vanessa Ngoi < &l
Subject: QUOTATION FOR DESKTOP VALUATION JUNE 2018

Cear Celine,
We would like to have & desktop Valuation for SKC3657P { damage on left tail lamp area) and YPIRGET
Attached with log card

Thank you

Best Regards

Darren Lee
PFS Credit Approval & Collections
HL Bank Singapore



