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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 14 November, 2018 9:57 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: GBG5781K & SKQ1945Y Accident Report DOA: 19/06/2018 LKK REF 

CC4/ASM18011374/Ahb3

Dear Vic ,  

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  

SAVE TIME & COST  

 

I will process legal flight 100% , video & scene photo very clear your insured turning into our lane & our car 

stopped behind the stop line then  your insured hit  .   

Your insured want see lawyer letter then he want his fault .  

No need waste my time .  

 

 
Regards,  

Chris Chan Pick Yuen 

 

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, November 14, 2018 9:52 AM 

To: chan pick yuen 

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: GBG5781K & SKQ1945Y Accident Report DOA: 19/06/2018 LKK REF CC4/ASM18011374/Ahb3  

  
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Chris, 
  
We refer further to the below email. 
  
Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of liability to our Insured’s 

part, our Insured had managed to claim 50/50 against your client’s insurer. We have our principal’s mandate and we 

offer a global sum of $2,900.00  (all in) to settle your client’s claim. 
  
Kindly let the owner sign the attached DV and forward back to us a clear copy for payment processing.  
  
Thank you. 
  
***NOTE: PLEASE USE OUR ATTACHED DV 
  
"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and 

should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement 

should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present 

matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer 

in any other related matters.  
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Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessary.... 

  

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
  
  

From: chan pick yuen [mailto:chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 13 November, 2018 11:46 PM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: Re: GBG5781K & SKQ1945Y Accident Report DOA: 19/06/2018 LKK REF CC4/ASM18011374/Ahb3 

  

Dear Vic ,  

  

2nd Reminder  

  

This case liability is clear with video camera & scene photos .  

I already explain with you . (* refer email 04.10.2018 )  

If your principal no offer in next 7 days , I have my client's instruction to process legal .  

Please let us have your reply soon . Thanks   

  
Regards,  

Chris Chan Pick Yuen 

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com> 

Sent: Saturday, October 20, 2018 6:22 PM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: Re: GBG5781K & SKQ1945Y Accident Report DOA: 19/06/2018 LKK REF CC4/ASM18011374/Ahb3  

  

Dear Vic ,  

  

1ST Reminder  

  

Please let us have your offer soon . Thanks  

  
Regards,  

Chris Chan Pick Yuen 

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Thursday, October 4, 2018 9:51 AM 

To: chan pick yuen 

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: GBG5781K & SKQ1945Y Accident Report DOA: 19/06/2018 LKK REF CC4/ASM18011374/Ahb3  
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Without Prejudice 
 

Dear Chris, 
 

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted. 
 

We will get back to you for an update in due course. 
  
Thank you. 
  

Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
  
  

From: chan pick yuen [mailto:chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 4 October, 2018 1:03 AM 

To: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: Fw: GBG5781K & SKQ1945Y Accident Report DOA: 19/06/2018 

  

Dear Sir / Mdm ,  

  

Enclosed is our invoice , rental , LOA , GIA , SCENE PHOTO & VIDEO .  

As request following :  

  

1. RC    $5000 ( AS AGREED )  

2. LOR $800 ( $100 INCLUDE GST X 8 DAYS - 7 days recommend + 1 day weekend )  

  

@ 100% ( video & scene photos very clear to show that , our client's vehicle GBG5781K slowing down & 

stopped  behind the stop line . your insured driver turning into our insured lane & encroach inside the stop 

line & hit onto our client's vehicle . please check the scene photo , I already circle your insured damaged 

parts fall down inside the stop line & tyre marked encroach our lane & inside the stop line  & our vehicle 

behind the stop line .  

  

total $ 5800/-.  

  

Please advise your insured or insurer bear his liability 100% in full settlement .  

Please let us have your settlement spoon . Thanks  

  
Regards,  

Chris Chan Pick Yuen 

F-1 AUTOCLINIC PTE LTD  
BLOCK 25 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4  
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# 05-26 SYNERGY @ KB  
SINGAPORE 417800 
HP: 92712214 
  

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, June 20, 2018 4:25 PM 

To: motor.survey@axa.com.sg 

Cc: cynthia.loh@axa.com.sg 

Subject: Fw: GBG5781K & SKQ1945Y Accident Report DOA: 19/06/2018  

  

Dear Sir / Mdm ,  

  

  

Your refer : SKQ1945Y 

Enclosed is our client's GIA report & video camera . 

Please let us have your 10 name list of surveyor to survey our client's vehicle : GBG5781K .  

  

  
Regards,  

Chris Chan Pick Yuen 

F-1 AUTOCLINIC PTE LTD  
BLOCK 25 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4  
# 05-26 SYNERGY @ KB  
SINGAPORE 417800 
HP: 92712214 

  

  

  


