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B V4 Vg LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
- g e = 51 Utr Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408533

- TEL: 256 3561 FAX 6256 4315

Reg. No 189607198R GST Reg MNo. 18-9607198-R

Affillated to Federation Intermationale Des Experts En Automobile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref CCe/EQIB011373/Kub3
T AN
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date = 22-06-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 068110
Code: EQI
1. Policy Particulars ;- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
insured Veh.  YF 13457 Veh. Inspected YM 8145P
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 22/08/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Maodification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
RiH Front Tyre mm
L/H Frant Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  07/05/2018 Inspection Date 21/06/2018
Survey held at AUTOWORX HOUSE
176 SIN MING DRIVE
#02-0
SINGAPORE 575721
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




4 2
AUTOWORX HOUSE

C/0.176 SIN MING DRIVE #02-01 SINGAPORE 575721
TEL: 64520715 FAX 84529250

ESTIMATE Vs 7y

75,25
Alk Sun Demoalition & Engineering
c/o 46 Lentor Plain
Singapore 786548 / a’?
Date: 19/5/2016
QUANTITY PARTICULARS AMOUNT (%)
RE: ISUZU NFRB5 1
1 pe rear tall gate s.nett S 1.20000( £
1 pe rear tall gate hinge s.nett sU  120.00| £
1pc rear floor panel and frame s.nett A1 700.00( A
1 pc rear tall lamp assy /5. ¢, s.nett SBo/cory 466.00|
1 pe rear side gate s.nett 7 1,500.00 f
1pc rear side gate hinge s.nett L 120.00
1pc *23 Pax" sticker s.neft o 3000) o
1 pc “100km/h" sticker s.nett ~~ 2000 X
1pc rear side gate guard s.nelt J. 850.00 X
sub-total 5,096.00
To remove and replace the parts mentioned abave,
panel beat and realign the necessary affected areas. 1,000.00| 7geor
To apply putty and apray painting on affected areas. 300.00( /ce/*
To check wiring system 40.00| 2 &¢
Total 6.436.00|
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Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

e EETE}R}R}R}Rb e ——

From: Joel Goh <joel goh@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 25 June 2018 9:55 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Ce Thin Thin (LEKAuUto); Admin A

Subject: RE Direct Settlement - Aceident Involving YP1345T (Ol : EQI - DM1BHOD1294-)G) AND
YMB145P (TP - LKK REF - CCE/EQI18011373/Kub3) on 17.052018

Attachments: YP13457 paf -

Dear Shu Pei

Attached our insured’s accident repart for your attention
Best Regards,

loel Goh

[
ﬂ‘ LW | _]T L
b hae (s

EQ Insurance Company Limited

did tel fax

B

B o A e C 3

Privlleged/Confidential information may be containgd in this messoge, If yol are not the intended recipient, please notify the sefi

From: Shu Pel (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupel@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, June 25, 2018 9:32 AM

To: Joel Goh

Cc: Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YP1345T (OI : EQI - TBA) AND YM&145F (TF : LKK REF -
CC6/EQI18011373/Kub3) on 17.05.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Joel,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle YM 6145P at M/s Autoworx House,
Enclosed for your perusal is:

- TP's GIA report
- Estimated cost of repair




Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge Is Thin Thin and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2360,

Thank you,

Besl Regards,

Shu Pei| Agmin

LEK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd

Pione: 6366-0055 | email shupeiSikbauto com | fax 67414108
Bl 51, Paya Ubi industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{4083933)




Hsiao Tuﬂ (LKKAuto)

From: claim autoworshouse@gmail com

Sent: Monday, 9 December 2019 3:55 PM

To: Hslao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT ¥YM 6145 L DOA 17052018 //LKK REF:

CC6/EQI18011373/Kpb3

Dear Hsiao Tong,

As the liability is unclear, we would like to propose 50-50 for the claim for fast settlement.
Thank you.

Best regards,

Ms. Lee

Autoworx House

No.176 Sin Ming Drive
#02-01 Singapore 575721
Tel: 96725547 / 87668115
Fax: 64517423

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Saturday, December 7, 2019 1:15 PM

To: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com

Cec: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=>; Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT ¥M 6145 L DOA 17052018 //LKK REF: CC6/EQI18011373/Kpb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to our below emalil,

Kindly advise.

*Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liabllity, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

LEE WLIRET JOr MITTY CRrIRmRs, ond Happy New Year 20U




Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phome: 6742-4197 | email: chewht@ lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue i, #02-25 | S(4084:11)

From: Hsiao Tang (LKKAuto)

Sent; Friday, 25 October 2019 8:25 AM

To: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>; Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT YM 6145 L DOA 17052018 //LKK REF: CC6/EQI18011373/Kpb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Please be informed that liability is unclear. Our insured driver reported that your client cut into his lane and resulted
the accident. Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy reference.

As per EQ instruction, we would like to request for evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) for our
necessary action.

Appreciate an early reply.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liabllity, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@ kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: 5u LI (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 11 October 2019 2:15 PM

To: claim.autowarxhouse@gmail.com; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) schewht@|kkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: FW: DIRECT SETTLEMENT YM 6145 L DOA 17052018

2




Without Prejudice

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email,

Please be informed that this matter is now handled by my colleague, Ms Hsiao Tong.
HI Hsiao Tang,

FYNA, our ref CC6/EQI18011373/Kpb3

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Su Li | Admin Support

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 (Ext:119) Email: Suli@lkkauto.com| Fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com [mailto:claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com|
Sent: Friday, 11 October 2019 11:59 AM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: FW: DIRECT SETTLEMENT YM 6145 L DOA 17052018

Hello,

The LOD of this case was sent on 10/04/2019.
Just to check if there are any updates on this case?
Thank you,

Best regards,

Ms. Ho

Autoworx House

No.176 Sin Ming Drive
#02-01 Singapore 575721
Tel: 96725547 / 87668115
Fax: 64517423

From: admin@supreme.sg <admin@supreme.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, April 10, 2019 10:23 AM

To: '‘Admin A' <cadmin-a@|kkauto.com=

Subject: DIRECT SETTLEMENT YM 6145 L DOA 17052018

Hello,

Attached is the LOD for settlement.
Kindly help me revert this to the officer in charge.
Thank you.




Best regards,

Yuki Ho

Supreme Auto Service Pte Lid
No.176 Sin Ming Drive
#02-01 Singapore 575721
Tel: 64528211

Fax: 64517423




Hsiao Tanﬂ [LKKAutn!

From: admin @ AutoworxHouse <claim autoworxhouse@gmall.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 10 March 2020 3:19 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LEKKAUtO)

Subject: Re: DIRECT SETTLEMENT YM 6145 L DOA 17052018 //LKK REF:

CCe/EQIT8011373/Kpb3

Dear Hsiao Tong,
We accept your offer. Do send us the DV soon.

Thank you,

Best regards,

Ms. Lee

Autoworx House

No.176 Sin Ming Drive
#02-01 Singapore 575721
Tel; 96725547 / 87668115

Fax: 64517423

On 3/8/2020 2:54 PM, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) wrote:
Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.
We propose settlement at a global sum of $220.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“please note that our above settlement Is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an
admission of lkability on our part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be
disclosed In any other related matter{s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is
made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this
offer in any ather related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of orig inal documents on demand at any time and executlon of
Discharge Voucher (for settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plalntiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall
be retained by us after we have made payment on the settiement sum.”




Best Regards,

Hsian Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LEKEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkanto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ui Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From; claim.autoworkhouse@gmail.com <claim.autoworxhouse@gmall.com>
sent: Monday, 9 December 2019 3:55 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT YM 6145 L DOA 17052018 //LKK REF: CC6/EQI1B011373/Kpb3

Dear Hsiao Tong,

As the liability is unclear, we would like to propose 50-50 for the claim for fast settlement,
Thank you.

Best regards,

Ms. Lee

Autoworx House

No.176 Sin Ming Drive
#02-01 Singapore 575721
Tel: 96725547 / 87668115
Fax: 64517423

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Saturday, December 7, 2019 1:19 PM

To: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>; Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT YM £145 | DOA 17052018 //LKK REF: CC6/EQI1801 1373/Kpb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to our below email.

Kindly advise.

*Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settiement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially

affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party s not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settiement.”

“Best Wishes for merry Chrtitmas, al Hapyy New Yiar 20000




Hest Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Hundler

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lud

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hslao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 25 October 2019 8:25 AM

To: claim.autoworkhouse@gmail.com
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>; Su Li [LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT ¥YM 6145 L DOA 17052018 //LKK REF: CC6/EQI18011373/Kpb3
Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Please be informed that liability is unclear. Our Iinsured driver reported that your client cut into his
lane and resulted the accident. Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy
reference.

As per EQ instruction, we would like to request for evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR)
for our necessary action,

Appreciate an early reply.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter ks purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed [ Inferred from this negatiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlemant.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@ kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Uhi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Su Li (LKK Auto) <sull@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 11 October 2019 2:15 PM

To: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
3




Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto com>
Subject: FW: DIRECT SETTLEMENT YM 6145 L DOA 17052018

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Please be informed that this matter is now handled by my colleague, Ms Hsiao Tong.
Hi Hsiao Tong,

FYNA, our ref CC6/EQI18011373/Kpb3

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Su Li | Admin Support

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 (Ext:119) Email: Suli@lkkauto.com| Fax: 67414108
Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 202-25 | S(408023)

From: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com allto:claim.autoworkhous mall.com
Sent: Friday, 11 October 2019 11:59 AM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: FW: DIRECT SETTLEMENT YM 65145 L DOA 17052018

Hello,

The LOD of this case was sent on 10/04/2019.
Just to check if there are any updates on this case?
Thank you.

Best regards,

Ms. Ho

Autoworx House
No.176 5in Ming Drive

#02-D1 Singapore 575721

Tel: 96725547 / 87668115

Fax: 64517423

From: admin@supreme.sg <admin@supreme.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, April 10, 2019 10:23 AM
To: 'Admin A' <admin-af@|kkauto.com>

Subject: DIRECT SETTLEMENT YM 6145 L DDA 17052018
Hello,

Attached is the LOD for settlement.
Kindly help me revert this to the officer in charge.




Thank you.

Best regards,

Yuki Ho

Supreme Auto Service Pte Ltd
Ne.176 Sin Ming Drive
#02-01 Singapore 575721
Tel: 64528211

Fax: 64517423

Best regards,

Admin Team,
Autoworx House
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Company Registration Mo, 198607 108R

S1 UHIAVE 1, A02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (045) 62560015

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Date: 06/04/2020
HI NT

—— YP 1345T (Insd Veh) |Your Ref. No.: DM18HO01294-JG

i YM 61451 (TP Veh) |OurRef. No.: CCS/EQI18011373/Kpa3q2

Date of Accident 7/5/2018

Liability 50%

Final Repair Cost ‘5 175.88 B

Loss of Use 1 50.00 1 days B B

Rental (If any) : ] days

Others:; - - 1 2.00 - N

- S

227.88

Final Settlement Sum |: § 220.00 |GLOBAL SUM

Remarks

1) |AUTOWORX HOUSE ' 220.00

- i 1
JOANNE LEE

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industnal Park, Singapore 408933
TEL 8255 1581 FAXM 5258 4315
Reg. No 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8807188-R

= e N R LT T O T T T N T e TR T i, P I 2 Py
i Afflliated to Federation Internationale Des Exp  ENn Automot

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Ref :
o Yo o MR
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date: 06-04-2020
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Code: EQI
Insured Veh. YP 13457 Veh. Inspected YM 6145L
Policy No. DMCPHQ17-005457 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DM18HO01294-JG Excess ($) 0.00

Assign From

GoOoD

Make & Model ISUZU NPR85 2000
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg 2007
Chassis No. JAANPRBSLTTI01807 Colour WHITE
Odometer 463621 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General

DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

[THE TRUCK HAD PARTIALLY RECOVERED AT THE TIME OF INSPECTION.

07/05/2018

o 'I.:.1 o I,-..-I,‘F.I: i I'_F ana
T T L e

Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[7.50 R 16X10 VIKRANT 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |7.50 R 16X10 VIKRANT 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |7.50 R 16X10(D) MIRAGE 77T mm
L/H Rear Tyre |7.50 R 18X10 (D) MIRAGE 77 mm

age!

21/06/2018

AUTOWORX HOUSE

176 SIN MING DRIVE
#02-01

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

1 Working Days




_I LL” LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

B iB BB §1 Ubi Ave 1 #01.25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
- TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg No: 199607188R GST Reg No. 19-9607198-R Page No.i1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. YM 6145L

REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR TAIL LAMP ASSY CRACKED / CUT 468.00| 155.00
LESS 15% DISCOUNT - -23.25
468,00 131.75
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR TAIL GATE (SN) SERVICEABLE 1,200.00 -
1|REAR TAIL GATE HINGE (SN) TO REPAIR SEE 120.00 B
LABOUR
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL AND FRAME (SN) TO REPAIR SEE 700.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR SIDE GATE (SN) TO REPAIR SEE 1.500.00
LABOUR
1|REAR SIDE GATE HINGE (SN) TO REPAIR SEE 120.00
LABOUR
1123 PAX' STICKER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 20.00 -
1|"100KM/H' STICKER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 20.00 -
1|REAR SIDE GATE GUARD (SN) SERVICEABLE 850.00 -
4,630.00 g
LABOUR
TO REMOVE AND REPLACE THE PARTS MENTIONED 1,000.00 100.00
ABOVE PANEL BEAT AND REALIGN THE NECESSARY
AFFECTED AREAS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR
TAIL GATE HINGE,REAR FLOOR PANEL AND
FRAME REAR SIDE GATE AND REAR SIDE GATE HINGE .
TO APPLY PUTTY AND APRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED 300.00 100.00
AREAS.
TO CHECK WIRING SYSTEM. 40.00 20.00
1,340.00 220.00
GRAND TOTAL 6,436.00 351,75
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