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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

-
From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto}
Sent: Friday, 22 June 2018 9:18 AM
To: Tan, Bennie-WZ; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: SUR
Subject: RE: Market Value for SGL1039L - DOA: 17/06/2018 9507468690SG

Dear Bennie,

The market value of SGL 1039L is $18K-$20K (Estimated) as at June 2018.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ [mailto:Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com]

Sent: Thursday, 21 June 2018 5:41 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Market Value for SGL1039L - DOA: 17/06/2018 9507468690SG

Hi LKK

Kindly assist to advise on the Market Value for the above vehicle.

Thanks.

Best Regards

Bennie Tan

AlG

Senior Complex Ciaims Examiner

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1718] Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must

not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by

"Reply" tommand and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars

PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

L TAE

Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC ( P\ \G‘)
Owner ID: 6112G

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: SGL1039L

Vehicle to be Exported: Yes

Intended De-registration Date: 19 Jun 2018

Vehicle Make: NISSAN

Vehicle Model: LATIO 1.5LA mV $ EK" -)—Ot
Primary Colour: White

Manufacturing Year: 2006

Engine No.: HR15371191

Chassis No.: JN1BAAC11Z0001329
Maximum Power Output: 80.0 kW (107 bhp)
Open Market Value: $15,027.00

Original Registration Date: 01 Sep 2006

First Registration Date: 01 Sep 2006

Transfer Count: 4

Actual ARF Paid: $16,530.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Forfeited

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: #

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 31 Aug 2021

COE Category: E - Open Category
COE Period(Years): 5

PQP Paid: $25,759.00

COE Rebate Amount: $16,480.00

Total Rebate Amount: $16,480.00

Message

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the
vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is earlier.
The information contained herein is correct as at 19 Jun 2018
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