Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 28 March, 2019 4:34 PM

To: Hunsin Lau

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SLG 2902E LKK REF CC4/ASM18011298/Ahb3

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that we had already received a copy of your accident report.

Kindly be advised that we are still pending for finalization with the claimant’s workshop with regards to the claim.
We will be looking into the matter and will proceed to settle the claim at best.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ LIRS

w0 Save the Earth Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Hunsin Lau [mailto:lauhunsin@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 27 June, 2018 10:08 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: SLG 2902E

Dear Sir

I am the owner of SLG2902E. The driver involved in the accident is my son.

I received your letter yesterday regarding a minor accident involving my car SLG2902E and the other car
SJQ 7683A on 19/06/2018.

The driver of SJQ7683A didn’t said he wanted to report to his insurance company and simply said he will
check with workshop and revert to my son,but waited many days had no response from him.

Anyway, we had made an accident report at SME Motor @ Kaki Bukit this morning.



I hereby enclose photo taken on his car damages on 19June for your reference in my separate email.

Regards
Lau Hun Sin
27-6-2018



