Cecilia Chunﬁ (LKK Auto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com=

Sent: Wednesday, 20 March 2019 4:37 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SGR81175 AGAINST SKK82264A DOA 17/06/18 AT CIME LEISURE
BASEMENT CARPARK EXIT GANTRY ***LKK REF.CC4/LPC18011290/T1pb3 [External
General]

Lonpac External - General
Dear Cecilia

Please our claim ref. 17/18/18/VP05/020688 for this case.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all { ¥8¥ ) lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: ONG LI LI

Sent: Wednesday, 20 March, 2019 4:33 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Admin A; Hslao Tong (LKKAuta)

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SGR8117S AGAINST SKK8226A DOA 17/06/18 AT CINE LEISURE BASEMENT CARPARK EXIT
GANTRY *=**_KK REF:CC4/LPC18011290/T1pb3 [External General]

Lonpac External - General
Dear Cecilia

Please proceed.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706
e}

The all (Me% lonpac.com.sg



Lonpac External - General data Js for internal / external use.

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 19 March, 2019 11:38 AM

To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT; GERALD POH WEE BIN; ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUtD)

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SGRB1175 AGAINST SKK8226A DOA 17/06/18 AT CINE LEISURE BASEMENT CARPARK EXIT
GANTRY *#*| KK REF:CC4/LPC18011290/T1pb3

Lonpac Ref: TBA
LKK Ref: CC4/LPC18011270/T pb3

Dear Sirs/Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 28/06/2018 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.,

This is a chain collision. Liability is not in our driver's favour.

Summary to offer to third party repairer, "MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD" is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $11,761.33 $ 6,366.50
2. Loss of Use [05days x $120.00) $ &00.00 $ 500.00 (5days x $100.00)
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee i3 2.00 3 2.00
Total | § 12,3563.33 S 6,8468.50

**05days recommendation for repair = 5days.
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval.

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 28 June 2018 5:40 PM

To: 'ERIC WOO JUN KIAT' <ericwoo@lonpac.com>; 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; ONG LI LI
<llong@lonpac.com>

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SGR81175 AGAINST SKK8226A DOA 17/06/18 AT CINE LEISURE BASEMENT CARPARK EXIT
GANTRY ***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18011290/T1pb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



@MOVA

\ 7

Our Ref cSGRA11TS/ TO20718 Main Office:
Your Ref - CC4/LPC18011290/pb3 Maova Bulding
Date ©17 January 2019 M

WITHOUT PREJUDICE . /00 e han
LONPAC INSURANCE BERHAD Fax ; (65) 6271 589
300 Beach Road AR T iy
#17-04/07 The Concourse w'ﬂ'h'ﬂ_h_ﬂli_l: Dle__pt__:
Singapore 199555. -

ATTN : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT (65) 6272 3892

Dear Sir/Mdm

ACCIDENT INVOLVING: SGR§11T$.& SKKB226A
DATE OF ACCIDENT: 17 JUNE 2018
ALONG: CINE LEISURE BASEMENT CARPARK EXIT GANTRY

We refer to the above.

We are claiming as per below:

Cost of Repairs $ 6,366.50
Loss of Use ($_120.00 x _05 days) % 600.00
Loss of Rental ($ _x _ days) + 7% 5

Towing Fees $

Medical Fee $

LTA /GIA Search Fee $2.00
E-Day License $

Loss of Income (5 _ x _ days) b

Grand Total ) $ 6,968.50

Documents enclosed:
Car date in: 26.06.2018 Car date out: 30.06.2018
Authorized Repair Days: _S (TP/IOB/AWS/Recovery-of Incidental Costs)

[;)(_ Invoice | Certificate of Insurance
Excess Invoice X | LTA/GIA Search Bill
Power of Attorney ~ | Taxi Bill
¥ | Police Investigation Report/G1A Medical Bill (photocopy)
|| Copies of NRIC/License of Owner/Driver Income Statement
| Rental Bil/Rental Agreement | E-Day License receipt (photocopy)
| Survey Report with Photographs | Towing Fee (photocopy)
Vehicle Registration Card/COE | Witness Statement
L ] Letter from Supplier Traffic Police Investigation Result

* This is @ computer generated letter and does not need a signature.



@MOVA

Please issue the payment of 5% 6,968.50 in favor of MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTELTD.  Auiomotive Ple Lid

If you have any enquires, please call or email Suann Chiu - suann@mova.com.sg

155; 6476 3353
% .':"_: B271 GBL
Thank you. AW, IOV GO ST
Yours faithfully, w“'kiﬂfﬂ"",f’-_ff.’
For Claims Manager : s

Claims Department

Bukit Merith Lane 3
SO1-04,DETAS
apofe 1597
NOTE: # Please note that the Loss of Use/Rental will be paid based on negotiation and on the i_'-:= 165] 52?2 3892
NIMA Protocol (Court Guideline). gl
# As of 01.06.08 all claims scenario will be based on the BOLA, Barometer Of Llat:uilt:..r
set by GlIA, General Insurance Association of Singapore.

* This is a computer generated letter and does not need a signatura.



@MOVA

Automotive Pte L t-d

Main Office: Mova Building, No. 22 Jalan Kilang, Singapore 158419, Tel : (65) 476 3333 Fax: (65)6271 5891 Website: WWW.MOVa.COm.5g
Workshop: Block 1008, Bukit Merah Lane 3, #01-04/06/08/%4, Singapore 158722 Tel : (B5) 6272 3892 Fax : (65) 6270 8314

POWER OF ATTORNEY

ACCIDENT INVOLVING (Owner's Vehicle No.) and (Third
Farty's Vehicle No.) an __along

BY THIS POWER OF ATTORNEY, *“I/We,

Z = *NRIC/Passport No. AR (Address)®
a company incorporate in Singapore and having its registered office at

B owner of Vehicle Registered No.
Sy MBS ___ hereby irrevocably appoint MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD,
(MOVA) a company incorporated in Singapore and having its registered office at Block 1008 Bukit Merah
Lane 3 #01-04/06/08 its agents or any person authorized by MOVA to be *my/our Attorney and in *my/our
name(s) and on “mylour behalf to do all or any of the following :

(Address)*

1. To submit, resolve and make any claim(s) (including the commencement of legal proceedings)
which "l/'we may have against the other ‘party/parties to the Accident and under the insurance
*policy/policies taken up b suﬁ ‘ptglrtwparties or alternatively under Insurance Policy No.

Y {'aij‘l’ w29 taken up by *me/us (subject to approval by my
Insurance Company) in respect of the cost of repairs, loss of use/rental and all other costs and
expenses, etc suffered by *me/us arising from the Accident (loss and damage).

2. For the purpose of such claim(s) as aforesaid, to appoint solicitors on *my/our behalf as *my/our Attorney
shall in MOVA absolute discretion, deem fit.

3. To collect payment(s) due in respect of any such claim(s) for the loss and damage, such payment
to be made by way of cheque in favor of MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD and to give a valid receipt
and discharge thereof,

4. For any of the purposes aforesaid, to execute, sign, seal and deliver all documents whatsoever in
relation thereto.

5. Generally do all such acts as it shall deem necessary for the purpose of settling such claim(s) and

6. To agree to any settlement at the absolute discretion of MOVA.

“I/We hereby declare that all acts, instruments and documents done by virtue of this Power of Attorney on
“my/our behalf by the Attorney, its agents or any person authorized by MOVA in its behalf shall be as good
valid and effectual to all intents and purposes whatsoever as it is the same had been done or executed by * me/us
in *my/our own proper person(s) and *l/we hereby ratify and confirm, all acts, instruments and documents done or
executed by virtue of the authority and powers hereby conferred.

*I/We hereby further declare that the powers and authority hereby conferred shall remain irrevocable.

“I/We further comfirm that the acceptance by MOVA of the settlement amount in respect of such constitute the
full discharge of mylour claim(s) in respect of such loss and damage.

*IN WITNESS WHEREOF. *I/We have hereunto to set *my/our hand and seal this day of the month
of , Year Two Thousand - (20 ).

Signed, Sealed & Delivered By

Customer's Name:
NRIC No:
Co's Rubber Stamp, where applicable. Insurer's copy *delete as appropriate.



i,

f' LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIMNO  17/18/18/VPOS/020688
DATE : 28/03/2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/'We. CHU MING CHEUNG confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner of SKK 8226A the sum of Singapore Dollars
Six Thousand, Eight Hundred Sixty Eight and Cents Fifty Only ($6,868.50) in full and
final satisfaction. liquidation and discharge of property claim competent to me/us upon
the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of propertv claim sustained by
me/us whether now or hereafier to become manifest. arising either directly or indirectly
from an accident to my vehicle. SGR 81175 on 17 June 2018 along/at Cineleisure
Basement Carpark Exit Gantry.

| /'We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LEE TECK HIAN /LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims whatsoever made by any
person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/s MOVA
Automotive Pte Ltd.

I/'We hereby acknowledge that this pavment is made on a without admission of liability
basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our insured’s recovery
action,

) : |
"l
O A

Signature of vehicle owner/Date

Cha "”'.m.{ If(__tﬂ.quu.-:l

MName of vehicle owner/Date



@MOVA

ve Pte Lid

Main Office:

Merva Building

: Page# - 1 131863 ..3:333
1 ax Invoice Tel: (65) 6476 3333

Vieh # ;= SGR8117S

/042019 Workshop Dept:
\eh Model .- MERCEDES BENZ B170 s

Blnck 1008
ikl Marah Lare 2
LCGMPAC INSURANCE BHD Tax # .. CK629829 Singapore 159722
300 TEACH ROAD i [E;j} 62723892
#17-04/07 The Concourse JOB # - T020718 v e el
SINGAPORE 109555, ACC. Date .. 17/06/18 o |:.:--r:w“;i.-:_~'-_ 40336
Terms .. C.OD '
Altention - XAD25 Remarks -
Mo Description Qty U.Price Amounts S§
Lump Sum Amount 5,950.00
E.&0E
|

|f|| AMOUNT S§ 5,8950.00

\ / GST@ 7% 416.50

\ jéf’ AMOUNT DUE S$ 6,366.50

Customer's Sianature/Co. Stamp MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTELTD



. GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
e & Raffles Quay #18-00. Singapore 048580
- ﬂ"!" |“SURANC Phane: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

I3 Operating Hau_rs: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE 8T Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE
Chir Ref Ma GR-18-002130
Dale of Request; TRDBZ018 Yaour Fef Mao: Online Purchasa
Maova Automotive Ple L
Blk 1008, #01-04/06/08/94
Bukit Merah Lane 3
Singapaore 159722
Dear SirfMadam,
Enguiry Date 180652018
Enguiry By Ho Kerl Shin
TF Wehicle Mo, SHEBZ26A
Accidant Date 17M06/2018
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (55)
TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amouwnt Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You,

This is & computer penerated dooument and requires no signature.

For GIARME Official usa
Date:
|¥] GIRC [ ] Cash [ ] Chequa



GENERAL
INSURANCE

RECORDS MAMAGEMENT CENTRE

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: <65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday 1o Friday Sam o Spm
GET Registration Mo: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Cur Ref No GR-18-002130

Date of Request; 18/06/2018 Your Ref Mo Online Purchase

Mava Automotva Ple Lid

Blk 1008, #01-04/06/08/24

Bukit Marah Lane 3

Singapore 159722

Dear SirMdadam,

Enguiry Date 18062018

Enguiry By Ho Kerl Shin

TP Vehicle Mo. SHKBZZ6A

Accident Date 17/108/2018

Enguiry Result

TP Vehicle Mo. Ingurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. Ma
SHKEZZEA Lonpac Insurancs Bhd 0208201 701092018 +B5 62507388
Thank Yeu

The images provided lo you are taken from the original reparts forwarded 1o the centre by the members af the General Insurance Assocation of $ ngapone and we take no responsibiiity for
their accuracy or conlents and shall be undes no kability whatscever for any less or damane ansing out of or in connection with the repars ar their mages,

This is & computer generated document and requirnes no signature



