Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 19 March 2019 11:38 AM

To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT; 'geraldpoh@lonpac.com’; ONG LI LI

Cc: '‘MT_Claim_SG'; Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SGR8117S AGAINST SKK8226A DOA 17/06/18 AT CINE LEISURE
BASEMENT CARPARK EXIT GANTRY ***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18011290/T1pb3

Attachments: LKK ADJUSTMENT REPORT.pdf; LKK INSPECTION REPORT.pdf; LKK RESURVEY PHOTO

(DISMANTLE).pdf; LKK RESURVEY PHOTO.pdf; LKK SURVEY PHOTO.pdf; LOD AND
OTHER DOCUMENTS.pdf

Lonpac Ref: TBA

LKK Ref: CC4/LPC18011290/T1pb3
Dear Sirs/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 28/06/2018 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

This is a chain collision. Liability is not in our driver's favour.

Summary to offer to third party repairer, “MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD” is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $11,761.33 $ 6,366.50
2. Loss of Use (05days x $120.00) $  600.00 $ 500.00 (5days x $100.00)
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $ 2.00 $ 2.00
Total | $12,363.33 $ 6,868.50

**05days recommendation for repair = 5days.
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval.

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 28 June 2018 5:40 PM

To: 'ERIC WOO JUN KIAT' <ericwoo@lonpac.com>; 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>; ONG LI LI
<llong@Ilonpac.com>




Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SGR8117S AGAINST SKK8226A DOA 17/06/18 AT CINE LEISURE BASEMENT CARPARK EXIT
GANTRY ***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18011290/T1pb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SGR 8117S at M/s Mova Automotive Pte Ltd.
Enclosed for your perusal is:
- Preliminary advice
- TP estimated cost of repair

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 20 June 2018 2:53 PM

To: 'ERIC WOO JUN KIAT' <ericwoo@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt _claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SGR8117S AGAINST SKK8226A DOA 17/06/18 AT CINE LEISURE BASEMENT CARPARK EXIT
GANTRY

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT [mailto:ericwoo@lonpac.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 20 June 2018 12:58 PM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; nitha@mova.com.sg




Subject: FW: TP CLAIMS - SGR8117S AGAINST SKK8226A DOA 17/06/18 AT CINE LEISURE BASEMENT CARPARK EXIT
GANTRY

Dear Catherine / Nivitha,

Kindly refer to our attachment and email below.

Please proceed to conduct a survey of the vehicle SGR 8117S on without Prejudice Basis.
We look forward to receiving your report soon.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Eric Woo

Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6279 9253 | Fax: (65) 6296 3767

From: nitha [mailto:nitha@mova.com.sq]

Sent: Wednesday, 20 June, 2018 12:48 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Cc: avril@mova.com.sg; tanyw@mova.com.sg

Subject: TP CLAIMS - SGR8117S AGAINST SKK8226A DOA 17/06/18 AT CINE LEISURE BASEMENT CARPARK EXIT
GANTRY

Dear Sir/Madam,
Good day

REF : SKK8226A
Kindly assist revert officer in charge and liability for the above mention case.

Best Regards,
N UHroo
Claims Officer

Mova Automotive Pte Ltd
Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA ¢ o

Automolive Ple Ltd



