¥an

-
2\ ]J;"FL BY l R_E*F: (- / f‘lell Em ‘I:N"3 /U ‘J‘) |Epr.'l.5ﬂ Wnétsuction.

r'“.‘.l':‘.'lli'l ASSIGNMENT (Office)

Frotis Py Kﬂu\qm i G Datetime: SWH YOS 11-16m
Estimaied Cost; N B . B
cm@wsrrunms:unuwuwa;m:mwm ' .

Tolnspect Vehicle No: QLH %?I%ﬂ Insured:; o CIEF {ﬂ%f’

ut Workshop m/s - Kﬁh m'ilr Tel Lmlh_ah::g

of . 15 ot RIJ. [1 o
Policy No:. _ ~ Claim Mo _L'IHQ_HVCE ﬂﬂQ *33_:{.5

Sum Insured: . . . Euxcess _ s —_

Make of Ve - DOA __m-!}h@g -
(CTient's Recnd) ' o o

CA | REV | REP. | _Ey 24 HRS Dﬁ‘ m}}m% G lbm WOL: Endogsegent:

_ DatefMme; __ lm.h'lm;& “ I-IE.UIr'. Person © 11ulﬁl_.lr_1| _PK_%__ - o= - Netigle-TN 1@

Date/ Time HLHUH."JI.IH'IﬂILHH.I[': '!I \/ ) [_":'.lhfﬂ".r‘-h"

1S3 SR - N /efpisoiong /al Ul (008

Ly
[

_ |BT I8P - x

_E:R[& | Emal {-;ﬁ'h ied 4o K'f"mhn




REF: (ﬁ
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on J@ WS | TP RES /0D RES | EVA | INV | MV

ASSI

GNMENT

b |mie

To Inspect Vohicle No: 8 LH 84 giﬂ[

at Waorkshop mis \’(Ll'r\ MB{'DT’
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Insured

Palicy No

Claims No

2um Insured Excess
(Client's Record) ”.'l am

Make of '-.'I“.lh M‘j

(Falicy Condition)
Remark: The veh had commenced its
repair at the time of inspection.

Bal. or Market Value

DAC Accident Rport: Consistent? ; Yes
ﬂy]{ Caan j— Consistent? | Yes
Esl, Repairs: l‘F days  Res. Yes
Lum Sum B Ival: Yes

CA | REV | REP, | 24HRS F'uf; -

Person Contacled:

or No
or No
or No

or No

Vehicle: [N [OUT

Veh No 5Lffa€7f7? viregn: (D1 /6

Type: @Jﬂ' M.Cycle [ Bus { Van [ Lorry | Taxi | Prime Mover |

Truck ! Trailer or (ﬁ /

Caolour o, /tf-!.-" AC:  Insured ! Std | NLTNA

Sp.Reating 3 %/ da7 T/Radio: Insured | Std [ NI | NA

Eng/No

Citio MRHFc& 450 AT 000307

Gen Cond(Gdag | Fair | Poor | Burnt

Steering: Ingretr | Jammed | Leaked | Burnt or

Brake: | ammed [ Leaked | Burnt or
Modi: Wil NS/Rim J STD A/IRim or

Tyre Size: F: g (_ff _f‘\.(_"t / (
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D.OA 'p///{t{/ D0l _2/7/05

——
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| 3 74 74

- . Consullants
B . Pie [ Company Registration No. 1986071

S1 UKLAVFE 1, #0225 PAYA LRI ISDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) H256A5A1 FAX (065 615364

Your Ref: PLEASE ADVISED
Our Ref: CS/GAIIB011283/Uvb Date:3/7/2018

The Motor Claims Department
M/s: GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY

Dear Sir/Madam.

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.SLH 878A

We thank you for your instruction on 21/6/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

212018 at the premises of M/s KA MOTOR CO SDN BHD
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5§85,988.08
Revised Estimate Amount : 552,378.57
"Check” Items Amount 1 5%6.90
Market Value : 55

LTA Reimbursement Value : 8%

Nett Value (8%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
rear ofs portion

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

#

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 3 July 2078 11:34 AM

To: 'Ngian, Kelvyna'; SUR

Subject: RE: CLMOMVCO00003275 : TP survey SLH&78A (LIBERTY) & GBF678P (GAIC) DOA:
02/06/2018@13.00PM

Attachments: SLH 878A PRELI REVISED.pdf

Dear Kelvyna,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLH 878A
Date of survey: 2/7/2018
Number of days :4 days

Bect Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Thursday, 21 June 2018 11:39 AM

To: 'Ngian, Kelvyna' <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>

Cc: assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: CLMOMVCD00003275 : TP survey SLH878A (LIBERTY) & GBF678P (GAIC) DOA: 02/06/2018@13.00PM

Dear Kelwyna,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer arrange survey on 29.06.2018.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ngian, Kelvyna [mailto:Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.
Sent: Thursday, 21 lune, 2018 11:11 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Subject: CLMOMVYCO00003275 : TP survey SLHB78A (LIBERTY) & GBF678P (GAIC) DOA: 02/06/2018@@13.00PM

Hi team

Please conduct TP survey Friday 22/06/2018@10.30am



Thanks
Kelvyna

From: Ary Chua <arychua@honda.com.sg=>

Sent: Wednesday, June 20, 2018 4:12 PM

To: Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna Ngian@sg.gaig.com>

Cc: Liew Thye Wui <twliew@honda.com.sg>

Subject: [External] RE: TPDS: SLH878A (LIBERTY) & GBF678P (GAIC) DOA: 02/06/2013@13.00PM

Hi Kelvyna
Kindly Establish this case Liability lssue?
We Choose 5. LKK Auto Consultants

Thank you

Best Regards,

Ary Chua Wai Ngee

Bodyshap Service Advisor Kah Mator Co Sdn.Bhd.15 Ubi Road 4 Singapore 408610
E-mail arychuaf@honda.com.sg Fax: 67480770 DID:EB465673  H/P:81006306
From: Ngian, Kelvyna [I‘Hfii|‘{I.".|:Kei"ﬂ,-'r‘_:a.NE,iHﬂ@SE.Eai[-_‘,.L.I:}ITl]

Sent: Wednesday, 20 June, 2018 3:21 PM

To: Ary Chua <arychua@honda.com.sg=>

Cc: Liew Thye Wui <twliew@honda.com.sg>

Subject: RE: TPDS: SLH878A (LIBERTY) & GBF678P (GAIC) DOA: 02/06/2018@13.00PM
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Ary

We append the following list of our panel surveyors:-

1.  AJAX Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd
2. L.B.S. Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd
3. Priority Services

4.  RT Appraisal Pte Ltd

5.  LKK Auto Consultants

6. 1P KNIGHTS PTE LTD

Please advise,

Thanks

Kelvwyna

From: Ary Chua <arychua@honda.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, June 20, 2018 2:30 PM

To: Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg gaig.com>; Michael.Tay@sg.gaig.com; General Claims
<GeneralClaims@sg.gaig.com>

Cc: Liew Thye Wui <twliew@honda.com.sg>

Subject: [External] TPDS: SLH878A (LIBERTY) & GBF&78P (GAIC) DOA: 02/06/2018@13.00PM
Hi QIC-GAIC

Kindly Arrange for car Survey this Friday 22/06/2018@10.30am

Thank you

Bast Regards,

Ary Chua Wai Ngee
Bodyshop Service Advisor Kah Motor Co.Sdn.Bhd. 13 LIbi Road 4 Singapore 408610
E-mail: arychua@honda.comsg  Fax 67480770  DID:6B465673  H/P:.81006306

CIVIC rrel

UPSIZE YOUR THRILL



Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Mgian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna Ngian@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Thursday, 21 June, 2018 11:11 AM

To: SUR; Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject; CLMOMVCO00003275 : TP survey SLHEVBA (LUBERTY) & GBFG78P (GAIC) DOA:
02/06/2018@13.00FM

Attachments: GBFE&78P.pdf; 2401_001.pdf; SLHE78A.pdf

Hi team

Please conduct TP survey Friday 22/06/2018@10.30am

Thanks
Kelwyna

From: Ary Chua <arychua@honda.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, June 20, 2018 4:12 PM

To: Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg_gaig.com>

Cc: Liew Thye Wui <twliew@honda.com.sg>

Subject: [External] RE: TPDS: SLHE78A (LIBERTY) & GBF678P (GAIC) DOA: 02/06/2018@13.00PM

Hi Kelvyna
Kindly Establish this case Liability |ssue?
We Choose 5. LKK Auto Consultants

Thank you

Best Regards,

Ary Chua Wai Ngee

Bodyshop Service Advisor Kah Motor Co.Sdn Bhd.15 Ubi Road 4 Singapore 408510
E-mail arychua@honda.comsy Fax 67480770 DID:BB465673  H/P.31006306
From: Ngian, Kelvyna [mailto:Kelvyna. Ngian@sg.gaig.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 20 June, 2018 3:21 PM

To: Ary Chua <arychua@honda.com.sg>

Cc: Liew Thye Wui <twliew@honda.com.sg>

Subject: RE: TPDS: SLHA78A (LIBERTY) & GBF678P (GAIC) DOA: 02/06/2018@13.00PM
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Ary

We append the following list of our panel surveyors:-
AJAX Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd

L.B.S. Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd

Priority Services

RT Appraisal Pte Ltd

LKK Auto Consultants

6. JP KNIGHTS PTE LTD

Please advise.

Thanks

Kelwyna

From: Ary Chua <arychua@honda.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, June 20, 2018 2:30 PM

To: Ngian, Kelvyna <kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>; Michael. Tay@sg.gaig.com; General Claims
<GeneralClaims@sg gaig.com>




Cc: Liew Thye Wui <twliew@honda.com.sg>
Subject: [External] TPDS: SLH878A (LIBERTY) & GBF678P (GAIC) DOA: 02/06/2018@13.00PM
Hi OIC-GAIC,

Kindly Arrange for car Survey this Friday 22/06/2018@10.30am

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ary Chua Wai Ngee

Bodyshop Service Advisor Kah Motor Go.Sdn.Bhd, 15 Ubi Road 4 Singapore 408610
E-mail: arychua@honda.comsa  Fax: 67480770 DID:GE465673 H/P:81006306

T

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and
exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately
notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you.

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended salely for the addresses: If vou are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited, If vou receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

#

From: Ary Chua <arychua@honda.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 19 July 2018 8:12 PM

To: Marcus Chua (LKKAuto); SUR

Cc: Liew Thye Wui; Faeaz

Subject: 15T Reminder: Finalise TPDS: SLH&78A (LIBERTY) & GBFETBP (GAIC) DOA:
02/06/2018@13.00PM

Attachments: 2914_001.pdf

Hi Marcus Chua
Kindly Finalise TPDS: SLHE78A (LIBERTY) & GBF678P (GAIC) DOA: 02/06/2018@13.00PM — 15! Reminder

Final Repair Costs (include GST) $2,378.57 + (5166.49) = $2,545.06
Repair Period* (Working Day) 04
*NOTES: The Repair Not Includes Public Holiday & Sunday.
Please examineg the above information carefully, If no discrepancy ks reported within 7 days [exclude Sunddy and Public Holiday) fram

the date of this email, the information will be considered as comect. Thereafter, no adjustment will be mode,

Thank you

Bast Regards,

Ary Chua Wai Ngee

Bodyshop Service Advisor Kah Motor Co.Sdn.Bhd. 15 Ubi Road 4 Singapore 408610

E-mail grychua@hordacomsyg Fax 67480770 DID.6B46567T3  HIP.B10D06308

From: Ary Chua

Sent: Friday, 6 July, 2018 8:44 AM

To: Marcuschua@lkkauto.com; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Liew Thye Wui <twliew@honda.com.sg>; Faeaz <faeaz@honda.com.sg>

Subject: Finalise TPDS: SLH878A (LIBERTY) & GBF678P (GAIC) DOA: 02/06/2018@13.00PM
Hi Marcus Chua,

Kindly Finalise TPDS: SLHB878A (LIBERTY) & GBFEB78P (GAIC) DOA: 02/06/2018@13.00PM

Final Repair Costs (include GST) §2,378.57 + (5166.49) = 52,545.06

Repair Period* (Working Day) 04

*NOTES: The Repair Not Includes Public Holiday & Sunday.
Please examine the above information carefully, If no discrepancy is reported within 7 doys [exclude Sunday and Public Holiday] fram
ihe date of this email, the information will be considered as corect. Thereafter, no adjustment will be made,

Thank you

Best Regards,

Ary Chua Wai Ngee

Bodyshop Service Advisor Kah Motor Co.Sdn.Bhd 15 Ubi Road 4 Singapore 408610
E-mail aryvehua@hongda.com sa  Fax: 67480770 DID:BB4656T3 H/P:81006306

[x] £

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and
exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately
notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you.



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner 1D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
0225E

SLH878A

No

02 Jul 2018
HONDA

CIVIC LAVTICVT
Silver

2016
R16B21600434
MRHFC5650GT0O00307
92.0 kW (123 bhp)
$19,491.00

04 Oct 2016

04 Oct 2016

0

$19,491.00

Yes
03 Oct 2026
$14,618.00

03 Oct 2026

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$53,334.00

$44,014.00

$58,632.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 02 Jul 2018

https://vrl.Ita.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateBy PublicBeforeDereglnput ?ZFUNCTION _ID=F0304...

Page 1 of 1

02-Jul-18



\ HON'DA N
KAH MOTOR CO. SDN. BHD. fuconta

(A Member of the Oriental Holdings Berhad)

Service and Body Repair AL

Tel: +55 6841 3838

Website: www honda.com.sg Do

For 24-hours Roadside Assistance, Call 98203838

1 -
MEC APl rHeYY

QUOTATION

GST Reg Mo.- M200050223
Company Ref. No.. SB0FC13B0G
L1 0

) B * Fothoring

Dog appoiticet

Customer : GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE Document No. : SQT18002525 Page 1
3 TEMASEK AVENUE Date + 20, Jun 2018
#16-01 CENTENNIAL TOWER Customer No. : WZG001
SINGAPORE 039190 Sve Advisor : ARY CHUA WAI NGEE
Registration No . SLHBT78A Engine No : R16B21600434
Chassis No : MRHFCSB50GT000307 Date | Time . 20, Jun 2018 1:19:42 PM
Model : CVIC 1.6 VTI YM2016 Surveyor Name g
Owner's Name : TOH WONG LIM Survey Date . BIf: +65 GRAE BRTI
Ins Policy No. . 5D16V13008NPC2/R00 Authorisation Date Ea ;J-,'r-—.m.;-...- -
Date of Accident  : 4/6/2018 s
0% GST Amount
Iter Description Qty  UnitPrice Disc%  Amount Amount incid GST
TP DIRECT SETTLEMENT {(J/NO: 70713)
CWNER: TOH WONG LIM
OWNER INSURER: LIBERTY INSURANCE PTE LTD
ACC DATE: 04/06/2018@ 13.00PM
SURVEYED BY
DATE:
REF NO
TP INSURER: GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY
91505-TME-003 CLIPBUMPER Al 14 2.00 25 — 2100~ 147 2247
71500.TEC-Q002Z  FACE ASSYRRBUMPER 7 7S 1 §17.20 25 7 46290 .~ 3240 485.30
75722-TBA-ADOD EMBLEM SETRR s 1 11.50 25 ) gez A 060 922
75725-TEA-TOA EMBLEMRR 11 1 10.60 25 M 795 % 056 851
71530-TEA-TO0ZZ  BEAM COMPRR.BUMPER  »14 1 173.00 25 X 12075 * 908 138.63
71502-TEX-Y 0O GARNISH RR.BUMPER LOWER ﬁﬁ 1 38.20 25 = 2885 X 20 3066
71503-TEA-T0O GARNISHR.RR.BUMFPER SIDE M jre !V{ 1 760 25 & 570" 040 810
71593-TEA-TO1 SPACERR RR BUMPER SIDE ~ Fewr? 1 11.50 25 = 8E2” 0860 8.22
71598-TEA-TO1 SPACERLRRBUMPERSIDE A 17 1 11.50 25 B.62 060 9.22
33505-TEA-TO1 REFLECTOR ASSYRRR. 1 4 1 7.00 25 g 525 0.37 562
71505-TBA-ADD BRACKETR RR BUMPER SiDE 4 1 2.20 25 Wy 1.65 D12 1.77
33500-TEA-TOM TAILLIGHT ASSYR. A72p 1 253.80 25 190.35 ~° 13.32 20367
34150-TEX-YD1 LIGHT ASSYRLID A A 1 118.70 25 802 * 523 95.25
Sum Item 968.08 6176 1.035.84
BOSUN SUNDRIES A 10000 20 10000 700  107.00
B2 mﬁEgT RR LIGHTING MECHANISMS. PERFORM 3 Sani0 qp > T 16580
BAD2ZR REMOVE & RENEW REVERSE SENSORS-4 PCS (N) 24000 / 3 O 24000 1680 256.80
BKRP225 STRAIGHTEN ALIGN RR PANEL RR R FENDER & RENEWh" ?*¥b0.00 ‘1[- J O 1800.00  126.00 1926.00
AR %J;F:M’ PAINTING OM REF'A:;ED zﬂl FEEFLACED AREAS. 0000 9 00 270000  185.00 288,00
. ":j Sumlabor 502000 35140 537140



HONDA

KAH MOTOR CO. SDN. BHD.

(A Member of the Oriental Holdings Berhad)

Service and Body Repair

Tel: +55 5841 3838 Website: www honda com sg
For 24-hours Roadside Assistance, Call 98203838

QUOTATION

GST Reg Mo.: M200050223
Company Ref. No., S60FC1380G

Customer . GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE Document No. : SQT18002525 Page 2

3 TEMASEK AVENUE Date + 20, Jun 2018

#16-01 CENTENNIAL TOWER Customer No, : WZG00

SINGAPORE 039190 Svc Advisor : ARY CHUA WAI NGEE
Registration No ; SLHET8A Engine No : R16B21600434
Chassis No . MRHFC5650GT000307 Date | Time : 20. Jun 2018 1:19:42 PM
Modal : CWVIC 1.6 VTI YM2016 Surveyor Name s DND : +B5 GALE 5673
Owner's Name . TOH WONG LIM Survey Date HP ;<85 8100 6301
Ins Policy No. - SD16V13008/VPC2/R00 Authorisation Date ;& S JeeEREEE
Date of Accident - 4/6/2018

0% GST Amount

item Description Qty _ UnitPrice Disc%  Amount Amount incid GST
Survey By MG el A
Date & Time 2/ ?/{f @ /0. Yoan. Total Amount 598808 41916  6407.24
Excess —_ % Tetal (Inclusive of GST) 6.407.24
Status V9 / ShttotiA
Signature ?r'é‘ /JA( gg/{u ja-:

7e( ¢ 28B2¢8/

i

Acknowledgad by [« e pe—

Cate

Printed on 2006/2018 2:08:23 PM
This is 8 computer génergléd nvoece. No sgnatune i3 regJined

Far prices are subjectad 1o changs without malkse.
Tra abown eslimated cost of repar da not include any unfareseen damages

GST Amount is calculaled from indvidual lme(s)



V) HONDA

KAH MOTOR CO. SDN. BHD.
(4 Member of the Oriental Holdings Berhad)

SERVICE PRE-INVOICE

GST Reg Mo M200050223
Company Ref. No.. S80FC1380G

370 Uki Road 3 Singapore 408651, Tel: +55 6841 3883 Fac +65 6741 5022
265 Alexandra Road Singapore 158937, Tel: +65 6471 5458 Fax; +65 6471 5460

Customer: WZG001 F_GR_E.!&T AMERICAN Document No: SV018038284
Chassis No: MRHFCS650GT000307 Printed By: ARYCHUA
License No: SLHBTEBA Order Date: 2. July 2018
Mileage: 34188 Order Time: 11:03:59 AM
Engine No: R16B21600434 Service Advisor: ARY CHUA WAI NGEE
TEM DESCRIPTION Qry  UNIT DISC%  AMOUNT T
TP DIRECT SETTLEMENT (JMND: 70713)
OWNER: TOH WONG LIM
OWMNER INSURER: LIBERTY INSURANCE FTE LTD D - Ar
ACC DATE: 04/08/2018@ 13 00PM N /
SURVEYED BY: MARCUS CHUA(LKKAUTO)02/07/2018@10.40A §
REF NO:
TP INSURER: GREAT AMERIGAN INSURANCE COMPANY
01505-TM8-003 CLIPBUMPER 14 2,00 25 21.00 1.47 2047
74500-TEC-Q00ZZ FACE ASSY,RR.BUMPER 1 B1720 25 462.90 3240 49530
71503-TEA.TOO GARNISHR.RR BUMPER SIDE 1 7.60 25 5.70 D40 B.10
71583-TEA-TO4 SPACERR.RR BUMPER SIDE 1 11.50 25 B.52 050 922
33500-TEA-TO1 TAILLIGHT ASSYR. 1 25380 25 190.35 1332 203,67
SUM PARTS: 688.57 4819 736.76
BOSUN 0672 1 20.00 20,00 1.40 21.40
SUNDRIES
BMLOZI EXT-YJ 1 B0.00 B0.00 560 B5.60
INSPECT RR LIGHTING MECHANISMS.
PERFORM WATER
TEST.{N)
BAOZR EXT-YJ 1 130.00 130,00 9.10 139.10
REMOVE & RENEW REVERSE
SENSORS- PCS (N}
BHRP22S EXT-YJ 1 58000 560.00 38,20 599,20
STRAIGHTEN ALIGN RR PANEL RR R
FENDER & RENEW
DAMAGE PARTS.
BPOZR EXT-YBH 1 900.00 500,00 §3.00 863,00
SPRAY PAINTING ON REPAIRED OR
REPLACED AREAS.(2F)
SUM LABOUR:  1,690.00 {4830  1,808.30
TOTALSGD 237857 16648 254506
Total Payable (SGD) 2,545,086

G5T Amount is calculabad from indhidual Tneds)



' I V4 l/ LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

AV 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
g TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607198-R
Afflliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY Ref : CS/GAINB011283/Uvbn2
Dy CENTEAL LRI
#16-01 CENTENNIAL TOWER Date: 24-07-2018
SINGAPORE 035190
Code: GAl
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBF 678P Veh. Inspected SLH B78A
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CLMOMYVCO00003275 Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From KELVYNA Assign Date 21/06/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA CIVIC (A) c.c 1597
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. MRHFCE850GTO00307 Colour SILVER
Odometer 34187 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Maodification SPORTS RIM
General GOoOoD
5 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/55 R16 HANKOOK & mm
L/H Front Tyre |213/55 R16 HANKOOK 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[215/55R16 HANKOOK & mm
L/H Rear Tyre [215/55R16 HANKOOK 8 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR O/S PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  02/08/2018 Inspection Date 02/07/2018
Survey held at KAH MOTOR CO SON BERHAD
15 UBI RDAD 4
SINGAPORE 408610
5a, Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

IESTII".I'EATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days
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Sdl BE B

TEL. 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Rog. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 18-8607188-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLH 878A

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Page Mo 1 of 1

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop {;} “j}
REP F
14|CLIPBUMPER (SN) NECESSARY 21.00 21.00
1|FACE ASSY RR BUMPER (SN) DISTORTED 462.90 462.90
1|EMBLEM SETRR (SN} NOT NECESSARY 8.62 -
1 |EMBLEMRR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 7.95 .
1|BEAM COMPRR.BUMPER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 129.75 -
1|GARNISH,RR BUMPER LOWER (SN} NOT NECESSARY 28.65 -
1|GARNISH,RR BUMPER SIDE (SN) GRAZED 5.70 570
1|SPACERR RR BUMPER SIDE (SN) BENT 8.62 8.62
1|SPACERL RR BUMPER SIDE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 8.62
1|REFLECTOR ASSYR.RR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 5.25 :
1|BRACKETR.RR BUMPER SIDE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 165 :
1|TAILLIGHT ASSYR (SN) BROKEN 190.35 190.35
1|LIGHT ASSYR.LID (SN) NOT NECESSARY 89.02 2
1|SUNDRIES (SN) NECESSARY 100.00 20.00
1,068.08 708.57
LABOUR
INSPECT RR LIGHTING MECHANISMS. PERFORM 180.00 80.00
WATER.
REMOVE & RENEW REVERSE SENSORS-4 PCS. 240.00 130.00
STRAIGHTEN ALIGN RR PANEL RR R FENDER & RENEW 1,800.00 560.00
DAMAGE PARTS.
SPRAY PAINTING ON REPAIRED OR REPLACED 2,700.00 900.00
AREAS.BUMPER & FENDER RH ONLY.
4 520.00 1.670.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,988.08 2,378.57
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | 2,378.57

Report Ref No. CS/GAI18011283/Uvbn2

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser




VU HONDA

KAH MOTOR CO. SDN. BHD.
(A Member of the Oriental Holdings Berhad
Sarvice and Body Repair

Tel +55 G841 3838

Website: www.honda com.sg

For 24-hours Roadside Assistance, Call 98203838

QUOTATION

GST Reg Mo M200050223
GCompany Ref. MNo.. S60FC1380G

Customer - GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE Document No. : SQT18002525 Page 2

3 TEMASEK AVENUE Date + 20. Jun 2018

#16-01 CENTENNIAL TOWER Customer No. + WZG0MM

SINGAPORE 039190 Svc Advisor - ARY CHUA WAl NGEE
Registration No - SLHB78A Engine No : R16B21600434
Chassls No + MRHFCS650GTO00307 Date | Time : 20, Jun 2018 1:19:42 PM
Model - CIVIC 1.6 VT ¥YM2016 Surveyor Name
Owner's Name : TOH WONG LIM Survey Date
Ins Policy No. - SD16V13008A/PC2/R0O0 Authorisation Date
Date of Accident  : 4/6/2018

0%GST Amount

Item Description Qty  UnitPrice Disc%  Amount Amount _incld GST
Survey By
Date & Time Total Amount 5 5BBDE 41916 6.407.24
Excess Total (Inclusive of GST) 5,407.24
Siatus
Signature

Printed on 20/6/2018 2:07:30 PM
This = & campuler ganaraled mymce No Sgnalune = reguirad

Fan prices are subjecbed ba changs wilhout noboe
The abave estimated cost of repair oo nol ncude any ufareseen damagas

GET Amount is caloulabad from iIndeddual nals)



