Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd <cardoc@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 June 2018 10:46 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: FWACCIDENT INVOLVING SKP9997A AND SGY311M ON 20/06/2018 AT ANG MO

KI AVE 1 ***LKK REF:CC6/AIG18011235/eb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Asher
Any update for the above claim?

Thanks & Regards
Irene Ting
6747 2112

From: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd [mailto:cardoc@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 26 June, 2018 4:25 PM

To: 'Asher Sng (LKKAuto)'

Subject: RE: FWACCIDENT INVOLVING SKP9997A AND SGY311M ON 20/06/2018 AT ANG MO KI AVE 1 ***LKK
REF:CC6/AIG18011235/eb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Asher
Any update for the above claim?

Thanks & Regards
Irene Ting
6747 2112

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 21 June, 2018 5:45 PM

To: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: FWACCIDENT INVOLVING SKP9997A AND SGY311M ON 20/06/2018 AT ANG MO KI AVE 1 ***_KK
REF:CC6/AIG18011235/eb3

Without Prejudice

Hi lrene,

We refer to the email below.

Our insured yet to report till date, we will follow up with our insured and revert to you in due course.

Thank You.



Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd [mailto:cardoc@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 21 June 2018 5:32 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: FWACCIDENT INVOLVING SKP9997A AND SGY311M ON 20/06/2018 AT ANG MO KI AVE 1 ***LKK
REF:CC6/A1G18011235/eb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Asher
Any update for the above claim?

Regards
Irene

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 20 June, 2018 8:35 PM

To: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd

Cc: CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: FW: FWACCIDENT INVOLVING SKP9997A AND SGY311M ON 20/06/2018 AT ANG MO KI AVE 1 ***LKK
REF:CC6/AI1G18011235/eb3

Dear Irene,

We refer to the below email.

Please be informed that we are currently pending for our insured’s report.

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Asher at 6841 6051.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Thank you

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd [mailto:cardoc@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 20 June 2018 4:41 PM




To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; admin-a@lkk.com
Subject: FWACCIDENT INVOLVING SKP9997A AND SGY311M ON 20/06/2018 AT ANG MO KI AVE 1

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/ Madam

Please refer to the above matter.

Our client (SKP9997A) is claiming against AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance insured (SGY311M).
Kindly check for us the above claim liability as soon as possible.

Thanks & Regards

Irene Ting

6747 2112

From: cardoc@singnet.com.sg [mailto:cardoc@singnet.com.sq]
Sent: Wednesday, 20 June, 2018 3:28 PM

To: CARDOC

Subject: Attached Image




