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COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
REPAIR ESTIMATE"
VEHILCE NO: SHD3080D

MAKE . HYUNDAI
MODEL ;140 Date: 19.06.201E
[ oty | Parts Description | Labour [ Type | Unit Price | Amount
1 Front Bumper )('ﬁ-f-"' 5 1,052.20
10 Front Bumper Clips > 52.20 5 22,00
1 Front Bumper Top Bracket - RH % 8 22.40
1 Front Bumper Bracket - RH 7 $ 24,60
1 Headlamp »x 5 1.388.00
1 Headlamp Support Panel X 5 1,067.50
Frst RH Feade scrpet
SuUB TOTAL $ 3,57T6.T0
LESS 20% _ 715.34
DISCOUNTED TOTAL $ 2,861.36
$
Labour Charge g0
1 Panel Beating $ ;93‘05
1 Spray Painting Charge $ 500700 %=
1 Wiring Charge $ SR80
1 Tuff Kote s 8p-00 <
TOTAL LABOUR 5 1,130.00

ESTIMATE TOTAL

This is an initial estimate based on a visual Inspection of the Bbove vehicle. The final repair quantum wil

be prepared after the vehicle is survayed by a motor Surve

/C. A.\ A

/)_/{/f! fkarA

2 ¥

e
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r appoirited by the insurance company.
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COMFORIDELGRO

ENGINEERING

Qur Job Ref No . 305177240
B
Date | 22.Jun. 2018 e T Sobads
Fan: G548 B158

FINALIZATION FORM
To 1 LKK Fax:
Ann KALVIN
Vehicle Reg No. SHD3080D Date of Accident 18.06.2018

The survey and estimates of the repairs of the above-mantioned vehicle are as foliows:-

1 The repair job shall bill 1a: ECICS SGT2042C

z The finalized amount shall be:

() Spare Parts after List discount {

(B} Labour Charges £600.00
Total for Part-By-Part Repair Cost P/ F $600.00

(c.) Lumpsum Repair (if applicable)
Total for Lumpsum repair cost after Less
Final Lumpsum Repair cost

3 Estimated normal penod for repairs: 2 working days

4 We shall treat the above amount as Correct and Confirmed if thers is no reply from you
within T working days

B Thank you for your assistance. We confirm the estimales and

finalizad amount

Signature ) : Signature X
Mame Mame Kl I""l
Tel - 6214 B316 Date 21 ([ e
Fax - 6546 8156

For Official Use Only

Document
Item Amount Attached g;g:?ug’; Remarks
Yes or No

1. Rental Rata P/Day YES

2. Loss of Income Paid

3. Survey Faes

4. LTA Search Fee

5. Medical Fees (on behalf

of driver, if applicabla)
6 Owverrun

Remarks:




COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
REPAIR ESTIMATE"

VEHILCE NO : SHD3090D

r |

5 c\CS

Do (R-06 (R

MAKE : HYUNDAI
MODEL : 140 Date: 19.06.201¢
| aty | Parts Description / Labour | Type | Unit Price | Amount
1 FrontBumper XA+ $ 1,052.20
10 FrontBumper Clips > 2% $220 'S 22.00
9 Front Bumper Top Brackat = RH ‘YJ'H 5 22.40
1 Front Bumper Bracket - RH X/ 5 24 60
1 Headiamp ) I $ 1.3&3.01.'!'
1 Headlamp Support Panel X dii $ 1,067.50
Frost RH Foade scrpet
| SUB TOTAL $ 3,576.70
LESS 20% | 715,34
DISCOUNTED TOTAL 5 2,861.36
. Feg——
|
Labour Charge 2 a0
1 Panel Beating $ ;j;ﬂ*ﬁﬁ]
1 |Spray Painting Charge 5 m‘ﬁ-ﬁ] oo
1 Wiring Charge $ G080 3 .
1 [TuffKote s 8000 € o,
TOTAL LABOUR s 1,130.00
L0
2 i 5 .
ESTIMATE TOTAL ' $ 3,991.36

This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection f the :
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (ce neg ne 1ssscrissn;
51 Ubi Ave 1 ?1-25. PHEE%MWMI Park

ingapore 4
Tel 6256-3561 Fax B844-B805 Emimr@-ﬂ:kamn.mm:nugnmanuﬂlkkamu.m

To ECICS Limited From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
7 Temasek Boulevard 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
#10-01 Suntec Towar One Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 038387 Singapore 408932

Attr Date 22 Jun 2018

Preliminary Advice

Insured Vehicle No | 5GT2042C

TP Vehicle No : SHD3090D Accident Date 18/06/2018
Make I HYUNDA] 140 Assignment Date 20/06/2018
Date of Inspection | 20/08/2018 EsL Duration of Repair 2 days
Inspaction At . ComfortDelGro Enginearing Pte Lid (Loyang)

58 Loyang Drive

Singapore 508069

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained Impact / damages ...0/S fronl._. portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) 5% 3,8681.36
Ravisad Amount S5 800.00
Check llems (Estimated) 'S8 0.00
Total 5% 800.00
Lump Sum Repair 5%

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Valus 5%

Pra-Accidant Valua 5%

COE / PARF Rebate 5%

Salvage Value 5%

Margin for Repair 5%

Remarks

{ 1} The vehicla is repairable at our adjusted amounl. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage.
Kindly let us have your authorisation.

{ )} The vehicle is unaconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invilte tendear for the wreck.

{ X ) Other comments .| We have nol authorized repairs.



Asher SI'_IE !LKI[Autu!

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 13 August 2018 1:50 PM

To: ‘Jim Wong See Pah'

Subject: Your Ref.T0618/SHD3030D/)Wi(st), ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 30900 AND SGT 2042C
ON 1B/06/2018

Attachments: D1 SKETCH PLAN pdf

Your Ref:TOG18/SHD3090D/IW(st)
Our Ref: CC4/IC518011219/K1ea3

Without Prejudice

Hi Sir,

We refer to the above matter,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 3090D AND SGT 2042C ON 18/06/2018

Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's accident report for your perusal.

Our principle would like to request a copy of your client video footage.

Thank You,

Bas! Regards

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LEK Aulo Coniullants Ple Lid

phone. 684 1-46051 | emall; shenng@kkguto.com | fox 6741-4108
Bik 51 Paya Ubl Industial Park, Ul Avenue |, #02-25 | 5(408933)



Asher Sng (LKKAuto

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 9 November 2018 11:54 AM

To: ECICS Claims

Cc: Desmaond Lee Ker Wen (ECICS, Claims); Crystabelle Tan Gek Peng (ECICS, Claims); Janice
Goh Siew Geok (ECICS, Claims)

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST) Your ref : DMPC1800239H, ACCIDENT ON 18/06/2018
INVOLVING SGT 2042C (OI) & SHD 30300 (TP)

Attachments: SHD30900 VC (T5).avi

Your ref : DMPC1800239H
Our ref : CC4/1C518011219/K1ea3

Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT ON 18/06/2018 INVOLVING SGT 2042C (Ol) & SHD 30%0D (TP)
We refer to the above matter.

The accident occurred when our insured travel straight on turning right lane and hit third party vehicle [Refer to tp
Video)

Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability.
We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.

We seek your approval to offer repairer " COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD" at § 1,226.99 (all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repairs (with GST] S 4,270.76 S B42.00
2. Loss of Rental (4days x 5115) S  460.00 5 40250 (3.5days x 5115)
3. Loss of Income (ddays x SBO) 5  320.00 5 175.00 (3.5days x §50)
4. LTA Search Fee 5 7.49 5 7.49
Total 5 5,058.25 $1,226.99
For your approval in merimen please.
Thank You.
pesl Regards
Asher Sng | Care Horclle
LKK Aufo Consuftants Fie Lid
phone. s841-6050 | emal gshepng@tkouto.com | fos 4741-4 108

Bl 51, Porwa Ui incusinol Fark, LDl Aveniga 1, §02.25 | 51408933)



Print Received Message

This mail Is associated with -

*SHD3090D (DMPC1800239H)
[SGT2042C]
TP
COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD
Jun 18 2018 10:00AM

3
ComfortDalGro Enginaaring Pte Lid

From ECICS Limited (HQ) (ECICS), sent on 1311/2018 18:08 PM.
To LKK_HO
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (8§1226.99) - SHD3090D - Claim Handler: Crystabelle Tan

Approved:1226,99.




COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

ComferiDelGro Englnesring Ple Lid
205 Braddell Roed Singapors 5TAT01

Mainiine +65 6383 6200
g&iﬁmmﬁ.‘:ﬂm Facaimilie +65 5280 9755

Singapore 508569 WWw.Cdge.com.eg
Comaery Reghirrmn Mo GFSEMAN
Workshops
Your Ref: DMPC18000238H/CT Braddall
205 Braddell Road
Singapore 5TET0Y
22th November 2018
59 me
Singapora
3|
383 5in Mi 3 m
ECICS LIMITED Singapore 575717
10 Eunos Road B Singapore Post Center #02-04A Pandan
45 Pandan Road
Singapora 408600, Singapor Enazﬁs
Attantion: (Motor Claims Division) 320 Ubl Roed 3
Singapare 408649
Senoko
24 Sencko Loop
Dear Sirs / Madams Singapore 758166
Sungei Kadut
7 Sungel Kadut Wa
Please find the enclosurs, discharge voucher being endorsed for processing Bimiteore 12079
seltiement purpose, 501 Vishun Industrial Ptk A
Singapora 768732
Look forward for an early paymentL
Thank you,
Yours Sincerely
Jim ¥Wong

CDGE Claims Department (Loyang)
DID: 6214 B374 Fax: 6214 1843
Email: jimwong@cdge,com.sg

A remine of 7]
COMFORTDELGRO Gy B g&



COMFORIDELCRO

s:;:t:;f | T 0618/ SHD3090D NJW(st) ENGINEER'NG
Date 27-Jun-18
CDGE Tan Claims Dept
ECICS LIMITED 88 Loyang Drive 41h Fir
#10-03 Singapors S085EY
7 Temasek Boulevard
Singapore 038987
Attn - Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir
ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SHD309%D AND YOUR INSURED
SGT2042C OTHER ON 18.06.18

We are the authorised repair workshop for Comfort Transportation Pte Lid, the owner
of motor Vehicle No SHD3090D which was involved in the captioned accident with
your insured vehicle. The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concerned have requested
and authorized us to assist them in presenting their claims agains! the party responsible
for all applicable matters arising from the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving : _ SGT2042C
we are submitting these claim for your consideration on behalf of the claimants.

TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM

1 Cost of Repair s £42.00

2 4 days Loss of Rental @ 5 11500 perday -] 460.00

3 Survey Report Fees (Surveyed by Mis LKK) 5 =

4 GIA/LTA Search Fees ] 7.49

5 GIA/Police Report Fees $ -

6 Towing / Medical / Transporation Fees 5 -
SubTotal: § 1,109.49

HIRER'S CLAIM

7 4 days LossofIncome @  § 80.00 per day $ 320.00

Total Claims: $ 142848

We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims: -

a) Original repair bill and photocopied photographs : 2] pcs
by LTA search slip/s of . SGT2042C
¢) GIA/ Police report/s of SHD3090D
d) Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator
[ ) Witness statement/s { ) Certificate of Insurance [ X ) Rental Rate letter

{ X ) Photograph/s of Accident Scene

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settiement of the said claims as
soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any persanal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver.

Yours faithfully

Jim TWomg

Deputy Manager

CDGE Claims Department

Tel - 6214 B374 Fax: 6214 1843 Email : jimwong@cdge com sg

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.
)

COMFORIDELGRO -

)
A
O



€1 U AVE |, #i42% Paya UI ISDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408953 TEL @ (0651 62568561 F AN @ imnsni 1410

Our Refl: CCYICSIS01121%K]eald

12 SEPT 2018

MUMTAJ BIVI /O MOHAMED ANWAR
BLK 278 BISHAN ST24

#H-68

SINGAPORE 570278

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGT 2042C & SHD 3090D AT / ALONG HAVELOCK
RD ON 18/06/2018.

We refer to the above accident, we are the loss adjusters acting on behalf of M/s ECICS
Limited, the Motor Insurer of SGT 2042C on the reported accident on 18/06/2018,

Our Principal has received a Third Party property damage claim from the owner of SHD
3090D with regards to the above accident.

We will try our best to negotiate for an amicable settlement on best possible terms with
Third Party under the terms and conditions of your motor policy. In this respect. the
vehicle's premium/NCD may be affected as a result of the above claim.

Should you however wish 10 further discuss on the matter prior (o our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

In the event that you receive any letters/ court documents regards to the above accident
matter. please do not reply or respond, you may forward to us directly for further
handling and we will reply on your behalf.

Thank you.

Yours faithfully,

-

Asher

Case Handler

DID: 6841 6051

FAX: 6741 4108

Emiul: Ashersng @ lkkauto.com

c.r. ECICS Limited
t Motar Claims Dept)



CDG.VARS.V . LettofAuthorisation Page | of |

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

(NAF | PAF) f

ACCIDENT INVOLVING 1 40 SHD3090D , SGTZ042( ON 1B-Jun-18 10:40
ALONG HAVELOCK ROAD X JUNCION q!’ NEW BRIDGE RD,

1/ We NG SIOW HWEE (Hirer) NRIC No.: 574197030

andfaor (Relef) NRIC No.:

Taxl Number SHD3I090D
hereby authorise ComfartDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd(CDGE):

1. To submit my/our claims for damages. costs and expense, including loss of Income, loss of rental,
medical fee and legal costs

2. Ta have absolute discretion to agree to any settlemant or compensation amount in respect of my/our claim
against third party (except personal imjunies and medical claims)

3. To sign Discharge Voucher an my/aur behalf.
4. To accept any payment (claim procesds) in respect of the claim against third party and payment by chegue

shall be foarward directly to CDGE m accordance with CDGE's instruchion and made in favour of
“ComfortDelGro Engineering Pre Ltd™.

Date 18-Jun-2018

Name of Hirer NG SIOW HWEE

Hirer NRIC 574197090 Signature ;

Address 725 YISHUN STREET 71 #10-23
760725

Contact No BBD92489

http://cdgek2srv:82/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/ Runtime/View/ CDG.VAR... 18/06/2018



L
ECjcs . -
nsurance
DISCHARGE VOUCHER

CLAIM NO: DMPC1800239H/CT

In consideration of the payment of the sum of DOLLAR ONE THOUSAND TWO HUNDRED TWENTY
SIX AND CENTS NINETY NINE ONLY, (551,226.99), I/We, hereby accept such sum in full and final
settlement of all claims, present or future, that I/We have or may have against ECICS Umited,
MUMTAJ BIVI D/O MOHAMED ANWAR as insurers, owner and driver of Vehicle no. SGT 2042C in
connection with or in any way arising from the accident involving the said vehicle which accurred

on 18/06/2018 at HAVELOCK ROAD X JUNCTION OF NEW BRIDGE RD with SHD 3090D.

I/We further agree that this payment is made without any admission of liability on the part of the
sald Insurers, owner and driver of the vehicle no. SGT 2042C and this settlement does not in any
way prejudice or prevent any party from making any claim whatsoever which may arise from the
damage caused to the vehicle no. _SHD 3090D in the above mentioned accident |/We further

undertake not to make any reference to the settlement hereln mentloned in respect of such claim.

*I/We authorize you to pay the above settlement sum to COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE
LTD.

*DATED THIS 2V DAY OF Vlﬂ u 2018

Signature & for Signature
Co Stamp: Efor Co
Stamp:
Name of
Claimant : Name of !C:Q b
Witness:
Address: _mm DEPARTMENT
Mdr!s:s: £ LOvANG [};ﬂ'l'E
Occupation:
Occupation:
NRIC No:
NRIC No:
* Delete If notapplicable
* Please ensure the date is duly filled In O TPD (Ver Jan 18)
*The contents of fis document apply to vehicle damages only
A personal injuries and demeges arising therefrom & excluded
fom the ambi and application of 1 document

7 TEMASEX BOULEVARD #10-01 SUNTEC TOWER ONE SINGAPORE 038087 TEL! 63374770 FAX: 63380267
COMPANY REGISTRATION NO: 188501301C WEBSITE: hifp:/'www acics com 54

our cheque made payable 10,
gummmménu ENGINEERING FTE 11D



COMFORIDELGRO
" ENGINEERING

I COMIORIDELCRO

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3

epair

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pre Lid
A member of COMPORIDN LA

Head Office
205 Beaddell Road
Singapore 579701

Kindly note that no recalpt shall be ssusd unless equestod
CUSTOMER'S COPY

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid

TAX INVOICE

v R |.Ia-5 .Hr: I NV NI/ AT

l-f{'-l-i!- e

3K HEMECTR WAL NG
ATE (OF HEG
i LAME 4 f

KMHET. R4 il

ACCOUNT No.

INVOICE No AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No



Our Ref. CT18060533
Lomiort

| g

Date: 26 June 2018

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear SirfMadam

ACCIDENT ON 18/06/2018 @ 10:40 hrs
ALONG HAVELOCK ROAD X JUNCION OF NEW BRIDGE RD
INVOLVING SGT2042C

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration
number SHD3090D (the "Taxi"). The Taxi was hired to NG SIOW HWEE IC NO
§7419709D a registered hirer-operator of Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd at the time
of occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $115.00 per day
(inclusive of GST),

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with MS First Capital Insurance Ltd on
a third party basis at the material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had oblained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accidenl with a motor
workshop of his choice.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

seltlement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident.

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717 Mainline +65 6555 1188 Facsimile +65 6453 3183
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Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

..-CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

| case |Notified Est Submitted | Ad) Assigned | Ad) Rpt Ad| Submitted | Ins Auth'ed [Status -
| 7% Oct 2018 20 Jun 2018 | Panding for Survey
Main  |17:10 0000 “I’f::'“ | ““?:'“ | | Report
Eit feg | gt aa) At | M- " | Cance| Case |

Hain Claim Details

CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS o | [Created by adjuster])
Insured: | MUMTAJ BIVI D/0 MOHAMED ANWAR, [D: S6909500C, Email: www abodfcom.sg

;lll:nlm: COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 199303821R

Vehicke Reg 18/06/2018 10:00 - :59
Na.; $HD3090D Date of Lass: |14 Months and 2 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr)]

Claim Type: | TP / DMPC1800239H mﬁ'ﬁ?_“" |MPC18A0D103701

SGT2042C :&';‘I" m":ﬂ, B~ 1B0BADIEMESH

Excesy:
ComfortDelGro l‘mnlnﬂ;ml Pte Ltd (Loyang} 59 Loyang Drive, SOB96% Loyang - Tel: 6214 8300
ECICS Limited (HQ) - Tel: 61374779 /6303 0178 ... [Handied by Crystabelle Tan - 6303 0130)

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd (HQ) - Tell 62222311

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 _ [Handled by KALVIN ANG WET KUN ] . [Final Rpt due
29/06/2018]

|ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED

o B  ViewAr | Compase Case M |
|+ ECICS (13/11/2018): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (S$1226.90) - SHO3I090D - Claim Handler: Crystabelle...
» ECICS (12/11/2018) Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S5$1226.99) - SHDI090D - Claim Handier: Crystabaile...

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS=

view All | Search Tasks | Creste New Tash | Compete ||
Due Date Priority Typs  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
Mo results. |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp... 14/12/2018



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SHD3090D (DMPC1B00239H)
[5GT2042C)
TP
COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD
Jun 18 2018 10:00AM
[MUMTAD BIVI D/O MOHAMED ANWAR]
ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd

Page | of 2

Upload Documents | Uplosd Prates | _Compose Wew Lener | View [View in Srmwssr [~ ]
e ipecpage V]| M
|Mo_|Finalized On ECICS Limited [HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |15/11/1609:33 | Video © | oaoav
Letters/Correspondences [1perpage V] 4
{Wo |Finalized On [LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall| Print
1 |(oraft) _ Third Party Express Settiement - Payment Breakdown 0 Edit
Assessment Reports -~ [1oerpage  [¥] A
{Mo | Finallzed On | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall Print
1 (22/06/18 19:00 | Adjuster Immediate Advice © [ oad |
I."M‘tﬂflm 1 per page +1 &
[Ho [Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Cansultants Pie Ltd (HGQ) Thumbnall Print
't 21/08/1208:53 | General View © | asws | A
'z |21/06/1808:53 | General View O wors | B
13 |21/06/18 08:5) | General View O i | A
|4 [11/08/18 08:51 | General View O | Losa s | &2
5 |21/06/1808:53 | Genersl View © | oaws M
6 |21/06/18 08:53 | General View 0| ioows | B
7 JU06/1808:51 | General View O | ods | A
8 [21/08/18 D8:53 General View i_ .Eﬂ?ﬁ_lm
9 [21/06/1808:51 | General View 0 | loeas | B
10 |21/06/18 08:53 | General View - 0| s | 4
11 |20/06/18 08:51 | Genersl View © | oosws [
12 |21/06/18 08:51 | General View 0 | tedwc | M
13 |21/06/18 08:51 | Genarai View 0D | iowdiec | B
14 |21/06/18 08:53 General View '? load 30 | 1
15 | 21/06/18 08:53 General View D tcaawc | A
16 | 2106/18 08:53 | Genersl View 0 | aaws
17 |ZU/06/18 08:51 | Genersl View D | weows || A
18 [21/06/18 08:51 | General View D | wedirc | B
19 |21/06/18 0B:53 | General View 0 e | B
0 |21/06/18 08:537 | Genersl View O | aaws | &
21 |[20/06/18 17:13 | Relnspection Photo D v | A
22 |21/06/1817:11 | Reinspection Photo 0| loadws | A
i3 |21/06/18 17113 | Reinspection Photo 0 ledies | A
|
Documentation iperpage [v] [
e | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail| Print
I |20/06/18 18:21 | ACKNOWLEDGEMENT EMALL TO ICS DD 20.08.2018 @ | Loadpor
1 |10/06/18 18:23 | NOTIFICATION FROM WORKSHOP + TP ESTIMATE + TP GIA REPORT ) | Load POF

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_do...

14/12/2018



Merimen e-Claims

Page 2 of 2

Video - 1perpoge |}
(Mo | Finalireq Cn ECICS Limited [HG) Thumbnail
1 [23/06/18 16:51 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED I Load FOF
4 01/07/1811:53 | EMAIL FROM ICS DD 03.07.2018 I | §_ Load AOF
5 D307/1811:53 OI GIA REPORT ' B @ | toscror
|6 2910718 17:15 WORKSHOP INVDICE Loagd POF
i? [29710/18 17115 RENTAL RECEIPT Load POF |
8 |29/10/18 17:15 | RENTAL MILEAGE Load POF
o |29/10/18 17:15 | LTA SEARCH | @ | Ltosaror |
10 129/10/1817:15 | LOD Load POF |
11 [14/12/18 10003 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load PDF |
112 14/12/18 10:03 | DISCHARGE VOUCHER Load POF
13 14012718 1DiD3 | LETTER TD O o o Losg PFOF
Documents Checklist
' DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | Save | prin |

| There are no document checkiists configured,

- Pte Ltd (HQ)

Show Remarks To: | Handling Insurer
Fante: EEmarks 5o privihs unkess you BDs i 50 Sther paries

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_do...

14/12/2018



Preview Page | of |

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
I\Fnhll::luu No: SGT2042C (Insd veh) Model: YUNDAI 140 1.7 D CRODI FIL
SHD3090D (TP veh) AIRBAG 4DR (A)

| Date of Accident: | 18/06/2018

Global Sum Settlement |- | [ ] ves | [x] No

Repair Estimate 3 4.270.76

Final Repair Cost $ 74200

Loss of Income g 175.00 3.50 days at $50.00 per day

Rental (if any) ' 8 40250 350 days

LTA [ GIA Search Fee - T7.49

Others: :§ 0.00

-

Final Settlement Sum 3 1,226.99

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [X] YES [ ] NO (Kindlyindicale
below)
|A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability (%)

B) For GIA Registersd Workshop: B_{'.:qurt ipplnr:.nhl&. ¥ea/No BOLA Scenario Na:

BOLA Liabilty: __ 100____ (%) Assessed Liability (*): (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |ComforiDelGro Engineering Pte Lid 5 1,226,099

2) -

3) 'S

4] .1

5) ]

JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN ‘;u?;‘:
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Releass Voucher: Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report/ Bill (if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc... 14/12/2018



Adjuster Report Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoreg o 1sseoresn)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Libi Industrial Park
Singapore 408633
Tel 6258-3561 Fax: BB44-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto com;assignmenis@ikkauto com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CC41CS518011219K1EA3Q2

Date: 14/1272018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: ECICS Limited Palicy Mo MPC1BADD103701
Lisimant Vehicle sHD30s0D Insured Vehicle No:  SGT2042C
Date of Loss: 18/06/2018 MNatura of Claim: ™ Claim No: DMPC1B800230H
DE IPTI
Reg No: SHD3080D
Make & Model ;‘;UHDAI 140, 1.7 D CROI F/L ABS AIRBAG 40R Engine No: D4FDGUBS 1827
Reg Date: 16/06/2016 (Man. Year: 2016) Chassis No: KMHLB41UMGLIOB1454
Colour; Black Odometer: 258484 km
Engine Capacity: 1685 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S5): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: MNo  Pre-accident Condition:
Tl FTYR
Front Tyre Size: 205/80 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 205/60 R16
Front Lelt Side: West Lake 7 mm Rear Left Side: Weslt Lake 7 mm
Front Right Side: West Lake 7 mm Rear Right Side Wes! Lake 7 mm
The above values represent the ramaining fyre reeds depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's  Adjuster's  Difference  Dff %
Parts 2.861.36 0.00 2,861.36 100.00
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,130.00 600.00 530.00 46.90
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 3.991.36 600.00 3,391.36 B4.97
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S§) 279,40 42 00 23740 84 87
Natt Amount (S$) 4270.76 642.00 3,628.76 8497
+ Loss of Use (3.5 x S$50.00/day) (S§) 175.00
+ Car Rental (3.5 x 55$115.00/day) (58) 402 50
+ Doc/Search Fee (55) 7.49
Nett Liability (S§) 1,226.99
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 20/06/2018
Date Inspecled: 20/08/2018 Inspacted Al ComforiDelGro Engineering Pte Lid
{Loyang)
58 Loyang Drive
Singapore 508069

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen... 14/12/2018



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Estimated Pariod of Repair: 2D days

Adjuster: KALVIN ANG WE| KUN Manager: Asher Sng Rong Y

NOTE: This repor represents our findings af the Hime snd place of inspection stated bemn. Such inspection hes been carmied ouf fo the best of o
knowiedge and abiity but any other Gabiity undar any olhor oreumstences is heraby exprassly excluded,

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen... 14/12/2018
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REPAIR DETAILS

'Reference

:Purl Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised 29 Oct 2018)

|Parts: 143 HYUNDAI 140 1.7 D CRDI F/l. ABS AIRBAG 4DR (A) (Catalogue:Mariman Singapore 1.0)

| Labour: Repairar's (Price-denominaled Standard List)
Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no prin-code for SHD3080D)

E?-Hd‘ﬂy: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page |
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the las! estimate page

iFurth.nr Info: Items/values nol in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk * |

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairar's Amount
1 1 *FRONT BUMPER Repair 1,052 20FL *-FL
2 10 *FRONT BUMPER CLIPS Not Necessary 22.00FL *-FL
3 *FRONT BUMPER TOP BRACKET -RH Serviceable 2240FL “-FL
4 1 *FRONT BUMPER BRACKET -RH Serviceable 24 BOFL *-FL
5 1 *HEADLAMP Serviceable 1.388.00 FL *.FL
6 1 *HEADLAMP SUPPORT PANEL Serviceable 1.067.50 FL *-FL
T 1 *FRONT RH FENDER [NPA) Repair 0.00FL *-FL

F=Franchise pan. L=LsllemDisc

Sub Total (S§)  3,576.70 0.00

= List ltem Discount on L items 20.00/20.00% (S§) 715.34 0.00

Total Parts (55) 2,861.36 0.00

[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen... 14/12/2018
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellanecus items selocted.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 PANEL BEATING New 500.00 200.00

2 SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE MNew 500.00 400.00

3 WING CHARGE New 50.00 0.00

4 TUFF KOTE MNew B0.00 0.00

Gross Labour Cost (55) 1,130.00 600.00

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out. —[

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen... 14/12/2018



