Vic !LI{I(Autu}

From: Vic [(LKKAUtD)

Sent: Thursday, 13 June, 2019 10:26 AM

To: Ong Chin Kiat

Cce: Alfred Toh; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLV2850S (O1 :
SNM18D02721C02/0) AND SJU2929D (TP : LKK REF -CC6/CTI18011217/Ahb3) on
28.05.2018

Dear Chin Kiat,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that we had settled the matter with TP repairer on a global sum of $15,800.00 (all in).
We will now close the matter and will forward relevant documents to your good office.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

FECES S
S RER wW Saye the Eorth Print only when pecessery-

This e-mall contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe thal you received this e-mail in error, please do nol
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereol. and inform the
sander that you have deleted the e-mail, all atachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Ong Chin Kiat [mailto:chinkiat.ong@sg.cntaiping.com)

Sent: Thursday, 6 June, 2019 3:00 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Alfred Toh

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLV28505 (Ol : SNM18D02721C02/0) AND
5JU29280D (TP : LKK REF -CC6/CTI118011217/Ahb3) on 28.05.2018

Without Prejudice
Dear Vic,
Please proceed and settle as per recommended,

Thank you.

Ong Chin Kiat
Assistant Claims Executive
Claims



Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Ong Chin Kiat <chinkiat.ong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 6 June, 2019 3:.00 PM

To: Vie (LKKAuUto)

Ce Alfred Toh

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLV2850S (Ol :
SNM1B8D02721C02/0) AND SJU2929D (TP : LKK REF -CC6/CTI18011217/Ahb3) on
28.05.2018

Without Prejudice

Dear Vic,

Please proceed and settle as per recommended.

Thank you.

Ong Chin Kiat
Assistant Claims Executive
Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079309
DID: (B5) 63896174 | F: (B5) 6224 7174/ 6224 7478

W: www sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www facebook com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: & ¥ ¥ijlil Taiping SG

Discimimer: This e-mail and any fites transmitted with i i5 iWended only for the named recipmnts and may contain confidential information, Any
unauthorzed disclosuns, wse or dissaminalion of this message, eiher in whole or partial is prohibited I you are nal the infended recipien!, pleasse
nalify the sender immadiately. Flease delete the e-mail and any copies of Il thereafter,

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, June 6, 2019 10:02:09 AM

To: Chong Boan Sen

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI; Alfred Toh; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLV2850S (01 : SNM18D02721C02/0) AND
SJU29290 (TP : LKK REF -CCB/CT 118011217/Ahb3) on 28.05.2018

CTI REF - SNM18D02721C02/0
LKK REF — CC6/CT118011217/Ahb3

Dear Boon Sen,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SLV 28505 (OI) / SIU 2929D (TP) OTHERS ON 28/05/2018
We refer to the above matter. Please be informed that | am taking over this matter.

It was reported that the Insured vehicle swerved lane to avoid a vehicle coming out from the minor road when collided
to the TP vehicle.



We had spoken to the Insured Mr Jeffrey and he was informed of the TP claim and liability issues. PIR received and
was against Insured (per attached LOD).

In view of the above, we are of the view that liability is not to our Insured’s favour and the damages sustained to TP
vehicle were consistent to the nature of the accident.

Summary to offer to repairer KANG CAR REPAIRERS PTE LTD is as follows:
TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair (w/gst) S 34,546.02 S 14,980.00
Loss of Use (5150 x 10 days) S 1,500.00 S 800.00 (S80 x 10 days)
GIA Search Fee S 31.00 S 31.00
TOTAL $ 36,077.02 § 15,811.00
Breakdown of days is as follows:
Recommended Days 9 days
Weekends / Downtime 1 day
TOTAL | 10days

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.
For your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

—
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SLERER W Save the Farthe Print only when necessory:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you belleve that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments. including any copies thereof, and inform the
sendar that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereol. Thank you.

From: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg cntaiping.com>
Sent: Monday, 27 May 2019 1:50 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cec: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLV2B505 (O1: SNM18D02721C02/0) AND 51U2929D (TP : LKK
REF -CCH/CTI18011217/Apb3) on 28.05.2018

Importance: High

Dear HsiaoTong,

Appreciate you can provide the final report as soon as possible as we need to settle third party claim based on
surveyor recommendation or third party claimant will go to GIA.

2
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KANG CAR REPAIRERS PTE LTD

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #02-06 AUTOBAY @KAKI BUKIT SINGAPORE 417883
TEL: 67477636, 67473005 FAX: 67485071 Email: kangcar@singnet.com.sg
Co. Reg. No. 201300201N GST Reg. No. 201300201N

Our Ref : KCR0520182929CTI
Your Ref : SLVZ2850S

Date i 7 Auc 200 WITHOUT PREJUDICE

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road

#16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079900

Attention : Motor Claim Department

Dear Sirs,

Accident involving SJU2929D /SLV2850S and others on 28.05.2018 along Sims Ave East
near Kembangan Mrt station

We refer to the above accident. On our record showed that you are the insurer of motor
vehicle SLV2850S.

We are instructed that the accident was caused by your insured's negligent driving and/or
management of his vehicle. As a result of the accident. our client's vehicle was damaged and
our client has been put to loss and expense.

On behalf of and as authorized by Mdm Ong Chin Choo, the owner of motor-vehicle no
SJU2929D, we submit her claim to you:

Cost of repairs (Inclusive of 7% GST) $14,980.00
Loss of use (10 days (9+1Sunday) x $15000) $ 1,500.00
GIA report of SLV2850S $ 29.00
GIA search fee $ 2.00

$ 16.511.00

Enclosed herewith are copies of the following documents in support of our client's claim;

1) Tax invoice no: KCR-INV1800447
2) GIA report of SJU2929D
3) Police Report No ' T20180529/2079
4) GIA report & search fee and invoice
5) GIA report of SLV2850S
We hope to receive your early reply soon.

Thank you.

¥

Yours faithfully, g
KANG CAR REP R?S PTELTD

\
S
J
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51 UBIAVE L #01-25 PAYA UBTINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (D65) 2564315

Our Ref: CC6/CTI18011217/Ahb3
06 JUNE 2019

JEFFREY JOLANDO SIM KEE CHUAN By Post and By Email
BLOCK 81 BEDOK NORTH ROAD

#14-298

SINGAPORE 460081

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLV 28508 / SJU 2929D / OTHERS ON 28/0572018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report, accident scenario and evidence at hand, liability is down
against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the

Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior 10 our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if vou have further queries.

F )

Yours Fﬂithfﬂ;lly.

Vm.ﬁ.
D I 2096
E{ 6741 4108
Email: vicalpeh@|kkauto.com

cc.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)

jeffreviolando@mac.com
(Email)



Vic SLKHAutn!

From: Vic (LKKAUto)

Sent: Thursday, 6 June, 2019 9:57 AM

To: jeffreyjolando@mac.com

Ce: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Your Ref: SLV2850S_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLV 28505 / 5JU 29290 / OTHERS ON
28/05/2018

S1UHLAVE 1, 80125 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (45) 62563561 FAX @ (065) 61564315

Our Ref: CC6/CTI18011217/Ahb3
06 JUNE 2019

JEFFREY JOLANDO SIM KEE CHUAN By Post and By Email
BLOCK 81 BEDOK NORTH ROAD

#14-298

SINGAPORE 460081

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLV 28508 / SJU 2929D / OTHERS ON 28/05/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report, accident scenario and evidence at hand, liability is down against us. We will therefore
proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2096 | emall: vicalpeh@[kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

ILKK = Save the Earth- Frint only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged matenial, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do nol
read this e-mall or any attached items. Please delete the e-mall and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform tha
sender thal you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.
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LETTER OF AUTHORITY

Your Ref: SNM18D0O2721C02/0

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
3 Anson Rd

#16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Dear Sirs,

Accident involving_SJU2929D and_ SLV2B50S
on28.05.2018 gt Sims Ave East near Kembangan MRT station.

I'We am/are the owner/s of vehicle number sju2920D

I/We had instructed KANG CAR REPAIRERS PTE LTD to make a claim on my/our
behalf against your company in respect of the abovementioned matter.

IWe hereby authorize you to issue the settlement cheque in favour of my/our
workshop, KANG CAR REPAIRERS PTE LTD in full and final settiement of my/our
claim for my/our repair cost and loss of use/rental charges, in respect of the above
accident.

Yours faithfully,

ElFsasadannddslasnnnnrane

Ong Chin Choo

'
[

4
L T E T - e

Witnessed by: kong Chin Watt
il
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KANG CAR REPAIRERS PTE LTD

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #02-06 AUTOBAY @KAKI BUKIT SINGAPORE 417883
TEL: 67477636, 67473005 FAX: 67485071 Email: kangcar@singnet.com.sg
Co. Reg. No. 201300201N GST Reg. No. 201300201N

M/S: CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORLE) PTE LTD  Final No:

3 ANSON ROAD

#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER
SINGAPORE 079909

TEL: 63896111

FAX: 62247175

ATTN:  Motor Claim Department

Your Rel No: SLV28508
Claim Type: Third Pary
Accidemt Dme:  2E/0572018
. I'P Veh Reg No: SLY2B3505

Description

KOR-INVIS00447
Claim No: ESTISOUISS
Duite: 17 Aug 2018

Policy No:
Vih Reg No: SJU2929D

Make/Model: M.BENZ C200

KOMPRESSOR
Chassis No: WDD20404 1 2A0053 14
Engine No:
Ree Date: 24/0172018

Tax Invoice to Vehicle No :SJU2929D

| Quantity | List Price
S5

As recommended by surveyor to procesd repair at total cost/lumpsum cost

Add GST @ T
Total Amount pavable

TOTAL: SINGAPORE DOLLAR FOURTEEN THOUSAND NINE HUNDRED EIGHTY ONLY

E&0.E

For Kang 'L:/Rnpuirrn e Lid

:_ : ‘.a L{-/ ’___:
V a
py. 5/,-

AUTHORISED SIGNATURI

ALl
Amount
5%

5% 14.000.00
L8000

S% 14.980.00
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| GENERAL
INSURANCE

ENTHE

‘%

RECORDS MANAGEMENT

GR-18-084268
04/06/2018

Qur Ref No:
Date of Request:

Kang Car Repairers Pte Lid
No 1 Kaki Bukit Ave B

#02-06 AutoBay@Kak) Bukn
Singapors 417883

Dear SirMadam,

Date of Accident: 2810672018
Vehicle No: SJu28280D
Flace of Accident

Irmvolving Vehicle No. SLV2B50S

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raflles Quay #18-00. Singapore DABSE0

Phone. +65 6224 0010 Fax +65 6224 D030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to Spm
GST Registration No' M4D0017735

TAX INVOICE

Your Rel Na: KCR320182028CTI

----

ALONG SIMS AVE EAST>NEAR KEMBANGAN MRT STATION

|DOCUMENTS |ACCIDENT LOCATION ___|PERDOC (85)_[QTY [AMOUNT (s5)

[swzms ALONG SIMS AVE EAST>NEAR KEMBANGAN MRT STATION ~1a.00]1 13,08
|GST Amount B Doz
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) P R

The images pravided 1o you are teken from the onginal reparts forwarded to the cenire by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for thelr accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for
any lngs or damage arising out of ar In connection with the reports ar their images.

Thank You.

This (s 8 compuler generated document and reguires no signature

For GIARMC Official use
Date;
|X] GIRO [ ] Cash | ] Cheque



B, 2018 Irvoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF

' SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

I"SUMNCE 6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
ASSOCLATION Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax. +65 6224 D030

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm
GST Registration No: M400017735

SEARCH RESULTS

Our Ref No: GR-18-084263
Date of Request: 04/06/2018 Your Ref No: KCR520182929CTI

Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd
No 1 Kaki Bukit Ave &
#02-06 AutoBay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

‘ear SirfMadam,

Your Search Criteria:
Date of Accident: 28/05/2018
Place of Accident: SIMS AVENUE EAST TWDS CHANGI

Client Vehicle No: SJU2929D

With reference to your search criteria for the accident report, the following documents were found to closely
match your search criteria

REQ. VEHICLE ACCIDENT LOCATION ACCIDENT DATE
SLV28505 SIMS AVENUE 2B8/05/2018 23:45
Thank You.

The images provided lo you are taken from the original reports forwarded Lo the centre by the members of the General
Insurance Assoclation of Singapore and we take no respansibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no
liability whatsoever for any loss or damage arising oul of or in connection with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

hiips www giarme org sgiclaimalindse cfm Musabox=MTRsash luseaction=dep_geninvipArafid=18221818CFID=24BT50404CFTOKEN =404 191341 240086 T



W4, 2018 Invace
GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF
SINGAPORE

GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
lNSUWCE 6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

ASSOCIATION Phone +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

- S
" Y

Our Ref No: GR-18-084263
Date of Request: 04/06/2018 Your Ref No KCR520182929CTI

Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd
No 1 Kakl Bukit Ave 6
#02-06 AutoBay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

lear Sir/lMadam,

Your Search Criteria:
Date of Accident; 28/05/2018
Place of Accident; SIMS AVENUE EAST TWDS CHANGI

Client Vehicle No: SJU2929D

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S%)

E-File Search Fee (Public) 14]32_
GST Amount 0.98
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 15.00
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signalure.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRO[] Cash[] Cheque

hitpsc/fwww.giarme, ong, sg/ciaims/index cfm Husebox=MTRsssS fussaction=dap geninvip&rahd=1A22383ACFID=248T 5040 ACFTORKEN=404 1518041 200007 1



Invoice Page | of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Sngapore 048580
INSURANCE #hone +55 5224 0010 Fax +65 6226 0030
ASSOCLATION Operating Hours: Monday lo Frday Sam to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Regstration No: M300017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No GR-18-083484
Date of Request 01/08/2018 Your Rel No Onling Purchase
Kang Car Repairers Ple Lig

No 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#02-06 AutoBay@ Kaki Bukil

Singapore 417883

Dear SirMadam,

Enquiry Date 01082018

Enquiry By Yea Msi Cheng

TP Vehicla No SLV2B50S

Accident Date 28052018

Enquiry Result I o
TP Vahicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Ingurar Tel No
SLv28505 China Tlipkng Insurance 15iw} Pte Lid. 23-!'91-"25‘_{5-2%1@1 8 g3g0 E119

Thank You

The images provided to you s taken from Lhe onginal repons foiwanded 1o the centre by the membery of the Ganeral Insurance
Assocition of Singapone and we take no respansibility for their accuracy or contants and shall be under no liability wnatsoever for any
Ioss or damage arsing out of of la connection with the reports or their images

This is a computer generated document and reguires no signature

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.ctm’fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp _ge... /62018



Invoice Pape 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffies Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
@ INSURANCE Frone <65 6226 0010 Fax +85 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE ) Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No GR-18-083484

Date of Reguest 011082018 Your Ref No Online Purchase

Kang Car Repairers Pte Lid

Mo 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

#02-06 AuloBay@Kakl Bukit

Singapore 417883

Dear SifMadam,

Enquiry Cate 01/08/2018

Engquiry By Yee Mel Cheng

TP Vehicle No SLY2a505

Accident Date 2B/052018

DESCRIPTION o ~ |amounT (ss) H
TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amouni 013
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 200
Thark You

This is a compuler generaled documen! and requires no signature

For GIARMC Official use.
Date:
[A] GIRO [ ] Cash [ ) Cheque

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp ge... [/6/2018



