Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 13 February, 2019 1:13 PM

To: Anikka Lai

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT OF VEHICLE NO: SLE6412L AGAINST SHD9456T. Accident

date on 2/5/2018 *** LKK REF: CC4/AXA18011148/ha3

Without Prejudice

Anikka,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that till date, we are still pending for our Insured’s GIA report.
Kindly advise if your client is still pursuing the claim.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ LIRS

w0 Save the Earth Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Anikka Lai [mailto:anikkalai@honda.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 11 September, 2018 2:20 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A; assignments

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT OF VEHICLE NO: SLE6412L AGAINST SHD9456T. Accident date on 2/5/2018 ***
LKK REF: CC4/AXA18011148/ha3

Dear Mei Kwan,

Pls advise if there is any news from your insured.

Thank you

Warmest Regards

Anikka Lai



Kah Motor Co. Sdn Bhd

6A Mandai Estate

Singapore 729903

DID : 6514 5248 HP : 8288 6302
Email: anikkalai@honda.com.sg

From: Jason Heng

Sent: Tuesday, 19 June, 2018 7:50 PM

To: 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)' <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT OF VEHICLE NO: SLE6412L AGAINST SHD9456T. Accident date on 2/5/2018 ***
LKK REF: CC4/AXA18011148/ha3

Dear Mei Kwan,

The footage is 55mb and | cannot send to your via email. Will you weTransfer. Please look out for a email link to
retrieve the video.

Regards,
Jason

Mandai Body & Paint Centre
Kah Motor Sdn Bhd
Mobile: 82886309

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 19 June, 2018 7:43 PM

To: Jason Heng <jasonheng@honda.com.sg>

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT OF VEHICLE NO: SLE6412L AGAINST SHD9456T. Accident date on 2/5/2018 ***
LKK REF: CC4/AXA18011148/ha3

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that OI has yet to report the accident and we are currently pending verification for direct
settlement.

Please provide us evidence i.e. video/ scene photo and arrange for TP survey.
Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Vic at 6841 2096.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

ANA Insurance Pte Ltd

§ Shenton Way #27-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811
CustOmer caTe([ aXa. Com.58

Tel: 1800-830-4838 (Within Singapore) / (63) 68304838 (International)
Fax: (65) 6880 4283

Website: www_axa com sg

Dear Officer-in-charge,

Eindly refer to the attachments for third party direct settlement.

WVehicle is not in our woerkshop. Please advised a suitable date for a survey.

Meanwhile, kindly get back to me once liability has establish

Begards,

Jason

g KAHOTELR

Eah Motor B ]:r 4 Paint Centre (A MEMEER OF (JAENTAL MO NNGS DERMAL)

6A Mandai Estate HGN DA

The Power of Oreams
Singapore 729903

DID: 631435248
Mobile: 52886309
Email- jasonheng@honda com sg

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and
exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately
notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you.



