Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vie (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 24 September, 2018 10:07 AM

Ta: Claims Dept of CTL Admin A

Ce Catherine Thia; Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); KKLau; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving 5JQ2272K (OI :
CT1 - SNM18D02990C02/2) and SHC1660C (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI18011098/K1ha3)
on 14/06/2018

Dear Alfred,

We refer to your below email.
Please be informed that we had settled the matter with TP at a global sum of $3,400.00 (all in).
Thank you.

Best Regords,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

LMK S
&l ~5 Save the Earth Print only when pecessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged matenal, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law If you believe that you received this e-mail in eror, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mall and all attachments, including any copies thereol, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mall, all attachments and ary copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Claims Dept of CTI [mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com)

Sent: Thursday, 13 September, 2018 5:49 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Catherine Thia; Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); KKLau

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving $JQ2272K (01 : CTI - SNM18D02990C02/2)
and SHC1660C (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CT118011098/K1ha3) on 14/06/2018

LKK REF - CC3/CT118011098/K1ha3
CT1 REF — SNM18D02990C02/2 (5)Q2272K)

Dear Vic
We refer to your email of even date pertaining to the abave matter,
Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $3,403.27.

We await your payment advice to enable Catherine to act accordingly.



Vic SLI{HAutu!

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com=>

Sent: Thursday, 13 September, 2018 5:49 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc Catherine Thia: Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); KKLau

Subject: RE- <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving $)Q2272K (Ol

CTl - SNM18D02990C02/2) and SHC1660C (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CT118011098/K1ha3)
on 14/06/2018

LKK REF - CC3/CT118011098/K1ha3
CTI REF — SNM18D02990€02/2 (S1Q2272K)

Dear Vic
We refer to your emall of even date pertaining to the above matter.
Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at 53,403.27.

We await your payment advice to enable Catherine to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Talping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079908

DID: +65 63806183

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com

.entaiping.co

ANNIVTHSARY
I Simgupeer vimer 1948

Disclaimer

This message is confidential: its coments do nol constifute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pie. Lid excepi
where provided for in a written agreemeni between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauihorized
disclosure. use ar dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited [f you are not the intended recipient of the message.
please notify the sender immediarely

From: Vic [LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, September 13, 2018 4:21 PM

To: Alfred Toh <alfred toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>



Subject: <SEEXK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settiement - Accident Involving SJ02272K (O1: CT1 - SNM18D02990C02) and
SHC1660C (TP : LKK REF - EB!I'..'I'I]B:DIIDEEIKII‘I&S} on 14/06/2018

CT1 REF — SNM18D02990C02
LKK REF — CC3/CT118011098/K1ha3

Dear Alfred,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES 51Q 2272K (O1) AND SHC 1660C (TP) ON 14/06/2018

We refer to the above matter.

it was reported that the Insured vehicle had rear-ended to the TP vehicle.

Wwe had spoken to the Insured PIC Ms Margaret and she was informed of the TP claim and liability issues on
29/06/2018 and agreed to settle the matter. A letter was sent out to the Insured to informed about the TP claim and

liability. No feedback from Insured till date.

in view of the above, we are of the view that liability is not to our insured’s favour and the damages sustained to TP
vehicle were consistent to the nature of the accident.

Summary to offer to repairer COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTELTD is as follows:
TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair (w/gst) $ 522218 § 2,518.78
Loss of Rental ($125.40 x 6 days) < 752.40 5 627.00 (5125.40 x 5 days)
Loss of Income (580 x 6 days) s 480.00 S 250.00 (550 x 5 days)
LTA Search Fee S 7.49 5 7.49
TOTAL $ 6,462.07 5 3,403.27

Breakdown of days is as follows:

Recommended Days 3 days
Weekends [ Downtime 2 days
TOTAL 5 days

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.
For your approval and/or further instructions please,

Thank you.

Rest Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408933)

¥y ISR T )
e =TT Save the Earthe Priné only when necessary-

This &-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mall in error, please do not
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read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delele the e-mall and all attachments, including any copias thereof. and inform the
sendar that you have deletad the e-mail. all attachments and any copies thereof Thank you

From: Lucas Lee <lucas.| .cntaiping.coms>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 June, 2018 1:17 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh ntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving $)Q2272K (01 : CT1 - SNM18D02990C02) and SHC1660C (TP © LKK
REF - CC3/CT118011098/K1ha3) on 14/06/2018

Dear Sirs,
Kindly refer to the above attachment.

Case Handler: Alfred Toh

Lucas Lee

Claims Department (Motor)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 078809
Direct (65) 6389 6181

Fax (B5)6222 7175/6224 7478

Email lucas lee@sg.cntaiping.com

Website: www s cniaiping.com

ANNEY THSARY
e Sompapace wnee 1938

Diselaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitmeni by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid. except
where pravided for in a written dgreemen! between vou and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Ltd Any unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, elther in whole or partial, ix prohibired. If you are nof the intended recipient of the message
please notify the sender immediately

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@Ikkauto.com

sent: Friday, 22 June, 2018 10:22 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Sharon Han; Angie Foo; Vic (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving $JQ2272K (01 : CT1 - TBA) and SHC1660C (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI18011098/K1ha3) on 14/06/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
wWe refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case.



We had inspected TP vehicle SHC 1660C at M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd (Loyang).
Enclosed for your perusal is:

TP GIA report

TP estimated cost of repair

Preliminary advice

Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the un dersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Meli Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 o055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Incustrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.

For more information please visit http:/www.symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com




COMFORIDELCRO

Qur Ref T 0618/ SHC1660C MNT(st) ENC'INEERINC'
Your Ref :
Date 29-Jun-18 CDGE Tax Claims Dept
59 Loyang Drive 4th Flr
CHINA INSURANCE CO LTD Singapore 508969
3 ANSON ROAD
#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER
SINGAPORE 079809
Attn : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir
ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SHC1660C YOUR INSURED $SJQ2272K
AND OTHER ON 14.06.18

We are the authorised repair workshop for Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd, the owner of motor
Vehicle No:  SHC1660C which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured
vehicle The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concerned have requested and authonzed us to
assist them in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters
arising from the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving SJQ2272K
we are submitting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants.

TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM

1 Cost of Repair $ 251878

2 f days Lossof Rental@ § 12540 perday - 752.40

3 Survey Report Fees (Surveyed by M/s LKK) $ -

“ LTA Search Fees 5 7.49

5 GIA / Police Report Fees 5 2

B Towing / Medical / Transporation Fees 3 -

SubTotal: § 327867

HIRER'S CLAIM

7 6 days Lossofincome @ $  B0.00 perdays b 480.00
Total Claims : § 3,758.67

We enclose herewith the following documents to support the claims: -

a)  Original repair bill and photocopies of photographs i} pcs.

b)  LTA search slip/s of - SJQ2272K

¢)  GIA/Police report/s of - SHC1660C

d)  Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator
{ ) Traffic Compound ( ) Towing/Medical billireceipts { ) Ceriificate of Insurance
{ X ) Photograph/s of Accident Scen ( x ) Downtime/Mileage record { x ) Rental Rate latier

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of the said claims as
s00n as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settiement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver

Yours faithfully
““Wallvam ‘lan

Deputy Manager
CDGE Claims Department
Tel: 6214 8737 Fax 6214 1843 Emall : willlamtan@cdge.com.sq

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

COMFORIDELGRO



S1UNLAVE 1 #0125 PAYA UBTINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL @ (063) 62563561 FAX © (065) h2564515

Our Ref: CC3/CTI18011098/K1ha3
29 JUNE 2018

MULTRON SYSTEMS PTE LTD By Post and By Email
217 KALLANG BAHRU

MULTRON BUILDING

SINGAPORE 339347

ATTN: THE MANAGEMENT / MS MARGARET

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJQ 2272K AND SHC 1660C ON 14/06/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Ple Lid to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them,

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if vou have further queries.

Yours fail?hfull}'.

Vi A;pc h

DI%: 6841 2096

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: vicalpeh/@lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Deprt)

[uavvhi@muliron. com
{Email)



Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuUto)
Sent: Friday, 29 June, 2018 2:50 PM
To: Juayyh@multron.com
Ce: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)
Sub Your Ref: S)Q 2272K_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJQ 2272K AND SHC 1660C ON
14/06/2018
74 74

- ®mwm o= Consuirants
i, A B Pl Lo

21 UBIAVE 1, #0025 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FANX : (063) 62564315

Our Ref: CC3/CTI18011098/K1ha3
29 JUNE 2018

MULTRON SYSTEMS PTE LTD By Post and By Email
217 KALLANG BAHRU

MULTRON BUILDING

SINGAPORE 339347

ATTN: THE MANAGEMENT / M5 MARGARET

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING S)Q 2272K AND SHC 1660C ON 14/06/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them,

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter,

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(qo89:33)
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unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you belleve that you received this e-mail in ermor, please do not
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read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mall and all attachments, including any copies thereof. and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereol Thank you.



" CDG.VARS.V LettofAuthorisation Page | of |

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

(MAF / PAF)
ACCIDENT INVOLVING TOYOTA PRIUS SHC1660C , S1Q2272K ON 14-Jun-18 12:45
ALONG MOULMIEN RD X BALESTIER RD
1/ We HENG JEE MIN (Hirer) NRIC No.: S1115993A
and/ar (Relief) NRIC Na.:

|

Taxl Number SHC1660C

hereby authorise ComfertDelGro Engineering Pre Lid(CDGE):

1. To submit my/our claims for damages, costs and expense, including loss of income, loss of rental,
‘ medical fee and legal costs.

2. To have absolute discretion to agree to any settlament or compensation amount in respect of my/our claim
against third party (except personal injuries and medical claims).

1. To sian Discharge Youcher on my/our behalf.

4. To accept any payment (claim procesds) In respect of the claim against third party and payment by cheque
shall be forward directly to CDGE in accordance with CDGE's instruction and made in favaur of
"ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd".

Date 14-Jun-2018

Name af Hirer HENG JEE MIN

Hirer NRIC S1115993A Signature ;

Address 48 STRATHMORE AVENUE #38-229
140048

Contact No. 97665355




MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUUHER

Folicy Ho MPCSKI0ZE00L08] Claim Ho :SENI1BDOZSFT0C0Z/2|5J02272K)
Claimant : COMFORT TRAMSPORTATION PIE LTD

'

(2]

Amount 553,400.00

SINGAXPORE DOLLARS THREE THOUSAND FOUR HUNDEED ONLY

I/We agres o accspt cthe sbove mentionsd amcun:t to be paid o mefus in full &
final sectlem=nt of all claims, coacs | disborsspants for Anjuziss J damages
sustalned by me/uas through an accident itvalving

Claimant Vehicle Mo. @ EHC 1&80C
Insured Vahicle Roe. : 5JQ Z2T7IX

Date af Losg : L4/067201B
Flace =l Kcoocident : MOULMEIN ROAD TOWARDE BRLESTIER ROAD

I COMSTDERATION of the pay=en: mads to me/ys of the aforsmentioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LID., I/We agree sbaclitely to
dischazge CHINA TAIFING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PIE. LTD. and/or

Insured Hana : MULTFON SYSTEME PTE LID
Priver Name : JUAY YEW HARI

from all claims, pressnt or futurea Ln gespact of all leas, lnjury or danags
sustaines by me/us arising out of the =said accident.

1 ackrowledge that this payment i{s smads without ad=siszsion af llabllity on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

{1} Global Sum 55 3,400.00

TOTAL < & & & & % & & s & & o s o« « 35 3,400.00

CLnd DEARRTHENY
COUPCRTIELCR ENOMEERINC FTE 4 T
IFLUTRNG DAL
Claimant Kame : _ ShEAS0eT Salden NRIC %o 3
L2 b
- |
Signature t {I_ _,’ o pace : m\ l %

"The contéms 5ty argly m e =
i L] A [ ] =i-|. o Kl ‘:. w i U |I |‘| g [rirvitdid 34 |h ue A p".:}ﬂ[ﬂ: T

Al perscnsi Aies ol UaMages ansing Maraiiom 2@ exciydeq "'EMFUH‘EHHGHCF EHGWHHIHG e
fom the ambit and appdeation of s deciment



COMFOR1DELGRQ ComioriDelGro Engineering Pie Lid
ENGINEERING

MFORIDELGRO

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE ' 3w

VEHITT.E M) Yy ML TATE

HINA ATPING ITNSURANCE WS SHC TR ] 7 ¥
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ComfortDelGro Engineering Pre Lid
A mimtee of COMPORT =L 20

ACCOUNT No INVOICE Mo AMOUNT BANK/CHO No.

Heud Office:
205 Braddell Road
Singapore $79701

Kindly not that no receipt shall be issued unless requestod J A ! =
CUSTOMER'S COPY




COMFDR1DELGRQ ComiortDelGro Engineering Ple Lid
ENGINEERING '

noer ol COMFORDELCRO
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ComfortDelGro Engineering Pre Lid
A mambar of COMFORICE  Lag) ACCOUNT No INVOICE No AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No.
Head Office:

205 Braddell Road
Singnpore STIT0I

Kindly note mat no recaipt shall be ssued uniess requested

CUSTOMER'S COPY




Our Re: CT18060424 'n

Date: 26 June 2018

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear SirlMadam

ACCIDENT ON 14/06/2018 @ 12:45hrs
ALONG MOULMIEN RD X BALESTIER RD
INVOLVING SJQ2272K

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration
number SHC1660C (the "Tax("). The Taxi was hired to HENG JEE MIN IC NO
$1115993A a registered hirer-operator of Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd at the time
of occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $125.40 per day
(inclusive of GST).

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with MS First Capital Insurance Ltd on
a third party basis at the material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a motor
workshop of his choice.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

settlement of claims with third party’s insurance company in respect of the said
accident

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fleet Safely

This is a compuler generaled letter. No signature is required.

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717 Mainline +65 6555 1188 Facsimile +65 6453 3183
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Insurance Particulars Enquiry By Ageats Detail https: vl govsg/la/velaction/ims PanDetal By AATFUNCTION ..

Enquire Vehicle Insurer

Vehicle No. Incident Date/Time Search Status Insurance Company Code Insurance Company Name

SH32272K 14 Jun 2018/ 124500 Successtul co1 CHIMNA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD
Previous OK

lofl 14/06/2018, 2:20 PM



