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51 UBLAVE 1, #00-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563501 FAX : (005) 62564315

Your Ref: D18003256MFSH Date: 04 July 2018

Our Ref: CS/FCI18011082/R1qd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __SJU 9136D .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 03/07/2018 at the premises of M/s ETHOZ . and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :S§  8.580.80

Revised Estimate Amount 1 8% 350840

“Check™ Items Amount : S% 1.,694.24

Market Value ' 8% -

LTA Reimbursement Value : S§ -

Nett Value : 5§ -

Description of Damage: e—

The vehicle sustained damages =

at the front o/s portion. i e
offside

Yours faithfully

Rasul
Automotive Assessor



H i M5 First Capital Insurance Limited csfeq no 1950000060 GST Reg Mo, M2 00016759
MS‘ FI rStca pltal & Raffles Quay 421-00 Singapore 048580

Tet (656222 2311 Fax: [B5) 6222 3547
Clalmes & Matur Undenwriting Dept: 36 Robinson Read #16-01 City House Singapore 068877

Tet (65) 6507 3848 Fax; (B5) 6507 3849
wwiw, msfirsteapital.com.sg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 25-04-2018 Our Ref No. D18003256MFSH
Accident Date 23-04-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHC7220A Third Party Vehicle. SJUS136D
Survey Location 30 BUKIT BATOK CRESCENT
Contact Person. LEE CHEN SIN
Contact No. 66547250/ 8B228339 Fax No. 66547542
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
A

Pt LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person NA Fax No. 6B416315
Contact Number. MNA,

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop ETHOZ GROUP LTD Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor MNA, TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge LURENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is @ computer generated letter, no signature required.

A Mpmber of EEESEIIE IRSLIRANCE GROLP




6/10/2018 Claim Workflow Systam
Job Sheet (/ClaimWS/Surveyor/JobSheet/239297) -)*7_- PRI Documents 9 | Close X
PRI Header Details

Claimant
Claim No D1B003256MFSH Policy No D-1808B8937MFSH S.No & 1 & ETHOZ GI

Name
Workshoo | ETHOZ GROUP LTD f“":f:; 30 BUKIT BATOK CRESCENT
bk, P | (Contact Person : LEE &“;o;m"ﬂ Mobile: 88228339 , Phone: 66547250 , Fax: 6654754

CHEN SIN ) Details Emailld: CHENSIN,LEE@ETHOZGROUP.COM

Our LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS Instructions ;
Surveyor PTE LTD To Surveyor WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
i CITYCAB PTE LTD Insured SHC7220A :Ph' I SIU9136D
Name Vehicle No .

MNo
PRI Surveyor Surveyor
Recieved 18-06-2018 05:15:05 PM Appointed 19-06-2018 09:26:40 AM Accept 19-08-2018 1
Date Date Date

Survey Report Upload
|
Sl [ Surveyor :p::d "
Inspection | s v 19-06-2018 sy Choose File
Report Date Report .
Date *; " X
Vehicle Particulars
Make Please Select Make ¥| | Model Please Select Model ¥ | Year ‘Select Year v
Chasis No l Engine No | Mileage ’
Cubic
|
AR | Capacity {
Multiple Documents Upload
Upload Multiple Documents
File Name Action

Surveyor Job Remarks

Remarks

https./ficlaims.com:3001/ClaimWS/Surveyar/Details/2 39297

12



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) :

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 9 January 2019 9:46 AM

To: Lee Chen Sin

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION REPORT OF SJU-9136-D HONDA QDYSSEY (TP)(MS FIRST
CAPITAL)

Hi Lee,

Finalised amount confirmed

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥y KR e
sennid® W Sque the Larth Print only when necessary

From: Lee Chen 5in [maiIt-:::ChenSin.Lee@ethnzgmup.mm]

Sent: Tuesday, 8 January, 2019 6:12 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: FINALIZATION REPORT OF SJU-9136-D HONDA ODYSSEY (TP)(MS FIRST CAPITAL)

Hi Rasul,

Attached are the finalization report, check item photo and photo after paint of above mention vehicle.

Please send acceptance once the COR is confirm.

COR - § 4,150.00 (Lump Sum Repair)
Repair days : 4

Kindly revert.

Thank you.

Warmest Regards,
Lee Chen Sin
Motor Claims Operations

ETHOZ

ETHOZ GROUP LTD

30 Bukit Batok Crescent Singapore 658075

DID: 6654 7520 | FAX: 6654 7542 | Mobile: 8822 8339
www . ethozgroup.co

fRinl - RU




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Lee Chen Sin <ChenSin.Lee@ethozgroup.coms

Sent: Friday, 30 November 2018 3:12 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuUta)

Subject: RE: FINALISE OF VEHICLE SJU 9136D (DOA: 23/04/2018)

Dear Shiau Chan,

; ot I T kel LT
P4 | Al TE® 5! ’} La At
i i ' . Safsl
Vehicle yet repair. L Ol e, e 4 |
. = . + 5 . A i 2 r"-w*‘- e
We will advise and arrange customer come our side for repair. 4l wivele & . be
poxXd weele for vl
Thank you.
Warmest Regards,
Lee Chen Sin

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, November 30, 2018 3:11 PM

To: Lee Chen Sin <ChenSin.Lee@ethozgroup.com>

Subject: FINALISE OF VEHICLE 5JU 9136D (DOA: 23/04/2018)

Dear Chen Sin,
Kindly advise the status of 5JU 9136D.

If done for repair, kindly send us the final bill for finalise.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S5(408033)

Disclaimer: This message may contain confidential information intended only for the use of the addressee named
above. If you are not the intended recipient of this message you are hereby notified that any use, dissemination,
distribution or reproduction of this message is prohibited. If you received this message by mistake, please notify the
sender by reply email immediately. Please conduct your own virus checks before opening any attachment as ETHOZ
Group does not guarantee the integrity of this email or attached files has been maintained nor this communication
is free of viruses, interceptions or interference. Any views expressed in this message are those of the individual
sender and may not necessarily reflect the views of ETHOZ Group. ETHOZ Group shall not be responsible nor liable
for the improper and incomplete transmission of the information contained in this communication nor for any delay
in its receipt or damage to your system.



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 4 July 2018 3:42 PM

To: ‘Claim Workflow System’; assignments

Cc LURENEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; SUR
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18003256MFSH/1
Attachments: CSFCI18011082R1gd3.pdf

Dear Lurene,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of 5JU 9136D.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 5250-4315
Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 19 June 2018 9:40 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cec: LURENEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18003256MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 19 June 2018 9:26 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@ MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; LURENEJAW @MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D1B003256MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards.
Admin Team
Claim Workflow System
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 10 Type:

Crwmer ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Mo.:

ehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QF Faid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 18 Jun 2018

PARFICOE Rebale Enquiry

Singapore NRIC
76370

SIU9136D

Mo

18 Jun 2018
HOMNDA

ODYSSEY 2.4L AT
Purple

2009
K24Z21301757
JHMRB38309C201751
132.0kW [177 bhp)
$31,488.00

04 Jan 2010

04 Jan 2010

0

$31,468.00

Yes
03 Jan 2020
$17,318.00

03 Jan 2020

B - Car (1601cc & above)
10

$17,889.00

$2.760.00

$20,078.00

PRSI ITE e SRR ARSI RN PR R ANATRHVET IR ICHATOFRLIATRINDUT SF LN LD IUN IU=SPUSUEUIE
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PLEASE ARRANGE TO SURVEY

VEHICLE AT 30 BUKIT BATOK
CRESCENT (S 658075)

Lee Chen Sin
CLAIM DEPARTMENT
DID : 66547520

Date ; 18/06/2018 FAX :
To : MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED
ESTIMATION
Attn - Motor Claim Department FAX :
Owmer : AZMAN BIN SUPANDI
DIRECT ASIA INSURANCE(SINGAPORE) PTE LTD
Certificate No . MT/00016921/07 Accident Date . 23/04/2018
Vehicle No : SIU-9136-D Make & Model . HONDA ODYSSEY 2.4L AT
ESTIMATED REPAIR COST DETAILS Excess : 000 Add Excess 0.00
QTY DESCRIPTION REPATRER AMT(5) SURVEYOR AFP.
List Item
| FRONT BONNET 712.40 19:‘#’
10 FRONT BONNET INSULATOR CLIP 35.00 [P 7
1 FRONT FENDER LH RESTORE
1 FRONT FENDER RH RESTORE
1 HEADLAMP LH 73390 | K
1 HEADLAMP RH 73300 |[CRA ~
| HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKET LH 37.40 K
1 HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKET RH 3740 |,
1 FRONT GRILLE (QUTER) 220,50 |FL <

ETHOZ PROTECT PTE LTD 35 8ukit Batok Crescent. Singapore 658075 | Tel 6312 8000

PAGE : 1

| Fax: 6319 BO8O0 | v ethozgroug.com
Company Fegeiiatsn b, 153130100N
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Date ¢ 18/06/2018
To : MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED
ESTIMATION
Atin : Motor Claim Department FAX :
Owner : AZMAN BIN SUPANDI
DIRECT ASIA INSURANCE(SINGAPORE) PTE LTD
Certificate No - MT/00016921/07 Accident Date -~ - 23/04/2018
Vehicle No : SJU-9136-D Make & Model ; HONDA ODYSSEY 24L AT
ESTIMATED REPAIR COST DETAILS Excess 2000 Add Exeess :  0.00
QTY DESCRIFTION REFPAIRER AMT (5) SURY -l:':‘x;'ﬂR APP.
1 FRONT GRILLE (INNER) 20790 |PE ~—
| FRONT GRILLE LOGO 23.40 -~
10 FRONT GRILLE CLIP 39.00 e
| FRONT BUMPER 7113.60 & ~
10 FRONT BUMPER CLIP 39,00 e <7
| FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH 1200 X
| FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH 12.00 [Max «~
| FRONT BUMPER CHROME GARNISH 35630 |CRa ~
| FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE 80.00 |p€
1 FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT 23370 | 7 r,{,/
PAGE : 2

ETHOZ PROTECT PTE LTD 30 ukit Batok Crescent. Singa

pore 658075 | Tet: 6312 2000 | Fax: 6319 BOSO | e sthazaroup com

Camrady Fegaiaton o 110N
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ETHOZ PROTECT PTE LTD 30 Bukit Batok Crescent. Singapore 658075 | Tel: 6219 8000 | Fax: 6319 B8O | www elhozomoup.com

Company Megaheion M 1#R100105N

Date : 18/06/2018
To : MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED
ESTIMATION
Attn : Motor Claim Department FAX -
Owner AZMAN BIN SUPANDI
DIRECT ASIA INSURANCE(SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

Certificate No MT/00016921/07 Accident Date 23/04/2018

Vehicle No SJU-9136-D Make & Model HONDA ODYSSEY 2.4L AT
ESTIMATED REPAIR COST DETAILS Excess 0.00 Add Excess : 0.00

QTyY DESCRIPTION REPAIRER AMT (3) SURVEYOR APP.
| CONDENSER SIDE COVER LH 9.00 | X
| CONDENSER SIDE COVER RH 9.00 | 7
| SUPPORT PANEL 584.00 | %"
1 CONDENSER 753.70 ﬂ-
1 RADIATOR 1,865.70 7 X
1 RADIATOR FAN COWLING 107.50 | X
I RADIATOR FAN MOTOR 308.00 | X
1 RADIATOR FAN BLADE ss.00 | X
1 AIR COND FAN COWLING 82.90 | X
1 AIR COND FAN BLADE 52.00 K.
PAGE : 3
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Date 18/06/2018
Te MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED
ESTIMATION
Attn Motor Claim Department FAX :
Owmer AZMAN BIN SUPANDI
DIRECT ASIA INSURANCE(SINGAPORE) PTE LTD
Certificate No MT/00016921/07 Accident Date 23/04/2018
Vehicle No SJU-9136-D Make & Model HONDA ODYSSEY 24L AT
ESTIMATED REPAIR COST DETAILS Excess 0.00 Add Excess 0.00
OTY  DESCRIPTION - REPAIRER AMT(S)  SURVEYOR npp.—‘
I AIR COND FAN MOTOR 29680 | Y

Sub Total 8351.00

Discount 20%  On Parts (1670.20) |
Special Nett Item

7 i
1 FRONT BUMPER PARKING SENSOR (SET) 25040 | 20 -
1 FRONT NUMBER PLATE 3500 (MM
1 RADIATOR COOLANT 30.00 )Q
Sub Total 315.00
Labour & Misc

L ABOUR TO CARRY OUT FRONT REPAIR W Son

PAGE :

4
ETHOZ PROTECT PTE LTD 30 Bukit Batok Crescent, Singapore 658075 | Tel: 6318 8000 | Fax: 6319 B080 | wwiw.£ihozgeoup.com

Company Fegseanon Mo YIS0

—

F 48
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Date : 18/06/2018
To MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED
ESTIMATION
Attn : Motor Claim Department FAX ;
Owmer : AZMAN BIN SUPANDI
: DIRECT ASIA INSURANCE(SINGAPORE) PTE LTD
Certificate No . MT/00016921/07 Accident Date . 23/04/2018
Vehicle No : SIU-9136-D Make & Model . HONDA ODYSSEY 24L AT
ESTIMATED REPAIR COST DETA_ILS Excess : 0.00 Add Fxcess :  0.00
II QTY  DESCRIPTION ' REPAIRER AMT(S)  SURVEYOR APP.
TO CHECK AND RECONNECT ALL NECCESSARY WIRINGS 35.00 |7
TO SPRAY PAINTING ON FRONT AFFECTED AREA oo
TO REMOVE & FIX AIRCON CONDENSER INCLUDING 1500 | (ov ™
TOP UP AIRCON GAS—
KK Auto ltants hence notif
Sllb Tﬂ'ﬂl the Rﬁpalr{%fﬂf!he fl.'.l]fl:lwlnr ¥ ]585[“]‘ ‘
o To resurvey befarafafter spray painti ing
«To dlSFﬂE}' "-'idmageﬂ paﬂ]:s] durgng resurvey
» Parts prices are subject ta confirmation
. ?hr.d party survey is on a “Without Prajudice” basis
* Mo 1||Eg34 mudil'p\:a“gn,:'“ is allowed i
* Supplementary item(s) mus! b
is subject to final appraval rmnflﬁ:ﬁ:::%;iam
Acknowiedged by Repairar
Signature:
s | 8,580.80
Remarks: = f
L‘r GQM‘/) . Lum-fW"“‘ SUB TOTAL
GST 7.0 % 600.66
R TOTAL 9,181.46
suveyorename:  ROAWL ~Up Qrﬂrm\’f{
\‘*"‘
Principal's name: AZMAN BIN SUPANDI \\ / _-
|I \ ) l‘ﬁ’
Survey Date & Time: Usibﬂllg’ éj H")ﬂ | N ,_%\“N

{Rgﬁvb ﬁ-i’ﬁ" '7'7“4“ PAGE:  §

ETHOZ PROTECT PTE LTD 30 Bukit Batok Crescent, Singapore 656075 | Tel: 6319 8000 | Fax. 6319 8080 | www ethozgroup.com
Campany Hegeimion Mo 1991001008



Fuauzanen) Rate]

ETHGCZ

Date : 08012019
To : MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED
Attn : Maotor Claim Department FAX :
G AZMAN BIN SUPANDI
Insured By : DIRECT ASIA INSURANCE(SINGAPORE) PTE LTD
Certificale N MT/O006921/07 Accident Date :  23/04/2018
Vehicle No SJU-8136-D Make & Model : HONDA QODYSSEY 2.4L AT
FINAL ESTIMATED REPAIR COST DETAILSExcess : 000 Add Excess | 0.00
oy DESCRIFTION REPAIRER AMT (SFURVEYOIR AMT (3) |
List liem
1 FRONT BONNET T12.40 f12.40
10 FRONT BONMET INSULATOR CLIP 35.00 a5.00
1 FROMNI FENDER LH RESTORE 0.00 ﬂ.ﬂua?ﬁ_’
1 FRONT FENDER RH RESTORE 0.00 0.00
1 HEARLAMP LH AL ey ke 733,90 733.90
1 HEADLAMP R 733,90 733.90
1 HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKETLH 0 et ien, ctr ar.40 37.40
1 HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKET RH -/ ar.40 3r.40
1 FROMNT GRILLE (OUTER) 220.50 220.50
1 FRONT GRILLE (INNER) 20780 207.90
1 FRONT GRILLF LOGO 23.40 23.40
10 FRONT GRILLE CLIP 39,00 39.00
1 FRONT BUMPER 713,60 713.60
10 FRONT BUMPER CLIP 309.00 39.00
PAGE : 1

ETHOZ PROTECT PTE LTD 30 Bukil Batok Crescent. Singapore 058076 | Tet: 6319 6000 | Fao: €210 8030 | www ethozg

Covpany Higatraton Ha 166 00 0N



Dute D801/2019

Attn

Chaner

Insured By

Certificate No

Vehicle Mo 5JU-9136-D

Muotor Claim Department

AZMAN BIN SURPANDI

MT/O0016921/07

Accident Date

Make & Model

FINAL ESTIMATED REPAIR COST DETAILSExcess

o1y

1 A S i T e

DESCRIFTION

FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH

FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH
FRONT BUMPER CHROME GARNISH
FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE
FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT
CONDENSER SIDE COVER'LH
CONDENSER SIDE COVER RH
SUPPORT RPANEL
CONDEMSER K
RADIATOR
RADIATOR FAN COWLING
RADIATOR FAN MOTOR
RADIATOR FAN BLADE
AIR COND FAN COWLING
AIR COND FAN BLADH

e e

ETHC

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED

Ffmll

FAX :

DIRECT ASIA INSURANCE(SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

23/04/2018

HONDA ODYSSEY 2.4L AT

0.00

Add Excess

Z.

: 0.00

RI*.]‘&IRFR AMT ﬁﬁUR\’F\"OH AMT (5)

12. Bﬂ
12.00
356,30
80.00
233.70
9.00
9.00
584.00
753,70
1865.70
107.50
308.00
55.00
82.90
52.00

PAGE :

0.00 Y&
12.00
356.30
B0.00
233.70
0.00
ﬂ.ﬂﬂaﬁ’\
0.00
753.70
0.00
0.00
0.00 fan
0.0
0.00
0.00

2

ETHOZ PROTECT PTE LTD 30 Bukit Batok Crescent. Singapore 658075 | Tal: 319 8000 | Fax; 6319 8080 | www.ethozgroun com

Convgpany Hegalinton o YRS
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Dale 08/01/2019

To ' MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED

Attn - Motor Claim Department FAX

Cwner AZMAN BIN SUPANDI

Insured By DIRECT ASIA INSURANCE(SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

Certificate No MT/O00168921/07 Accident Date - 23/04/2018

Vehicle No 5JU-9136-D Make & Model | HONDA ODYSSEY 2.4L AT
FINAL ESTIMATED REPAIR COST DETAILSExcess : D00 Add Excess

Ty DESCHIFTION

1 AIR COND FAN MOTOR R ' 206,80
Sub Taotal B3as51.00
Discouwnt| 20%% O Parls l;ﬂ“ﬂ} [lﬁ'?ll.lil}

Special Nett Lem

1 FRONT BUMPER PARKING SENSOR (SET) GMIK fm An /. 250.00

1 FRONT NUMBER PLATE 35.00

1 RADIATOR COOLANT 30.00
Sub Tatal 315.00

Lahour & Mise
LABOLUR TO CARRY OUT FRONT REPAIR T00.00
TO CHECK AND RECONNECT ALL 35.00
MECCESSARY WIRHINGS
TOSPRAY PAINTING ON FRONT 700.00

ETHOZ PROTECT PTE LTD 30 Bukit Batok Crescent, Singapare 658075 | Tel 6315 8000 | Fax: 6319 8080 | wany olhoZarolp.com
Enreany Mogstraton Me 195 00N
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REPAIRER AMT ($BURVEYOR AMT (§) l

0.00 J{m“l
4969.10
(993.82)

200.00
45.00
0.00 AnX

235.00

500.00
35.00

A00.00
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Daie 08/01/2018
Fo MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED
Adtn : Maotor Claim Department FAX :
Owner AZMAN BIN SUFANDI
Insured By DIRECT ASIA INSURANCE(SINGAPORE) PTE LTD
Certificate N MT/O0016921/07 Accident Date  :  23/04/2018
Vehicle MNo ' SJU-9136-D Make & Model © HONDA ODYSSEY 2.4L AT
FINAL ESTIMATED REPAIR COST DETAILSExcess : 0.00 Add Excess @ 0.00
oTY DESCRIFTION - REPAIRER AMT (SPURVEYOR AMT ($)
‘ AFFECTED AREA ' -
TO REMOVE & FIX AIRCON CONDENSER 150.00 100.00
INGLUDIHNG 10U ARCON GAS
Sulby Tuiznl 1585.00 1035.00
Sub Total £.580.80 Sed24
GST 7.0% 60066 6717
Total 9.181.46 5.612.45
cor - 4, 150.00 (4 REAR )
4 Diys KECR
Surveyor Name RASUL - LKK '("r’” o4 e R F g 2 .ff
Date & Time 03/07/2018 11:30:00 AM B 3975 ey
Lee Chen Sin SN~ I 235.00 PAGE: 4
CLAIM DEPARTMENT Boue . 8 ), a35 (dl®,
DID : 66547520 T —

B 5 245 28
FAX: ; 7 Jo C4N paone)
B )96 22 N
ETHOZ PROTECT PTE LTD 30 Bukit Batok Crescent. Sngapore 650075 | Tel: 6319 8000 | Fax: 6319 8080 | yooy elhozaiolp Lam
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408533

TEL: B256 3661 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

36 ROBINSON ROAD

Ref GCSIFC118011082/R1gd3n2

#16-01 GITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Dafec: L2010 M“anmlmm
Code : FCI2
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 72204 Veh. Inspected SJU 81380
Policy No. D-1B0BBS3TMFSH Coverage (§} 0.00
Claim No. D18003256MFSH Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From LURENE Assign Date 19/06/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA ODYSSEY Z.4A C.C 2354
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2010
Chassis No. JHMRB3B309C201751 Colour PURPLE
Odometer 97434 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/55 R17 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/55 R17 YOKOHAMA & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |21 5155 R17 YOKOHAMA 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/55 R17 YOKOHAMA & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT Q/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  23/04/2018 Inspection Date 03/07/2018
Survey held at ETHOZ GROUP LTD
30 BUKIT BATOK CRESCENT
SINGAPORE 658075
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"MITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5h. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR

4 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #04-25 Paya Ubl Indusinal Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: G256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-0607198-R Page No..1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJU 9136D
: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) s)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS

1|FRONT BONNET BENT 712 40 712,40
10|FRONT BONMET INSULATOR CLIP NECESSARY 35,00 35.00
1|FRONT FENDER LH (NPA) SERVICEABLE - .
1|FRONT FENDER RH (NPA) SERVICEABLE - -
1|HEADLAMP LH CRACKED 733.90 733.20
1|HEADLAMP RH CRACKED 733.90 733.90
1|HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKET LH CRACKED 37.40 37.40
1|HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKET RH CRACKED 37.40 37.40
1|FRONT GRILLE (QUTER) SCRATCHED 220.50 220.50
1|FRONT GRILLE {INNER) DEFORMED 207.90 207.90
1|FRONT GRILLE LOGO NECESSARY 23.40 23.40
10|FRONT GRILLE CLIP NECESSARY 39.00 30.00
1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED 713.60 713,80
10|FRONT BUMPER CLIP NEGESSARY 39.00 39.00
1|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH SERVICEABLE 12.00 -
1|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH NECESSARY 12.00 12.00
1|FRONT BUMPER CHROME GARNISH CRACKED 356.30 356 30
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE DEFORMED B0.00 80.00
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BENT 233.70 233.70
1|CONDENSER SIDE COVER LH NOT NECESSARY .00 .
1|CONDENSER SIDE COVER RH NOT NECESSARY .00 -
1|SUPPORT PANEL NOT NECESSARY 584.00 .
1|CONDENSER BENT 753.70 753.70

1|RADIATOR MOT NECESSARY 1,865.70
1|RADIATOR FAN COWLING NOT NECESSARY 107.50 -

1|RADIATOR FAN MOTOR NOT NECESSARY 308.00
1|RADIATOR FAM BLADE NOT NECESSARY 55.00 -
1|AIR COND FAN COWLING NOT NECESSARY 82.20 -

1|AIR COND FAN BLADE NOT NECESSARY 52.00
1|AIR COND FAN MOTOR NOT NECESSARY 25680 -

Report Ref No. CS/FCI118011082/R1gd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX. 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No..2 of 2
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
Qty P Workshop ()] (5)
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -1,670.20 -093 82
B,680.80 397528
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET FRONT BUMPER PARKING SENSOR (SN) NOT WORKING 250.00 200.00
1|ERONT NUMBER PLATE (SN) BENT 35.00 35.00
1|RADIATOR COOLANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 30.00 -
315.00 235.00
LABOUR
LABOUR TO CARRY OUT FRONT REPAIR. 700.00 500.00
TG CHECK AND RECONNECT ALL NECESSARY 35.00 35.00
WIRINGS
TO SPRAY PAINTING ON FRONT AFFECTED AREA. 700.00 400.00
TO REMOVE & FIX AIRCON CONDENSER INCLUDING 150.00 100.00
TOP UP AIRCON GAS
1,585.00 1,035.00
GRAND TOTAL B,580.80 5,245.28
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 4,150.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

U

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18011082/R1gd3n2

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS

Automotive Assessor

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- Th
Mo liabifity of

Bepert. o wiole or in part, does =0 at

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng.,AMSOE,AMIRTE,AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

s Report ie mads sclaly for the wee and benefit of the Client namad on the front page of this Repod.
mwwwmmwwmwm
hiig ar her own sk




