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B V4N 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
=

- - - - ) .
- = aa A 51 Libd Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ut Industrial Park. Singapore 408933
- TEL: 5256 3581 FAX G256 4315

Reg Mo 199607186R GST Reg Mo. 18-0607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automabile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref :  CC4/EQI18011070/T1jb3
TR [IRIREEAAIN
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date 18-06-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAFPORE 068110
Code: EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GW B466H Veh. Inspected SFP 2403C
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (5) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 19/08/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  18/03/2018 Inspection Date 21/06r2018
Survey held at SPORT MODE AUTO PTE LTD
B KAK| BUKIT AVE 4
#05-48 PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 415875
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS
BIIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




Catherine Chnna (LKK Auto)

From: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 18 June, 2018 4:49 PM

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: FW: DM18HOO00737/JT-: Our Vehicle SFP2403C , Your Vehicle GWB466H
Attachments: img018.jpg; ATTO000L.txt; img019.jpg: ATTO0002.txt; img020.jpg; ATTO0003 txt;

img021.jpg; ATTO0004.txt; img022.jpg; ATTO000S.txt; img023 jpg; ATTO0006.txt:
Img024.jpg; ATTO0007 txt; img025.jpg; ATTOO008 txt; img026,jpg; ATTO0009.txt:
img027 jpg; ATT00010.txt; GWB466H.PDF

Dear all,

Please arrange to attend to the PRS.

Liability is cleared, proceed to direct settle if possible. \ % m} 1{‘4 l% Q b Ju?‘“
N
E&‘{ﬂﬁ W

Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

eﬁnsuronce
L Gt Tewachs

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190

WWwWw . eginsurance.com.sg
L
J‘ A Mernber of (rtate @—

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify t!

From: JEFFERY SEET [mailto:sportmode0911@gmail.com)

Sent: Monday, June 18, 2018 4:16 PM

To: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>; EQI PRS <EQIPRS@eqinsurance.com.sg>
Subject: Re: DM1BHO00737/JT-: Our Vehicle SFP2403C , Your Vehicle GWB466H

Hi Ms Janet ,

Will like to have LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd.

Thanks

Jeffery 9389 7789

Sport Mode

25 Kaki Bukit Road 4 , Synergy @ KB #05-66 Spore 417800

Sent from my iPhone



On 18 Jun 2018, at 13:32, Janet Tan <janet.tan/@eqinsurance. com.sg> wrote:

Without Prejudice
Save As To Costs

Dear Jeffrey

Liability is cleared.

For Pre repair survey request, please email to eqiprsi@eqinsurance com.sg

We shall be appointing our surveyor to attend to the pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle.

Below is a list of motor surveyors in our panel. Please revert within 2 working days if you agree or
have any objections to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors. If we do not hear from you,
you are deemed to have agreed to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors listed by us.
Alternatively, please specify one or more of our proposed motor surveyors to the said assignment,

1)

AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd
Tel: 6255 0808
Fax: 6849 9155

2) Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd
Tel: 6286 0155
Fax: 6284 1539
Contact Person: Sophia

3)

LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd
L.B.S. Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 6281 6690 / 62832866

Fax: 6281 8748

Contact Person: Amy/ Grace

4) Priority Services
Tel: 62934822
Fax: 62963283
Contact Person: Sharon

5)

RT Appraisal Pte Ltd

Tel: 67486076

Fax: 67480361

Contact Person: Elson/Elgene

6) LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 6256-3561
Fax: 6741-4108

7)

Kelvin Automotive Appraising Services
Tel: 81825263

Fax: 67461148

Contact Person: Kelvin

8) Automaotive Appraiser & Surveying
Services
Tel: 96623655
Fax: 67655662
Contact Person: Mr Chee

9)

JP Knights Pte Ltd
Tel: 63450068
Fax: 63445328

If you object to all the motor surveyors as proposed by us, please provide a list of at least 10 motor
surveyors whom you consider as suitable to appoint for our consideration. We shall revert to you
within 2 working days.




Meanwhile, we reserve our rights on Post-Repair Inspection, kindly contact us or our appointed
Surveyor before you return your client’s vehicle to him/her.

Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

<image001.png>

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190

WWww.eqinsurance.com.sg
<image003.png>

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please

From: JEFFERY SEET [mailto:sportmode0911@gmail.com]

Sent: Saturday, June 16, 2018 1:14 PM
To: lanet Tan <janet.tan@eqginsurance.com.sg>
Subject: Our Vehicle SFP2403C, Your Vehicle GWB466H

Dear Officer in charge ,

Please advise us the liability for this case , we have attach the related documents for your
reference.

Best Regards,

Jeffery 9389 7789
Sport Mode
25 Kaki Bukit Road 4 , Synergy @ KB #05-66 Spore 417800



SPORT MODE

Date : 14/01/2019
MS Joy (Motor Claims Department)

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex
Singapore 069110

Our ref : SFP2403C/ 190318
Your ref : DM18H000737/|T (GW8466H)

Dear Sir,

RE: SUBMISSION OF DOCUMENTS FOR SFP2403C

Kindly be informed that our customer, PANG HUI CHIN owner of vehicle
registration no. SFP2403C (insured with NTUC INCOME) holds vehicle
registration no. GWB8466H which is insured with you EQ INSURANCE at the time
of an accicé?jnt liable and hereby submitting a claim against your insured for the
cost incurred.

On behalf of our customer, we provide the following claim for your settlement
below:

Repair cost : S 1200.00
Loss of use : S$  300.00 (560 per day for 5 days)
Total : $ 1500.00

Please contact Mr Jeffe Seet at 93897789 or email him at
jefferyseet@yahoo.com.sg within 7 working days from the date of this letter
should there be any missing documents or any other additional documents
required. If we do not hear from you during these 7 days, we would take it that all
documents submitted to you are complete and in order.

Cheque should be made payable to SPORT MODE

We look forward to receiving your early settiement of the invoice(s). Thank you.

Yours faithfully




J_qz Irene !LKKAutu] i

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 29 January 2019 5:55 PM

To: ‘gohsweeseng816@gmail.com’

Cc Admin A

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GW B466H AND SFP 2403C ON 19/03/2018

Attachments: INSPECTION OF THIRD PARTY VEHICLE pdf; ESTIMATED CLAIM WITH SURVEYORS
MARKINGS.pdf

Our ref: CC4/EQI18011070/T1jb3

GOH SWEE SENG
Policy Holder

Dear Sir,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GW 8466H AND SFP 2403C ON 19/03/2018,

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed
to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please
contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter,

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further clarifications.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene @lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408533)

All contents of this emall is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this emall in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email

is strictly forbidden.



LETTER OF INDEMINITY AND AUTHORITY

To: Sport Mode of 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #05-66 Singapore 417800 (Synergy @ Kaki Bukit)

Re: Accident on 19/03/2018 _involving vehicle number SFP2403C and_GW8466H _ at TAMPINES GIANT
SHELTERED CARPARK I/We PANG HUI CHIN __ of NRIC _S2555974F , the Owner of vehicle no.

SFP2403C _ hereby authorize Sport Mode (following sentence named as “you") to commence repairs of the
said vehicle forthwith.

1.

jj’?f{/i PV A

I/We authorize your instruct and deal with the surveyor/ experts and whoever else necessary on order
for you to assist me/ us in my/ our claim.

IWVe also authorize you to appoint solicitors on my behalf to process my/our claim against the third
party driver for my/ our damages including. If necessary, to commence legal proceeding in court in my/
our name

If the third party claim is unsuccessful or if no payment is received. [/We hereby instruct and authorize
you to make claim against my/ our insurance company on my/our behalf or pay by myself for shortage
amount, for your repair costs and any other losses. In case, |/We understand the any "Excess”
applicable under my/our insurance policy is to be borne by me/us.

IWe give you full authority to instruct my/our solicitors to negotiate settlement, to sue, to reject or
accept any offer of settiement on such terms as you deem fit from third party driver and/ or his insurers
and/or from my/our insurers.

I/We undertake to assign the whole process on my/ our third party and/ or own insurance claim to you
and if applicable, my/ our solicitors shall accept this as my/ our irrevocable authority to pay the amount
compensated direct to you after deduction of their costs on a solicitors and clients basis.

IWe undertake to cooperate fully with you and all parties concerned including attending Court (when
necessary) to see the claim to successful conclusion.

For Third Party Claim (Direct settiement) all repair cost shall paid to Sport Mode

IWe also authorize your to sign all Discharge Voucher/ Indemnity forms and all necessary papers in
connection with the above claim.

IWe authorized you to reimburse the loss-of-use received from insurance company to the Car Rental
Company on our behalf and in the event of any shortfall we will bear the different.

Date this 67 dayof T3 20 /%

Owner's Signature Witness's Signature



SPORT MODE

BILL: EQINSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED INVOICE NO. : 2019-0205
5 MAXWELL ROAD #17-00 TOWER BLOCK MND COMPLEX DATE: 5-Jan-19
SINGAPORE 069110 TERMS: Cash
VEHICLE NO. : SFP2403C
MODEL: MINI COOPER

UNITPRICE  TOTAL
NO DESCRIPTION aty (S$) (S$)
T BEING LUMP SUM REPAIR FOR VEHICLE SJP2403C 1 1,200,00 1,200.00
TOTAL PAYABLE: 1,200.00

All cheques should be crossed and made payable to "SPORT MODE®
This is system genterated invoice. No Signature is required

25 Kakl Bukit Road 4 #05-56 Synergy @ KB Singapore 417800 TEL; (65) 9389 7788

Company Registration No: 53370094M
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Company Registration Na. 199607 198R

S AVE | SU22E PAYA UNEINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL - (065) 62563581 FAX : (651 A2504312

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Date: 17/07/2019

TJHIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT
Vehicte N GW 8466H {Insd Veh) |Your Ref. No. : DM18HO00737/JT .

SRR SFP 2403C (TP Veh) |Our Ref. No.: CC4/EQI18011070/T1jb3q2
Date of Accident 19/3/2018
Liability 100%
Final Repair Cost ] 1,200.00
Loss of L.I_sa : § EDD.DD_ 5 days ¥
Rental (If any) : 9 days
Others: '$
:$

1.500.00
Final Settlement Sum |: § 1.500.00
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1)

SPORT MODE

- 1,500.00

JOANNE LEE
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

&1 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park. Singapore 408833
TEL: 62556 3561 FAX: 256 4315
Reg. No: 199807198R GST Reg. Mo 15-9607198-R

' 7d 74

s

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automabile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Rel CC4EQNB011070/T1jb3q2

MR

5 MAXWELL ROAD

#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date: 17-07-2019
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 068110
Code: EQI
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GW B4B86H Veh. Inspected SFP 2403C
Policy No. DMCPHQ17-005431 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DM1BHOOOTITIT Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From JANET Assign Date 18/06/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MINICOOPER S c.c 1598
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2004
Chassis No. WMWRE3I2000TK75613 Colour GREEN
Odometer 121842 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOCD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre [205/45R17 DUNLOP 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/45R17 DUNLOP 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/45 R17 DUNLOP 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/45R17 DUNLOP & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT N}S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,
5. General Information
Accident Date 19032018 Inspection Date 21/06/2018
Survey held at 25 KAKI BUKIT RD 4 # 05-66 2
Repairer SPORT MODE AUTO PTELTD
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A™WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REFAIR: 3 Working Days




Eedm BE &
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
&1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 5256 4115

Reg No: 199607188R GST Reg. No, 18-8607185-R Page N 1ol 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SFP 2403C
' Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo rluhnp?}] {Sl}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|CARRIER NOT NECESSARY 520.00 -
1|MOUNT BRACKET LH NOT NECESSARY 8500
1|FOG LAMP COVER LH NOT NECESSARY 38.00
1|FRONT PANEL NOT NECESSARY 550.00
1|SPLASH WALL REINFORCEMENT LH NOT NECESSARY 102.00
1|COVER PANEL WHEEL HOUSE NOT NECESSARY 35.00
1|SUPPORTING STRUT NOT NECESSARY 189.00
1|INTERIOR COLUMN A LH NOT NECESSARY 110.00
1|LOWER APRON NOT NECESSARY 145.00
1|GUIDE LEFT BOTTM NECESSARY 33.00 33.00
1|GUIDE LEFT TOP NECESSARY 11.00 11.00
1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED 670.00 670.00
1|TRIM STRIP NOT NECESSARY 99.00 -
1|CENTRE FINISHER NOT NECESSARY 89.00
1|GRILLE NOT NECESSARY 4500 -
1|CENTRE SPOILER NOT NECESSARY §7.00
1|LEFT SPOILER NOT NECESSARY 42.00
1| TRIM PANEL NOT NECESSARY 75.00
1|SPOILER LEFT NOT NECESSARY 75.00
1|WHEEL ARCH LH NOT NECESSARY 73.00
1|ENGINE HOOD TO REPAIR SEE 1,100.00
LABOUR
1|HEADLAMP LH NOT NECESSARY 1,650.00 -
1|FOG LAMP LH NOT NECESSARY 185.00 -
1|CONTROL UNIT XENON NOT NECESSARY 630.00 -
1|XENON BULB NOT NECESSARY 375.00 -
1|LEFT TURN INDICATOR NOT NECESSARY 77.00 -
1|WHEEL HOUSING COVER LH NOT NECESSARY 93.00 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -719.30 -71.40
8.473.70 642,60

Report Ref No. CC4/EQI18011070/T1jb3g2




¥y L

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Rl anae = 51 Ubi Ave 1 #0125 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapare 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg Mo 198807188FR GST Reg MNo. 12-9607188-R Page No 2ol 2
. Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | =stima m'gn "i:jl
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT NUMBER PLATE WITH FRAME (SN) NOT NECESSARY 50.00 H
1|SUNDRY (SN) MNECESSARY 20.00 20.00
T70.00 20,00
LABOUR
RENEW ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS ON FRT 800,00 300.00
BUMPER BONNET.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF
ENGINE HOOD
RESPRAY PAINT ACCIDENT DAMAGED PORTION ON 600.00 400.00
FRT BUMPER ,BONNET
CHECK WIRING AND ELECTRICAL SYSTEM 30.00 30.00
TO CONDUCT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK FOR THE CAR 200.00 100,00
SYSTEM
TO APPLY SEALANT FOR ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREA. |NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
TO RENEW FRT UNDER CARRIAGE NOT NECESSARY 300.00
TO CONDUCT WHEELALIGNMENT NOT NECESSARY 120.00
2.270.00 830,00
GRAND TOTAL B,813.T0 i 1.492.60
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,200.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CC4/EQI18011070/T1jb3q2
. i
o ré
MOHAMAD TAUFIKH HO LEONG CHUAN

M.MATAIL AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

Automotive Assessor

DISCLAIMER OF LLARILITY TD THIRD PARTIES: - This Report is made salely for the use and beneli of the Client named on the frant page of 1his Aepor




Joanne Lee !I.KK Rutnz

From: Joanne Lee (LKK Auto) <reporti@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 18 July 2019 3:52 PM

To: janettan@eqinsurance.com.sg’

Cc: Joylrene®@lkkauto.com’

Subject: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GW B4B6H (O1) and SFP 2403C [TP) on
19/03/2018

Attachments: LKK REPORT & PHOTO.pdf; TP DS SUPPORTING DOCUMENT .pdf

Dear SirMadam,
Please be mformed that the above-mentioned case had been settled.
Enclose herewnth final report & relevant documents for your necessary action please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

JOANNE | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone; 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email; report@lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933




