Vic (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 31 August, 2018 9:16 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; claims@cartimes.com.sg

Subject: FW: REF:17/18/18/VP05/020677

Attachments: CCF30082018.pdf; PROFORMA.docx; Rental Bill & Agreement SLZ4885H.pdf
Dear Vic,

Kindly let us have your mandate for our approval.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: claims@cartimes.com.sg [mailto:claims@cartimes.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 30 August, 2018 6:09 PM

To: ericwoo

Subject: REF:17/18/18/VP05/020677

Hi Eric,

Attached the document of SLZ 4885 H,please reply us ASAP.
Thank you.

Regards.

Angel



