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* Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Dwner ID Type: Singapore NRIC
Cwner 1D J207A
[ TN o T W e SISO 0- . o S P s~ 51—
Vehicle No.: SLESDO&H
Vehicle to be Exported: Yes
Intended De-registration Date 19 Jun 2018
Vehicle Make; BMW
Vehicle Model: A35| AT 3.0L ABS DJAB HID 2WD 4DR
Primary Colour: White
Manufacturing Year: 2008
Engine Mo.; D&PEAP63N54BI0A
Chassis N WEBAPM72000A38103%
Maximum Power Outpit: 2250 kW (301 bhp)
Open Market Value: $63.325.00
Original Reglstration Date: 19 Dec 2008
First Registration Date 19 Dec 2008
Transfer Count: 3
Actual ARF Paid: $43,325.00
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Ellgibility Expiry Date:; 1B Dec 2018
PARF Rebate Amount: $31.642.00
COE Expiry Date: 18 Dec 2018
COE Category E-Open Category
COE Period[Years) 10
QP Paid: §7.589.00
COE Rebate Amount £32200

Total Rebate Amount: £31984.00

Transfer of ownership ar de-registration ks not allewed for this vehicle.
The information contained herein s correct as at 19 Jun 2018
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53 Ubl Ave 1, #01-56 Paya Ubl Industrial Parlk, Singapore 408934,
Tel : 6747 4454 | Fax : 6747 7752 | Emall: cdaims@unitedsg.com.sg
UEN No. 201729521C | G5T No: 201729521C

ESTIMATION QUOTE

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED VEHICLE NO SLESO06H
5 MAXWELL ROAD #17-00 MAKE MODEL - BMW 335
TOWER BLOCK MND COMPLEX REFERENCE © USG-201806-16
SINGAPORE 069110 DOA - 08-Jun-18
ATTN: MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT CLAIM TYPE 3P CLAIM
PAGE 1 OF 2
UsTimems 5 T anY] USTPRIGERIT _ REMARKS
REAR BUMPER RETAINER v U 12000 || —
REAR BUMPER LOWER BRACKET Az #n 2|5 66.00 | | +
REAR BUMPER INNER GUIDE A7 it 1 |s 54000 | | X
TOW COVER Aol Al 1|8 5400 || +
REAR PDC SENSOR 4 plaws =gt 4|53 #0001 Y420
REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT TP pe 115 540.00 | | A
< i) 5 2,160.00
£ LESS 5% S 108.00
- - SUBTOTAL $  2,052.00
BALANCEC/F 3 2,052.00
|SPECIAL NETT ITEMS __|awy] usTeRicE(S) ][]  REMARKS |
p BALANCE B/F § 2,052.00
REAR BUMPER { AFTER MARKET ] Ip&—d 1158 2800801 /3cY :
REAR EXHAUST ASSY | AFTER MARKET ) ?-3—,__—.:5- gt | 1]S 350000 | Zec loalM)r
REAR BUMPER CLIP M 15E7] S 50:00- | & =
SUBTOTAL § §,350.00
BALANCE C/F § 8,402.00
[(asour . s/NO| LISTPRICE(S) || REMARKS
BALANCE BfF & 8,402.00
CHECK REAR WIRING AND LIGHTNING SYSTEM 1]5 60.00 s 7
PANEL BEATING ON AFFECTED AREAS 2 |s 50000 ] 289
SPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED AREAS 3|5 S00-007 2377
APPLY ANT] RUST ON AFFCTED AREAS 4|5 150.00 A

SUBTOTAL 5 1,210.00

ﬂl . GRAND TOTAL § 9,612.00
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- Pre Lid Company Reglstration No. 19960T1968R

S1UBEAVE 1, #02-25 FAYA UBEINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315
Y our ref: TBA
Our ref: CC4/EQIIB011057/Apa3 Date: 30/04/2019
The Motor Claims Department
M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SLE 5006H
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 19/06/2018
at the premises of M/s United SG Automobile Pre Lid - Ubi and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : S$ 9,612.00
Revised Estimate Amount : 83 2,050.00
"Check" ltems Amount : §% -
Total (Including Check Items) : 8§ 2,050.00
Market Value : S§ -
LTA Reimbursement Value : 5% -
Nett Value : S§ -
Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the -
Rear portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 3.0 days

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAN LING
Licensed Appraiser



Nivitha !LKK Auto)

From: Francis Ng <francis.ng@eqinsurance.comsg>
Sent: Thursday, 14 June 2018 1:27 PM
To: assignments
Subject: RE: PRI SURVEY FOR SLE5006H BMW 3351 / DOA:08 JUNE2018 / YOUR
REFERENCE: SLB4350K / OUR REFERENCE: USG-201806-16

Attach : 422518 pdf

ttachments SAS2422518 pd I BRRES 14| 0€ [1&
Dear Sirs 1&”‘[1'[ M,f l-ﬁ

' orn 1 |& he

o
Please assign Mr. Adrian to conduct the PRS as requested by the workshop below. ‘mihﬁ @ \,{%
Please note that our insured has not reported the accident.

Regards,
Francis Ng
Executive | Claims

ec:insuronce

- f:}'rl fﬁ.-ﬁ:‘.

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110

did 65 6496 9115 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 115 | fax 65 6223 4190

WWW.eqinsurance.com.sg <

J‘Ammmmm &@-———-'

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify t!

From: Claims@UnitedSG [mailto:claims@unitedsg.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, June 14, 2018 12:43 PM

To: EQI PRS <EQIPRS@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Ce: 'Claims@UnitedSG' <claims@unitedsg.com.sg>
Subject: RE: PRI SURVEY FOR SLES006H BMW 335/ / DOA: 08 JUNE 2018 / YOUR REFERENCE: SLB4350K / OUR
REFERENCE: USG-201806-16

Importance: High

Dear Sirs,

We agreed to use your proposed list of surveyor for SIE PRI
Our choice of surveyor is as follow :

LKK = MR ADRIAN

Please proceed with the assignment.

The car can be survey at our workshop on 18 June 2018 after 10am.



Thanks and best regards,

Vicky | Admin Executive

United SG Automobile Pte Ltd

Phone: 6747-4454 | Fax: 6747-7752

53 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-56 Paya Ubi Industrial Park Singapare 408934

From: Claims@UnitedSG [mailto:claims@unitedsg.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 14 June 2018 11:18 AM

To: 'eqiprs@eqinsurance.com.sg’ <egiprs@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Ce: 'Claims@UnitedSG' <claims itedsg.com.sg>

Subject: PRI SURVEY FOR SLESO06H BMW 335! / DOA: 08 JUNE 2018 / YOUR REFERENCE: SLB4350K / OUR
REFERENCE: USG-201806-16

Importance: High

Dear Sirs,
Refer to the above reference.

We'd like to call for a pre-repair inspection. As per new protocol, please let us have your list of surveyors / surveyor
companies.

Kindly respond within the next 2 working days otherwise we'll deem that you do not wish to proceed with the PRI
survey and we’ll arrange for our own.

Thanks and best regards,

Vicky | Admin Executive

United SG Automobile Pte Ltd

Phone: 6747-4454 | Fax: 6747-7752

53 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-56 Paya Ubi Industrial Park Singapore 408934



MOTOR CLAIM DISCHARGE

INSURED:..// 70 zetr. se i [atd  CAR/LORRY/CYCLE:REGNO:..[0C 2007
Foisiod|p Sl pale W1 T ) (o —————— | | I | | @ SRRSO

| / We confirm that |/'we have taken delivery nf@f Lorry / Motor Cycle
Registerad NO. .........cccouererc e L ETEELT o ieiivesisrvasensennsns from the repairers,
Messrs ffrf!f*hx
and that all repairs necessary as a result of an accident in which the said vehicle was
involved on or about ,....:f-.i‘..,..i.{DD]...,..':F.'.:....,(MM]......:‘:’.".;‘.,...[W} have been
completed to my / our satisfaction; and that | / we have no further claims on the above

Company in respect thereof.

DATE / TIME F cormemsseissssissrmmsrsiicsssssss HANATURE OF INSURED...coco oy AAL e s cssisissias ssssasssiasias
PLE IGN AND RETURN

\



- Sompo Insurance Singapore Ple. Lid
@) SOMPO | EaSos tunmamic b ot

F b—.] L | L S R R TET Ry W N

Certificate of Insurance

MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD-PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION) ACT (CHAPTER189)
MOTOR VEHICLES [THIRD-PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION) RULES. 1860
ROAD TRANSPORT ACT,1987 (MALAYSIA)

MOTOR VEHICLES [THIRD-PARTY RISKS) RULES, 1959 (MALAYSIA)

Cort NoJPolicy No. DATMTPVO1014423

Insured SIREGAR WALTER TIMBLIL

Motor Car (Registration No.)  SLES006H

Cover Comprehensive - ExcelDnve FOCUS
Policy Commancement Date - 04 OCTOBER 2017 08:26

Policy Expiry Date 03 OCTOBER 2018 2356
Maximum Liabllity (Section 1) = Market value al time of loss
Excess’ $1200 - Section |

(Waived up 10 50% or maximum S$800 whichever is lower if accident repair is done at ExcelDrive
Warkshops for the first claim per policy year)

Voluntary Excess* NA
Windscreen Excesa® S3100.00 - Waved if Repair ai Exceilnve Workshop
Loss of Use N.A
* Subject to GST wherever applicable

Persons or Classes of Persons anfitled o drive*
1. Tha Inswred.
Z. Any other persan who is driving on the Insured's order or with fhis parmission
3. In the avent of the death of the insured,
a_any member of the insured's family, or a paid driver who has been driving the Motar Car during the life of the insured and parmission
1o drive had nol bean withdrawn prior to the death of the insured. and
b. any ofher person who has been given permission io drive the Motor Car prior o the death and such permission had nol been
withdrawn by the Insured
Provided that the person driving is permitied in accordance with e icensing or ofher laws o regulations o drive the Molor Car ar has
bean so permifted and (s not disqualifisd by order of a Court of Law or by reason of any enactment or regulation i that bebalf from
driving the Maotor Car Amlprwlﬂﬂhﬂm‘mlthm:lrﬂlrhwm#uﬂuldTﬂlﬂuh:l{ﬂhpuri?llﬂhmiwuﬁm
under the Road Traffic Act (Chapler 276) has not been cancailed at the time of the accldent, loss or damage.

Limitations As To Use
Use only for social, domestic and pleasure purposa and for the Insurad's business. The Policy doas notl cover use for hire or reward,

racing. pace-making, speed lesting, relinbility trial, the carriage of goods other than samgples in connection with any irade or business or
use for any purposes in connection with the Motor Trade

ExcelDrive Workshops and Accident Reporting
It s & condlition precedent Lo liability thal the Insured shall call af the Company's Accident Reporting Center with the Motor Car within 24
howrs of the accident or by the next working day thareof,

All acadent repairs to the Motor Car must be carried out al ExcelDrive Workshops, olherwise the claim is not payable under the Policy,
FuEmnnnMeHm.mdmtmmlnﬂnumrhmmunhdmnltwmmhupnﬂwmm&mnﬂnwm

Far the list of Accident Reporting Centres and Excellirive Workshops. please visit our website at www.sompo,com.sg or call our
Emergency Hotlina: (85) 8226 3323.

Vive HERERY CERTIFY Mt i policy io which e Canficate mdated & siusd in accrsance win (1] ine provisans of ine Mo verches [Thirg-Pary Hisks and Compenissan] Act
Chagter 1907 and Part v of the Aoed Trarepont Aot 1887 (Msisynn) and (2) S Policy lerma. conditioen and exceptions o the Frivats Car Bolicy e MTR 2T

Sampo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid.
SU-L-.J"

Authorised Signatory

Date/Time of isaus - 04 OCTOBER 2017 0826

IMPORTANT ROTICE

a8  Hasap ihe Comfcam in your Motor Car

= Urcer i Moior ‘vehicies [Thes-Pany Rases eng Comparmation) A [Chapier 188) 1 shal be undewdl for sry pecson 12 Uas or CEUNS 5= PerTIE Sry SINer erson 13 UsE §
rror wihiche ssthout 2 valid policy of meurence urde the Act.

2 On the ssle of e Wottr Car of f for ary resen e insurencs @ ermngied Sunng o3 curmency he insured must surencter the Canifcais of nsurmce ard e Policy 18
s nsurance compary. If he Cerificas of Inewsance Ras Seen loat or desiioyed & staiory Secaryion &5 T #%ect Tt be mace. Fadune to Comply wem Sin ooligesan
8 an sfferce under B Motor Vehiclas [Third-Party Risks and Compensanan] Act [Chaptsr 180

o This Policy will casse o b sl once 1 Naior Car his Deen soid 19 snster persar The Foiicy |4 not TEmEfersils 1 S niw sweee of (e Vokr Car

Imermediary Code & Narrs - 11P11003 & PACIFIC PRIME INSURANCE BROKERS SINGAPORE PTE. LTD.  Cf Code: 224 JJLADSHEZNTYMEKA
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Hsiao TunE !u:mm)

From: Chris@UNITEDSG <chris@unitedsg.comsg>

Sent: Thursday, 22 August 2019 3:55 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: SLESDO6H BMW 3351 // LKK REF: CC4/EQI18011057/Apa3
importance: High

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Thanks for your offer.

We agree to accept the offer settlement as follow:-
Global @ $2560 (all-in)

Please let us have the DV for endorsement asap.

Thanks and best regards,

Chris | Motor Claims Department

United SG Automaobile Pte Ltd

Phone: 6747-4454 | Fax: 6747-7752

53 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-56 Paya Ubl Industrial Park Singapore 408534

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht(@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Saturday, August 17, 2019 12:43 PM

To: Chnis@UNITEDSG

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: SLES006H BMW 3351 // LKK REF: CC4/EQI18011057/Apa3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdrm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $2,560.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceplance.

“Please note that our above setilement is made on a withoul prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of lability on
our part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in
respect of the accldent. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall
be made (o this offer or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters,

Settlement and payment are subject to production of vriginal documents on demand al any time and execution of Discharge Voucher
{for settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the PlaintifffClaimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have

made payment on the settlement sum.”



Rest Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto,.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #oz2-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Frniday, 19 July 2019 5:13 PM
To: Chns@UNITEDSG <chris(@unitedsg.com.sg>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a(@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SLES006H BMW 3351 // LKK REF: CC4/EQI18011057/Apal

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm.,
We refer to the above matier.

Please be informed that our insured has yet lodge the accident report. We are following up with EQ and
get back to you asap.

By copy to Mei Kwan,
FYNA, CC4/EQI18011057/Apad

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkautocom | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chris@UNITEDSG <chris@unitedsg com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 19 July 2019 3:22 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SLESO06H BMW 3351

Importance: High

Hi Hsiao Tong,

LOD has been forwarded to your office since 22 Apr 2019.



Please let us have an offer soonest.

I'hanks and best regards,

Chris | Motor Claims Department

United SG Automobile Pte Ltd

Phone: 6747-4454 | Fax; 6747-7752

§3 Ubi Avenue | #01-56 Paya Ubi Industrial Park Singapore 408934

United

From: Chns@UNITEDSG [mailto;christ@unitedsg com.sg]
Sent: Monday, Apnl 22, 2019 4:02 PM

To: 'Denise Tay (LKKAuto)'

Ce: 'ADRIANLING@LKKAUTO.COM'

Subject: SLE5006H BMW 3351

Importance: High

Hi Denise,
We confirm COR (@ $2050 and DOR (@ 3 days.
Please advise LOD to vour office or EQ directly

Thanks and best regards,

Chris | Motor Claims Department

Umited SG Automobile Pte Lid

Phone: 6747-4454 | Fax: 6747-7752

33 Ubt Avenue | #01-56 Pava Ubi Industrial Park Singapore 408934

United

From: Demse Tay (LKKAuto) [mailto:demsetay@ lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, April 18, 2019 10:22 AM

To: chris(@unitedsg.com.sg

Subject: ESTIMATE

Dear Chris,

Please see attach

Bext Regards
Denise Tay | Case Handler
LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-356] | email: denisetavi@ kkauto com | fax; 6256435




Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue |, #02-25 | S{408933)



53 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-56 Paya Ubi Indusfrial Park Singapore 408934
Tel: 6747-4454 | Fax: 6747-7752 | Email: claims@unitedsg.com.sg
Register No: 201729521C | GST No: 201729521C

22 Apr 2018

Our reference: USG-201806-18
Your reference: SLB4350K

EQ Insurance Company Limited BY POST
5 Maxwsll Road #17-00

Tower Block MND Complex

Singapore 068110

Attn: Motor Claims Department

Dear Sir/f Madam,

Claimant SIREGAR WALTER TIMBUL
Address BLOCK 101C PUNGGOL FIELD #06-464 SINGAPORE 823101

We are instructed by the above named to claim damages against your insured/your insured's driver in
connection with a road accident on 08 JUNE 2018 along JALAN |SKANDAR CIQ TOWARDS MALAYSIA
involving our client's vehicle registration number SLES006H and vehicle registrations number SLB4350K

driven by you/your insured's driver al the material time

The accident was caused by your insured negligent driving and/or management of the vehicle. As a result of
the accident, our client's vehicle was damaged and our client has been put to loss and expense, particulars of
which are as follows: -

Cost of Repair $2, 193.50
Loss of Rental by B [5U $900.00
LTA Search Fee §7.45
Total - §3,100985

A copy of each of the following supporting documents are enclosed: -

g) Our client's Accident Report/Police Report b} COE/PARF Cerificates

c) Certificate Of Insurance d) Owner/ Driver's IC & Driving License
g) LTA Search Receipt & Result f) Satisfaction

g) Letter Of Authorisation n) Invoice

i) Rental Invoice



The demand herein is in respect of our client's claim for damages pertaining to their motor vehicle and any
settiement following or subsequent of this demand shall not prejudice our client's claim in respect of damages
and consequential loss in relation to personal injuries.

Please send to us an acknowledgement of receipt of this letter with 14 days of your receipt of this letter, failing
which our client will have no alternative but to commence proceedings against you without further notice to
you or your insurer. Our client's claim is quantified based on the supporting documents in our file  Until a
settiement is reached, all negotiations are conducted on the basis that the damages quantified herein are
subject to revision If so instructed by our client

United SG Automobile Pte Ltd
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Our Ref: CC4/EQI18011057/Apa3
05 August 2019

EAZI CAR LEASING & MARKETING PTE LTD
| Bukit Batok Crescent,

#0243 WCEGA Plaza,

Singapore 658064

Atin: The Management
Dear SirrfMadam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB 4350K AND SLE 5006H ON 08/06/2018

We refer 1o the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY
LIMITED to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

We have received a claim from SLE 5006H against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not
in your favour as it is head-to-rear collision. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an
amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

CF% SIAO TONG

Case Handler

DID: 6742 3197

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: chewht@/lkkauto.com

c.c.  EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED
(Moror Claims Dept)
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Dat

Altn: Mator Claims Dept

L0 hdunmonge Cvwpeny UM
Dear SirfMdm

ACCIDENT ON O Doe Joud

INVOLVING VEHICLE NODS: el 4 B uyilok

ALONG Z &t f":r i 4 4 die. r-"r"j' if{l’-rc“‘, ..'r-:-

I/We the registered owner/driver of vehicle regn. no. FLE Gecl tf which was involved
in the above accident with motor vehicle regn no, JiA w3 Jok insured by you.

/'We also hereby authorise that any payment due to me/us from the aforesald claim be
paid to M/s UNITED SG AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD.

IAWe hereby indemnify M/s United SG Automobile Pte Ltd against all claims and/fer
damages which may arise from all action taken forand on my/our behalf.

l'We hereby affirmed that above-mentioned statement to be true and correct

Yours faithfully

\J

|
Owner S mluré\
(Company’s stamp if applicable)

Name in Full - ./ i oty Hued
NRIC No - ¥ rr2aedn
Address D _lork 101C  Aupges P/

:‘,{' Wi SV g [ )

i f




United

53 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-56 Paya Ubi Industrial Park Singapore 408934
Tel : 6747-4454 | Fax : 6747-7752 | Email: claims@unitedsg.com.sg
UEN No : 201729521C | GST No : 201729521C

TAX INVOICE

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED Invoice number
5 MAXWELL ROAD #17-00 Date

TOWER BLOCK MND COMPLEX Vehicle numner
SINGAPORE 069110 Make Model
ATTN: MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT Accident date

Reference numbet

ul-1128
22-Apr-19
SLESD06H
BMW 3351
08-Jun-18
USG-201806-16

Description

Amount SGDS

Inclusive of supplying parts, labour, panel beating and spray

painting

Lump Sum Repair

G5T @ T&

2050.00

143.50

Total 2193.50

Singdollars: Two Thousand One Hundred Ninety Three and Cents Fifty

UNITED 5G AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD



INVOICE

§-24 AUTOD
21 MRCNG FORTROAD #03-2T/00
JURONG LOGITICS HUS SPORE 419118

Dot 20
Recelpl ® 100 00]

BT UBETLAE § a0 Y Hpes
SO 10T PUNGEDN, BE
#lib-ddd WNOAFIRE T 0
AEXAT
Vehicle Numbar Make Modal Rental Veniche Numbe:
SLESO04H AW 335 SLTBET 1B HYUND A ELANTRA
Ho Of Doy e # Durafion Unit Price Discount Tolal
é 14 JUNE 2018 - 20 JUNE 2018 § 15000 § 0000
D900 HES - 1800 =RS
Totol Decount $0.00
subior §%00 00

Tolal = ¥00.00

Tremi wons oF youlr Dusmeeis)



Land 1 rnspor AL

Land Transport Attty
10 Sin Ming Ditva

Singapors 575701
G57 Regmtraton No - M4-D00E526-2

Tan Involce/Receipt

Receipt No. © ITNET-00000-1804614-000589

Previocs Recapt No

S/N Item Description/
Business Transaction Referonce
No.

Result of Insurance Enguiry - SLB4350K

As at 08 Jun 2018/14:10:00

Insurance Co: EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

1 Insurance Enguiry - SLB4350K
Enquiry Fes
2018081411 1410102421
Sub-Total
Tatal Before Rounding
Rounding Difference
Total Amount Payable
Paw By
rocoeoroo 343

Total
Cash Change
Tendered Amount
Excess Relundable Amount

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Frint DateTime

Receipt CateTme

14 Jun 20187 111457
14 Jun 2018 ¢ 1114 50

Amount GST Amount
Bafore Amount After GST

GST (8%) (8$)
7.00 048
7.00 048
7.00 [ -]

Cregil Carg: Visa

MasierCarg

T 4R

748
Tag
00
745

TA45
Tag
0.00
745
ooo

Pleasa that all payments Lo the Authority are good and promplly settied by the payment service
wu%lm Mﬁl#ﬂ mocaipt is Mﬂﬂ“h

mary apply.
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Company Registration No. 180607 188R

S UKL AVE L #02.28 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL ¢ (065) 62563561 FAX : 1065) h2564313

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Date: 18/09/2018

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT
SLB 4350K (Insd Veh) |Your Ref. No. : DM18HO01489-JG
Vehicle No. _
SLE 5006H (TP Veh) |Our Ref. No.: CC4/EQI18011057/Apa3q2
Date of Accident 8/6/2018
Liability 100% - -
Final Repair Cost ' $ 2,193.50 -
Loss of Use ' $ days - -
Rental (If any) ' § 360.00 3 days - B
Others: '3 7.45 B
B ' 3
2,560.95
Final Settliement Sum :$ 2,560.00 |GLOBAL SUM

Remarks

ment Instruction: Pa

's Break

1 |UNITED SG AUTOMOBILE PTELTD

] 2,560.00

JOANNE LEE

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Libl Industrial Park, Singapore 408532
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No 199607198R GST Reg Mo. 18-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref CCA4/EQI18011057/Apa3q2
Yo o [IEAMHATIN
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Dale: 18-08-2019
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Code : EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SLB 4350K Veh. Inspected SLE 5006H
Policy No. DMCFHQ18-000035 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DM18HO01488-JG Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From JOEL Assign Date 14/06/2018
2, | Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model BMW, 335 c.c 24979
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. WBAPMT72000A381039 Colour WHITE
Odometer 132248 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Maodification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |265/40 R18 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |265/40 R18 MICHELIN 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |265/40 R18 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |265/40 R18 MICHELIN & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,
5. ' General Information
Accident Date 0B/D8/2018 Inspection Date 19/06/2018
Survey held at UNITED SG AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD
53 UBI AVENUE 1 #01-56
PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK SINGAPORE 408534
Sa. | Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. | Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 3 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL 258 3581 FAX' B256 4318

Reg. No: 188607188R GST Reg. No. 18-95071968-R Page No.1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLE 5006H
Qty Description of Parts Condition m'“;;g}l “‘“"-‘gl}“‘"
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
2|REAR BUMPER RETAINER NECESSARY 120.00 120.00
2|REAR BUMPER LOWER BRACKET NOT NECESSARY B5.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER INNER GUIDE NOT NECESSARY 540.00 -
1|ToOW COVER NOT NECESSARY 54.00 -
4|REAR PDC SENSDR DAMAGED (2 PCS B40.00 420.00
OMNLY)
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT NOT NECESSARY 540.00
LESS 5% DISCOUNT -108.00 -27.00
2.052.00 513.00
ISPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BUMPER (AFTER MARKET) (SN) DEFORMED 2.800.00 1.300.00
1|REAR EXHAUST ASSY (AFTER MARKET) (LOCAL BENT 3,500.00 200.00
REPAIR) (SN)
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIP (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 30,00
6,350.00 1,530.00
LABOUR
CHECK REAR WIRING AND LIGHTING SYSTEM 60.00 30,00
PAMNEL BEATING OM AFFECTED AREAS 500.00 250.00
SPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED AREAS 500.00 250.00
APPLY ANTI RUST ON AFFECTED AREAS. NOT NECESSARY 150.00
1,210.00 530.00
GRAND TOTAL 9,612.00 2,573.00
'RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REana T | 2,050.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION) ia i

Report Ref No. CC4/EQI1B011057/Apadq2

KR

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensad Appralser

DISCLAIMER OF LIARILITY T0 THIRD PARTIES:- This Repori ls made selely for the use snd banefil of ihe Client nemed on the froni page of this Repart.
h bty ol ieaoons il ¥ '




