» Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahongcom.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 14 November 2019 238 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Ce: Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJU 9955G (TP) & SUJ 1325L [AIG] ON 17/06/2018
Attachments: LOA.pdf: Rental Agreement.pdf: Tax Invoice pdf

Dear Khanchna

I refer to the matter above.

Please refer to the LOD as attached. We are claiming for the following:-

COR S 3,531.00
TP Search Fee §
LOR 5 481.50
Total S 4,012.50
Thank vou.
Thanks & Regards
Ashley Tan
HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9690 | M. 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9699
Follow us @ huahong.com.sg
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From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday. 6 November 2019 11:05 AM

To: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIU 9955G (TP) & SLJ 13251 [AIG] ON 17/06/2018

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm

Thank you lor your patience.

For COR, recommended amount at L/S $3,300.00{before G5T) with 3 repair days.

** Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation o act, rental
receipt) to us |LKK) for our necessary action.



Joz Irane !LI{]{Au‘tn!

From: loy Irene (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 26 June 2018 1:47 PM

To: Eileen Yap

Cc: Admin A Vivian Lau (LKKAuto), Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5L 1325L (LCR) & SJU 9955G ON 17/06/2018 (12:45)
ALONG MARSILING ROAD

26 June 2018

LCRF PTELTD
Policy Holder

Your Ref: SLJ 1325L
Our Ref: CC4/LCR18011046/]b3

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SUJ 1325L (LCR) & SJU 9955G ON 17/06/2018 (12:45) ALONG MARSILING

ROAD

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Aute Insurance policy taken up with them,

We have received a claim from SJU 9955G against your insurance policy.

Based on the information on hand, we are of the opinion that we cannot be absolved from liability.
We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please
contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email; joylrene@|kkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.lt may contain confidential and/or privileged
Information.if you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.



AUTHORISATI ACT
(AIG Express Third Party Claim)

I, Yﬂn: M Jiu} (the third party claimant) of __PK IS Waddiangls
Ctreet b 45, 4% SIw 48 (address), owner of SJMU ‘HF‘@ (vehicle no.)
hereby authorize 'H.“ﬁ ﬂ'ﬁ"g Pre H’d (“the workshop™) to act for me

with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle

no. _BWIISE G that was damaged pursuant 10 the accident which occurred on _ 1] log 21 #
(date) along Mnni'.ihd Dy g (location) involving vehicle no/s

Sl 1323 b (“the accident”),

I further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit
and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop.

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without

prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other

vehicle/s is concerned.
Datedthis |8 (day)of __Jund _ (month) 2018 (year)
r -;".1% : l,\":--p-'.
i B fra/
L
Signed by["if:: third party claimant” Signed by “the wurksﬁ,up“

(with chop if applicable) (with chop)




RELEASE VOUCHER
Al fic - Ex Third Claim

“We/l. HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED("the workshop”) hereby confirm that we/l have
reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LKK

AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed far
8583,531.00(Repair Cost), SS385.20(Loss of Hee/Rental), $3—(Disbursement) for vehicle no. SJU
99556 that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 17/06/2018 (date) along
MARSILING DRIVE(location) involving vehicle no/s SLJ 1325L. This is pursuant to the
inspection conducted on 27/06/2018 (date) at *“the workshop”.

We/l canfirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner YONG Y1 JING (the third party claimant™)
of vehicle no. SJU 9955G make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l have full
authority 1o settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/] deem fit. We/l enclose herein
the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant” afier the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the
damage to SJUT 9955G(vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis,

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this_|_ (day) of ___Des (month) 201 4. (year)

Signed by “the workshap™ (with chop)




e
/ HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

240 SUNGE EADUT STREET |, INGAPORE 729232
Tol: [45] 6441 9688 Fox: (45] 4641 7659 Emaikinfolinuahong.comsg

TAX INVOICE

13 November 2018 Wwo201911-0011
HHTPCLAIMS18-55

AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.

78 SHENTON WAY, #07-16

AIG BUILDING

SINGAPORE 078120

Attn: Motor Claims Department

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJU9955G & SLJ1325L ON 17/06/2018 ALONG MARSILING DRIVE AT
ABOUT 0020 HOURS

Insured 1 YONG Y1 JING
Vehicle Registration No. : SJUBSsEG
Vahicle Make : a.Mmw
Vahicle Model : 5201 AUTD ABS AIRBAG ZWD XENON HEADLAMP
Vehicle Chassle No. : WBANT12000CX30326
Policy No. : GADBB4BE2N
Date of Accidont : 17/08/2018 Type of Claim: Third Party
Lump sum repair for the damaged portion $ 3,300.00
7% GST § 231.00
$ 3,531.00
r ?
o) W
Authorised h}f Clairs Dept
Co. Reg. Mo, 20090030%m | huahong.com.ig | GS5T Reg. Mo. 20090030%M
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SiDRIVE

RENTAL

PTE LTD

250 SUNGE| KRADUT STREET 1, INGAPORE 729132
Fel [85] add| PABE Fou {45) s641 VEFY

VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT

Date: 27062018
Vehicle Rental Agreement made between iDrive Rental Private Limited

the terms and conditions as set forth.

V.R.A No.:

_201B0600SE

ited (THE OWNER) and The Hirer and/or The Driver, under

HIRER'S DETAILS
NAME OF HIRER YONG Yi JING NRIT No, SS9012025E Gender MALE
ARORES BLOCK 145 WOODLANDS STREET 13 3, 5730145
(AS STATED IN NRIC) 0 T #05-88 + 57301
CONTALCT
| EMAIL ADORESS NUMBER
DRIVING LICENCE No S9012035E | DATE OF BIATH 06.04.1990
PLALCE OF
DRIVING EXPRIENCE l 04 vears MATIOMALITY SINGAPOREAN SINGAPORE
VEHICLE DETAILS
MAKE [ MWODEL IAGUAR XF 2.0 VEMICLE REG Na. SKP B3ISZE
LEGEND: FETROL
F 2z
0 = DENT "'-"-:_.._:____
X =S5CRATCH ,::.
C=CHIP o =
R = RUST “::..‘;_--
E NS
| HIRER'S i
UT L3
o "1 sienatune i
= PETH HIRER'S | L7 |
DATE IN (|2l & TIME 1N HAS SGNATURE | i,]n&
7~
RENTAL DETAILS s
SECLRITY DEPOSIT A IH:I.I*M-HL‘E Plegin w“:-,:;:“:: Conditioni
RENTAL CHARGES 5 S o
DAY(S) | WEER(S) |
TOTAL Mty I.‘ G5 |55 5| 5T GRANDTOTAL | S U § ¢
REMARKT)
'\\\.. .Lh )
|
LY -
. s
AUTHORISED SiaTung HIREN'S NAME, NRIC & SIGN

Co Eeg. No. 20101 5485w | IDRIVESS



