Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Ary Chua <arychua@honda.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 4 December, 2018 1:29 PM

To: Joseph Tan; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A; assignments; Poh Kin
(LKKAuto)

Cc: Liew Thye Wui; Faeaz

Subject: RE: First Reminder TPDS: SFU7092G (TM) & SKM5080L (AXA) dOA:06/06/2018@
08.15AM

Hi Vic,

Second Reminder: How this case Liability Issue from AXA? Kindly Establish Liability Issue. Owner kept asking for car
Repair?

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ary Chua Wai Ngee

Bodyshop Service Advisor Kah Motor Co.Sdn.Bhd. Address:15 Ubi Road 4 Singapore 408610
E-mail: arychua@honda.com.sg Fax: 67480770 DID:68465673 H/P:81006306

From: Ary Chua

Sent: Monday, 8 October, 2018 4:44 PM

To: Joseph Tan <joseph.tjw@gmail.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Liew Thye Wui <twliew@honda.com.sg>; Faeaz <faesaz@honda.com.sg>

Subject: First Reminder TPDS: SFU7092G (TM) & SKM5080L (AXA) dOA:06/06/2018 @08.15AM

Hi Vic,
First Reminder: How this case Liability Issue from AXA? Kindly Establish Liability Issue. Owner kept asking for car
Repair?

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ary Chua Wai Ngee

Bodyshop Service Advisor Kah Motor Co.Sdn.Bhd. Address:15 Ubi Road 4 Singapore 408610
E-mail: arychua@honda.com.sq Fax: 67480770 DID:68465673 H/P:81006306

From: Ary Chua

Sent: Monday, 17 September, 2018 3:42 PM

To: Joseph Tan <joseph.tiw@gmail.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Liew Thye Wui <twliew@honda.com.sg>; Faeaz <faesaz@honda.com.sg>

Subject: RE: GIA REPORT: SFU7092G

Hi Vic,

How this case Liability Issue from AXA? Kindly Establish Liability Issue. Owner kept asking for car Repair?

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ary Chua Wai Ngee

Bodyshop Service Advisor Kah Motor Co.Sdn.Bhd.15 Ubi Road 4 Singapore 408610
E-mail: arychua@honda.com.sq  Fax: 67480770 DID:68465673 H/P:81006306

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 15 August, 2018 5:17 PM

To: Ary Chua <arychua@honda.com.sg>; Liew Thye Wui <twliew@honda.com.sg>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT OF VEHICLE NO. SFU7092G AGAINST SKM5080L ACCIDENT DATE: 06/06/18 ***
LKK REF: CC4/ASM18011038/Aha3

Without Prejudice

Dear All,




We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that our Insured had already reported the accident to our principal and we are currently in the
midst of engaging our Insured.

We will expedite and will get back to you for an update on liability.

Thank you.
Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd
Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

" Save the Larth- Print only whern necessary-

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ary Chua Wai Ngee

Bodyshop Service Advisor Kah Motor Co.Sdn.Bhd.15 Ubi Road 4 Singapore 408610
E-mail: arychua@honda.com.sq  Fax: 67480770 DID:68465673 H/P:81006306

From: Joseph Tan <joseph.tjw@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 17 September, 2018 2:42 PM
To: Ary Chua <arychua@honda.com.sg>
Subject: Re: GIA REPORT: SFU7092G

Dear Mr Ary Chua,

| have not received any updates regarding my car accident claim for SFU7092G. Can you kindly call me back to give
me an update?

It has been 3 months since the accident, and Tokio Marine & AXA has not given any reply till date?

Thank you.

Regards,

Joseph Tan
On Wed, Jun 6, 2018 at 6:21 PM, Ary Chua <arychua@honda.com.sg> wrote:

Hi Mr. Tan,

Send you the attachment GIA Report:

Note: All Video Footage File Only Can be View by All Insurance Company Singapore.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ary Chua Wai Ngee

Bodyshop Service Advisor Kah Motor Co.Sdn.Bhd.15 Ubi Road 4 Singapore 408610

E-mail: arychua@honda.com.sg Fax: 67480770 DID:68465673 H/P:81006306

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and
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exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately
notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you.



