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Surveyor:

Pre-assign / CCU/FTE

Insured Vehicle No.
Name of [nsured
Insured Tel No.

Excess Sec 11 :S$

Is driver the owner?

eV Waeg VB, geb e

fLzx:

ASSIGNMENT \& ) 0£ AQ
DOL Date / Time :
Registered in Merimen: .__g( ‘¢ ol \¥
gk}—( Q E 7/){ 5 Claim No.
L UV/Q ? h/ Policy No.
HP: Make / Model H\M‘* Verad
poa: 13-06-§ Place of Accident:  ROPN fm  Kdl

( YES / @)

Nature of Accident :

1If NO, Driver Name / Age : ‘\{’:) &_Q L\tf 00 Ol GlA REPORT: YES /NO :; TP GIA REPORT: YES/NO
Driver Tel No. : a3y 944 4J (V/L:YES/NO) Insured Liability : % Final ? Yes/No
Gum BER8Y — N
INSRS: = INSRS: = INSRS: INSRS:
WSP: WSP: WSP: WSP:
Te: L Tel [ Tel Tel
Liability : Liability : Liability : Liability :
RMKS: RMKS: RMKS: RMKS:
Date/ Time
VY CLW Uy (v . (s K STAGE  DATE/PIC
\ o o ) Non-Reporting ltr (1st):
77%777 B "R ] _ Non-Repon%ng Itr af'd)_-u__m__._
I c = m Y i D E 6 i f { 6‘ \ _;* . E ' . Non-Reporting ltr (Final): B
______ Notification Itr (if non-pickup):
T TP MJEE PowpnN BAJED O«uﬁtﬂ- . |canor
- - N T - After call Itr to OI: T
) - o Documentation Check List: Handler  Typist
N - Notification Itr (if non-pickup) 1 J
. Y g o - After call lr to Ol
Q 6/ C{/,C{ < ‘ I _s_w t Aﬂ C‘e L —F \ LE Authorisation To Act: [ |
M o~ Release Voucher:
vy o wo Sutk N T Dow - Final Repair Bill; =
Vl/ » _ ! . Car Rental Invoice: f J
e Towing Invoice L___l i__l
B - LTA/GIA - T
Medical Bill: C ] ]
PIR: T o
Mandate/Reject Instruction: | | —__ .
- LOD L]
Payment Breakdown Form: N
PRELIMINARY ADVICE Date/Time: Sent By: . Post-Repair Photos: L1 [
Others: { J l ]
FINALIZATION Date/T: ime_:) Confirm with: Confirm by:
Repair Cost: S$ { days) Reduction: B % Email [___Jcall ]
FINAL SETTLEMENT Date/Time: Confirm with Email |_] Cal]]_f
Final Liability: l9 (Agreed / Assessed) BOLA S/N No. TfNO or B 28, Ass. Lia : L o
|Repair Cost: ‘8§ ‘
Loss of Rental (LOR): |S$ - ( da);;i
Loss of Use (LOU}: Is$ $ X days) -
Loss of Income (LOI); A‘jSS {8 X days) -
LORonly ] LOUenly [_JLOR+LOUL__] LOR +LOI[__] [Tick only one] -
GIA/LTA Search 'ss
Medical: S$ N i1) Claim status: Normal/Reject/Private Settle
Disbursement; S$ (¢.g. Tow/ Independent ) %2) Report Format: :
Legal Cost S$ i3) Survey fee:
Total: S$ Global Sum S§:
FINAL PAYMENT Dat/Time: Cenfirm with: Fuaitl ] cal___J
Pavee 1: Iss o ;I\Eu’_._-c_l_ . o o
Payee 2: (Strike if N.A)) S$ _|Name 2: |
Payee 3: (Strike if N.A.) -S$ Name 3




’ V V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

S == 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

adl B
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affilisted to Federation Intarnationale Des Experts En Automobile

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref : CC3/LCR18010989/ja3

e RNl oue: owane [N
CHARTIS BUILDINGSINGAPORE 079120
Code: LCR
1. R "~ Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SLF 9627J Veh. Inspected SLM 5868U
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 18/06/2018
2, a Vehicle Particulars & Condition ’
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. - . ot Conditions of Tyres ;
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. o ' ~ Description of Damages
5. i . -+ " General Information * "
Accident Date  13/06/2018 |Inspection Date

Survey held at PERFORMANCE MOTORS LTD
303 ALEXANDRA ROAD

SINGAPORE 159941
Sa. Lo - Remarks

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




/

Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 19 July 2019 4:06 PM

To: Boyogan, Joane

Subject: RE: #3424461642SG003#027#Accident involving SLF9627) and SLM5868U on 13
June 2018

Dear Joane,
No survey vehicle for this case, we will proceed to cancel.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 21 June, 2019 2:52 PM

To: Boyogan, Joane; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: #34244616425G003#027#Accident involving SLF9627) and SLM5868U on 13 June 2018

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Joane
Thank you for the email.
Dear Joy,

Kindly assist

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafier, by the negotiation terms/settlement.



Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com] fax: 6741-4108
BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Boyogan, Joane [mailto:loane.Boyogan@aig.com]
Sent: Friday, 21 June, 2019 2:46 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: #34244616425G003#027#Accident involving SLF9627) and SLM5868U on 13 June 2018

Dear Hsiao Tong and Vivian,

With reference to above matter

Please note that we have since received a subrogation claim from insurer of SLM5868U

Kindly proceed to submit your bill in merimen (if any work was done) and proceed to close the matter

Thank you

Regards,

Joane Boyogan

AlG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific tnsurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way AIG Building #08-16 Singapore 079120

Tel +65 64191898
joane.boyogan@aig.com | www.aig.sg

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visit to learn more.

AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards.
Click here to find out more

Follow us:

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this emaif (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply” command and permanently defete the original and
any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might afqut any
computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by AIG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.
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IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply” command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.



