Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 19 July 2019 4:06 PM

To: Boyogan, Joane

Subject: RE: #3424461642SG003#027#Accident involving SLF9627) and SLM5868U on 13
June 2018

Dear Joane,

No survey vehicle for this case, we will proceed to cancel.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 21 June, 2019 2:52 PM

To: Boyogan, Joane; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: #34244616425G003#027#Accident involving SLF9627J) and SLM5868U on 13 June 2018

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Joane
Thank you for the email.
Dear Joy,

Kindly assist

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafier, by the negotiation terms/settlement.



Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Boyogan, Joane [mailto:Joane.Boyogan@aig.com]

Sent: Friday, 21 June, 2019 2:46 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>
Subject: #3424461642SG003#027#Accident involving SLF9627J) and SLM5868U on 13 June 2018

Dear Hsiao Tong and Vivian,

With reference to above matter

Please note that we have since received a subrogation claim from insurer of SLM5868U

Kindly proceed to submit your bill in merimen (if any work was done) and proceed to close the matter

Thank you

Regards,

Joane Boyogan

AIG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way AIG Building #08-16 Singapore 079120

Tel +65 64191898
joane.boyogan®@aig.com | www.aig.sg

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visit to learn more.

AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards.
Click here to find out more

Follow us:

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and
any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any
computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by AIG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.
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