
 
 
 
 
 





 
 
 
CLAIM NO : 18/18/18/VP05/020663 
DATE  : 14 JULY 2020 
     

   DISCHARGE VOUCHER  
 
 
I/We, ABDUL RASHID BIN JANTAN confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC 
INSURANCE BHD and/or owner of SKL 737P the sum of Singapore Dollar Four 
Thousand and Twenty Only ($4,020.00) in full and final satisfaction, liquidation and 
discharge of all property losses competent to me/us upon the said M/s LONPAC 
INSURANCE BHD  in respect of all property losses sustained by me/us whether 
now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from an 
accident involving SKU 7487S and SKL 737P on 08 June 2018  along 
WOODLANDS CAUSEWAY TOWARDS SINGAPORE. 
 
I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE 
BHD AND/OR ANG CHEE CHIANG) against all claims and any claims 
whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident. 
 
I/We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to 
SINCERELEAD GARAGE PTE LTD.                                                                                                                                                                    
 
I/We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of 
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our 

 
 
 
 
 

     
Signature of vehicle owner/Date 
 
 
 

 
Name of vehicle owner /Date 
 
 
 
` 

Abdul Rashid Bin Jantan

15/7/2020



FAX: 6287 7949

TEL: 6734 1869 | 6734 1387

Less: Deposit

UEN No.

Total

SINCERELEAD GARAGE PTE LTDDATE

Invoice

Attn: Phone:

SINCERELEAD GARAGE PTE LTD
2 BUROH CRESCENT
#02-09 ACE@BUROH
SINGAPORE 627546

Invoice No : SLG00716

Date : 15/7/2020

Page : 1

Bill To:
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
300 BEACH ROAD #17-04/07
THE CONCOURSE
SINGAPORE  199555

SKU7487S
HONDA / VEZEL

Amount (S$)

P.O. Number Date In Terms

Balance Due

201706891H

E. & O. E

COMPANY STAMPRECEIVED BY

Fax:

SalesPerson

Vehicle No/Model:

Date Out

Description

Memo:

SKU7487S C.O.D.

S$4,020.001. COST OF REPAIR + LOSS OF RENTAL (GLOBAL SUM)

S$4,020.00

S$0.00

S$4,020.00
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Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)
Sent: Wednesday, 15 July 2020 4:02 PM
To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'
Cc: MT_Claim_SG
Subject: RE: Your ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020663 | ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKU7487S 

& SKL737P ON 8/6/2018 [External General]

Dear Gerald, 
 
Please be informed that we have settled at a global sum of $4,020.00 with third party.  
 
Thank you. 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256 3561 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 2 July 2020 8:41 AM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG 
Subject: RE: Your ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020663 | ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKU7487S & 
SKL737P ON 8/6/2018 [External General] 
 
Dear Jia Le, 
 
Kindly proceed as proposed. 
 
 
Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 1 July 2020 10:46 am 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
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Subject: RE: Your ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020663 | ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKU7487S & 
SKL737P ON 8/6/2018 [External General] 
 
Lonpac Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020663 
LKK Ref: CC4/LPC18010987/T1db3q2 
  
Dear Sirs/Madam, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
We have highlighted to your good office on 03/07/2018 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with 
our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 
  
The said chain collision involved 3 vehicles whereby our insured was the 2nd vehicle. In accordance to the 
MCF guideline for chain collision, we have to settle the front vehicle's claim at 100%. 
  
Summary to offer to third party repairer, “SINCERELEAD GARAGE PTE LTD” is as follows: - 
  
  Claimed Amount Revised Amount   
1. Cost of Repair  $ 16,766.00 $ 3,300.00   
2. Loss of Rental (6days x $180) $   1,080.00 $    720.00 (6days x $120)   
3. Loss of Use (2days x $180) $      360.00 $        -   
4. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $         7.49 $       7.49   

Total $ 18,213.49 $ 4,027.49   
       
       
  
**05days recommendation for repair + 1sunday = 6days. 
  
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference. 
  
The above is for your approval. 
 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256 3561 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, 30 June 2020 1:31 PM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; 'sincerelead@hotmail.com' 
Subject: FW: Your ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020663 | ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKU7487S & 
SKL737P ON 8/6/2018 [External General] 
 
Dear Jia Le, 
 
Kindly revert to them on liability. 
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Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 

From: Sincere Lead Automotive [mailto:sincerelead@hotmail.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, 30 June 2020 1:22 pm 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: Your ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020663 | ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKU7487S & 
SKL737P ON 8/6/2018 [External General] 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Please let us have your offer soonest.  
 
 
 
Thank you. 
 
With regards, 
Xiao Foong 
2 Buroh Crescent  
#02-09 Ace@Buroh 
Singapore 627546 
HP: 8510 9999 
 
 
 
From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 16 June 2020 2:40 PM 
To: 'sincerelead@hotmail.com' <sincerelead@hotmail.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: FW: Your ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020663 | ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKU7487S & 
SKL737P ON 8/6/2018 [External General] 
 
Lonpac External - General 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Xiao Foong, 
 
We are currently working from home and we shall respond once we are back in office. 
 
 
Best Regards 
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Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 

From: Sincere Lead Automotive [mailto:sincerelead@hotmail.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, 16 June 2020 2:31 pm 
To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: Your ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020663 | ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKU7487S & 
SKL737P ON 8/6/2018 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
Please find attached for your kind attention. 
 
Please acknowledge receipt of this email.  
 
 
 
Thank you. 
 
With regards, 
Xiao Foong 
2 Buroh Crescent  
#02-09 Ace@Buroh 
Singapore 627546 
HP: 8510 9999 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 
 
Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use. 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 
 
Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use. 
 












