Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eginsurance.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 10 July, 2018 11:00 AM

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: 'LKK Assignments'

Subject: RE: PRS FOR GV2178J (OUR REF: GW1784K)

Dear Catherine
Our reference: DM18HO01506-JG
Best Regards,

Joel Goh
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Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the .

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, July 9, 2018 10:32 AM

To: Joel Goh

Cc: 'LKK Assignments'

Subject: RE: PRS FOR GV2178] (OUR REF: GW1784K)

Dear Joel,
Kindly provide us the claim number.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, 18 June, 2018 4:28 PM

To: 'Joel Goh' <joel.goh@eqginsurance.com.sg>

Cc: 'LKK Assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: PRS FOR GV2178) (OUR REF: GW1784K)

Dear Joel,



