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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
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From: Lucas Lee <lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping com=

Sent: Friday, 22 June, 2018 4:42 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKU3787C (OI : CTI - SNM18D03022C02)
and SH81268B (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI18010946/K1ha3) on 13/06/2018

Attachments: leeSZ_SMNM18D03022C01-5KU3TEC-

LKKDirectSettlementAccidentMotReportedLtr_clcr96.786.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Due By: Thursday, 28 June, 2018 4:00 PM
Flag Status: Completed

Categories: HMEK

Dear Sirs,

Kindly refer to the above attachment.

Case Handler: Irene Tay

Lucas Lee

Claims Department {Motor)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapaore 0793908
Direct (65) 6389 6181

Fax (B65) 6222 7175/6224 7478

Email: lucas leei@sg.cntaiping.com

Website: www.sg.cniaiping.com

AN RSARY
In Semgapore sinee 1938

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pre. Lud. except
where provided for in a written agreement between vou and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Ltd, Any unauthorized
disclosure. use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message,
please natify the sender immediately,

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 22 June, 2018 9:26 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Irene Tay; Lucas Lee; Vic (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKU3787C (O : CTI - TBA) and 5H8126B (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI18010946/K1ha3) on 13/06/2018



WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case.

We had inspected TP vehicle SH 8126B at M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd (Loyang).
Enclosed for your perusal is:

TP GIA report

TP estimated cost of repair

Preliminary advice

* Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thanl you,

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com
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CHINA TAIPING CHIMA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTI.'.L

3 Arscs Rosd 918-00 Spragleal Tower Sngapors 0THE0S
Tei, G360 8111 Fax 5222 1003

Wishsnie, v g ClREe G0

Ca. Flag ko 2002083848

Our Reference: SNM18D03022/C01/7

Date : 22 JUNE 2018 via Ordinary & Registered Mail

TK LIMO AND RENTAL SERVICES
BLK 212B PUNGGOL WALK
#08-715 PUNGGOL WAVES
SINGAPORE 822212

Dear Sir/ Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKU3787C AND SH8126B ON 13 JUNE 2018
ALONG AYE TOWARDS KEPPEL AFTER ALEXANDRA EXIT

We refer to the abovementioned accident.

Please be advised that the third party vehicle, SH8126B , is filing a third party property claim
against your vehicle.

We have appointed LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd, te administer the said claim on our behalf and
they will soon contact you for more information about the accident.  Kindly render your assistance
and co-operation accordingly.

We understand that you or your driver has not filed an accident report within 24 hours as per Motor Claims
Framework. We would urge you to comply with the condition to file your accident report with your vehicle
(whether damaged or not) to us IMMEDIATELY through LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd or any of our

authorized workshops. You may log onto our website www.sg.cntaiping.com for location of the respective

workshops.

We regret to advice that we and/or LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd will not be handling the third party claim
and your MO CLAIM DISCOUNT will be penalized upon renewal of your policy if you fail to comply
with the condition of reporting.

Yours truly,
Claims Department

(This is a computer generated letter and no signature is required. )

CC : LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Attn WIC

Ref 3 CC3/CTIMB010946/K1HAZ
Contact No : 68412006

via Email ©  VICELKKAUTO.COM

CC - Agent - (ANOSS0A) - TECK WEI CREDIT PTE LTD

FO2/LKKDSANR-2013



Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

—_—ﬂ

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Attachments:

Categories:

Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Monday, 25 June, 2018 5:34 PM

Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Irene Tay; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Alfred Toh; Hwang Shiang Yi; Chee So Chow,
KKLau; Olivia Lau (LKKAUtO)

RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKU3787C (OL SNM18D03022C02/7) and
SHE1268 (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI18010946/K1ha3) on 13/06/2018

Your Ref: TBA Our Ref: IRCNT18-060276 CHAIN ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKU3787C
ALONG AYE TOWARDS THE DIRECTIONM OF CITY ON 13 JUNE 2018,
MJAS18079688-SKU3787C pdf

HME

LKK REF - CC3/CTI18010946/K1ha3
CTI REF - SNM18D03022C02/7 (SKU3787C)

Der Mei Kwan/Vic

We refer to the above matter.

Attach herewith Insured’s SAS report and media report for your attention and further action.

Irene, please keep track on the matter.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh
Senlor Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: +65 6389 6183
FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred,toh .cntaiping.com

www.sq.cntaiping.com

ANNIYVFRSARY
In Siagapore since 1938

Disclaimer !

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment kv China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid. except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or .]':':’rrh':'ril. iz prohibited. .!f you are naot the intended recipient of He message,

please notify the sender immediarely.



Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

—_— == e e ——S—
From: Candy Cai <candycai@jpknights.com>
Sent: Monday, 18 June, 2018 5:44 PM
To: Alfred Teh
Cc: Claims Dept of CTL; investigations
Subject: Your Ref: TBA Our Ref: IRCNT18-060276 CHAIN ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKU3T87C

ALONG AYE TOWARDS THE DIRECTION OF CITY ON 13 JUNE 2018

Dear Alfred,

We refer to your tele-communication with our Mr Bokhari on the following accident link involving your insured
vehicle, SKU3787C:

https://www facebook.com/BehChialor/videos/2087591488163601/
We hereby acknowledge the receipt of new assignment.

Your Ref: TBA
Our Ref: IRCNT18-060276

Our Mr Nuur (nuur@ijpknights.com) will be handling this matter and our advice will follow shortly.

We seek your kind assistance towards forwarding the Insured Driver’s as well as Third Parties’ SAS reports, if any.
Otherwise, kindly provide us with the Insured’s details and contact number.

Thank you for this assignment,

Regards,

Candy Cai — Adjusters & Surveyors

IP KNIGHTS PTELTD | 33 UBI AVE 3 #05-47 VERTEX TOWER A SINGAPORE 408868 |CO REG: 2007237637
Tel: (65) 6345 0068 | Fax: (65) 6344 5328| HP: (65) 9297 7324

www.|pknights.com; www.aspectus.s
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Confidential: This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential infarmation which may be privileged. It is intended salely for the
ielentified recipient|s) to whom it is addressed. if you are not an intended recipient, please reply 1o us immediately and delete this message
from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com
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ENGINEERING

A rnemibar of COMPORIDELGRO

‘eam: ARC Repair TP(CLSO)1

Date/Time:

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd

205 Braddsll Mosd Sngapors STITI

Mainng + B5 4383 G280 FacsimiEm « 65 G280 0755
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Page : 1

JC No305175152

STOMER | REGN NS 81268 MILEAGE
!
'COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD , FLEL
:II'IIEMEH ?01Dﬂ45 MAKEW E U - I—
ee 383 SIN MING DRIVE ey S
Singapore SINGAPORE 575717 ' SONATA 13.06.2018 15:35
65508755
. (A (e ¥R OF R TARGET DATE
P 40’ 06.2011
CHAS COMPLETION DATETIME:
T YoEET41 vMBAS1 3043
JOB DESCRIPTION
\ccident Date: 13.06.2018
{ATURE: 3P 13.06.18/B
3/NO LABOER CODE DESCRIPTION
ZCKED & PASSED OUT BY:
SERVIGE ADVISOR CUSTOMER'S SIGNATURE
wiledgement Shp Exit Pass
:;.: Vehicle No.:
eNo. SH 8126B FZ CHINA LKK SH 8126B

of Service Advisor

raturned to Service Aeception upon collection

ﬁnaturﬁ-"ﬂate

Narme of Service Adisar

To be kept by Security Guard

Data




' COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD 7[ -
REPAIRESTIMATE* / (/IN/N | ] 'K -
CHINA *"—%““/.\ ~

VEHICLENO : SH8126B (/7 | \ DATE 13/6/2018 15:52 =
' s
MAKE A LAE 4 rf (7 f}; '
MODEL : HYUNDALI SONATA - “ /
| Oty Parts Description/ Labour Type | Unit Price Amount |
T BoolLid  >¢ AP/ S 1.34050
Boot Lid Sonata Plate ~~ $ 43.60
Boot Lid Hyundai Plate - 5 24.20
Boot Lid 'H' Emblem #— 5 26.10
Boot Lid CRDI Plate b 22.70
Boot Lid Lamp (RH) <~ § 23020
Rear Bumper -~ B 378.40
Rear Bumper Reinforcement q e 483,30
Rear Bumper Clip ~~ S 22.00
Rear Bumper Sponge  © § 13740
Rear Bumper Under Cover $ 185.80
Rear Bumper Protector (RH) =i b 38.00
Tail Lamp (RH) = S 34400
Rear Fender (RH) i £  1.935.90
Rear Fender Inner Lining (RH) > 8 74.10
Rear Windscreen Moulding = 5 60,00
SUB TOTAL § 5.555.20
LESS 20% % 1.111.04
DISCOUNTED TOTAL 5 4.444.16
Boot Lid Comfort Logo & Tel No. Sticker 18 3000 [Net
Boot Lid Advertisement Logo - ) b 10000 [Netr
Rear Bumper Reverse Sensor  ~— g ‘ 135.70 |Nett
Rear Bumper Advertisement Logo ~— {Tod $ 50.00 |Nett
Rear Bumper Rubber Mat -~ | 5 5000 [Nett
Rear Fender Advertisement Logo (LH/EH) - : 5 100,00 | S 200,00 |Nett
Rear Windscreen Sealant _ g | 46.00 | Net
| S 611.70
Labour Charge / (-f M / -1 foo
Panel Be;latullg % / % ;(/a.é - W fo
Spray Painting Charge : % 7560
Wiring Charge 95 é $ S0t 20
Tuff Kote M 5 5}1,96"1-&
Remove/Refix Cushion & Upholstery Rear 4‘# d S 15087 5a
Remove/Refix Rear Windscreen Glass ' S 12040 Yoo
Remove/Refix Reverse Sensor % 1,"’,@’0‘0" Tls
TOTAL LABOUR S 2,090.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL $  7,145.86
This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quantum will
be prepared afier the vehicle is surveved by a motor Surveyor appointed by the insurance company.

Fage Tor 1



: com OMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING 1‘7}: LTD

REF-\IR ESTIMATE* ( H /\/ A
VEHICLE NO : SH 8126B

DATE 13/6/2018 15:52 .
Fauzy
MAKE - @. / £ / { W
MODEL : HYUNDAI SONATA
Oty Parts Description/ Labour Type Unit Price _[ Amount |
BootLid ¢ M/r Ts 1349504
Boot Lid Sonata Platc il $ 43.60
Boot Lid Hyundai Plate - ’: 4 24.20
Boot Lid 'H' Emblem ~_ * b 26.10
Boot Lid CRDI Plate $ 22.70
oot Lid Lamp (RE) < <7 s 23020
Rear Bumper  ~— ﬂi b 378.40
Rear Bumper Reinforcement X’ ! 483 30%
Rear Bumper Clip ::' 5 22.00
Rear Bumper Sponge = 5 137.40°%
Rear Bumper Under Cover $ 185.80%
Rear Bumper Protector (RH } i g 3800
Tail Lamp (RH) 7 § 34400
Rear Fender (RH) aiil ﬂ"’ 5 1,93590
Rear Fender Inner Lining (RH) Yf“ % 74104
Rear Windscreen Moulding = 5 60,00
SUB TOTAL S 5,555.20
LESS 20% S 1,111.04
DISCOUNTED TOTAL S 444416
s
Boot Lid Comfort Logo & Tel Nn Sticixer b 30,00 [Nett
Boot Lid Advertisement Logo I JE‘ 5 l 100,00 |Nett
Rear Bumper Reverse Sensor ~— $ | 135.70 |Nett
Rear Bumper Advertisement Logo ~— - 5 50,00 |Nett
Rear Bumper Rubber Mat =~ #% $ 50.00 |Nett
Rear Fender Advertisement Logo (LH/RH) Z7 b 100.00 | § | 200.00 |Nett
Rear Windscreen Sealant e $ 46.00 |Nett
St s | 61170
Labour Charge /Cf M/Jy ‘ﬂ
Panel Be:.itu?g ‘ / / % ik S w fon
Spray Painting Charge ' b ;{}G‘Uﬁ‘
Wiring Charge QC g 5 S0BT 2o
Tuff Kote M $ 50.067 ™
Remove/Refix Cushion & Upholstery Rear 4’“_ ﬂ 5 1 50045 B
Remove/Refix Rear Windscreen Glass F § 12040 foo
RemoveRefix Reverse Sensor $ 1}9‘50’ Is
TOTAL LABOUR 5 2,090.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL % '? 145, Bﬁ
T'his is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection af the above vehicle. The fimal repair quantum will
be prepared after the vehicle is surveyved by a motor Surveyor appointed by the insurance company.

Fage 1ol 1
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Our Job Ref Mo ; 305175152
Diale s Ol 21.06.2018
FRALIZATION FORM
T 4B LKK
Aln ; KALVIN
Vehicle Reg No. 5H 81268

COMFORIDELCRO
ENGINEERING

GomfartDelGra Engineering Pte Lid
58 Loyang Dinve Singapore SUB9ED

Fax 8546 8156
Fax:
Date of Accident 13.06.2018

The survey and estimates of the repairs of the above-mentioned vehicle are as foliows:-

1. The repair job shall bill to:

CHINA

- SKU3T&TC

Z.  Thefinalized amount shall be:
{a)  Spare Parts afler List discount
(b}  Labour Charges

Tatal far Part-By-Part Repair Cost

(6.}  Lumpsum Repair (if applicable)

Total for Lumpsum repair cost after Less:

Final Lumpsum Repair cost

3 Esliratad normal period for repairs:

4, Wae shall treat the above amount as C

T waorking days

5. Thank you for your assistance.

50.00

$0.00

50.00

20% 53,750.00

4

Signatura : /
Mame : FAUZY BIN MDKPJ{I'AR
Ted o B2148318

Fax : 65468158

$3,750.00

working days,

t and Confirmed if there is no reply from you within

We confirm the estimates and
finalized amount

Signature :

Mame }tﬂj‘:l"

Date ; 3'/6?!71’

For Official Use Only

Documeant

Item Amount Attached :T-Snn!'r::':f:} Remarks
Yes or No "
1. Rental Rate PiDay YES
2. Loss of Income Paid M
3. Survey Feas
4. LTA Search Fee 7.49
5. Medical Fees {on behalf
of driver, if applicabls)
6 Owerrun

Remarks:




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 ki Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Fark, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607 188R GST Reg. Mo 159607 108-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (8) PTE LTD Ref CCa/CTI18010846/K1ha3n2
R INOLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079908 RRiR: HaR=riE N”"II““M"M““
Code: CTI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SKU 3787C Veh. Inspected SH 81268
Policy No. DMHCSMN1657921701 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM18D03022C02/7 Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 14/06/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI SONATA c.c 1991
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2011
Chassis No. KMHET41VMBAB13043 Colour BLUE
Odometer 347039 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Maodification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 WEST LAKE 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R18 WEST LAKE 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60R18 WEST LAKE 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R18 WEST LAKE 7 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR OQ/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  13/D6/2018 Inspection Date 14/068/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508969
Sa. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

lESTIMP-.TED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




1 Pl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SH 81268

AdE B .' & 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-9607198-R

Page Mo..1of2

Qty Description of Parts Condition "‘E:rt;r::;?;n au hglusted
REP ENT OF PART
1{BOOT LID TO REPAIR SEE 1,349.50 .
LABOUR
1|BOOT LID SONATA PLATE NECESSARY 43.60 43.60
1|BOOT LID HYUNDAI PLATE NECESSARY 24.20 24.20
1|BOOT LID 'H' EMBLEM NECESSARY 26.10 26.10
1|BOOT LID CRID PLATE NECESSARY 22.70 22,70
1|BOOT LID LAMP (RH) CRACKED 230.20 230.20
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 578.40 578.40
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT SERVICEABLE 483.30 -
10|REAR BUMPER CLIP NECESSARY 22.00 22.00
1|REAR BUMPER SPONGE SERVICEABLE 137.40 :
1|REAR BUMPER UNDER COVER SERVICEABLE 185.80 :
1|REAR BUMPER PROTECTOR (RH) CRACKED 38.00 38.00
1| TAIL LAMP (RH) CRACKED 344.00 344.00
1|REAR FENDER (RH) DENTED 1,935.90 1,935.90
1|REAR FENDER INNER LINING (RH) SERVICEABLE 74.10 :
1|REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING NECESSARY 60.00 60.00
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -1,111.04 -865.02
4,444.16 2,660.08
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|BOOT LID COMFORT LOGO & TEL NO.STICKER (SN) NECESSARY 30,00 30.00
1|BOOT LID ADVERTISEMENT LOGO (SN) NECESSARY 100.00 100.00
1|REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR (SN) SHORTED 135.70 135.70
1|REAR BUMPER ADVERTISEMENT LOGO (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|REAR BUMPER RUBBER MAT (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
2|REAR FENDER ADVERTISEMENT LOGO (LH/RH) NECESSARY 200.00 200.00
@$100.00 (SN)
1|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 46.00 46.00
611.70 §11.70

Report Ref No. CC3/CTI18010946/K1hadn2
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TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No. 2 of 2
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
ri ris
Qty Description of Pa Condition Workshop ($)) ($)
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF BOOT 850.00 00.00
LID
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE 750.00 600.00
WIRING CHARGE. 50.00 20.00
TUFF KOTE. 50.00 20.00
REMOVE/REFIX CUSHION & UPHOLSTERY REAR. 150.00 50.00
REMOVE/REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS 120.00 100.00
REMOVE /REFIX REVERSE SENSOR. 120.00 30.00
2,090.00 1,420.00
GRAND TOTAL 7,145.86 4,691.78
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,750.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CC3/CTI18010946/K1ha3n2
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KALVIN ANG WEI KUN HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor | Investigator Automotive Assessor




