Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 16 August, 2018 1:28 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Irene Tay; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKU3787C (OI: SNM18D03022C02/7) and
SH8126B (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI18010946/K1ha3) on 13/06/2018

Attachments: SH8126B doa 13.6.18. mov

Dear Alfred,

Please find attached copy of TP video footage for your reference.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

" Save the Larth Print only whernr necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Claims Dept of CTI [mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Thursday, 5 July, 2018 12:25 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Irene Tay

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKU3787C (Ol: SNM18D03022C02/7) and SH8126B (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CT118010946/K1ha3) on 13/06/2018

LKK REF - CC3/CTI118010946/K1ha3
CTI REF — SNM18D03022C02/7 (SKU3787C)

Der Vic
We refer to the above matter.
Attach herewith the Rental agreement, driving licence and Vocational licence of driver/hirer for your attention.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.



3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: +65 6389 6183

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sgqg.cntaiping.com
www.sqg.chtaiping.com
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Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message,
please notify the sender immediately.

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, July 05, 2018 12:08 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin A
<admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Hwang Shiang Yi
<shiangyi.hwang@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>; KKLau
<kklau@lkkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>; Angie Foo <angie.foo@sg.cntaiping.com>; Vic
(LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKU3787C (Ol: SNM18D03022C02/7) and SH8126B (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CT118010946/K1ha3) on 13/06/2018

Dear Alfred,
We refer to our telephone conversation earlier and to your below email and the contents were noted.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.



From: Claims Dept of CTI [mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Thursday, 5 July, 2018 11:46 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Irene Tay; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Hwang Shiang Yi; Chee So Chow; KKLau; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); Angie Foo
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKU3787C (Ol: SNM18D03022C02/7) and SH8126B (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CT118010946/K1ha3) on 13/06/2018

LKK REF - CC3/CT118010946/K1ha3
CTI REF — SNM18D03022C02/7 (SKU3787C)

Der Mei Kwan/Vic
We refer to the above matter.
Attach herewith copy of email from Insured for your attention and necessary action.

p/s The Insurance Contract is between Insurer and Insurer, M/s TK Limo And Rental Services & Section Il Excess
applicable is $1,500.00.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

TEL: +65 6389 6116

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
www.sqg.chtaiping.com
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Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message,
please notify the sender immediately.



