Vic (LKKAuto)

e e e ee— ———

From: Vic (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Wednesday, 12 September, 2018 9:49 AM

To: Claims Dept of CT1; Admin A

Ce: Irene Tay; Alfred Toh; Angie Foo; Chee So Chow; Hsiao Tong [(LKKAuto); Vic
(LEKAuUto)

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving 5KU3787C (OL
SNM18D03022C02/7) and SHB126B (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI18010946/K1ha3) on
13/06/2018

Dear Alfred,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that we had settled the matter with TP at a global sum of 54,980.00 (all in).
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(g08033)

IKK -

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipieni. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient |s prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached llems. Please delele the e-mall and all attachments, including any copies thereafl, and inform the
sender (hat you have deleted the e-mall_ all attachments and any copies thereofl. Thank you.

From: Claims Dept of CTI [mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Friday, 7 September, 2018 11:58 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Irene Tay; Alfred Toh; Angie Foo; Chee So Chow; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKU3787C (O1: SNM18D03022€02/7) and
S5HE1268 (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CT118010946/K1ha3) on 13/06/2018

LKK REF - CC3/CT118010946/K1ha3
CTI REF - SNM18D03022C02/7 (SKU3787C)

Dear Vic
We refer to your email of 6 September 2018 pertaining to the above matter.
Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at 54,983.62.

We await your payment advice to enable Irene to act accordingly.



Vic (LKKAuto) =

From: Claims Dept of CT1 <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Friday, 7 September, 2018 11:58 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto) Admin A

Cc: Irene Tay; Alfred Toh; Angie Foo, Chee So Chow; Hsiao Tong (LKkAuto)

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKU3787C (OL
SNM18D03022C02/7) and SH81268 (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CT118010946/K1ha3) on
13/06/2018

Attachments: TP LOD.pdf; LETTER TO OLpdf

LKK REF - CC3/CTI18010946/K1ha3
CTI REF - SNM18D03022C02/7 (SKU3787C)

Dear Vic

We refer to your email of & September 2018 pertaining to the above matter.
Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at 54,983.62.

We await your payment advice to enable Irene to act accordingly,

Aside to Angie, please follow up on the recovery.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd,

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: +65 6389 6183

FAX: +B65 6224 747B/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

alfred.toh .com
WWW.s50.C ﬂtﬂ|EiﬂE.§ﬂm

ANNIFRSARY
In Simpupere simee 1958

Dhisclaimer

Thix message is confideniial; s contents do nor constinure a commirmenr by Chinag Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid. excepr
where pravided for in a written agreemenr benween you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid Any wnauthorized
disclosure, wse or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited If yow are nwot the intended recipiont of the message,
please narify the sender immediarely

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com)]
Sent: Thursday, September 06, 2018 5:06 PM
To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

l



Cc: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow
<sochow.chee @sg.cntaiping.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Angie Foo
<angie.foo@sg.cntaiping.com>; KKLau <kklau@lkkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>; Vic
[LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKU3787C (Ol: SNM18D03022C02/7) and
SHB126B (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CT118010946/K1ha3) on 13/06/2018

CTI REF — SNM18D03022C02/7
LKK REF — CC3/CT118010946/K1ha3

Dear lIrene,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKU 3787C (OI) AND SH 81268 (TP) ON 13/06/2018

We refer to the above matter.

It was reported that the Insured vehicle had rear-ended to the TP vehicle.

We had spoken to the Insured PIC Mr Ken Wong and he was informed of the TP claim and liability issues on 16/08/2018
and agreed to settle the matter. He was also inform and is aware of the TP excess that is applicable for this matter. A

letter was sent out to the Insured to informed about the TP claim and liability. No feedback from Insured till date.

In view of the above, we are of the view that liability is not to our Insured’s favour and the damages sustained to TP
vehicle were consistent to the nature of the accident.

Summary to offer to repairer COMF ENGINEERING PTE LTD Is as follows:
TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair (w/gst) S 7.,646.07 S 4,012.50
Loss of Rental ($98.25 x 7 days) S 687.75 S 638.63 (598.25 x 6.5 days)
Loss of Income ($80 x 7 days) S 560.00 S 375.00 (550 x 6.5 days)
LTA Search Fee 5 7.49 s 7.49
TOTAL $ 8,901.31 $ 4,983.62

Breakdown of days is as follows:

Recommended Days 4 days
Weekends / Downtime 2.5 day
TOTAL 6.5 days

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.
For your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

LKK = Save the Earth Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mall and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender thal you have deleled the e-mall, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 31 August, 2018 10:27 AM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI'; Irene Tay

Cc: Irene Tay; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Angie Foo; KKLau; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); Vic
(LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKU3787C (OI: SNM18D03022C02/7) and SH81268 (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CT118010946/K1ha3) on 13/06/2018

Dear Irene,
We refer to the below emall and to our telephone conversation earlier.
Please find attached video as requested.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phane: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | 5{(408913)

= ST Save the Earth Print only when necessary:

This e-mall cantain confidential and privileged matenal, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribufion by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mall in ermor, please do not
read this e-mall or any attached llems. Please delele the e-mall and all attachments, including any copies thereal, and inform the
sander that you have deleted the a-mail, all attachments and any coples thereof. Thank you.

From: Claims Dept of CTl [mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Thursday, 16 August, 2018 3:26 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Irene Tay; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Angie Foo; KKLau; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKU3787C (Ol: SNM18D03022C02/7) and SH81268 (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CT118010946/K1ha3) on 13/06/2018



COMFORIDELGRO

Our Ref T0618/ SH 81268 /WT(st) ENGINEERING
Your Ref :
Date 22-Jun-18 CDGE Taxi Claims Dept
59 Loyang Drive 4th Fir
CHINA INSURANCE CO LTD Singapore 508269
3 ANSON ROAD
#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER
SINGAPORE 079909
Attn : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir oyan
ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SH 8126B YOUR INSURED SKU3787C
AND OTHER ON 13.06.18

We are the authorised repair workshop for Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd, the owner of motor
Vehicle No : SH 81268 which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured
vehicle. The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concermed have requesled and authorized us to
assist them in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters
ansing from the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving SKU3787C
we are submitting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants.

TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM

1 Cost of Repair $ 401250

2 7 daysLossof Rental@ § 9825 perday ] B687.75

3 Survey Report Fees (Surveyed by Mis LKK) S -

4 LTA Search Fees 5 7.49

S GIA / Police Report Fees s -

(3] Towing / Medical / Transporation Fees 3 -
Sub Total: 4707.74

HIRER'S CLAIM

7 7 days Lossof Income @ §  80.00 perdays 5 560.00

TotalClaims : § 526774
We enclose herewith the following documents to support the claims: -

a) Original repair bill and photocopies of photographs 6 pcs
b)  LTA search slip/s of - SKU3787C
cl GIA / Palice report/s af : SH 81268

d)  Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator
{ ) Traffic Compound ( ) Towing/Medical billlreceipts [ ) Cerificate of Insurance
[ X ) Photograph/s of Accident Scen { x ) Downtime/Mileage record ( x ) Rental Rate letter

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settiement of the said claims as
s00n 85 possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi dnver.

Yours faithfully
‘Walliam ‘lan

Deputy Manager
CDGE Claims Department
Tel: 6214 B737 Fax: 6214 1843 Email : williamtani@cdge.com.sg

This is @ computer generated letter. No signature s required.

I

COMFORIDELGRO G



STURIAVE 1, #00.25 PAYA LBEINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (0631 62563561 FAX < (065) A2564315
Our Ref: CCYCTIIB010946/Khad
07 AUGUST 2018

TK LIMO AND RENTAL SERVICES By Post and By Email
BLOCK 212B PUNGGOL WALK

#08-715 PUNGGOL WAVES

SINGAPORE 822212

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKU 3787C AND SH 81268 ON 13/06/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Lid 10 resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or
vour authorized driver may not be absolved from blame for this accident.

If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim,
kindly let us have them in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 20/08/2018, after we
shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis
and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by vou/vour driver against the
other party’s insurer arising from this particular accidenl

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faimi}ﬂ im
/
/
n"al

¥,

VieAlpeh,
6841 2096

FAX: 6741 4108
Email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com

ce. China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pre Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)
Wong_shui_sheng@hotmail.com / irfantiskev@outlook.com
(Email)




Vic (LKKAutn!

From: Vic [LKKAuUTO)

Sent: Tuesday, 7 August, 2018 2:52 PM

To: Wong_shui_sheng@hotmail.com

Cc Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto), irfantiskey@outlook.com

Subject: Your Ref: SKU 3787C_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKU 3787C AND SH 81268 ON
13/06/2018

!' UU Auto

o Sl Consulhants
A BA B Pla Lid

1 U HIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBIINDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408953 TEL : 1065) 62563561 FAX 1 1063 2504315

Our Ref: CC3/CTI18010946/Kha3
07 AUGUST 2018

TK LIMO AND RENTAL SERVICES By Post and By Email
BLOCK 212B PUNGGOL WALK

#0B-715 PUNGGOL WAVES

SINGAPORE 822212

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKU 3787C AND SH 81268 ON 13/06/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or your authorized driver may
not be absolved from blame for this accident.

If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us have them in
writing within the next 10 days |.e. by 20/08/2018, after we shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant
on the without prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against
the other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,
Vie Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51. Pava Ubi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1. #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the inlended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in &rror, please do not

read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any coples thereof, and inform the
sendar that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any coples thereof. Thank you.



CDG.VARS.V LettofAuthorisation Page 1 of' ]

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

(NAF / PAF)
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SONATA SHB126B , SKU3787C ON 13-Jun-18 14:40
ALONG AYE TWDS KEPPEL AFTER ALEXANDRA EXIT
1/ We NG KOK HIM (Hirer) NRIC No..  S1283830A
and/or (Relief) NRIC No.:

Taxi Number SHB126B
hereby autharise ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd{CDGE):

1. To submit myfour tlaims for damages, costs and expense, Including laoss of Income, loss of rental,
medical fee and legal costs.

2. To have absolute discretion to agres to any settlement ar compensation amount in respect of my/faur claim
against third party (except personal injuries and medical claims).

3. To sign Discharge Voucher on my/four behalf
4. To accept any payment (claim proceeds) In respect of the claim against third party and paymeant by chexgue

shall be forward directly to CDGE in accordance with COGE's instruction and made In favour of
“"ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd".

Date 13-Jun-2018
Mame of Hirer NG KOK HIM
Hirer NRIC S128B3830A Signature :
w
Address 636A SENJA RD #05-309
671636
Contact No 98622526

hitp:edgek 25y :82/Runtime/Runtime’Runtime/Runtime/ View/CDG.VARS.V Lettof...

13062018



Folicy Mo i DMHCSNIGSTRZLTOL Claim Ne :SHMIBDOIDZZCO2/T(SEU3ITETE)

Claimant COMPORT TRANMSPORTATION PTIE LID

an

Amount  :  $84,580.00 _
SINGAPORE DOLLARS FOUR THOUSAND NINE HUNDRED EIGHTY ONMLY

IiWe agree co accept the above mencioned amcunt oo be paid to mes/um in full &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disburssments for Injuries / damages
sustalned by me/us through an accident lnvalving

Claimant Vehicle No. : SH B12€3

insured Vehicls Ha. : 5KO0 37870
Bate of Loss : 13/06/7201%8
Plasa af Accidant t AYE TOWARROE £T®

IN COMEIDERATION of the payment made to me/us of the aforementicoed sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPDRE) PTE. LTD., I/We agree absolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING IMEURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/ar

Insursd Hams t TE LIMO ABD RENTAL SERVICES
Driver Name i MUHAMAD IRFAN BIN IBRAHIM

from all claims, presant or Tuturs in gespect of all leas, injury or damsge
sustained by me/ua arising out of the sald acoidene.

I acknowledge chat this payment Ls made without ac=ission Sf lisbility on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE |SINGAPORE) FTE. LID.

(1 Glchal Sum {all in) 58 4,980,00

m ® 4 A 4 m k& & O & A & & @ @ 55 4|§Eu+ﬂu

CLANE DEFARTHLN

CONECE1ELSh] PaGnEETNG T[ELIC
58 | o Dt
Claimant Wame i TNLAPCRE (D% T
fy «
' : T- 1§
Signaturs 1 71 — )

"The contems o fis document aooly % vehile damegss only

Al personal mules ad damanss aneng Merstiom are excludeo Please forwand your chogue male payible fo.
X : NOMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE 1TD
rom ihe ambit and amicalen o Tus document



COMFOR‘DELCIRQ ComiortDelGro Engineering Ple Lid
ENGINEERING '

& member of COMFORDELGRO

i W
GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE "
VEHLLKE M) INV. NI/DATY
11 ] % E '
Al AlLFTN I NSTHANT - =k
| ' ’ S MAKE (H M
| M | '
\ ]
[ MEL INMETER KEAL NG+
! 1 r_] \ 73 [ al —
WTE (OF Kk
3 ¥
CHAS! TH - HIH TYH®
EMHETATUMKAST S04
Invol1cCe I I Hepa
A 1 {1
~ta =AM T 4 2.5
1M :;' ----- EH =l |

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pie Lid
A marnbar of COMPORIDELCEC ACCOUNT No INVDICE No AMOUNT BANK/CHO Mo

Head Office
205 Bruddell Road
Singapore 579701

Kindly note ihat no recaipl shall be issued unless equesied
CUSTOMER'S COPY




Our Ref: CT18060401

comrors

Date: 22 June 2018 ‘ ’

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear SirfMadam

ACCIDENT ON 13/06/2018 @ 14:40 hrs

ALONG AYE TWDS KEPPEL AFTER ALEXANDRA EXIT
INVOLVING SKU3787C

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration
number SHB126B (the "Taxi"). The Taxi was hired to NG KOK HIM IC NO S1283830A
a registered hirer-operator of Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd at the time of
occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $98.25 per day (inclusive of
GST).

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with MS First Capital Insurance Ltd on
a third party basis at the material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a motor
woarkshop of his choice.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

settlement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident.

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

This is a compulter generated letter. No signature is required.

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapare 575717 Mainline +65 6555 1188 Facsimile +65 6453 3183
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[msurance Particulars Enguuy By Agents Detail https: ‘vl ta.govsg/ vl setionimPantDetal By AATFUNCTION ...

Enquire Vehicle Insurer

Wehicle No. Incldent Date/Time Search Status Insurance Company Code Insurance Company Mame

SKU3I7TETC 13 Jun 2018/ 14:40:00 Successtul o CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD
Previous OK

lafl 13/06/2018. 4:25 'M



