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Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd e 32326

Bik 1019, Yishun industrial Pack A #01-3747352, Singapore To870 1

TEL: 67536142 (Y1) FAX: 67887719 (Y1S)  Emuil: chmotori@singnet com sg TP 1l e
GST201001158E RCB NO201001 | SHE
M/S: INDIA INT'L INSURANCE PTE LTD
64 CECIL STREET Estimate No:  ES1890648/YISHUN
#04/405 10B BUILDING Date: 12 Jun 2018
SINGAPORE 049711 Policy No: S1IBVOS352/VPE/RO3
TEL: 63476100 FAX: 62247743 Veh Reg No: SGZT7131G
ATTN: Motor Claim Department MakeModel:  MITSUBISHI LANCER
o7 AvTbprs 1.6 A
WS Ref: TPINDIAYS ﬁ Chassis No: JIMYSTCS3ASU002768
Claim Type: Third Party 24 v i & E 1274 Engine No: 4GI8JL1124
Accident Date:  11/06/2018 Reg. Date: 15/11/2007
TP Veh Reg No:  SHC3801A /4’14!/ Fanny (ﬁ@
Cl
Es te Repair Cost to Vehicle No :SGZ7232G PAGE: /1
Description U/Price  Quantity List Price Amount
] S8
List Price
| REAR BUMPER 69,00 | PC ‘g 68900 —
2 REAR BUMPER LOWER SKIRT HRA.00 | PC &#l.- He8 ) —
3 REAR BUMPER LH RETAINER $0.00 | PC Pry S00 —
4 REAR BUMPER CLIPS .50 6 PCS z 2100
5 REAR BUMPER CENTRE BEAM 200,00 I PC 200,00
6 TAILLAMPS oty 351,00 2 PCS 0200 2~1
7 REAR BOOT $67.00 | pC B s6T00
§  REAR BOOT LOGO 55,00 | PC e 5500 —
9 REAR BOOT EMBLEM 'LANCER' 30,00 | PC P 3000 —
10 REAR BOOT EMBLEM 'GLX' 29.00 I pC PR 2900 ——
11 REAR BOOT INNER LOCK 600 | PC ot (400 —
12 REAR BOOT INNER RUBBER 175.00 | pC #P1y 13500 Solia—
{1 REAR PANEL 583,00 | PC T osg300 )
14 REAR PANEL INNER GARNISH 156.00 | PC Mfea® 5500
15 REAR PANEL INNER GARNISH CLIPS 150 6 PCS | 200 —
I6 REAR SPARE TYRE TOP BOARD 147,00 pe Im gt K
17 REAR EXHAUST PIPE 439,00 | PC a0 ¥
4.625,00
Less 10% 462.50 4,162.50
Labour
I8 REMOVE & REFIX REAR BUMPER 850,00 I LA 850,00 ?r.(
ASSY, TAILLAMPS,LOWER SKIRT,REAR BOOT &
ATTACHMENT,TO CUT,WELD & RENEW REAR
PANEL KNOCK & REPAIR REAR FENDERS REAR SPARE
TYRE COMPARTMENT & REALIGN THE SAME
19 PUTTY & RESPRAY ON REAR SPARE TYRE 50,00 | LA 850,00 ?J’;r
COMPARTMENT, REAR FENDERS,REAR
BOOT HINGES, REAR BUMPER BEAM,LOWER SKIRT &
20 TO REMOVE & REFIX REAR EXHAUST & CHECK SYSTEM 60,00 | LA 6000
21 RUSTPROOFING 40,00 | LA 60.00
| B20.00 1.820.00
Total 55 5,042 .50
LKK Auto Consullgnts hence notily Add GST @ T% 41878
the Repairet of ine foiowng: Total Amount Pavable SS 6,401 28
» To resurvy beloneafiar wmay paieg
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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry
. >Backto OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:

Owner |D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:

Intended De-registration Date:
| Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:

Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:

Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:

First Registration Date:

Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 12 Jun 2018

OK

Singapore NRIC
46098C

SGZ7232G

No

12 Jun 2018
MITSUBISHI
LANCER 1.6 A
Silver

2007
4G18JL1124
JMYSTCS3ABUD02768
79.0 kW (105 bhp)
$12,064.00

15 Nov 2007

15 Nov 2007

1

$13,152.00

Forfeited

$0.00

14 Nov 2027

A - Car (1600cc & below)
10

$41,994.00

$39,567.00

$39,567.00

Page 1 of |

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNC... 12/06/2018
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Nivitha (LKK Auto!

From: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim®iii.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 12 June 2018 4:18 PM
To: Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (Yishun-June); ‘sur@Ilkkauto.com’; Catherine Chong (LKK
Auto)
Ce: Zuhaidah Samsuri =
Subject: RE: Repair Survey (Single Joint Expert) - SGZ7232G
4-24pm® '.-'-‘*l'f* |18
Dear Sir / Mdm, "D ‘ff'.c[ A
Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SGZ7232G and let us have your report urgently. u‘t‘ﬂl"‘- ) l
ahndy_on 13|06 (1§
This claim will be handled by Ms Aida.

*Kindly upload this survey request email to merimen,

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee

Motor Claims Dept.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd

64 Cecil Street | #05 |0B Building | Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

——-0riginal Message——

From: Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (Yishun-June) [mailto:chmotor@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: 12 June, 2018 2:41 PM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iil.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Repair Survey (Single Joint Expert) - SGZ7232G

Hi,
Our selection as below :-
* LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Pls assist to arrange for survey (SJE) asap.
Thank you.

Rgds

June Phua

Cheng Hoe Maotor Pte Ltd

Tel :67556142

Fax : 67557719

——-Original Message——

From: Motor Claim - 1|

Sent: Tuesday, June 12, 2018 2:22 PM



To: Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (Yishun-lune)
Subject: RE: Repair Survey (Single Joint Expert) - 5GZ7232G

Dear Sir / Mdm,
We acknowledge receipt of your email.
We proprose using one of the following motor surveyars:

« LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
* Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list.

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee

Motor Claims Dept.

India International Insurance Pre Ltd

54 Cecil Street | #05 0B Building | Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

-—0riginal Message—-

From: Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (Yishun-June) [mailto:chmotor@singnet.com.sg)
Sent: 12 June, 2018 1:30 PM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Subject: Repair Survey (Single Joint Expert) - $GZ72326G

Dear Sir,

OUR CLIENT - 5GZ7232G
DOoA ¢ 11/6/18 @7.15pm
YR INSURED : SHC3ED1A

Kindly provide us of your surveyor listing for the selection on the survey.,
Thank you,

Regards

Efeeda

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd
Tel :67556142

Fax : 67557719

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing and
processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located both inside and
outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance
Association of Singapore, This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling and/or dealing with your claim,
which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same,
kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information,

2



If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached you by mistake, please
delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby notified that any use, distribution, transmission,
printing, copying or dissemination of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be
unlawful.

Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be intercepted, corrupted,
lost, delayed or contain viruses,

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this message or any delay in
delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing and
processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located both inside and
outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance
Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling and/or dealing with your claim,
which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same,
kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached you by mistake, please
delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby notified that any use, distribution, transmission,
printing, copying or dissemination of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be
unlawful,

Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be intercepted, corrupted,
lost, delayed or contain viruses,

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this message or any delay In
delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission or any modification.

Print this emall only if it Is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment,

India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K



11/2r2018 Menman e-Claims
Print Received Message

This mail Is associated with .

*SGZ7232G (MCT18060344)
[SHE3801A)
TP

KOH SWEE HENG BENJAMIN (XU RUIXING)
Jdun 11 2018 T:00PM

Il
Cheng Hoa Motor Pte Ltd

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (IlI_SG), sent cn 30/10/2019 09:23 AM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (554411.08) - 5GZ7232G - Claim Handler: Zuhaidah Bte Samsuri

Approved:4411.08.

https.{isingapore mesimen.comiclaims/index.cimMusebox=5Y Cmail&fuseaction=dsp_Print&CFID=617068554CFTOKEN=43dcdaZeld465ca0-A1... 11



Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settlemant

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING |
Cas= |Motfied Est Submintsd | Ad) Assigned [ ad] #ert [Ad) Submitted | Ins Auth'ed Status
o | 19190 2018 D unI018 543,400.00 | 543,400.00 Peniing for Sureey
£t Reg S | !uﬂum.ul] view kat_| I“':.rnmtml

BFOLDER DETAILS
COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No. 199303821R

CLAIM SU | [Created by adjustar]

|Ran . |KOM SWEE HENG BENJAMIN (XU RUIXING), 1D: SB426096C
| Vehicle Rag. | 13/06/2018 19:00 - :59
Mo - SGI72326 Ciate of Lows: | (394 Months and 27 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)]
Claim Type: | TP / MCT18060344 Palicy/Cover | urcmnnss
Nate Ne. .
Vehide Reg.
Pakicy No.
:.:-m'ﬂ] SHCIBO1A Clamanty: | SL8VOS352/VPE/RO3
Excess:

Wepairer. | Cheng Hoa Motor Pte Lid (Yishun) Bik 1015 #01-374/382, Yishun Indusirial Park A, 768761 Yishun - Tel: 6755 6142
Hinding Indla International Insurance Pte Ltd [HQ) - Tel: 63476100 . [Mandied by Tuhaldah Bta Samsurl - 6347 6070]

Uberty Insurance Pte Ltd [HQ) - Tel: [55) 6221 B511
Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pta Ltd (HG) - Tel: 6256-1561 .. [Handied by KENNETH KONG] ... [Final Rpt due 27/06/2018]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al | Compose Case mail |

« 115G (30/10/2019): Alert - &d) Mandate Approved [5$4411.08) - SGZTIILG - Claim Handler: Zuhaidah Bt...
« 111_SG (13/10/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - SGZ72320 - Claim Handler: Zuhaidah Bte Samsuri
. IILEEWWHH[B]:m-“]mm{mnﬂ}-“ﬂﬂiﬂ-mm Zuhaidah Bte §...

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= View Al | Search Tasks | Create New Task | compiets |

Due Date  Priority Type Tash Group  Subject Handler  Assigned By Camplated On Created On  Done?
Mo results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 20/12/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 2

Claim Documents

*SGZ7232G (MCT18060344)
[SHC3BD1A]

TP
KOH SWEE HENG BENJAMIN (XU RUIXING)
Jun 11 2018 7:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Lid

|

Photos/Images Gperpage_1v]| & |
fo | Melabel/Reorder | LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) | Thumbnail | Print
1 |22/10/18 18:00 |General View 0| wedws | &
2 |22/10/19 18:00 | Genersl View Q| oarws | A
|3 [22/101915:00 | General View @ | waws | B
4 |22/10/1918:00 | General View 0 waws | &
5 |22/10/19 15:00 | Genaral View 0| waors | M
6 |2210/19 1800 | General View | waawsc | A
7 |22/10/19 18:00 Genersl View ) weawc | M
B |22/10/19 18:00 | General View | e | B
9 [22/10/19 16:00 | General View 0| wedirs | 4
10 221019 18:00 | Genersl View 0 cecrec | B
11 |2210/1918:00 | Genersl View 0| waws |
12 |22/10/19 18:00 | Genersl View 0| waws | H
(13 [22/10/19 18:00 | General View 0| wedrc |
14 |22/10/19 18:00 | Ganeral View 0| edwe | &
|15 |22/10718 18:00 | Genersl View 0| wwaws | B
16 |22/10/19 18:00 | Genarsl View 0| waws | A
17 |22/10/19 18:00 | General View 0| waawc | A
18 |22/10/19 18:00 | General View Q| wdwc | A
1% |22/10/19 18:00 | Genaral View 0| waws | A
0 |22/10/19 18:00 | Genaral View 0! weaws | A
21 |22/10/19 16:00 | Geners! View 0| waaws | A
22 |22/10/19 18:00 | General View ﬂ_: Load PG | BA
1 |22/10/13 18:00 | General View 0| leadrc | &
4 |72/10/15 18:00 | Genersl View 0| toaswc | A
25 |73/10/13 15:00 | Genaral View O | wawre |
26 [22/10/19 1B:00 | General View O wirs | R
27 |z210/19 18:00 | Genersl View 0| oceaws | &
28 |22/10/19 18:00 | General View O wurs | B
29 |Z210019 18:00 | Genersl View O werc | B
a0 |23/10/19 18:00 | General View 0| wedirc | A
31 |22/10/19 18:00 | Genersl View 8| vears | H
1 |22/10/19 18:00 Genaral View 0| wedws | A
3 | 21019 17:19 After Repair Phote 0| dws | A
3 | @0/19 1719 After Repair Photo i_ load ¥ | A
35 | 29/10/1917:1%9 | After Repair Photo @ | tews | A
Documentation 1 per paa |
No_| Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) eyl | i
1 |1A/D/1B 14:40 | ACKNOWLEDGEMENT EMAIL TO III DD 12.05.2018 Load POF
i 23/06/18 16:01 TP ESTIMATE - MARKED i Load FOF
3 |Z3/06/18 16:01 | TP GIA REPORT Load POF
4 |21/10/1917:13 | WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF
5 |21/10/19 17:13 | RENTAL RECEIPT Load POF
B |[nnonsiril (Lo ) | Losd PoF

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp... 20/ 2/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

No | Relabel/Reorder | LXK Auto Consultants Pis Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
7 [20/13/1914:.07  |AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF
[8 |20/12/15 1407 | DISCHARGE VOUCHER Load POF
No_| Finalized G India International tns Pte Ltd (HG) Thumbnall | Print
1 | 19/06/18 D8:52 Singapore Accident Statement Load FOF

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST neset | Save | enm Il
There are no document checklists configured.

Our Checkilst Remarks - LK imnis Lid i

Show Remarks To: L1 Handiing Insurer
ok Barnarih are privile LB yEu S B B otfe partes.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp... 20/12/2019



Adjuster Report Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoregno1sseorisen)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-35681 Fax 6844-8805 Email sur@lkkauto com;assignmenis@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/I1I1B010845/KGA3Q2

Date: 201272019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer India International Insurance Pte Ltd  Palicy No MCOMO015
Claimant "
Vehicle No : SGZ72326G Insured Vehicle No : SHC3801A
Date of Loss: 11/06/2018 Mature of Claim: TP Claim No: MCT 18060344
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SGZT2326
Make & Model! MITSUBISHI LANCER, 1.8 (A) Engine No: 4G18JL1124
Reg. Date: 15/11/2007 (Man. Year: 2007) Chassis No: JMYSTCS3IABUDO2TES
Colour Metallic Silver Odometer: 123084 km
Engine Capacity 1584 cc
Market Value/New Car NIA
Price:
Sum Insured (S$). Market Value/New Car Price
F
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabla): Yes Engine Modificalion: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 195/80 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 195/60 R15
Front Left Side: Yokohama 5 mm Rear Left Side: Yokohama 5 mm
Front Right Side: Yokohama 5 mm Rear Right Side: Yokohama 5 mm
The sbove wallss represent the mmaning hre reads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster’s Difference  DIff %|
Parts 4,162.50 2,724 50 1,438.00 34.55
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,820.00 1,570.00 250.00 13.74
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5) 5882.50 4,294.50 1,688.00 28.22
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 3,400.00
(S8) 5,982.50 3,400.00 2,582.50 4317
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (55) 418.78 238.00 180,78 4317
MNett Amount [55) 6,401.28 3,638.00 2,763.28 4317
+ Car Rental (8.5 x $590.95/day| (S§) 7r3.08
Nett Liability (S§) 4.411.08
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 13/06/2018
Date Inspected: 13/06/2018 Inspected Al: Cheng Hoe Mator Pte Lid (Yishun)
Blk 1018 #01-374/382, Yishun
Industrial Park A
Singapore TEBTE1
Estimated Period of Repair; 6.0 days
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Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: Chong Pul Lin

NOTE: This report represants our findings af the ime and piace of inspaction stated hersin. Such ingpection has bean camed out to the best of our
knowiedge and akility but any ofher fabiity under any ofbar crocumstances s heraty sxprassly axcluded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 20/12/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

'Reference

Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 21 Oct 2019)

Parts: 143 MITSUBISHI LANCER 1.8 (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0}
| Labour: Repairer's {Price-denominated Standard List)

\Print Code: (Unsubmitted. no print-code for SGZ7232G)

Validity: These estimales are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker an the last estimate page

Further Info: ltemsAalues not in reference catalogue are preficed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

L 1 *REAR BUMPER Bent B89.00FL “689.00FL
2 1 *REAR BUMPER LOWER SKIRT Buckled G88.00FL “"6BB.OOFL
3 1 *REAR BUMPER LH RETAINER Distorted 50.00 FL *50.00FL
4 & *REAR BUMPER CLIPS Necessary 21.00FL *21.00FL
5 1 "REAR BUMPER CENTRE BEAM Buckled 209.00FL *200.00FL
8 1 *TAILLAMPS OJ/S Cracked J02.00FL *351.00FL
7 1 *REAR BOOT Bent S8TO00FL *587.00FL
8 1 *REAR BOOT LOGO Necessary 55.00 FL *55.00FL
g 1 *REAR BOOT EMBLEM LANCER Necessary 30.00FL  *30.00FL
10 1 *REAR BOOT EMBLEM GLX Mecessary 2000FL  *29.00FL
1" 1 “REAR BOOT INNER LOCK Dented B400FL  “B4.00FL
12 1 *REAR BOOT INNER RUBBER (50%) Dented / Distorted 157.50FS  "8750FS
13 1 *REAR PANEL Repair 583.00 FL “FL
14 1 *REAR PANEL INNER GARNISH Mig Cracked 186,00FL *156.00FL
15 B *REAR PANEL INNER GARNISH CLIPS Necessary 21.00FL  *21.00FL
B8 1 *REAR SPARE TYRE TOP BOARD Serviceable 147.00 FL ~FL
17 1 *REAR EXHAUST PIPE Repair 439.00FL *.FL

FaFranchise part. S=SpcNatt, L=Listitambisc.
Sub Total [S§) 4,607.50 3,017.50
- List Item Discount on L ltems 10.00/10.00% (5%) 445 00 203.00

Total Parts (S§) 4,162.50 2,724.50

| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellanecus Hems selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repalirer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 REMOVE & REFIX REAR BUMPER MNew BS0.00 700.00

ASSY TAILLAMPS LOWER SKIRT ,REAR BOOT &
ATTACHMENT ,TO CUT ,WELD & RENEW REAR PANEL
KNOCK & REPAIR REAR FENDERS ,REAR SPARE TYRE
COMPARTMENT & REALIGN THE SAME

2 PUTTY & RESPRAY ON REAR SPARE TYRE MNew 850.00 750.00
COMPARTMENT ,REAR FENDERS ,REAR
BOOT ,HINGES ,REAR BUMPER ,BEAM ,LOWER SKIRT &

3  TOREMOVE & REFIX REAR EXHAUST & CHECK SYSTEM  New 60.00 60.00
4 RUSTPROOFING New 60.00 60.00
Gross Labour Cost (S8§) 1,820.00 1,570.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-oul, [

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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