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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

TEL: 6256 3581 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg Mo 199607188R GST Reg. No. 19-9807198-R

Afffiisted o Federation Inismationate Des Experts En Automotilie’

AXA INSURANCE PTELTD

Ref : CS/ASM18010823/Atd3

TR ovE oo owe:ssosze |||V
Code: ASM
1. _ Policy Particulars :- OWN DAMAGE
Insured Veh. Veh. Inspected 5JQ 888OR
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SBMO0KE4 Excess (§) 2,000.00
Assign From SMARTCLAIM (FETER WANG) | Assign Date 13/08/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Staering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
RIH Front Tyre mm
L/H Frant Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. [ General Information
Accident Date 08/06/2018 Inspection Date
Survey held at HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WKSP
1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6§
#01-51 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
S5a. Remarks
AJTHE MARKET VALUE |S 55——————(EST AVERAGE)
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE AUTHORISED REPAIRS




10/3/2018 Claim Portal

&« Re:RE: Breakdown & IA query - Noted

Type
© Question

Message
Kindly take note to update the handler if there is any movement in the supplementary and advise reason for
the increase so as to review and authorize. Thanks

hitps:/ivp. smariciaims.axa.com.sgiclaim-potalhtmlindex-vendor-sarvice-requests. htmid/service-requestsiview-message/ 7 serviceRequasiNumbe... 111
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Denise Ta: (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 21 June 2018 3:41 PM

To: Hua Meng

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: $JQ BBSOR / OD / HUA MENG / YOUR REF: BBMOOK64
Dear lune,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle S1Q 88B0R (Excess $2000/-). REPAIR ON
LUMP SUM AND COST PLUS 10%

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*0ur client reserve their right not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phaone: 6256-3561 | emall: denlsetay@Ikkauto.com | fax: B256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #0225 | 5{408933]

From: Hua Meng [mailto:huameng@live.com.sg}

Sent: Thursday, 21 June 2018 10:45 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: 5)Q 8880R / OD / HUA MENG / YOUR REF: 88MO0K64

Dear Denise

Cost price estimate attached.

Thanks & Regards

June

From: Hua Meng <huame live.com.sg=> i UEEy . TEw

Sent: Thursday, June 21, 2018 10:24:54 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) 07 SIUEINSUISIHEYD MW

Subject: Re: $JQ 8880R / OD / HUA MENG / YOUR REF: 88MOOK64 Juswyedsq swie;n
UIBSSNH JEMUY [nJeyy

Dear Denise spieday

B(|1951d "WiS  Jaum) ase)
L¥96.5008 : ou Wie

y “Mouy sn 33| asea|d ‘suizauodfsauanb Aue aney noh j|



62172018 Claim Portal

&« Lump-sum repair authroized

Type
© Question

Message
Lump-sum repair authorized. | will arrange AXA Assistance to contact workshop to make courtesy car
arrangement.

rrrtpa:rhrp.mum:tnirnn.m,mn,sgfdn'rrn-pnmMmm-mﬂmu.hh#ummmwﬂ-mﬂ?nmmwmh. 13



6/212018 Claim Partal

. Mm::tel :
PANAMERA

Service Address

Primary Contact/Insured

FOOD PARADISE ENTERPRISE HOLDING PTELTD
7 MANDAI LINK, #06-25, MANDAI CONNECTION, 728653, Singapore

Claim Handler
WANG Peter

peterwang@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions
Whkshop: Hua Meng Excess: $2000 Pending company authorization letter To survey WP

Messages Invoices History Documents Assessment Metrics Motes
Mew Messagt
TYPE (7]
SENT 6/21/18 3:17 PM
FROM WANG Peter
SUBJECT excess: $2000
BODY excess: $2000
-
TYPE (2]
SENT 6/21/18 3:16 PM
FROM WANG Peter

hlqm:-'hp.:nmnmm.m.m,wmmmmuwmm.mmwmmmﬁmnmw-ﬂTl:l'l



6R12018

SUBJECT.

BODY

TYPE

SENT

FROM

SUBJECT

BODY

TYPE

SENT

FROM

SUBJECT

BODY

TYPE

SENT

FROM

SUBJECT

BODY

Claim Porial

Lump-sum repair authroized

Lump-sum repair authorized. | will arrange AXA Ass...

-

6/21/18 11:47 AM

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (OD)

RE: Re:AGREE ON COST PLUS

Hi Peter, I've uploaded a new IA & estimate on the..

-~

6/21/18 9:35 AM

WANG Peter

Re:AGREE ON COST PLUS

Please confirm if the adjusted higure ($28471.50 ...

-

6/21/18 9:12 AM

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (OD)

AGREE ON COST PLUS

Hi Peter, Our surveyor has spoken to the repairer ...

-

nmpu'mp.anmﬂam_m.n:m.:g!dn|m-p-umm1'trnlhndn:-ﬂndnr-aenm:a—mqumnwnw“rﬂwummaﬂmmummﬁﬂm
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Immediate Advice
To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd

Survey Details:

Date of loss B-Jun-18
Date of appointment 13-Jun-18
Date of survey 14-Jun-18
Location of survey HUA MENG
Vehicle Details:
Claim Type: Own Damage
Vehicle number SJO 8880R
Make and Model PORSCHE PANAMERA,
Date of registration B/3/2011
Excess -] 2,000.00
Market Value S 130,000.00
Parf Rebate 5 78,758.00
Nett Loss 5 51,242.00
Repair details:
[Initial Estimate | 36,855.50 |

Proposed/Revised repair cost:

Parts 5 14,017.50
Check items (estimate) 5 12,674.00
Labour 5 1,780.00
Total 5 28,471.50
Lump Sum(if applicable) S

fﬂumheruf days for repair | ] 1

PRAARAER] AN piMS ) ISR

Date: 18/06/18



9/20/2018 Claim Portal

.l. ‘ ;
KK ALUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD(OD] - Meni '
<« Breakdown & IA query
Type
@ Question »
. k.« (o) C'--“"W
Message 123a5p 1 0 luwwp S -Faure (INZLSWE Chet

Hi, kindly advise: 1) Message on 21-06-2018 11.47, $13250 is Parts only? what was the checked items amt?

-2) Message on 05-07-2018 10,09, $13935 increase in Parts? 3) Message on 30-08-2018 10.0%, $18800;
Kindly advise where does the breakdown come from - Parts: $13,392.39 Confirm Check items: 3,707.43
Labour: 2,310.00 Supplemantary: 4188.14 total $ 23597.96 Thanks

9) Y pivte wereage dve o Quppleaniang, [ 417 \Y

) Bredk dow  Parts @204:2C Qupplemontany
(ordim Chack whomy, AD3<3 e wed Suvyeal
unconfinw  tizwA

W v found
4o he. damaat

oltes dic'r”ﬂ"'ﬁ“’"@
a8 Quew e
o bam B was— S

W\ “han PV s
it

mmmmmmmw:wmmﬂmemmmmw n
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Immediate Advice

To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd

Survey details

Date of loss B-Jun-18
Date of appointment 13-jun-18
Date of survey 14-jun-18
Location of survey Kaki Bukit @ Hua Meng

Vehicle Details:
Claim Type: Own Damage
Vehicle number 5] BEBOR
Make and Model Porsche Panamera
Date of registration 8/3/2011
Excess 52,000
Market Value §130,000
Parf Rebate 578,758
Nett Loss 551,242
Repair details
[initial Estimate | 26,572.09)
Proposed/Revis i
Parts 59,743
Check item(estimate) 55,010
Labour 51,780
Total 516,532
Lump Sum(if applicable) 13,250.00|

[Number of days of repair

Remarks:

S adEZ3nAsal kAN

Date:

it 2504000

21/6/2018

Damage consistent
Repair cost economcial
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Remarks:

DAMAGES CONSISTENT. REPAIR COST ECONOMICAL.

PENDING FOR COMPANY AUTHORISATION LETTER. WE

HAVE NOT AUTHORISE REPAIR.
Mandate:

Liability(TP) %

Proposed repair cost s

Loss of use 5 |no. of days

Loss of rental S|no. of days

Loss of income S|no. of days

LTA search fees S

Others 5

Proposed Total HVALUE!
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& Service Request Details

Claim
S8MO0K A4

Reference
None &

Loss Date
June B, 2018

Request Date
June 13, 2018

Due Date
June 21, 2018

Vendor Name
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD {oD)

Type of Loss
Own Damage

Services
Accelerated workshop survey
Actions

Next Step
Agree to perform service

Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (OD) »

Decline Wark II Accepl Wiork

Vehicle Information

Incident Vehicle Registration #
SJQ8880R

Make
PORSCHE

Menu

hwmsmwmm.m.MMWMM4mimmuhmmwmmmwumm1?m



6132018 Claim Portal

Meriu

SENVILE MAUUNESD

Primary Contact/Insured

FOOD PARADISE ENTERPRISE HOLDING PTE LTD
7 MANDAI LINK, #06-25, MANDAI CONNECTION, 728653, Singapore

Claim Handler
WANG Peter

peterwang@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions
Whshop: Hua Meng Excess: $2000 Pending company authorization letter To survey WP,

Messages Invoices History Documents Assessment Metrics MNotes

Mew Messaps

hitps.livp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portalhimifindex-vendar-service-requests. himi#/sarvice-requasts/ ?serviceReguestNumber=51701



ER202(18 Claim Portal

vd %U‘f’gqg

<« Insured disputed on the rejected items in Marked Estimate

Type
@ Question

Message
Insured called in and disputed on the rejected items in Marked Estimate. Please assist to call back Mr Marcus

from Insured company at Y833BBB0 to clarify. Thank you!

rrttpa!hp.smwmmu.m.mrn.w:rlmmvp-uml.-fhtrnll'lndnxmdnr-aammwusImhtmwuwmunwﬁnw-masmw?sawmﬁmmmmba. 11



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
o

wner |0 Type: Company
Crhwner ID: AA8T7M
Vehicle No.; SJIQBBBOR
Vehicle to be Exported: Yes
Intended De-registration Date 14 Jun 2018
Vehicle Maks PORSCHE
Vehicle Modal: PAMAMERA
Primary Colour White=
ranufacturing Year: 2011
Engine Mo BO4171
Chassis Na WPOZZZ97ZBLO03455
Maximum Power Output: 300.0 kv (402 bhp)
Open Market Value §104,994,00
Original Registration Date: 08 Mar 2011
First Registration Date 08 Mar 2011
Transfer Count: 4
Actual ARF Paid: $104,994.00
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 07 Mar 2021
PARF Rebate Amount: $64, 15600
COE Expiry Date: 07 Mar 2021
COE Category B - Car [1601cc & above)
COE Perlod(Years): 10
QP Paid; £53.400.00
COE Rebate Amount $14,56200
Total Rebate Amount: $78.758.00

The infermation contained herein is correct as at 14 Jun 2018

OK



- SGCARMART.COM togin | sen e [EEEEE O

o About the few Hyunda Accent 1.4 litre
ASK » DISCUSS * Sporean locked up in nhurmane conditaans in KL

LEARN - sHARE  SERENIES _ gy - Q) yede

r({{ HIN LUNG AUTO

D e

One Stop Car Hub
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Search Saluction  Pasamara Ay My 2013 Any Ay 2oy Avaitatile

Post an Advertisement
Sail & youralll Advertisa it ol |usi

£58 until it's SOLD!

sl BN aetiser Loon 0 Ways o Safling

[ Porsche Panamera 3.6A POK 3115800 | $25.590 /e 0%-lan-2011 3,805 ez 111,000 ke Luseury Avallabie

Stugaart Unitl Stunning Looks Deilverng Groundbroaking Performance. The Panamera [ The Eplieme OF Garman Enginsanng Reflned To Perfection
In Pristine Condition. First Class Commiting Experisncs. 1,

TS Whesler Capital Pes L3

[] Parsche Panamera 3,64 PO 5131800 £31,400 v 07-Jan-2011 3,805 ec 86,349 km Lusury Availatzhe

aummnmmmmwmmmwmmru:mmmmmmnwmm
2047, Clean And Mt Bisck Intanrioe, Call To View How!

| 2=boa ¥ il Ty Paams ~tw PEarern, e, Parereon, et e
[T} Pursche Panomara 3,68 PDK 130,800 530680 /iyt I7-Jan=2011 1,605 e 78,541 b Lusury Availabie
Full Serviced And Maintained By Agent]Stuttgart |, Still Linder Agent Wasranty And Can e Extended. 100% Accidant Free Ard Low Mileage, Excedant
Conditan Inside Cut. Flesible Loan Scheme Availsbie, Vi e
[T] Porsche Panamera 3.6A POK  $122,800 25,480 jyr 18:Fab-2011 B05 o 88,000 ki Lisary Avallabile

m-.Lunmmmmnwmmmnmmrimnw&mmmmmnmﬁ-mm
Benafit OF §10,000 And Acclderial Medical Reimbursement §1..,

Faster Auta Trading

ﬁ Car Bugging & Car Sslimg ): Car Ownership ¢ Buying a pre-owned car, bt
Unsure ol ity Condition?

‘w Car ARermarie] » m On The Mowe » i Lifestvie & Le2t,

[ Porsche Panamers 3.54 PDK $143.000 $22.560 fyr b-Fob-2011 1S 79,000 km Lumpry Avillabie
nn-mlﬁ-,Cni'ulMu-.tmmhﬂ:mmmnmmipmuwmh_ulnmmlwmnhumu‘w [renict cummn i §
=i M=
[C] Parsche Panamera 45 4.84 $170.0040 $34, 760 fyr 01-Age-2011 4,806 ez 56,160 km Lupary Kuailatibe
PO

1 Agent Unkt, Low Milesge, Porsche Active Suspension Minagemant. Porsche Entry And Orive, Power Boot, 20 Inch Soort Rima, Full Biack Leatte
Interiar, Call Mow Far Viewing

AEning Eurteports

[] Porsche Panamera 3.6A PDK  $137,800  $39,040 /yr 12Apr2011 3,608 e 3,000 ket Luisuiry Availabie

nuhmmmmmmwmmmwmwm,rmmmwmwmu“m
fecw For ng.

vl

L
O [] Porsche Panamera 3.6A PDK 142000 527,950 /yr 28-Jun-2011 3,608 ez . Lueuiry Avallable



DOs08 2018 FRI 1710 FAX R

FIGRE 1TRITA TS | S Matas P LA0 - Fsks Bkt
ENTRY DATE & TINE  DUAOGSHNE 17 77
SUDMITTED BY, Ohia Pw Yiag

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Plnaan repor cormactly the detnils of the scodenl io speed up the claima rocesa

Z This Form must be completed by the Polcyholder andfor the Authorised Dnver

3. Infarmaton prvanad st e as truthiul and accurate a5 possible. Ay wilful misrepresantation or witholdimg of matanal facts mey allow insurs e companies i
repudiate palicy ability 0 —

4. The maue and scceptance of s Form by insurance companies |8 not an admission of polcy apiidy on the par of he nmsurance companes

%, Any lalse reporting may be referred Lo the Palice for investigation.

B Thig report will be forwarded by the inguress of e GIA Racords Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and Mal capees of thes repor will, for 8 fes. be made avalable upon apolication by ETerssies pares

T.Bytha luclqu'ncnr af this reapor o the irsorers. you heraby consanl (o Be archiving af thes rapor! gl the canmlre and 1o copes of the reporit being mada availsble

alormsaid
Date Of Report DR/DGI201B 1717

Date Of Acciden DB/062018 11:15

Exact Location Of Accident CTE BRADDELL EXIT

Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE

Vehicle Registration Number 5JOB880R

Insured/Policyholder

Name Of Registerad Owner FOOD PARADISE ENTERPRISE FTE LTD
Co Reg Nao 201216687TM

Email Address NOEMAIL

Mobile Phane No

Altemative Phone No OFFICE-67940180

Vehicle Particulars

Manufacturer PORSCHE

Mode| PANAMERA

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used &l
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance palicy YES
for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please stale aclion 1o be taken
Vemcle Category PRIVATE CAR
Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company AXLA INSURANCE FTELTD

Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE
Flest Policy NO

Palicy Number CNBB1043

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver MARCLUS NG KIM YEW
NRIC Nao S8124230E

Date Of Birth 14/08/1881

Occupation INDODOR

Date Of Driving Pass
Oriving Expenence
Gender

Momle Numbier

Fax Mumber

Contaci Numbes

EMail Address

27/02/2008
B8 YEARS AND 3 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-98338880

NOEMAL

'y



0a3/06 2018 FRI 17:17 FAX yuvzesreua

.iu':rh'ess 34 DEDAFP ROAD
Postcode 809438

Was drver an employes of the Insured’'s Company YES

I No, Relationship of the Driver wilh the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -

Vehicle .

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accidenl COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
Waeather Conditions CLEAR

Road Surface WET

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO

Number of vehicles involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO
Was any injured conveyed 1o hospital by NO
ambulance?

Was any ather material or property damaged? YES
| have been approached by unknown person(s) NO

soliciting/offering eccident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 1
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reporied to the police? NO
If Yes, Please state which Police Station

Was nolice of intended Prosecution given? NO
If Yes, against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

| WAS TRAVELLING ALONG LANE 1IN CTE NEAR BRADDELL EXIT ON D&/08/2018 AT 1115HRS, VEHICLE B APPLIED E-
BRAKE AND | FOLLOWED SUIT. MY VEHICLE CANNOT STOPF IN TIME AND COLLIDED ONTO REAR PORTION OF
VEHICLE B. WET ROAD SURFACE THAT TIME

Attachment(s)
Are accident pholos avallable for attachmeant? YES
Was there any video captured by Car Camera? NO

Was there any audio recorded? NO

Vehicle Registration Number SLGSE20U
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour

Detalls Of Properties VEHICLE B
Vehicle Category FRIVATE CAR
MName of Driver YAP SIEW LOON
NRIC/Passport Numbar 574403606
Contact Number 201035903
Address

FPosicode

Insurance Company Name
Mature Of Damage

No. Of Passanger (Including Driver)

Paga 2 of 14
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Sketch Plan Pg. 1

OB-05-18;15:08 ¢ : # W3

IMPORTANT NOTICE

{ Weale eport eptnpetly ihe ahetisiie af {He orcinenl Lo SR i 1N KRG e EEE

- Toe fvm must e gammlinted Ry the Pulicghaldes And/ar the Suthorsed Drivet.

3 wlarmition provided inist Be i trghiul ang Resrzie 21 poapie. Any with muscpresentabies = writhetiisidlng of et il
Sy iy ablow Fsunanier compaves 10 pamiliie pelicy Rability,

2 Tre by 3rad sceagianeg @l thit Form by (nzararice Sompanics s mol an bfnEae ni puhey fanility an i matt Bl e imurande

FEmnpEnEc.

Ay batis peqiosting Ay e xigered fo the Palior lor inugetigation.

5 Tha eyt will be farwarted by e mrers ol the GIA Arconds Management Zeirs established by the General Insurance
rapaciatan ol dSmgapare HAA] for trchiulig sl that englies ol this report will fnr & fre b made dvbliabic spon applcatin by

il e Y he g Tl
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wettelofe) (mestued | Kk mecidfent dhill s catiertively relerred Lo b ihe "insurere’], he insurers’ awye sl N, e
tABIs Y Rustharity ] Sasgaponn and amy Televans paverent sgemeyfinshatiy (e a8 the pubce], foe the purposels)
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HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKS'HOP

1, Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, Blk C #01-61 / 01-34, Singapore 417883

Autobay @ Kaki Bukit
Tel: 6747 8064, 6746 5519 / 9666 9680 Fax: 6743 4896
ESTIMATE
FOOD PARADISE ENTERPRISE PTE LTD Date :12.06.2018
7 MANDAI LINK #06-25 Vehicle no SJQ BBBOR
MANDAI CONNECTION Make/Model {PORSCHE PANAMERA
5728653 Accident date :08.06.2018
No DESCRIPTION Qty Amount (S$)
List Items
1 Front bonnet B lic® 1 $ 4345
2 Front bonnet hinges @ $165.00 2 $ 330
3 Front bonnet hinges actuator @ $363.00 /. © -1 . 2 5 726 =
4 Front bonnet lock ' 1 $ 165 '
5 Front bonnet lock bracket 1 5 198
& Front bonnet PORSCHE emblem 1 5 3465
7 Front bonnet shock absorber @ $198.00 2 S 396
8 Front bonnet hinges cover @ $33.00 2 S 66 ¢
9 Front bumper ' ~—0 1 s 2915
10 Frontb umper side holder @ $55.00 2 S 110
11 Front bumper sensor @ $209.00 4 S 83621
12 Front bumper fog lamp @ $726.00 2 2 S 1452 12
13 Front bumper fog lamp garnish @ $231.00 2 S 4.2
14 Front bumper lower centre grille 1 S 5614”7
15 Front bumper top reinforcement 1 $ 1210
16 Front bumper lower reinforcement 1 S 561
17 Front bumper clips (1set) 1 S 100!
18 Front bumper nozzle @ $341.00 '~ ~— 2 S 682
19 Front support panel 1 S 10457
20 Front support panel lower garnish . 1 5 165 7
21 Front head lamp @ $3630.00 H¥io < 2 S 7260
22 Front fender @ $1760.00 <. 2 $ 35204
23 Front fender inenr shield @ $418.00 /- 2 5 8364
24 0il cooler 1 S 17607
25 Air con condenser 1 S 10787
26 Rediator 1 S 13757
27 Front bumper towing hook cover 1 § 55
Total S 32555.5

Special Nett Items

1 Front number plate o~ 1 S 50
Total 5 50




HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP

1, Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, Blk C #01-61 / 01-34, Singapore 417883
Autobay @ Kaki Bukit
Tel: 6747 8064, 6746 5519 / 9666 9680 Fax: 6743 4896

ESTIMATE
FOOD PARADISE ENTERPRISE PTE LTD Date :12.06.2018
7 MANDAI LINK #06-25 Vehicle no :S)Q 888B0R
MANDAI CONNECTION Make/Model :PORSCHE PANAMERA
5728653 Accident date :08.06.2018
No Description Qty Amount (55)
Labour Cost _
1 Remove & reinstall air con fill in gas $ 200
2 Remove & reinstall sensor 5 1504
3 Remove, replace & repair consistent to the accident 5 _J.DGI‘J i
4 Respray painting 5 1800
5 Tuff kote 5 100
Total 5 4350
Grand Total 5 36855.5
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HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP ce

1, Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, Blk C #01-61 / 01-34, Singapore 417883

Autobay @ Kaki Bukit
Tel: 6747 8064, 6746 5519 / 9666 9680 Fax: 6743 4896
ESTIMATE

FOOD PARADISE ENTERPRISE PTE LTD Date :12.06.2018

7 MANDAI LINK #06-25 Vehicle no :SIQ 8880R

MANDAI CONNECTION Make/Model :PORSCHE PANAMERA
5728653 Accident date :08.06.2018

- No |- DESCRIPTION ' Qty Amount (55)
List Items
1 Frontbonnet  PaltlA 2530

2 Front bonnet hinges @ $80.00 »*' Vit

3 Front bonnet hinges actuator @ $213.00 A

4 Front bonnet lock bkt NeL

5 Front bonnet lock bracket -

6 Front bonnet PORSCHE emblem /%%

7 Front bonnet shock absorber @ $77.00 -, ..o

8 Front bonnet hinges cover @ 511.00 -

g Front bumper o Tored
10 Frontb umper side holder @ 530.00 "
11 Front bumper sensor @ $210.50 1Y
12 Front bumper fog lamp @ $478.00 - Gl
13 Front bumper fog lamp garnish @ $93.10 ¢...
14 Front bumper lower centre grille '
15 Front bumper top reinforcement 5%
16 Front bumper lower reinforcement %
17 Front bumper clips {1set) Heos
18 Front bumper nozzle @ 5168.50 < ¢
19 Front support panel  Bue <000
20 Front support panel lower garnish
21 Front head lamp @ $2532.6 e x4
22 Front fender @ $1135.80 i 4 |
23 Front fender inenr shield @ $416.60 “*° 7
24 Oil cooler  +ad 1
25 Air con condenser el

resd
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-

26 Rediator Ba-A 84375

27 Front bumper towing hook cover i, 1 49.5
Caal2.0 Total 20247.35
FoT8e =" 10% 2024.735

fd 10 ARLRE 175 Total 22272.09
Special Nett Items
1 Front number plate al s &80 30

Total 5 50




HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP

1, Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, Blk C #01-61 / 01-34, Singapore 417883

Autobay @ Kaki Bukit
Tel: 6747 8064, 6746 5519 / 9666 9680 Fax: 6743 4896
ESTIMATE
FOOD PARADI|SE ENTERPRISE PTELTD Date :12.06,2018
7 MANDAI LINK #06-25 Vehicle no :5)Q BEBO R
MANDAI CONNECTION Make/Mode| :PORSCHE PANAMERA
5728653 Accident date :08.06.2018
' No ' Description Qty Amount (55)
Labour Cost
1 Remove & reinstall air con fill in gas Lo ¢ _200-1 l20
2 Remove & reinstall sensor : $ 15030
3 Remove, replace & repair consistent to the accident $ WEpoe— |07
4 Respray painting $ 1800 (gUm
S Tuff kote § w0 X
Total 5 4250
Grand Total s 26572.09
poast -+ 1Y
|'
4 4 ?



HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP

1, Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, Blk C #01-61 / 01-34, Singapore 417883

Autobay @ Kaki Bukit
Tel: 6747 8064, 6746 5519 / 9666 9680 Fax: 6743 4896
ESTIMATE (© ooy
FOOD PARADISE ENTERPRISE PTE LTD Date :26.06.2018
7 MANDAI LINK #06-25 Vehicle no :SIQ BB80R
MANDAI CONNECTION Make/Model :PORSCHE PANAMERA
5728653 Accident date :08.06.2018
| R T sl - DESCRIPTION 3 Qty - =" Amount [55)
Supplementary ltems
1 Alr intake duct @ $85.00 " 2 § oY
2 Radiator fan cowling 1 § 1377 7
3 Front support panel top garnish 48 1 § 55
4 Front bumper sponge upper . 1 S 66
" S5 Front bumper sponge lower 1 $ 310
& Power steering cooling pipe 1.0 1 § 214
7 Front support panel top rubber 1 5 108 <
8 Air filter housing Ll 8 1 $ 470 _-
9 Head lamp mounting @ $155.20 l 2 S 3104
10 Front bumper undercover | 1 $ 365
11 Front bumper undercover clips [1set) 1 $ 30.
12 Wiper panel garnish L} 1 S 190
13 Frontbumper sensor wire harness 1+ - 1 5 117 4
14 Head lamp control unit @ $1160.00 144 2 $ 2320°
15 Airintake guide 3 '—+ 1 S 250 °
5 6352.4
10% 5 63524
Total 5 b987.64
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HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP

AUTOBAY @ KAKIBUKIT
1, Kaki Bukit Avenue & Blk C #01-34/#01-61, Singapore 417883

Tel: 65747 8064, 6746 5519 Fax: 6743 4886 H/P: 9666 9680
Feg. No.. 254578/00M

~/

TP=CARCRD T TR FRLMELAT

WNANTY LD DA
Your Ref :
13/7/2018
Our Rel DR
VEHICLE NO :SIQBBBOR
MAKE / MODEL :PORSCHE PANAMERA
NAME :FOOD PARADISE ENTERPRISE PTE LTD
ADDRESS :7 MANDAI LINK
H#06-25
S 72B653
FINAL REPAIR BILL FOR VEHICLE NO:SIQ 8880 R
TO SUPPLY AND REPLACE PARTS, LABOUR CHARGES FOR S 18,800.00
REPAIRING, KNOCKING, WELDING AND TO RESPRAY PAINTING
(LUMP SUM REPAIR)
LESS EXCESS (52,000.00)
TOTAL 5 16,800.00

SINGAPORE DOLLARS:SIXTEEN THOUSAND AND EIGHT HUNDRED ONLY



SATISFACTION NOTE

I/We ______ FOOD PARADISE ENTERPRISE PTE LTD
Hereby certified that repairstoCar  __ SIQBBB0R have been carried out to my/our entire

Satisfaction and |/we agree that the discharge of the repair account from S _16,800.00

by AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD shall be in full discherge of all claims under Policy No. CNBB1043
in respect of damage to this car resulting from an accident which occurred on or about 8th
day of Jun 2018.

Data: Signature:




