
Print Received Message

 
This mail is associated with :

  
*SJK7838C (C0473874)

 [SHC5549R]
 TP

 QUAN LIFANG
 Jun 9 2018 3:00AM

 [TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD]
 Jin Huat & Co

  
 
From   AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (AXA_SG), sent on 18/07/2018 09:43 AM.
To   jas.tan@axa.com.sg; stacey.ng@axa.com.sg; LKK_HQ
CC   AXA_SG; ashersng@lkkauto.com
Subject   Re: New TP Assignment - C0473874/P1680520
 

 

 
HI,
 
Please reject TP claim.
 
Thanks.
Jas
 
 
<-- Original Message --> 
From: LKK_HQ
To: jas.tan@axa.com.sg; stacey.ng@axa.com.sg
CC: AXA_SG; ashersng@lkkauto.com
Sent On: 13/07/2018 10:09 AM
Subject: Re: New TP Assignment - C0473874/P1680520
 
Hi Sir,
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
TP reported that OI graze on the left front portion while making a right turn.
 
OI reported that TP make a right turn and hit his side door.
 
We are of the opinion that BOLA 9 applied, liability is not in third party’s favour.
 
In view of the above, we are intending to reject TP claim.
 
Kindly let us have your advice / instruction if any.
 
Thank You.
 
Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
 
<-- Original Message --> 
From: AXA_SG
To: LKK_HQ;sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com
CC: AXA_SG
Sent On: 12/06/2018 09:45 PM

mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com


Subject: New TP Assignment - C0473874/P1680520
 
Dear LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd,

  
Please survey the vehicle and proceed for direct settlement if damages consistent.

  
Workshop Name: Jin Huat & Co

 Policy Number: P1680520
 Vehicle Number: SJK7838C
 Date of Accident:09/06/2018

 Estimated Claim Amount:
 Excess: 5000.00

 Claim Handler Name: Stacey Ng


