ASS. REC BY: !mGSIRI uﬁfﬂ:}fﬁl . (ia lﬁpﬂmw-ﬂlnn:

SurveyoY ASSIGNMENT (Office)
. an%im}:n% () o ECI Dtef T, |1‘& |I‘E}6'5‘Im
‘__..m e ot

Bill !
(TP JWS TP RES { OD RES / EVA / INV /MY 1¢S5 . ,
To et Vehicle No: GRE 3479M Insucesd [k 4500']"
ot Workshop s SME Mooy 1 6343 6006
of : 4+ A nd415 L
Policy No. o EUD 4606 MPSH
S liswed  Bxems ,
Mk of Veh: noa_ 20(e6 (1§
(CHent's Record) | '
CA J REV [ REP. | REY 24 HRS “}) WO, Endersmment =
: WML’:E[[[PmcmW. 'lu’lﬂl"t\']_ Vehicle-INADUT
DutelTine _|Asionssroetion (3—") Ectie a/o]18= v Yui
GBE 34791M - % 2/01\8- v yed (ped yir )
34iA 4500 - CoAAMIR 10061 | Kluud hoa: 17€1ie
13\ )8 - mmf dation soid vehide SE1 ned In-
_Ji}\:;m m;h mﬂm @’m\
N81Ve | Uitk set In Ray Wm ol
Alale- | ehide doy- fe yey




MS @ FirstCapital

HS F!pnl:ulllllmmm Unmtl e W, IOSIHE G e e ) S0BLGIEY

'I'H ﬁﬂﬂ!! E!l:l Fax: ﬁmzmr

gt & Pt bee Urocspersi g Oepiz mwlmmmwmn
Fet (B 8507 BR4B Faxi (B5) £307 5848

Wiwel mERrYICania, com s
MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 08-08-2018 Our Ref No. D18004606MFSH
Accident Date 06-06-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHA4500Y Third Party Vehicle. GBE347TM

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 BLK D #02-15/18/1THBAUTOBAY @ KAK| BUKIT
PEIYING

67476106/ 0 Fax No. 67442368

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:
LKK ALUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST
Ce : Workshop SME MOTOR PTELTD. Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

Officer Incharge

MAY CHUA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kinefly submit the survey repor via: CWS within 14 days for survey assionment and 7 days fof re-inspection.

This Is-a computer generated istter, nd signature required.
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PRI Header Details
Claimant
Claim No D1800460E6MFSH Policy No D-1BDB8936MFSH S.No & 1 8SME MOT
Name
Workshop | SME MOTOR PTE LTD Suner 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 BLK D #02-15/16/17/18AUTOBAY |
Name ke (Contact Person : PEIYING & Contact Mobile: 0 , Phone: 67476106 , Fax: 67442368
T M COM.SG
) Details Emailid: PEIYINGRSMEMOTOR.COM.S
Our LKK ALITO CONSULTANTS | Instructions : : : : : .
| WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM
Surveyor FTE LTD To Surveyor i . Q
) h COMFORT ™
Insured | o ANSPORTATION PTE L SHA4500Y Vehicle | GBE3477M
Name Vehicle No :
oD No
PRIL Surveyor Surveyor
Recleved 11-06-2018 04:50:56 PM Appointed 12-06-2018 05:50:08 PM Accapt 13-06-2018 1.
Date Date Date
Survey Report Upload
Surveyor I Upload
; Surveyor Survey
Inspection | s 13-06-2018
R rt Date Report
Date *: EHEN eport Ds - we
Vehicle Particulars
Make Please Select Make ¥ | | Model Please Select Model ¥ | Year Select Year
Chasis No ] Engine No |_ Mileage |
Cubic
Color I Capacil |
Multiple Documents Upload
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File Name Action
Survayor Job Remarks
Remarks | Save I I
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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Nivitha (LKK Aute) <admin-d@Ikkauto.coms

Sen't: Thursday, 15 November 2018 3:03 PM

To: 'Claim Warkflow System’; 'ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM’
Cc: "MAYCHUABMSFIRST CAFET#L.{:QM.SG‘.' "SUR"

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D'18004606MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Plezse be informied that according to the repairer, TP owner already withdraw claim.

W will close this file at our end without billing.

BEST REGARDS,

G Nivitha | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phiine: 68411972 | email: asslgnmentsi@]kkaulocon | o 6256-4315
Bl 51, Payn Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Nivitha [LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@|kkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 13 June 2018 9:53 AM

To: 'Claim Workfiow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; ASSIGNM ENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Ce: MAYCHUA®MSFIRSTCARITALCOM.SG; "SUR" ﬁur@lkkauto.cum:r

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D1 BOOAGOEMFSH/1

Dear SirfMdm,
Thenk you for the assignment,

Plaase bé Inforined vekicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Mivitha | Adinin
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lud

Phtne 68411972 | emall: gsignmentam kknutecom | fus: 6256-4315
Bik 51. Poya Ubi Industrin! Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirst capital.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 12 June 2018 5:50 PM
To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL COM SG; MAYCHUA® MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004606MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm;

We refer to the above reference.
please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,
Admin Team



Claim Workflow System

Mgtor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



