Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh®@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 14 June 2019 8:39 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Cc MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: Acc involving SGY7368D & SGJ8781R Along Upper Serangoon Road on 8 June

2018 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC18010723/Kpa3s2 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Jia Le,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

‘ T The all (MW ) lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 30 May, 2019 10:33 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Acc involving SGY7368D & SGI8781R Along Upper Serangoon Road on 8 June 2018 [External
Confidential] **#* | KK REF: CC4/LPC1B010723/Kpa3s?

Lonpac Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020641
LKK Ref: CC4/LPC1801 0723/Kpa3s2
Dear Sirs/Madam,

We refer to the above matter,

We have highlighted to your good office on 18/06/2018 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settlement with
our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

3 vehicles chain collision, insured was the last vehicle. Liability is not in our driver's favour.

Summary to offer to third party repairer, “"K.KIM HIN AUTO PTE LTD" is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $11,588.58 $7.329.50
2. Loss of Use (15days x $100.00) $ 1.500.00 $ 900.00 (15days x $40.00)
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee ] 2.00 $ 200

Total | § 13,090.58 $8231.50




"*14days recommendation for repair + 1sunday = 15days.
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval.

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkanto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 22 April 2019 1:38 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.coms; margaret@kkimhin.com.sg

Ce: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@l|kkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-
a(@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Acc involving SGY7368D & SGJ8781R Along Upper Serangoon Road on 8 June 2018 [External
Confidential] *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC18010723/ Kpa3s2

ITH
SAVEAS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for your email.

Please note that: -

LKK ref Officer in charge
CC4/LPC18B010723/Kpa3s2 Hsiao Tong - 6742 3197

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Fhone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Thursday, 18 April, 2019 3:58 PM

To: margaret@kkimhin.com.sg

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt _claim@lonpac.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Acc involving SGY7368D & 5GJ8781R Along Upper Serangoon Road on 8 June 2018 [External
Confidential)

Lonpac External - Confidential
WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Dear Margaret,

Please liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
for your client’s claim.

Aside to Mei Kwan - Please look into the claim and revert to them.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tei_:_ (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

pr—

<

Sent: Thursday, 18 April, 20190 3:40 PM
To: MT_Claim_5G
Subject: Acc involving SGY7368D & SGIB781R Along Upper Serangoon Road on 8 June 2018

Your Ref: 17/18/18/VP0O5/020661
Our Ref : 180383/06

Dear Gerald
With reference to our Letter of Demand dated 10 October 2018,

We believe by now you would have completed your investigation and is in a position to let us have your offer of
settlement. Please let us hear from you.

Reds

Margaret
K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd.



Your Ref: SGIS78IR [ A!’ﬁ? / "/ 74
Our Ref : 180383/06 ?’ V:‘Pﬂ B?'ﬂrf; /

M/s Dreamzwork Work Creation
Correspondence address

¢/o M/s K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive #02-20

Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

Date - lh! ﬂﬁﬁ:f.zﬂﬁ

Lonpac Insurance Bhd
Motor Claims Dept

300 Beach Road #17-04/07
The Concourse

Singapore 199555

Dear Sir/Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGY 7368 D AND SGJ 8781

I am the owner of the m/vehicle which was inveolved
in the above accident. SGY 7368 D

My wvehicle sustained damages as a result of the said accident and
I am now claiming against you for the followings:-—

A

1, Costs of repairs - i
2. Loss of use of vehicle at $

per day for |5 day(s) {$I_ﬂ:[ll}['.‘}__
3. Police documents/Search fees
4, Surveyor report fee

7,320.50

B i
—_
Lh
=
=
=
=

Total:

1§ &

Please advise whether you are prepared to settle my claim as
outlined above. As I have yet to settle my repair bill with my
repairers, I hereby authorise my repairers and/or their
representatives to negotiate/compromise settlement of above claim

on my behalf.

Looking forward to hear from you soon.

Yours faithfully,

Please note that driver and passenger
were injured in the accident and are
T claiming for injuries thru their lawyers

ﬂ/‘%_Ir | .:.u:;:w‘
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o I'__ '
-__-""J.";I?-I o
encl. H



Letter of Authorizalion

To Whom It May Concern

-

Accidenton_ 9 Jewe o/ ory 7268 D Aub SGT 878/ K

involving

Along CFFEL SERAN Goond RoAD

UWe_ DREAMZ WORA HORA GEEAT/ON  NRICNQ. 23322734  of

Bll &4 SERANCoand Ale D ;i"-’_‘j‘ff-f?;fJ SrAfCAForcs SE90485

owner of Motor Vehicle Registration No SGY 72680 insured by

fFesic el & wrcE Co-e 2 A e ._..’ = ‘, | ,__':',_-. — &
AfFeC FACEAS IS G- cssra7IVE 27 ynder Policy No. L0 92255/ /

dobereby ithoitoe Kl  TESIEA0 SRl AoTe £0F & EB as raylow

representative with full authority to write, negotiate and settle claim for damages on my/our
behalf against the owner and for driver of Moter Vehicle Regn No. =< JEZH &
in regard to the above mentioned accident

[ /'We also consent to the agreed settlement sum be made in favour of my/our representative,

M/s S Sora? el AL Fe ./'Lj;'.a_f = 7T and the said

payment be forwarded to them to be construed as full and final discharge of ray/our claim.

L,
Yome L

I I|J ‘lll"-., |
M, [ ¥
Owner’ Sigﬁatﬁré’ ‘& Company Stamp




' LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIMNO : 17/18/18/VC05/020661
DATE : 25 JUNE 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We. DREAMZWORK WORK CREATION confirmed acceptance from M/s
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD and/or owner of SGJ 8781R the sum of Singapore
Dollar Eight Thousand Two Hundred Only ($8,200.00) in full and final satisfaction,
liquidation and discharge of all property losses competent to me/us upon the said M/s
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of all property losses sustained by me/us
whether now or hereafter to become manifest, anising either directly or indirectly from
an accident involving SGY 7368D and SGJ 8781R on 08 June 2018 along UPPER
SERANGOON ROAD.

| "We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD AND/OR LIM CHUQIANG) against all claims and any claims whatsoever
made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly 1o K.KIM HIN
AUTO PTE LTD.

I'We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of
lability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action,

éig:.a-ﬁiure of vehicle owner/Date
SENOREN
rf

& 2\

Name of vehicle uumer%ﬁ?

Tiale



@ > CO. REG. NO: 199402370D
Bf Biies BES e  GSTNO:M2-01232503
A UL LN ]| ] JAUTOPTELTD

SHEEHRERAFRLF
160 Sin Ming Drive, #02-20,

Sin Ming AutoCity, Singapore 575722
Tel: 6452 7018 Fax: 6458 38905

Email: service@kkimhin.com.sg

No.
Vehicle Insured : SGJ 8781 R
Accident Date : 0B-Jun-2018 Date
Our Ref : 180383 (LONPAC) / MARGARET FPAGE

DREAMZWORK WORK CREATION
Singapore

COST OF REPAIR FOR HONDA JAZZ 1.4A (2007) SGY7368D

S S s s EEE S S S S SRS S S S S S S S S S S S S EEEEEEEE==E==m===S=====

To supply spare parts

To tow accident vehicle to workshop
by normal towing

To remove, cut out damaged parts,
panel beating, welding, align,
refix and to renew affected parts.

To remove and refit rear windscreen
glass and conduct water leak test

To remove and refit reverse sensor
assy.

To apply undersealing

To check and realignment on chassis
member ,

To remove and renew exhaust
silencer box

To remove and refit rear upholstery

trimming, roof lining, seats,
speaker board in order to
facilitate repairing works

23679
25=-Jun-2018
1

Con't Page 2



CO. REG, NO: 199402370D

BF B as |

GST NO: M2-0123250-3

Bl &5
W LAWY IRl IT{auToPTELTD

THEMMIERAFTRAA

Vehicle Insured : SGJ §981SipMing Drive, #02-20,

Oour Ref : 180383 Sin Ming AutoCity, Singapore 575722
Tel: 6452 7018 Fax: 6458 3895
Email: service@kkimhin.com.sg

To remove aircon condenser, pipes
and driers. Vaccum and recharge gas

To putty and respray on affected
portions.

To focus Headlamps and Taillamps.

To check front and rear lighting
operation and rewiring

aAdd 7% GST :

Total

Singapore Dollars Seven Thousand Three Hundred
and Twenty Nine and Cents Fifty Only

: ~
P H iy Bk
\ 13

23679

479,350

e
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K. KIM HIN AUTO PTE LTD



GENERAL

ASS0CIATION

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Our Ref No; GR-18-D88482
Date of Requast: 08/06/2018

K Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive #02-20

INSURANCE

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapare 048580
Phone; +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Your Ref MNo: Online Purchase

Sin Ming AuteCity

Singapore 575722

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Dale 09062018

Enguiry By Wong Shu Man

TP Vehicle Ma. SGJETAIR

Accident Dale 08/06/2018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S5)

TP Insurer Enquiry 1,87
GET Amount 013
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generaled document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use;
Date;

[X] GIRO [ ] Cash [ ] Chegue



