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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Rico 60 <claims@rico60.com>

Sent: Saturday, 10 November, 2018 4:52 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SKS 8125R_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKZ 5751R 

ANDSKS8125R ON 10/06/2018 LKK REF CC4/ASM18010715/Ahb3

Attachments: Discharge Voucher.pdf

Dear Vic, 

 

Attached signed DV as per your pursuant. 

Kindly release cheque. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 

Cass Chua 

 

 
RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD. 

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit 

#02-24, Singapore 415875 

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060 

Email: claims@rico60.com 

 

From: Rico 60 

Sent: Thursday, 8 November 2018 3:50 PM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SKS 8125R_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKZ 5751R ANDSKS8125R ON 10/06/2018 LKK REF 

CC4/ASM18010715/Ahb3 

 

Dear Vic, 

 

The offer has been accepted. 

Will get the DV signed ASAP. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 

Cass Chua 

 

 
RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD. 

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit 
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#02-24, Singapore 415875 

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060 

Email: claims@rico60.com 

 

From: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Sent: Thursday, 8 November 2018 1:58 PM 

To: Rico 60 

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: Your Ref: SKS 8125R_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKZ 5751R AND SKS8125R ON 10/06/2018 LKK REF 

CC4/ASM18010715/Ahb3 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKZ 5751R AND SKS 8125R ON 10/06/2018 

 

We refer to your below email. 

 

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of liability to our Insured’s 

part, we have our principal’s mandate and we offer to settle your client’s claim as below: 

 

Cost of Repair (w/gst) $      3,317.00   

Loss of Rental ($90 x 5 days)  $          450.00  

LTA/GIA Search Fee $            36.49  

  TOTAL $      3,803.49  
    

 

If agreeable, kindly let the owner sign the attached DV then forward to a copy to us for payment processing.  

 

The above amount is to be made payable to RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD. 

 

Thank you. 
 

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and 

should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement 

should also not be disc 

 


