Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 13 December 2018 2:34 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: < ESTIMATE MARKING> TCS REF: AAD1806-077--Accident involving GBE7304C
& SHD5082P on 08.06.18

Attachments: image003.wmz; image010.wmz; image011.emz

Hi Shiau Chan

We do not have any document to support this.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764
/"""*C afv -

Website: www .tfranscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 13 December, 2018 8:58 AM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: < ESTIMATE MARKING> TCS REF: AAD1806-077--Accident involving GBE7304C & SHD5082P on 08.06.18

Dear Wai Yin,

Have document support?

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 13 December 2018 8:30 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: < ESTIMATE MARKING> TCS REF: AAD1806-077--Accident involving GBE7304C & SHD5082P on 08.06.18

Hi Shiau Chan

Book Value is $80,330.25.



Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

/_-..,Cag Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764

Website: www.iranscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: weichunkong [mailto:weichunkong@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 12 December, 2018 6:02 PM

To: 'Ng Wai Yin' <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: < ESTIMATE MARKING> TCS REF: AAD1806-077--Accident involving GBE7304C & SHD5082P on 08.06.18

Hi Wai Yin,
SHD5082P Net book value is $80,330.25

Thanks
Best regards

CK

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTELTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764
/"‘"Cﬁg -

Website: www .tfranscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 12 December, 2018 5:51 PM

To: 'weichunkong' <weichunkong@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: < ESTIMATE MARKING> TCS REF: AAD1806-077--Accident involving GBE7304C & SHD5082P on 08.06.18

Hi CK
Below email for your action.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308



*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764
/“'Cﬂg -

Website: www.transcab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 12 December, 2018 4:29 PM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: < ESTIMATE MARKING> TCS REF: AAD1806-077--Accident involving GBE7304C & SHD5082P on 08.06.18

Dear Wai Yin,

Kindly provide us the book value of above vehicle as requested by insurance officer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 December 2018 10:21 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@|kkauto.com>

Subject: FW: < ESTIMATE MARKING> TCS REF: AAD1806-077--Accident involving GBE7304C & SHD5082P on 08.06.18

Hi Shiau Chan
Please on hold this case, | will get back to you soon.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764
/"‘"Cﬁg -

Website: www.transcab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 12 December, 2018 10:19 AM




To: 'Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)' <siewsc@|kkauto.com>
Subject: < ESTIMATE MARKING> TCS REF: AAD1806-077--Accident involving GBE7304C & SHD5082P on 08.06.18

Hi Shiau Chan
Refer to our tele-conversation.
As per your requested.

Part - $21,968.00
S.Nett - $1,005.00

Labour - $2,810.00
$ 25,783.00

Lump Sum - $20,626.40

We submit LOD $ 20,600.00 (before GST).
Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department

TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

/._-..,Cag Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764

Website: www.franscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWwWw.avg.com




