Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 25 June 2018 12:48 PM

To: arunvinoth93@gmail.com

Cc: Shu Pei (LKKAuto); Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Katherine; Sharon Han; Lucas Lee;
Alfred Toh

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJQ2389H (Ol: SNM18D02940C02/9) and
SHC7003K (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CT118010604/K1pb3) on 06.06.2018

Attachments: 12062018142900.pdf; LIST OF AUTHORIZED WORKSHOP.pdf

Attn: Perumal Pillay s/o Naranasamy

Dear Sirs

We refer to the above matter.

It is noted that you have not/have yet to file accident report till date.

Please proceed to file the accident report IMMEDIATELY at M/s LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd OR any of China TaiPing

Insurance’s Authorized Workshop (Reporting Centre) to enable us to handle the incoming claim against your Motor
Insurance Policy on your behalf.

A copy of the List of Authorized Workshop (Reporting Centre) is attached for your attention and immediate action.
Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

TEL: +656389 6116

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
www.sg.chtaiping.com

. RSARY
In Singapere since 1938

Disclaimer :
This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure,



use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the
sender immediately.

From: Katherine [mailto:katherine@cowell.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, June 14, 2018 6:11 PM

To: arunvinoth93@gmail.com

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJQ2389H (OI: SNM18D02940C02/9) and SHC7003K (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CT118010604/K1pb3) on 06.06.2018

Hi Sir
Claim report have within 24 hours
Late reporting penalty applies

P/s do it asap

Best Regards,
Katherine Leong

DID } 6664.0834 Fax } 6338.9908



