Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 6 December 2018 10:58 AM

To: Joel Goh

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBF1787B (Ol : EQI - TBA) AND SKJ5717A
(TP : LKK REF -CC4/EQI18010602/Kpb3) on 16/03/2018

Attachments: SKJ 5717 A vs GBF 1787B - TP VIDEO.mp4

Hi Joel,

We attached herewith a copy of third party video for your easy reference.

The video footage shows that third party had stopped, then he moved from stationary portion, swerved
right and collided with our insured vehicle. We are of the view that third party is more liable as he was
moved out from the stationary position while our insured was driving pass.

In view of the above, we are intending to reject third party claim.

Kindly let us have your comments/ instruction.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 11 June 2018 6:23 PM

To: Joel Goh <joel.goh@egqinsurance.com.sg>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBF1787B (Ol : EQl - TBA) AND SKJ5717A (TP : LKK REF -
CC4/EQI18010602/Kpb3) on 16/03/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SK] 5717A at M/s K Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd.
Enclosed for your perusal is:
- Estimated cost of repair

- Preliminary advice
- TP GIA report



Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197.

Thank you.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



