Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 11 June 2018 3:08 PM

To: Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident involving SKJ 5717 A and GBF 1787 B on 16/3/2018
Attachments: GBF1787B.PDF

Dear LKK

Attached our insured’s accident report for your attention.
Please assist to take over this direct settlement.

Best Regards,

Joel Goh
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From: Joel Goh

Sent: Tuesday, April 3, 2018 11:14 AM

To: 'adminl@kkimhin.com.sg'

Cc: service@kkimhin.com.sg; sandrakhong@gmail.com

Subject: RE: Accident involving SKJ 5717 A and GBF 1787 B on 16/3/2018
Without Prejudice

Dear Shuman

Noted, we will assign LKK to conduct survey as SJE on without prejudice basis until liability is clear.
At the same time, please forward a copy of the video footage.

Dear LKK

Kindly assist on the following assignment.
Our insured has not reported the accident.

Best Regards,



Joel Goh
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From: admin1@kkimhin.com.sg [mailto:admin1@kkimhin.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, April 3, 2018 11:12 AM

To: Joel Goh

Cc: service@kkimhin.com.sg; sandrakhong@gmail.com

Subject: RE: Accident involving SKJ 5717 A and GBF 1787 B on 16/3/2018

Dear Joel,

Client is waiting for investigation and would like to proceed with claim.
Kindly appoint surveyor.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shuman

K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd

Tel: 6452 7018 Fax: 6458 3895

From: Joel Goh [mailto:joel.goh@eginsurance.com.sq]

Sent: 03 April, 2018 10:52 AM

To: adminl@kkimhin.com.sg

Cc: service@kkimhin.com.sg; sandrakhong@gmail.com; simon@kkimhin.com.sg; survey@kkimhin.com.sg

Subject: RE: Accident involving SKJ 5717 A and GBF 1787 B on 16/3/2018
Without Prejudice
Dear Shuman

Liability unclear as our insured has not reported this accident.
Kindly advise if you wish to proceed with survey.

Best Regards,



Joel Goh
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From: adminl@kkimhin.com.sg [mailto:adminl@kkimhin.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, April 3, 2018 10:15 AM

To: EQI PRS

Cc: service@kkimhin.com.sg; sandrakhong@gmail.com; simon@kkimhin.com.sg; survey@kkimhin.com.sg
Subject: Accident involving SKJ 5717 A and GBF 1787 B on 16/3/2018

Your ref: GBF 1787 B
Our ref: SKI 5717 A

Dear all,

Enclosed the GIA report of our client SKJ 5717 A, who was hit by your insured GBF 1787 B, on 16/3/2018.
Vehicle is not in yet, we will arrange for survey once ready.

Kindly appoint officer and advise liability.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shuman

K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd
Tel: 6452 7018 Fax: 6458 3895



