Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 20 January 2020 3:19 PM

To: Md Noor, Norsiah

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: [APPEAL ON REJECTION] AIG REF: TP / 1184644137SG - Accident involving SH

2388B (TP- Tan Lim Motor) & SGG 5161R (AIG) on 04/06/2018

Dear Ms. Norsiah,
Insured informed that he had withdrawn the Third party claim.
We will maintain the rejection of third party claim as per your approval dated 19/2/2019.

Thank you.

« Wishing you a Happy and rrosperous Lunar New Yegq, » "4

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 10 December 2019 3:45 PM

To: Md Noor, Norsiah <Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: [APPEAL ON REJECTION] AIG REF: TP / 1184644137SG - Accident involving SH 2388B (TP- Tan Lim Motor) &
SGG 5161R (AIG) on 04/06/2018

Dear Ms. Norsiah,
The above matter refers.
Please let us have your approval as third party is chasing for an update.

Thank you.

“Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 3 December 2019 2:32 PM

To: Md Noor, Norsiah <Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: [APPEAL ON REJECTION] AIG REF: TP / 1184644137SG - Accident involving SH 2388B (TP- Tan Lim Motor) &
SGG 5161R (AIG) on 04/06/2018

Dear Ms. Norsiah,

The above matter refers.

Please let us have your approval as third party is chasing for an update.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 24 October 2019 2:24 PM

To: Md Noor, Norsiah <Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: [APPEAL ON REJECTION] AIG REF: TP / 1184644137SG - Accident involving SH 2388B (TP) & SGG 5161R (AIG) on
04/06/2018

AIG REF: TP / 1184644137SG

Dear Ms. Norsiah,
We refer to the above matter and attachment herein.

Please be informed that NTUC Income informed third party repairer that they are offering liability for 50% for our
Insured’s counter claim and as such, the third party requests for amicable settlement for their claim against Insured at
50% basis as well.

Please let us have your approval on whether we can proceed to settle the third party’s claim on 50% liability.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




